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of 2,140 burden hours. OSHA reduced 
the number of apartment and non- 
residential construction sites that would 
use outside contractor engineering 
services for the required protective 
system design from 2,466 to 2,038. 
There was also a decrease in overall cost 
from $311,505 to $269,138, a difference 
of $42,367. 

The agency will summarize any 
comments submitted in response to this 
notice and will include this summary in 
the request to OMB to extend the 
approval of the information collection 
requirements contained in the Standard. 

Type of Review: Extension of a 
currently approved collection. 

Title: Excavations (Design of Cave-in 
Protection Systems) (29 CFR part 1926, 
subpart P). 

OMB Control Number: 1218–0137. 
Affected Public: Business or other for- 

profits. 
Number of Respondents: 8,152. 
Number of Responses: 19,402. 
Frequency of Responses: On occasion. 
Average Time per Response: Varies. 
Estimated Total Burden Hours: 19,402 

hours. 
Estimated Cost (Operation and 

Maintenance): $269,138. 

IV. Public Participation—Submission of 
Comments on This Notice and Internet 
Access to Comments and Submissions 

You may submit comments in 
response to this document as follows: 
(1) Electronically at http://
www.regulations.gov, which is the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal; (2) by 
facsimile (fax); or (3) by hard copy. All 
comments, attachments, and other 
material must identify the agency name 
and the OSHA docket number (Docket 
No. OSHA–2011–0057) for the ICR. You 
may supplement electronic submissions 
by uploading document files 
electronically. If you wish to mail 
additional materials in reference to an 
electronic or facsimile submission, you 
must submit them to the OSHA Docket 
Office (see the section of this notice 
titled ADDRESSES). The additional 
materials must clearly identify your 
electronic comments by your name, 
date, and the docket number so the 
agency can attach them to your 
comments. 

Due to security procedures, the use of 
regular mail may cause a significant 
delay in the receipt of comments. For 
information about security procedures 
concerning the delivery of materials by 
hand, express delivery, messenger, or 
courier service, please contact the 
OSHA Docket Office at (202) 693–2350, 
(TTY (877) 889–5627). 

Comments and submissions are 
posted without change at http://

www.regulations.gov. Therefore, OSHA 
cautions commenters about submitting 
personal information such as social 
security numbers and dates of birth. 
Although all submissions are listed in 
the http://www.regulations.gov index, 
some information (e.g., copyrighted 
material) is not publicly available to 
read or download through this website. 
All submissions, including copyrighted 
material, are available for inspection 
and copying at the OSHA Docket Office. 
Information on using the http://
www.regulations.gov website to submit 
comments and access the docket is 
available at the website’s ‘‘User Tips’’ 
link. Contact the OSHA Docket Office 
for information about materials not 
available through the website, and for 
assistance in using the internet to locate 
docket submissions. 

V. Authority and Signature 
Loren Sweatt, Principal Deputy 

Assistant Secretary of Labor for 
Occupational Safety and Health, 
directed the preparation of this notice. 
The authority for this notice is the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44 
U.S.C. 3506 et seq.) and Secretary of 
Labor’s Order No. 1–2012 (77 FR 3912). 

Signed at Washington, DC, on October 15, 
2020. 
Loren Sweatt, 
Principal Deputy Assistant Secretary of Labor 
for Occupational Safety and Health. 
[FR Doc. 2020–23266 Filed 10–20–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–26–P 

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND 
SPACE ADMINISTRATION 

[Notice: (20–086)] 

NASA Advisory Council; Aeronautics 
Committee; Meeting 

AGENCY: National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration. 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, as 
amended, the National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration (NASA) 
announces a meeting of the Aeronautics 
Committee of the NASA Advisory 
Council (NAC). This meeting will be 
held for soliciting, from the aeronautics 
community and other persons, research 
and technical information relevant to 
program planning. 
DATES: Tuesday, November 10, 2020, 
10:00 a.m.–6:00 p.m., Eastern Time. 
ADDRESSES: Virtual Meeting via WebEx 
and Toll-Free telephone only. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ms. 
Irma Rodriguez, Designated Federal 

Officer, Aeronautics Research Mission 
Directorate, NASA Headquarters, 
Washington, DC 20546, (202) 527–4826, 
or irma.c.rodriguez@nasa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: As noted 
above, this meeting will be available 
telephonically and by WebEx only. The 
WebEx link is https://
nasaenterprise.webex.com, the meeting 
number is 199 494 0997, and the 
password is mX47WJPMW8$ (case 
sensitive). You can also dial in by phone 
toll-free: 888–769–8716 passcode: 
6813159. The agenda for the meeting 
includes the following topics: 

—Capability and workforce strategic 
planning 

—COVID Impacts activities and NASA 
Return to site plans 

—Autonomy Plans 

It is imperative that the meeting be 
held on this date to accommodate the 
scheduling priorities of the key 
participants. 

Carol Hamilton, 
Acting Advisory Committee Management 
Officer, National Aeronautics and Space 
Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2020–23291 Filed 10–20–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7510–13–P 

NATIONAL SCIENCE FOUNDATION 

Proposal Review Panel for Physics; 
Notice of Meeting 

In accordance with the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (Pub. L. 92– 
463, as amended), the National Science 
Foundation (NSF) announces the 
following meetings: 

Name and Committee Code: Proposal 
Review Panel for Division of Physics 
(1208)—Institute for Quantum 
Information and Matter (IQIM). 

Date and Time: November 18, 2020 
10:00 a.m.–6:00 p.m., November 19, 
2020 10:00 a.m.–5:00 p.m., November 
20, 2020 10:00 a.m.–2:00 p.m. 

Place: NSF, 2415 Eisenhower Avenue, 
Alexandria, VA 22314 (Virtual). 

Type of Meeting: Part-open. 
Contact Persons: James Shank, 

Program Director for Physics Frontier 
Centers, Division of Physics, National 
Science Foundation, 2415 Eisenhower 
Avenue, Room W9214, Alexandria, VA 
22314; Telephone: (703) 292–4516. 

Purpose of Meeting: Virtual site visit 
to provide an evaluation of the progress 
of the projects at the host site for the 
Division of Physics at the National 
Science Foundation. 
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Agenda 

November 18, 2020; 10:00 a.m.–06:00 
p.m. 

10:00 a.m.–12:00 p.m. 
Directors Overview & Science Talks— 

Session 1 
12:00 p.m.–01:00 p.m. 

Lunch 
01:00 p.m.–04:00 p.m. 

Science Talks—Session 2 
04:00 p.m.–05:00 p.m. 

Executive Session—CLOSED 
05:00 p.m.–06:00 p.m. 

Poster Session 

November 19, 2020; 10:00 a.m.–05:00 
p.m. 

10:00 a.m.–12:00 p.m. 
Education/Outreach/Diversity (need 

more than 1 hour) 
12:00 p.m.–01:00 p.m. 

Lunch 
01:00 p.m.–02:00 p.m. 

University Administrators 
02:00 p.m.–03:00 p.m. 

Directors Conclusion and Plans for 
Coming Year 

03:00 p.m.–04:30 p.m. 
Executive Session—CLOSED 

04:30 p.m.–05:00 p.m. 
Questions delivered to PIs 

November 20, 2020; 10:00 a.m.–2:00 
p.m. 

10:00 a.m.–11:00 a.m. 
Responses to Questions 

11:00 a.m.–02:00 p.m. 
Panel Discussion of Report 
Reason for Closing: Topics to be 

discussed and evaluated during closed 
portions of the site review will include 
information of a proprietary or 
confidential nature, including technical 
information and information on 
personnel. These matters are exempt 
under 5 U.S.C. 552b(c), (4) and (6) of the 
Government in the Sunshine Act. 

Dated: October 16, 2020. 
Crystal Robinson, 
Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2020–23281 Filed 10–20–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7555–01–P 

NATIONAL SCIENCE FOUNDATION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Comment Request; Awardee 
Reporting Requirements for the 
Established Program To Stimulate 
Competitive Research (EPSCoR) 
Research Infrastructure Improvement 
Programs 

AGENCY: National Science Foundation. 
ACTION: Submission for OMB review; 
comment request. 

SUMMARY: The National Science 
Foundation (NSF) has submitted the 
following information collection 
requirement to OMB for review and 
clearance under the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. This is the 
second notice for public comment; the 
first was published in the Federal 
Register, and no comments were 
received. NSF is forwarding the 
proposed submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
clearance simultaneously with the 
publication of this second notice. 
DATES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAmain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Suzanne H. Plimpton, Reports Clearance 
Officer, National Science Foundation, 
2415 Eisenhower Avenue, Alexandria, 
VA 22314, or send email to splimpto@
nsf.gov. Individuals who use a 
telecommunications device for the deaf 
(TDD) may call the Federal Information 
Relay Service (FIRS) at 1–800–877– 
8339, which is accessible 24 hours a 
day, 7 days a week, 365 days a year 
(including federal holidays). Copies of 
the submission may be obtained by 
calling 703–292–7556. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: NSF may 
not conduct or sponsor a collection of 
information unless the collection of 
information displays a currently valid 
OMB control number and the agency 
informs potential persons who are to 
respond to the collection of information 
that such persons are not required to 
respond to the collection of information 
unless it displays a currently valid OMB 
control number. 

Title of Collection: Awardee Reporting 
Requirements for the Established 
Program to Stimulate Competitive 
Research (EPSCoR) Research 
Infrastructure Improvement Programs. 

OMB Number: 3145–0243. 
Type of Request: Reinstatement with 

change of an established information 
collection. 

Proposed Project: The mission of the 
National Science Foundation (NSF) is to 
promote the progress of science; to 
advance the national health, welfare, 
and prosperity; and to secure the 
national defense, while avoiding the 
undue concentration of research and 
education. In 1977, in response to 
congressional concern that NSF funding 
was overly concentrated geographically, 

a National Science Board task force 
analyzed the geographic distribution of 
NSF funds, which resulted in the 
creation of an NSF Experimental 
Program to Stimulate Competitive 
Research (EPSCoR). The American 
Innovation and Competitiveness Act 
(Pub. L. 114–329, Sec 103 D) effectively 
changed the program’s name from 
‘‘Experimental’’ to ‘‘Established’’ in FY 
2016. Congress specified two objectives 
for the EPSCoR program in the National 
Science Foundation Authorization Act 
of 1988: (1) To assist States that 
historically have received relatively 
little Federal research and development 
funding; and (2) to assist States that 
have demonstrated a commitment to 
develop their research bases and 
improve science and engineering 
research and education programs at 
their universities and colleges 

The EPSCoR Research Infrastructure 
Improvement (RII) Investment Strategies 
advance science and engineering 
capabilities in EPSCoR jurisdictions for 
discovery, innovation and overall 
knowledge-based prosperity. These 
projects build human, cyber, and 
physical infrastructure in EPSCoR 
jurisdictions, stimulating sustainable 
improvements in their Research & 
Development (R&D) capacity and 
competitiveness. 

EPSCoR projects are unique in their 
scope and complexity; in their 
integration of individual researchers, 
institutions, and organizations; and in 
their role in developing the diverse, 
well-prepared, STEM-enabled workforce 
necessary to sustain research 
competitiveness and catalyze economic 
development. In addition, these projects 
are generally inter- or multi-disciplinary 
and involve effective jurisdictional and 
regional collaborations among 
academic, government, and private 
sector stakeholders that advance 
scientific research, promote innovation, 
and provide multiple societal benefits. 
They also broaden participation in 
science and engineering by engaging 
multiple institutions and organizations 
at all levels of research and education, 
and people within and among EPSCoR 
jurisdictions. These projects usually 
involve between 100 to 300 participants 
per year over the performance period, 
and the projects reach thousands more 
through their extensive STEM outreach 
activities. The American Innovation and 
Competitiveness Act of 2016, Section 
103 (Pub. L. 114–329) requires NSF 
EPSCoR to submit annual reports to 
both Congress and OSTP that contain 
data detailing project progress and 
success (new investigators, broadening 
participation, dissemination of results, 
new workshops, outreach activities, 
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