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1 Forms 1, 1–F, 2, 2–A, 3–Q electric, 3–Q natural 
gas, 6, 6–Q, FERC–60, and FERC–714. 

email of new filings and issuances 
related to this or other pending projects. 
For assistance, call 1–866–208–3676 or 
email FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, for 
TTY, call (202) 502–8659. A copy is also 
available for inspection and 
reproduction at the address in item (h) 
above. 

m. Individuals desiring to be included 
on the Commission’s mailing list should 
so indicate by writing to the Secretary 
of the Commission. 

n. Comments, Motions to Intervene, or 
Protests: Anyone may submit 
comments, a motion to intervene, or a 
protest in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214. 
In determining the appropriate action to 
take, the Commission will consider all 
protests or other comments filed, but 
only those who file a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
Commission’s Rules may become a 
party to the proceeding. Any comments, 
motions to intervene, or protests must 
be received on or before the specified 
comment date for the particular 
application. 

o. Filing and Service of Responsive 
Documents: Any filing must (1) bear in 
all capital letters the title 
‘‘COMMENTS’’, ‘‘MOTION TO 
INTERVENE’’, or ‘‘PROTEST’’ as 
applicable; (2) set forth in the heading 
the name of the applicant and the 
project number of the application to 
which the filing responds; (3) furnish 
the name, address, and telephone 
number of the person intervening or 
protesting; and (4) otherwise comply 
with the requirements of 18 CFR 
385.2001 through 385.2005. All 
comments, motions to intervene, or 
protests must set forth their evidentiary 
basis and otherwise comply with the 
requirements of 18 CFR 4.34(b). All 
comments, motions to intervene, or 
protests should relate to project works 
which are the subject of the application. 
Agencies may obtain copies of the 
application directly from the applicant. 
A copy of any motion to intervene or 
protest must be served upon each 
representative of the applicant specified 
in the particular application. If an 
intervener files comments or documents 
with the Commission relating to the 
merits of an issue that may affect the 
responsibilities of a particular resource 
agency, they must also serve a copy of 
the document on that resource agency. 
A copy of all other filings in reference 
to this application must be accompanied 
by proof of service on all persons listed 
in the service list prepared by the 
Commission in this proceeding, in 
accordance with 18 CFR 4.34(b) and 
385.2010. 

Dated: May 29, 2015. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2015–13740 Filed 6–4–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. EL15–67–000] 

Linden VFT, LLC v. PJM 
Interconnection, L.L.C.; Notice of 
Complaint 

Take notice that on May 22, 2015, 
pursuant to sections 206 and 306 of the 
Federal Power Act, 16 U.S.C. 824(e) and 
825(e) and Rule 206 of the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission’s 
(Commission) Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.206, Linden 
VFT, LLC (Complainant), filed a formal 
complaint against PJM Interconnection, 
L.L.C. (PJM or Respondent), alleging 
that the Respondent’s proposed cost 
allocations for projects resulting from 
PJM’s 2013 Regional Transmission 
Expansion Plan, including Public 
Service Electric and Gas Company 
upgrades, are unjust, unreasonable, 
unduly discriminatory, and preferential, 
as more fully explained in the 
complaint. 

The Complainant certifies that copies 
of the complaint were served on the 
contacts for the Respondent as listed on 
the Commission’s list of Corporate 
Officials. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. The Respondent’s answer 
and all interventions, or protests must 
be filed on or before the comment date. 
The Respondent’s answer, motions to 
intervene, and protests must be served 
on the Complainants. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 5 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
electronic review in the Commission’s 
Public Reference Room in Washington, 
DC. There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on 
the Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on June 11, 2015. 

Dated: May 27, 2015. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2015–13735 Filed 6–4–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. AD15–11–000] 

Electronic Filing Protocols for 
Commission Forms; Supplemental 
Notice of Conference With North 
American Energy Standards Board 

As announced in the Notice of 
Technical Conference issued on May 1, 
2015, the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission (Commission) staff will 
lead a technical conference that will 
include the North American Energy 
Standards Board (NAESB) and 
interested members of the public and 
industry to discuss the transition to a 
new submission format for certain forms 
required by the Commission,1 and 
NAESB’s assistance in that process. The 
agenda for the technical conference is as 
follows: 
10:00 a.m.–10:15 a.m. Opening 

Remarks from Chairman Norman 
Bay 

10:15 a.m.–10:45 a.m. FERC Staff 
Overview Presentation 

10:45 a.m.–11:15 a.m. FERC Staff IT 
Presentation 

11:15 a.m.–11:45 a.m. North American 
Energy Standards Board 
Presentation 

11:45 a.m. Question & Answer Session 
Conferences held at the Federal 

Energy Regulatory Commission are 
accessible under section 508 of the 
Rehabilitation Act of 1973. For 
accessibility accommodations please 
send an email to accessibility@ferc.gov 
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or call toll free 1–866–208–3372 (voice) 
or 202–502–8659 (TTY), or send a FAX 
to 202–208–2106 with the required 
accommodations. 

Prior to the conference, Commission 
staff will post conference materials on 
the Commission’s Web site, 
www.ferc.gov (navigate to Documents & 
Filings, then Forms, then eForms 
Refresh). The conference will also be 
webcast and transcribed. The webcast 
will be available through a link on the 
Commission’s Calendar of Events, 
available at http://www.ferc.gov. An 
email account has been created for off- 
site participants to submit questions for 
the question and answer session at the 
technical conference. Please email 
questions at any time to 
eForms.Refresh@ferc.gov. 

For more information about this 
conference please contact Robert 
Hudson (Technical Information), Office 
of Enforcement, at (202) 502–6620 or 
Robert.Hudson@ferc.gov or Sarah 
McKinley (Logistical Information), 
Office of External Affairs at (202) 502– 
8368 or Sarah.McKinley@ferc.gov. 

Dated: May 29, 2015. 
Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2015–13725 Filed 6–4–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket Nos. CP15–492–000] 

Dominion Transmission, Inc.; Notice of 
Application 

Take notice that on May 15, 2015, 
Dominion Transmission, Inc. (DTI), 
filed an application pursuant to section 
7(c) of the Natural Gas Act (NGA) and 
part 157 of the Commission’s 
Regulations, for a certificate of public 
convenience and necessity to construct 
and operate the Leidy South Project (the 
‘‘Project’’). The various parts of the 
Project will be located in Clinton, 
Franklin, and Centre Counties, 
Pennsylvania; Frederick County, 
Maryland; and Loudoun and Fauquier 
Counties, Virginia. The filing may be 
viewed on the Web at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. For 
assistance, contact FERC at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Any questions regarding this 
application should be directed to 
Matthew R. Bley, Director Gas 
Transmission Certificates, Dominion 
Transmission, Inc., 701 E. Cary Street, 
Richmond, VA 23219, call at (804) 771– 
4399, or email Matthew.R.Bley@
dom.com. 

Specifically, DTI proposes to replace 
two 1,100 horsepower (hp) compressor 
units with one 10,915 hp unit at the 
Finnefrock Compressor Station in 
Clinton County, PA; install one suction 
filter/separator at the Centre Compressor 
Station in Centre County, PA; install 
one 13,220 hp unit at the Chambersburg 
Compressor Station in Franklin County, 
PA; install one 15,900 hp unit at the 
Myersville Compressor Station in 
Frederick County, MD; install one 8,000 
hp unit at the Leesburg Compressor 
Station in Loudoun County, VA; install 
a new cooler and filter separator at the 
Quantico Compressor Station in 
Fauquier County, VA; and construct a 
new meter station at the Panda 
Stonewall Power Project in Loudoun 
County, VA. The Project will allow DTI 
to provide an incremental 155 MMcf per 
day of firm transportation service to 
three electric power generation 
facilities. The total cost of the Project 
will be approximately $209,657,857. 

Pursuant to section 157.9 of the 
Commission’s rules, 18 CFR 157.9, 
within 90 days of this Notice the 
Commission staff will either: Complete 
its environmental assessment (EA) and 
place it into the Commission’s public 
record (eLibrary) for this proceeding, or 
issue a Notice of Schedule for 
Environmental Review. If a Notice of 
Schedule for Environmental Review is 
issued, it will indicate, among other 
milestones, the anticipated date for the 
Commission staff’s issuance of the final 
environmental impact statement (FEIS) 
or EA for this proposal. The filing of the 
EA in the Commission’s public record 
for this proceeding or the issuance of a 
Notice of Schedule will serve to notify 
federal and state agencies of the timing 
for the completion of all necessary 
reviews, and the subsequent need to 
complete all federal authorizations 
within 90 days of the date of issuance 
of the Commission staff’s FEIS or EA. 

There are two ways to become 
involved in the Commission’s review of 
this project. First, any person wishing to 
obtain legal status by becoming a party 
to the proceedings for this project 
should, on or before the comment date 
stated below, file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE., Washington, DC 20426, 
a motion to intervene in accordance 
with the requirements of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 

Procedure (18 CFR 385.214 or 385.211) 
and the Regulations under the NGA (18 
CFR 157.10). A person obtaining party 
status will be placed on the service list 
maintained by the Secretary of the 
Commission and will receive copies of 
all documents filed by the applicant and 
by all other parties. A party must submit 
5 copies of filings made with the 
Commission and must mail a copy to 
the applicant and to every other party in 
the proceeding. Only parties to the 
proceeding can ask for court review of 
Commission orders in the proceeding. 

However, a person does not have to 
intervene in order to have comments 
considered. The second way to 
participate is by filing with the 
Secretary of the Commission, as soon as 
possible, an original and two copies of 
comments in support of or in opposition 
to this project. The Commission will 
consider these comments in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but the filing of a comment alone 
will not serve to make the filer a party 
to the proceeding. The Commission’s 
rules require that persons filing 
comments in opposition to the project 
provide copies of their protests only to 
the party or parties directly involved in 
the protest. 

Persons who wish to comment only 
on the environmental review of this 
project should submit an original and 
two copies of their comments to the 
Secretary of the Commission. 
Environmental commenters will be 
placed on the Commission’s 
environmental mailing list, will receive 
copies of the environmental documents, 
and will be notified of meetings 
associated with the Commission’s 
environmental review process. 
Environmental commenters will not be 
required to serve copies of filed 
documents on all other parties. 
However, the non-party commenters 
will not receive copies of all documents 
filed by other parties or issued by the 
Commission (except for the mailing of 
environmental documents issued by the 
Commission) and will not have the right 
to seek court review of the 
Commission’s final order. 

Motions to intervene, protests and 
comments may be filed electronically 
via the internet in lieu of paper; see, 18 
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the 
instructions on the Commission’s Web 
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link. The 
Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on June 17, 2015. 
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