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DATES: Interested persons are invited to 
submit comments on or before 
December 6, 2002.
ADDRESSES: Written comments should 
be addressed to the Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Attention: Karen Lee, Desk Officer, 
Department of Education, Office of 
Management and Budget, 725 17th 
Street, NW., Room 10235, New 
Executive Office Building, Washington, 
DC 20503 or should be electronically 
mailed to the internet address 
Karen_F._Lee@omb.eop.gov.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Section 
3506 of the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995 (44 U.S.C. Chapter 35) requires 
that the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) provide interested 
Federal agencies and the public an early 
opportunity to comment on information 
collection requests. OMB may amend or 
waive the requirement for public 
consultation to the extent that public 
participation in the approval process 
would defeat the purpose of the 
information collection, violate State or 
Federal law, or substantially interfere 
with any agency’s ability to perform its 
statutory obligations. The Leader, 
Regulatory Management Group, Office 
of the Chief Information Officer, 
publishes that notice containing 
proposed information collection 
requests prior to submission of these 
requests to OMB. Each proposed 
information collection, grouped by 
office, contains the following: (1) Type 
of review requested, e.g. new, revision, 
extension, existing or reinstatement; (2) 
Title; (3) Summary of the collection; (4) 
Description of the need for, and 
proposed use of, the information; (5) 
Respondents and frequency of 
collection; and (6) Reporting and/or 
Recordkeeping burden. OMB invites 
public comment.

Dated: November 1, 2002. 
John D. Tressler, 
Leader, Regulatory Management Group, 
Office of the Chief Information Officer.

Office of Elementary and Secondary 
Education 

Type of Review: Extension. 
Title: Native Hawaiian Education 

Council. 
Frequency: Annually. 
Affected Public: Businesses or other 

for-profit; State, local or Tribal Gov’t, 
SEAs or LEAs. 

Reporting and Recordkeeping Hour 
Burden: 

Responses: 100, Burden Hours: 200. 
Abstract: The No Child Left Behind 

Act of 2001 authorized the Secretary of 
Education to establish a Native 
Hawaiian Education Council to help 

coordinate the educational and related 
services available to Native Hawaiians. 
The legislation states that the Education 
Council may consist of no more than 21 
members, unless otherwise determined 
by a majority of the Council. 
Furthermore, at least 10 members of the 
Education Council must be Native 
Hawaiian service providers and 10 
members must be Native Hawaiians or 
Native Hawaiian education consumers. 
In addition, membership must include a 
representative of the State of Hawaii 
Office of Hawaiian Affairs. 

Requests for copies of the submission 
for OMB review; comment request may 
be accessed from http://
edicsweb.ed.gov, by selecting the 
‘‘Browse Pending Collections’’ link and 
by clicking on link number 2062. When 
you access the information collection, 
click on ‘‘Download Attachments ‘‘ to 
view. Written requests for information 
should be addressed to Vivian Reese, 
Department of Education, 400 Maryland 
Avenue, SW., Room 4050, Regional 
Office Building 3, Washington, DC 
20202–4651 or to the e-mail address 
vivan.reese@ed.gov. Requests may also 
be electronically mailed to the internet 
address OCIO_RIMG@ed.gov or faxed to 
202–708–9346. Please specify the 
complete title of the information 
collection when making your request. 

Comments regarding burden and/or 
the collection activity requirements 
should be directed to Kathy Axt at her 
e-mail address Kathy.Axt@ed.gov. 
Individuals who use a 
telecommunications device for the deaf 
(TDD) may call the Federal Information 
Relay Service (FIRS) at 1–800–877–
8339.

[FR Doc. 02–28246 Filed 11–5–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4000–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request

AGENCY: Department of Education
SUMMARY: The Leader, Regulatory 
Management Group, Office of the Chief 
Information Officer invites comments 
on the submission for OMB review as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act of 1995.
DATES: Interested persons are invited to 
submit comments on or before 
December 6, 2002.
ADDRESSES: Written comments should 
be addressed to the Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Attention: Lauren Wittenberg, Acting 
Desk Officer, Department of Education, 
Office of Management and Budget, 725 
17th Street, NW., Room 10235, New 

Executive Office Building, Washington, 
DC 20503 or should be electronically 
mailed to the internet address 
Lauren_Wittenberg@omb.eop.gov.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Section 
3506 of the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995 (44 U.S.C. Chapter 35) requires 
that the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) provide interested 
Federal agencies and the public an early 
opportunity to comment on information 
collection requests. OMB may amend or 
waive the requirement for public 
consultation to the extent that public 
participation in the approval process 
would defeat the purpose of the 
information collection, violate State or 
Federal law, or substantially interfere 
with any agency’s ability to perform its 
statutory obligations. The Leader, 
Regulatory Management Group, Office 
of the Chief Information Officer, 
publishes that notice containing 
proposed information collection 
requests prior to submission of these 
requests to OMB. Each proposed 
information collection, grouped by 
office, contains the following: (1) Type 
of review requested, e.g. new, revision, 
extension, existing or reinstatement; (2) 
Title; (3) Summary of the collection; (4) 
Description of the need for, and 
proposed use of, the information; (5) 
Respondents and frequency of 
collection; and (6) Reporting and/or 
Recordkeeping burden. OMB invites 
public comment.

Dated: November 1, 2002. 
John D. Tressler, 
Leader, Regulatory Information Management, 
Office of the Chief Information Officer.

Office of Postsecondary Education 
Type of Review: Reinstatement, with 

change, of a previously approved 
collection for which approval has 
expired. 

Title: FIPSE Comprehensive Program 
Grant Application. 

Frequency: Annually. 
Affected Public: Not-for-profit 

institutions (primary). 
Reporting and Recordkeeping Hour 

Burden: 
Responses: 1,650. 
Burden Hours: 19,500. 
Abstract: The Comprehensive 

program is a discretionary grant award 
program of the fund for the 
Improvement of Postsecondary 
Education (FIPSE). Applications are 
submitted in two stages—preliminary 
and final. The program supports 
innovative reform projects that hold 
promise as models for the resolution of 
important issues and problems in 
postsecondary education. Grants made 
under this program are expected to 
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contribute new information in 
educational practice that can be shared 
with others. As its name suggests, the 
Comprehensive program may support 
activities in any discipline, program, or 
student service. Nonprofit institutions 
and organizations offering 
postsecondary education programs are 
eligible applicants. The Comprehensive 
Program has established a record of 
meaningful and lasting improvement to 
access, retention, and quality in 
postsecondary education. 

Requests for copies of the submission 
for OMB review; comment request may 
be accessed from http://
edicsweb.ed.gov, by selecting the 
‘‘Browse Pending Collections’’ link and 
by clicking on link number 2177. When 
you access the information collection, 
click on ‘‘Download Attachments ‘‘ to 
view. Written requests for information 
should be addressed to Vivian Reese, 
Department of Education, 400 Maryland 
Avenue, SW., Room 4050, Regional 
Office Building 3, Washington, DC 
20202–4651 or to the e-mail address 
vivan.reese@ed.gov. Requests may also 
be electronically mailed to the internet 
address OCIO_RIMG@ed.gov or faxed to 
(202) 708–9346. Please specify the 
complete title of the information 
collection when making your request. 

Comments regarding burden and/or 
the collection activity requirements 
should be directed to SCHUBART at 
(202) 708–9266. Individuals who use a 
telecommunications device for the deaf 
(TDD) may call the Federal Information 
Relay Service (FIRS) at 1–800–877–
8339.

[FR Doc. 02–28247 Filed 11–5–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4000–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 12287–000] 

Notice of Application Accepted for 
Filing and Soliciting Motions To 
Intervene, Protests, and Comments 

October 31, 2002. 
Take notice that the following 

hydroelectric application has been filed 
with the Commission and is available 
for public inspection: 

a. Type of Application: Preliminary 
Permit. 

b. Project No.: 12287–000. 
c. Date filed: July 5, 2002. 
d. Applicant: Greybull Valley 

Irrigation District. 
e. Name of Project: Stonewall Project. 
f. Location: On the Wood River, in 

Park County, Wyoming, utilizing the 

supply canal of an existing dam owned 
by the applicant. Part the project is 
located on land administered by the 
U.S. Bureau of Land Management. 

g. Filed Pursuant to: Federal Power 
Act, 16 U.S.C. §§ 791(a)–825(r). 

h. Applicant Contact: Mr. Norman L. 
Preator, Chairman, Greybull Valley 
Irrigation District, 949 Highway 20 
West, P.O. Box 44, Emblem, WY 82422, 
(307)762–3317. 

i. FERC Contact: Robert Bell, (202) 
502–6062. 

j. Deadline for filing comments, 
protests, and motions to intervene: 60 
days from the issuance date of this 
notice. 

All documents (original and eight 
copies) should be filed with: Magalie R. 
Salas, Secretary, Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First 
Street, NE, Washington, DC 20426. 
Comments, protests, and interventions 
may be filed electronically via the 
Internet in lieu of paper; see 18 CFR 
385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the instructions 
on the Commission’s web site under the 
‘‘e-Filing’’ link. The Commission 
strongly encourages electronic filings. 
Please include the project number (P–
12287–000) on any comments or 
motions filed. 

The Commission’s rules of practice 
and procedure require all interveners 
filing documents with the Commission 
to serve a copy of that document on 
each person in the official service list 
for the project. Further, if an intervener 
files comments or documents with the 
Commission relating to the merits of an 
issue that may affect the responsibilities 
of a particular resource agency, they 
must also serve a copy of the document 
on that resource agency. 

k. Description of Project: The 
proposed project would consist of: (1) A 
proposed intake structure from the 
canal, (2) a proposed 1,500-foot-long 
penstock, (3) a proposed powerhouse 
containing one generating unit with an 
installed capacity of 2.5 MW, (4) a 
proposed 3-mile-long 15kV transmission 
line, and (5) appurtenant facilities. 

Applicant estimates that the average 
annual generation would be 2 GWh and 
would be sold to a local utility. 

l. This filing is available for review at 
the Commission in the Public Reference 
Room or may be viewed on the 
Commission’s Web site at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘FERRIS’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. For 
assistance, call toll-free 1–866–208–
3676 or e-mail 
FERCONLINESUPPORT@FERC.GOV. 
For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. A copy is 
also available for inspection and 

reproduction at the address in item h 
above. 

m. Competing Preliminary Permit—
Anyone desiring to file a competing 
application for preliminary permit for a 
proposed project must submit the 
competing application itself, or a notice 
of intent to file such an application, to 
the Commission on or before the 
specified comment date for the 
particular application (see 18 CFR 4.36). 
Submission of a timely notice of intent 
allows an interested person to file the 
competing preliminary permit 
application no later than 30 days after 
the specified comment date for the 
particular application. A competing 
preliminary permit application must 
conform with 18 CFR 4.30(b) and 4.36. 

n. Competing Development 
Application—Any qualified 
development applicant desiring to file a 
competing development application 
must submit to the Commission, on or 
before a specified comment date for the 
particular application, either a 
competing development application or a 
notice of intent to file such an 
application. Submission of a timely 
notice of intent to file a development 
application allows an interested person 
to file the competing application no 
later than 120 days after the specified 
comment date for the particular 
application. A competing license 
application must conform with 18 CFR 
4.30(b) and 4.36. 

o. Notice of Intent—A notice of intent 
must specify the exact name, business 
address, and telephone number of the 
prospective applicant, and must include 
an unequivocal statement of intent to 
submit, if such an application may be 
filed, either a preliminary permit 
application or a development 
application (specify which type of 
application). A notice of intent must be 
served on the applicant(s) named in this 
public notice. 

p. Proposed Scope of Studies under 
Permit—A preliminary permit, if issued, 
does not authorize construction. The 
term of the proposed preliminary permit 
would be 36 months. The work 
proposed under the preliminary permit 
would include economic analysis, 
preparation of preliminary engineering 
plans, and a study of environmental 
impacts. Based on the results of these 
studies, the Applicant would decide 
whether to proceed with the preparation 
of a development application to 
construct and operate the project. 

q. Comments, Protests, or Motions to 
Intervene—Anyone may submit 
comments, a protest, or a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214. 
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