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expansion, including information on 
increased market access and export 
opportunities for products in these 
subsectors. The Commission will 
provide this report to the USTR by 
February 15, 2013. 

Public Hearing: A public hearing in 
connection with investigation No. 332– 
536 will be held at the U.S. 
International Trade Commission 
Building, 500 E Street SW., Washington, 
DC, beginning at 9:30 a.m. on November 
8, 2012. Requests to appear at the public 
hearing should be filed with the 
Secretary no later than 5:15 p.m., 
October 31, 2012. All pre-hearing briefs 
and statements should be filed no later 
than 5:15 p.m. November 2, 2012; and 
all post-hearing briefs and statements 
should be filed no later than 5:15 p.m. 
November 20, 2012. All such briefs and 
statements should otherwise comply 
with the filing requirements in the 
‘‘Submissions’’ section below. In the 
event that, as of the close of business on 
October 31, 2012, no witnesses are 
scheduled to appear at the hearing, the 
hearing will be canceled. Any person 
interested in attending the hearing as an 
observer or nonparticipant should 
contact the Office of the Secretary at 
202–205–2000 after October 31, 2012, 
for information concerning whether the 
hearing will be held. 

Written Submissions: Interested 
parties are invited to file written 
submissions concerning both 
investigations. For investigation No. 
332–532, interested parties are asked to 
provide information on (1) the ICT and 
non-ICT purposes for which products 
on the attached list are used, and (2) 
indicate which products they view as 
import-sensitive. Written submissions 
relating to investigation No. 332–532 
should be received not later than 5:15 
p.m., September 6, 2012. Written 
submission relating to investigation No. 
332–536 should be received not later 
than 5:15 p.m., November 20, 2012. 

Written submissions filed in 
connection with the respective 
investigations should focus on 
providing information of the kind 
described above that is relevant to the 
respective investigations and reports. 
All written submissions should be 
addressed to the Secretary. All written 
submissions must conform to the 
provisions of section 201.8 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (19 CFR 201.8). Section 201.8 
and the Commission’s Handbook on 
Filing Procedures require that interested 
parties file documents electronically on 
or before the filing deadline and submit 
eight (8) true paper copies by 12:00 
noon eastern time on the next business 
day. In the event that confidential 

treatment of a document is requested, 
interested parties must file, at the same 
time as the eight paper copies, at least 
four (4) additional true paper copies in 
which the confidential information 
must be deleted (see the following 
paragraph for further information 
regarding confidential business 
information). Persons with questions 
regarding electronic filing should 
contact the Secretary (202–205–2000). 

Any submissions that contain 
confidential business information must 
also conform to the requirements of 
section 201.6 of the Commission’s Rules 
of Practice and Procedure (19 CFR 
201.6). Section 201.6 of the rules 
requires that the cover of the document 
and the individual pages be clearly 
marked as to whether they are the 
‘‘confidential’’ or ‘‘non-confidential’’ 
version, and that the confidential 
business information be clearly 
identified by means of brackets. All 
written submissions, except for 
confidential business information, will 
be made available for inspection by 
interested parties. 

In his request letter the USTR said 
that it is the intent of his office to make 
the Commission’s reports available to 
the public in their entirety, and asked 
that the Commission not include any 
confidential business information. 
Accordingly, any confidential business 
information received by the 
Commission in these investigations and 
used in preparing the respective reports 
will not be included in the reports that 
the Commission sends to the USTR and 
will not be published in a manner that 
would reveal the operations of the firm 
supplying the information. 

Issued: August 8, 2012. 
By order of the Commission. 

Lisa R. Barton, 
Acting Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2012–19791 Filed 8–10–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[USITC SE–12–024] 

Government in the Sunshine Act 
Meeting Notice 

AGENCY HOLDING THE MEETING: United 
States International Trade Commission. 
TIME AND DATE: August 21, 2012 at 9:30 
a.m. 
PLACE: Room 101, 500 E Street SW., 
Washington, DC 20436, Telephone: 
(202) 205–2000. 
STATUS: Open to the public. 
MATTERS TO BE CONSIDERED:  

1. Agendas for future meetings: None. 
2. Minutes. 
3. Ratification List. 
4. Vote in Inv. No. 731–TA–709 

(Third Review) (Certain Seamless 
Carbon and Alloy Steel Standard, Line, 
and Pressure Pipe from Germany). The 
Commission is currently scheduled to 
transmit its determination and 
Commissioners’’ opinions to the 
Secretary of Commerce on or before 
August 30, 2012. 

5. Outstanding action jackets: None. 
In accordance with Commission 

policy, subject matter listed above, not 
disposed of at the scheduled meeting, 
may be carried over to the agenda of the 
following meeting. 

Issued: August 8, 2012. 
By order of the Commission. 

William R. Bishop, 
Hearings and Meetings Coordinator. 
[FR Doc. 2012–19850 Filed 8–9–12; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Notice of Lodging of Consent Decree 
Pursuant to Comprehensive 
Environmental Response, 
Compensation, and Liability Act 

Notice is hereby given that on August 
6, 2012, a proposed Consent Decree in 
United States of America v. The Gillette 
Company, et al., Civil Action No. 1:12– 
cv–01247–MAD–TWD, was lodged with 
the United States District Court for the 
Northern District of New York. 

The proposed Consent Decree is 
between Plaintiff the United States of 
America, and the following Defendants: 
The Gillette Company; KeySpan Gas 
East Corporation (d/b/a National Grid); 
Energizer Battery Manufacturing, Inc.; 
Union Carbide Corporation; Spectrum 
Brands, Inc.; Brambles Environmental, 
Inc.; Clean Harbors Environmental 
Services, Inc.; Qwest Communications 
International, Inc.; Verizon New York, 
Inc.; 26 Railroad Ave., Inc.; A.P. 
Pharma, Inc.; Ajinomoto North America, 
Inc.; Allegheny Ludlum, LLC; Amresco, 
LLC; Arizona Chemical Company, LLC; 
Atmos Energy Corporation; Battery 
Broker Environmental Services, Inc.; 
Buffalo Optical Co.; Cameron 
International Corp; Chemtron Corp.; 
City of Lakeland; City of North 
Tonawanda; City of Richmond; Dukane 
Corp.; East Side Jersey Dairy, Inc.; 
FirstEnergy Corp.; Glit, Division of CCP, 
LLC; Harding Metals, Inc.; Honeywell 
International, Inc.; Johnson Controls, 
Inc.; Los Angeles Unified School 
District; MDI, Inc.; Memphis Light, Gas 
& Water Division; Metalor Technologies 
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