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and suggestions from the public and 
affected agencies regarding items 
contained in this notice and especially 
with regard to the estimated public 
burden and associated response time 
should be directed to the Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget. 
Comments should be addressed to OMB 
Desk Officer, for United States 
Immigration and Customs Enforcement, 
Department of Homeland Security, and 
sent via electronic mail to 
oira_submission@omb.eop.gov or faxed 
to (202) 395–6974. 

Written comments and suggestions 
from the public and affected agencies 
concerning the proposed collection of 
information should address one or more 
of the following four points: 

(1) Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agencies estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
Extension of a currently approved 
information collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: 
Immigration Bond. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department of Homeland Security 
sponsoring the collection: Form I–352. 
U.S. Immigration and Customs 
Enforcement. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: Individuals or 
Households and Businesses. The data 
collected through this collection 
instrument is used by U.S. Immigration 
and Customs Enforcement to ensure that 
the person or company posting the bond 
is aware of the duties and 
responsibilities associated with the 
bond. The collection instrument serves 
the purpose of instruction in the 

completion of the form, together with an 
explanation of the terms and conditions 
of bond. Sureties will have the 
capability of accessing, completing and 
submitting a bond electronically 
through ICE’s eBonds initiative which 
encompasses the I–352, while 
individuals and households will still be 
required to complete the bond form 
manually. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: 25,000 responses at 30 minutes 
(.50 hours) per response. 

(6) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: 12,500 annual burden hours. 

Requests for a copy of the proposed 
information collection instrument, with 
instructions; or inquiries for additional 
information should be directed to: 
Joseph M. Gerhart, Chief, Records 
Management Branch; U.S. Immigration 
and Customs Enforcement, 500 12th 
Street, SW., Room 3138, Washington, 
DC 20024; (202) 732–6337. 

Dated: January 8, 2009. 
Joseph M. Gerhart, 
Chief, Records Management Branch, U.S. 
Immigration and Customs Enforcement, 
Department of Homeland Security. 
[FR Doc. E9–602 Filed 1–13–09; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 9111–28–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

Bureau of Land Management 

[F–14891–B; AK–964–1410–KC–P] 

Alaska Native Claims Selection 

AGENCY: Bureau of Land Management, 
Interior. 
ACTION: Notice of decision approving 
lands for conveyance. 

SUMMARY: As required by 43 CFR 
2650.7(d), notice is hereby given that an 
appealable decision approving lands for 
conveyance pursuant to the Alaska 
Native Claims Settlement Act will be 
issued to Bean Ridge Corporation. The 
lands are in the vicinity of Manley Hot 
Springs, Alaska, and are located in: 

Fairbanks Meridian, Alaska 

T. 1 N., R. 14 W., 
Tract R; 
Secs. 34, 35, and 36. 

Containing approximately 1,486 acres. 
T. 2 N., R. 14 W., 

Secs. 28 and 33. 

Containing approximately 1,264 acres. 
T. 3 N., R. 14 W., 

Secs. 11 and 12; 
Secs. 14 and 15; 

Sec. 21. 

Containing approximately 3,200 acres. 

T. 2 N., R. 16 W., 
Secs. 1 and 2; 
Secs. 11 and 12. 

Containing approximately 2,519 acres. 

T. 2 N., R. 17 W., 
Sec. 25, lot 2; 
Sec. 26, lot 2; 
Sec. 33, lots 2 and 3; 
Sec. 34, lots 1, 3, and 4; 
Sec. 35. 

Containing approximately 1,249 acres. 

T. 1 S., R. 14 W., 
Secs. 1, 2, and 3. 

Containing approximately 1,221 acres. 

Aggregating approximately 10,938 
acres. 

The subsurface estate in these lands 
will be conveyed to Doyon, Limited, 
when the surface estate is conveyed to 
Bean Ridge Corporation. Notice of the 
decision will also be published four 
times in the Fairbanks Daily News- 
Miner. 

DATES: The time limits for filing an 
appeal are: 

1. Any party claiming a property 
interest which is adversely affected by 
the decision shall have until February 
13, 2009 to file an appeal. 

2. Parties receiving service of the 
decision by certified mail shall have 30 
days from the date of receipt to file an 
appeal. 

Parties who do not file an appeal in 
accordance with the requirements of 43 
CFR Part 4, Subpart E, shall be deemed 
to have waived their rights. 

ADDRESSES: A copy of the decision may 
be obtained from: Bureau of Land 
Management, Alaska State Office, 222 
West Seventh Avenue, #13, Anchorage, 
Alaska 99513–7504. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION, CONTACT: The 
Bureau of Land Management by phone 
at 907–271–5960, or by e-mail at 
ak.blm.conveyance@ak.blm.gov. Persons 
who use a telecommunication device 
(TTD) may call the Federal Information 
Relay Service (FIRS) at 1–800–877– 
8330, 24 hours a day, seven days a 
week, to contact the Bureau of Land 
Management. 

Barbara Opp Waldal, 
Land Law Examiner, Land Transfer 
Adjudication I. 
[FR Doc. E9–580 Filed 1–13–09; 8:45 am] 
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