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—Reporting Member Country 
Developments to the IA Secretariat.
9. Emergency Response Activities.

—Report on Preparations for the 
Upcoming MOS/JODI Meeting of 
Statisticians and Data Contacts. 

—Progress Report on the Proposed MOS 
Addendum on Bilateral Stock Tickets. 

—Oil Demand Restraint in the Transport 
Sector: An Analysis of Potential Fuel 
Savings.
10. Activities with Non-Member 

Countries and International 
Organizations.
—Participation of Non-Member 

Countries in ERE3 Training and 
Simulation Exercise. 

—Report on ZORD Conference on 
Compulsory Oil Stocks. 

—Situation and Developing Capabilities 
in Southeast Europe, Slovenia, Sept. 
2004. 

—Report on KZZZ Conference on 
Extended European Union-extended 
Security, Budapest, November 3–5, 
2004.
11. Other Documents for Information.

—Emergency Reserve Situation of IEA 
Member Countries on July 1, 2004. 

—Emergency Reserve Situation of IEA 
Candidate Countries on July 1, 2004. 

—Monthly Oil Statistics: July 2004. 
—Base Period Final Consumption: 

3Q2003–2Q2004. 
—Quarterly Oil Forecast. 
—Update of Emergency Contacts List.

12. Other Business.
—ERE3 Exercise with Governing Board, 

December 7, 2004. 
—Dates of Next Meetings. 
—March 15–17, 2005. 
—June 21–22, 2005. 
—November 15–17, 2005. 
—Changes in the Secretariat and 

Delegations.
As provided in section 252(c)(1)(A)(ii) 

of the Energy Policy and Conservation 
Act (42 U.S.C. 6272(c)(1)(A)(ii)), the 
meetings of the IAB are open to 
representatives of members of the IAB 
and their counsel; representatives of 
members of the IEA’s SEQ; 
representatives of the Departments of 
Energy, Justice, and State, the Federal 
Trade Commission, the General 
Accounting Office, Committees of 
Congress, the IEA, and the European 
Commission; and invitees of the IAB, 
the SEQ, or the IEA.

Issued in Washington, DC, October 12, 
2004. 
Samuel M. Bradley, 
Assistant General Counsel for International 
and National Security Programs.
[FR Doc. 04–23228 Filed 10–15–04; 8:45 am] 
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[Docket No. RP04–468–001] 

Algonquin Gas Transmission, LLC; 
Notice of Compliance Filing 

October 7, 2004. 
Take notice that on October 1, 2004, 

Algonquin Gas Transmission, LLC 
(Algonquin) submitted a compliance 
filing pursuant to the Commission’s 
Order in Algonquin Gas Transmission, 
LLC, 108 FERC ¶61,275 (2004), issued 
on September 21, 2004, in Docket No. 
RP04–468–000. 

Algonquin states that copies of the 
filing were served upon all affected 
customers of Algonquin and interested 
state commissions, as well as upon all 
parties on the Commission’s official 
service list in this proceeding. 

Any person desiring to protest this 
filing must file in accordance with Rule 
211 of the Commission’s Rules of 
Practice and Procedure (18 CFR 
385.211). Protests to this filing will be 
considered by the Commission in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but will not serve to make 
protestants parties to the proceeding. 
Such protests must be filed in 
accordance with the provisions of 
Section 154.210 of the Commission’s 
regulations (18 CFR 154.210). Anyone 
filing a protest must serve a copy of that 
document on all the parties to the 
proceeding. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests in lieu 
of paper using the ‘‘eFiling’’ link at 
http://www.ferc.gov. Persons unable to 
file electronically should submit an 
original and 14 copies of the protest to 
the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 888 First Street, NE., 
Washington, DC 20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–2677 Filed 10–15–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket Nos. PL04–15–000, RM02–12–000, 
RM02–1–001, RM02–1–005] 

Interconnection for Wind Energy and 
Other Alternative Technologies; 
Standardization of Small Generator 
Interconnection Agreements and 
Procedures; Standardizing Generator 
Interconnection Agreements and 
Procedures; Notice Regarding Post-
Technical Conference Comments 

October 7, 2004. 
On September 24, 2004, the 

Commission held a technical conference 
in the above-referenced dockets 
regarding the issues raised by a petition 
for rulemaking submitted by the 
American Wind Energy Association 
(AWEA) related to the adoption of 
certain requirements for the 
interconnection of large wind 
generators. Specifically, the conference 
focused on the interconnection of wind 
energy and other alternative 
technologies, and considered the 
technical requirements for the 
interconnection of large and small wind 
generators and other alternative 
technologies, and the need for creating 
specific requirements for their 
interconnection to the grid. A transcript 
of the technical conference will be 
available in the near future from the 
Commission’s Web site, http://
www.ferc.gov. 

At the technical conference, Staff 
stated that the Commission would allow 
interested parties to file post-technical 
conference comments. These comments 
must be filed with the Commission no 
later than 5 p.m. Eastern Standard Time 
(EST) on November 1, 2004.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–2669 Filed 10–15–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RP00–305–018] 

CenterPoint Energy—Mississippi River 
Transmission Corporation; Notice of 
Negotiated Rate 

October 7, 2004. 
Take notice that on September 30, 

2004, CenterPoint Energy—Mississippi 
River Transmission Corporation (MRT) 
tendered for filing and approval a 
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