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(Respondent) requesting that the 
Commission find that sections of the 
Respondent’s Financial Obligations of 
Withdrawing Members Bylaws and 
Membership Agreement, as applied to 
Independent Power Producer and other 
similarly situated non-transmission 
owners and non-load-serving entities, 
are unlawful, unjust and unreasonable, 
and unduly discriminatory, as more 
fully explained in the complaint. 

Complainants certify that a copy of 
the complaint has been served on the 
contacts for the Respondent as listed on 
the Commission’s website in the list of 
Corporate Officials. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. The Respondent’s answer 
and all interventions, or protests must 
be filed on or before the comment date. 
The Respondent’s answer, motions to 
intervene, and protests must be served 
on the Complainant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 5 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
electronic review in the Commission’s 
Public Reference Room in Washington, 
DC. There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on 
the website that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on November 23, 2018. 

Dated: November 6, 2018. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2018–24702 Filed 11–9–18; 8:45 am] 
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Notice of Filing; Southern California 
Edison Company, Appalachian Power 
Company, Arizona Public Service, 
Indiana Michigan Power Company, 
Kentucky Power Company, Pacific Gas 
and Electric Company, PNM 
Resources, Public Service Company of 
Colorado, Puget Sound Energy, San 
Diego Gas & Electric Company, South 
Carolina Electric & Gas Company, 
Southwestern Electric Power 
Company, Southwestern Public 
Service Company, Wheeling Power 
Company 

Take notice that on November 5, 
2018, Southern California Edison 
Company, Appalachian Power 
Company, Arizona Public Service, 
Indiana Michigan Power Company, 
Kentucky Power Company, Pacific Gas 
and Electric Company, PNM Resources, 
Public Service Company of Colorado, 
Puget Sound Energy, San Diego Gas & 
Electric Company, South Carolina 
Electric & Gas Company, Southwestern 
Electric Power Company, Southwestern 
Public Service Company, and Wheeling 
Power Company (collectively, the Joint 
Requesters), filed a request for approval 
to use Account 439, authorized by the 
Financial Accounting Standards Board. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. Anyone filing a motion 
to intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 5 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 

Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
website that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comments: 5:00 p.m. Eastern Time on 
November 26, 2018. 

Dated: November 6, 2018. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2018–24706 Filed 11–9–18; 8:45 am] 
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ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OECA–2011–0256; FRL–9986– 
00–OEI] 

Information Collection Request 
Submitted to OMB for Review and 
Approval; Comment Request; 
Emission Guidelines for Existing Other 
Solid Waste Incineration Units 
(Renewal) 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA) has submitted an 
information collection request (ICR), 
Emission Guidelines for Existing Other 
Solid Waste Incineration Units (EPA 
ICR No. 2164.06, OMB Control No. 
2060–0562), to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB), for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act. This is a 
proposed extension of the ICR, which is 
currently approved through November 
30, 2018. Public comments were 
previously requested, via the Federal 
Register on June 29, 2017, during a 60- 
day comment period. This notice allows 
for an additional 30 days for public 
comments. A fuller description of the 
ICR is given below, including its 
estimated burden and cost to the public. 
An agency may neither conduct nor 
sponsor, and a person is not required to 
respond to, a collection of information 
unless it displays a currently valid OMB 
control number. 
DATES: Additional comments may be 
submitted on or before December 13, 
2018. 

ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
referencing Docket ID Number EPA– 
HQ–OECA–2011–0256, to: (1) EPA 
online using www.regulations.gov (our 
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