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DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. EF08–5191–000] 

Western Area Power Administration; 
Notice of Filing 

October 11, 2007. 

Take notice that on October 2, 2007, 
the Deputy Secretary of the Department 
of Energy, pursuant to the authority 
vested on the Deputy Secretary by 
Delegation Order No. 00–037.00, 
submitted for confirmation and 
approval on a final basis, Rate Order No. 
WAPA–130 and Rate Schedules INT– 
FT4 and INT–NFT3, for firm and 
nonfirm transmission service on the 
Pacific Northwest-Pacific Southwest 
Intertie Project, effective October 1, 
2007 and ending September 30, 2012. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. On or before the 
comment date, it is not necessary to 
serve motions to intervene or protests 
on persons other than the Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on November 1, 2007. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E7–20531 Filed 10–17–07; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OECA–2007–0045; FRL–8483–9] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to OMB for 
Review and Approval; Comment 
Request; NSPS for Phosphate Rock 
Plants (Renewal); EPA ICR Number 
1078.08, OMB Control Number 2060– 
0111 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In compliance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (44 U.S.C. 
3501 et seq.), this document announces 
that an Information Collection Request 
(ICR) has been forwarded to the Office 
of Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval. This is a request 
to renew an existing approved 
collection. The ICR which is abstracted 
below describes the nature of the 
collection and the estimated burden and 
cost. 
DATES: Additional comments may be 
submitted on or before November 19, 
2007. 

ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
referencing docket ID number EPA–HQ– 
OECA–2007–0045, to (1) EPA online 
using http://www.regulations.gov (our 
preferred method), or by e-mail to 
docket.oeca@epa.gov, or by mail to: EPA 
Docket Center (EPA/DC), Environmental 
Protection Agency, Enforcement and 
Compliance Docket and Information 
Center, mail code 2201T, 1200 
Pennsylvania Avenue, NW., 
Washington, DC 20460, and (2) OMB at: 
Office of Information and Regulatory 
Affairs, Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB), Attention: Desk Officer 
for EPA, 725 17th Street, NW., 
Washington, DC 20503. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Learia Williams, Compliance 
Assessment and Media Programs 
Division, Office of Compliance, Mail 
Code 2223A, Environmental Protection 
Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania Avenue, 
NW., Washington, DC 20460; telephone 
number: (202) 564–4113; fax number: 
(202) 564–0050; e-mail address: 
williams.learia@epa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: EPA has 
submitted the following ICR to OMB for 
review and approval according to the 
procedures prescribed in 5 CFR 1320.12. 
On March 9, 2007 (72 FR 10735), EPA 
sought comments on this ICR pursuant 
to 5 CFR 1320.8(d). EPA received no 
comments. Any additional comments on 
this ICR should be submitted to EPA 
and OMB within 30 days of this notice. 

EPA has established a public docket 
for this ICR under docket ID number 
EPA–HQ–OECA–2007–0045, which is 
available for public viewing online at 
http://www.regulations.gov, or in person 
viewing at the Enforcement and 
Compliance Docket and Information 
Center in the EPA Docket Center (EPA/ 
DC), EPA West, Room 3334, 1301 
Constitution Avenue, NW., Washington, 
DC. The EPA Docket Center Public 
Reading Room is open from 8:30 a.m. to 
4:30 p.m., Monday through Friday, 
excluding legal holidays. The telephone 
number for the Reading Room is (202) 
566–1744, and the telephone number for 
the Enforcement and Compliance 
Docket is (202) 566–1752. 

Use EPA’s electronic docket and 
comment system at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, to submit or view 
public comments, access the index 
listing of the contents of the docket, and 
to access those documents in the docket 
that are available electronically. Once in 
the system, select ‘‘docket search,’’ then 
key in the docket ID number identified 
above. Please note that EPA’s policy is 
that public comments, whether 
submitted electronically or in paper, 
will be made available for public 
viewing at http://www.regulations.gov 
as EPA receives them and without 
change, unless the comment contains 
copyrighted material, confidential 
business information (CBI) or other 
information whose public disclosure is 
restricted by statute. For further 
information about the electronic docket, 
go to http://www.regulations.gov. 

Title: NSPS for Phosphate Rock Plants 
(Renewal). 

ICR Numbers: EPA ICR Number 
1078.08, OMB Control Number 2060– 
0111. 

ICR Status: This ICR is scheduled to 
expire on November 30, 2007. Under 
OMB regulations, the Agency may 
continue to conduct or sponsor the 
collection of information while this 
submission is pending at OMB. An 
Agency may not conduct or sponsor, 
and a person is not required to respond 
to, a collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. The OMB control numbers for 
EPA’s regulations in title 40 of the CFR, 
after appearing in the Federal Register 
when approved, are listed in 40 CFR 
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