
37941 Federal Register / Vol. 85, No. 122 / Wednesday, June 24, 2020 / Notices 

esubscription.asp to be notified via 
email of new filings and issuances 
related to this or other pending projects. 
For assistance, contact FERC Online 
Support. 

n. Anyone may submit comments, a 
protest, or a motion to intervene in 
accordance with the requirements of 
Rules of Practice and Procedure, 18 CFR 
385.210, .211, and .214. In determining 
the appropriate action to take, the 
Commission will consider all protests or 
other comments filed, but only those 
who file a motion to intervene in 
accordance with the Commission’s 
Rules may become a party to the 
proceeding. Any comments, protests, or 
motions to intervene must be received 
on or before the specified comment date 
for the particular application. 

When the application is ready for 
environmental analysis, the 
Commission will issue a public notice 
requesting comments, 
recommendations, terms and 
conditions, or prescriptions. 

All filings must (1) bear in all capital 
letters the title PROTEST or MOTION 
TO INTERVENE, (2) set forth in the 
heading the name of the applicant and 
the project number of the application to 
which the filing responds; (3) furnish 
the name, address, and telephone 
number of the person protesting or 
intervening; and (4) otherwise comply 
with the requirements of 18 CFR 
385.2001 through 385.2005. Agencies 
may obtain copies of the application 
directly from the applicant. A copy of 
any protest or motion to intervene must 
be served upon each representative of 
the applicant specified in the particular 
application. 

o. Procedural schedule: The 
application will be processed according 
to the following schedule. Revisions to 
the schedule will be made as 
appropriate. 

Milestone Target date 

Issue Scoping Document 1 
for comments.

August 2020. 

Issue Scoping Document 2 (if 
necessary).

October 2020. 

Issue notice of ready for en-
vironmental analysis.

October 2020. 

Issue Single EA ..................... April 2021. 
Comments on EA .................. May 2021. 

Dated: June 17, 2020. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–13558 Filed 6–23–20; 8:45 am] 
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Cedar Springs Wind III, LLC; 
Supplemental Notice That Initial 
Market-Based Rate Filing Includes 
Request for Blanket Section 204 
Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced Cedar Springs Wind 
III, LLC’s application for market-based 
rate authority, with an accompanying 
rate tariff, noting that such application 
includes a request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability, is July 8, 2020. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http://
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
may mail similar pleadings to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. Hand delivered submissions in 
docketed proceedings should be 
delivered to Health and Human 
Services, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
ferc.gov) using the eLibrary link. Enter 
the docket number excluding the last 
three digits in the docket number field 

to access the document. At this time, the 
Commission has suspended access to 
the Commission’s Public Reference 
Room, due to the proclamation 
declaring a National Emergency 
concerning the Novel Coronavirus 
Disease (COVID–19), issued by the 
President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Dated: June 18, 2020. 
Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–13624 Filed 6–23–20; 8:45 am] 
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Gichi Noodin Wind Farm, LLC; 
Supplemental Notice That Initial 
Market-Based Rate Filing Includes 
Request for Blanket Section 204 
Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced Gichi Noodin Wind 
Farm, LLC’s application for market- 
based rate authority, with an 
accompanying rate tariff, noting that 
such application includes a request for 
blanket authorization, under 18 CFR 
part 34, of future issuances of securities 
and assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability, is July 8, 2020. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http://
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 18:20 Jun 23, 2020 Jkt 250001 PO 00000 Frm 00122 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\24JNN1.SGM 24JNN1jb
el

l o
n 

D
S

K
JL

S
W

7X
2P

R
O

D
 w

ith
 N

O
T

IC
E

S

mailto:FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov
http://www.ferc.gov
http://www.ferc.gov
http://www.ferc.gov
http://www.ferc.gov
http://ferc.gov
http://ferc.gov

		Superintendent of Documents
	2020-06-24T05:19:32-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




