
57494 Federal Register / Vol. 87, No. 181 / Tuesday, September 20, 2022 / Notices 

requirements that are comparable to and 
no less stringent than the federal 
requirements. EPA has also determined 
that Arizona’s program revision request 
meets all of the regulatory requirements 
for approval, as set forth in 40 CFR 
142.12, including a side-by-side 
comparison of the Federal requirements 
demonstrating the corresponding 
Arizona authorities, additional materials 
to support special primacy requirements 
of 40 CFR 142.16, a review of the 
requirements contained in 40 CFR 
142.10 necessary for States to attain and 
retain primary enforcement 
responsibility, and a statement by the 
Arizona Attorney General certifying that 
Arizona’s laws and regulations to carry 
out the program revision were duly 
adopted and are enforceable. The 
Attorney General’s statement also 
affirms that Arizona’s audit privilege 
law does not impact Arizona’s ability to 
implement or enforce the Arizona laws 
and regulations pertaining to the 
program revision. This finding relies 
upon the analysis contained in the letter 
from the Office of the Attorney General 
to the EPA Region 9 Water Division 
Director, dated January 28, 2019, 
regarding its environmental audit 
privilege law. Therefore, EPA approves 
this revision of Arizona’s approved 
State primacy program. The Technical 
Support Document, which provides 
EPA’s analysis of Arizona’s program 
revision request, is available by 
submitting a request to the following 
email address: R9dw-program@epa.gov. 
Please note ‘‘Technical Support 
Document’’ in the subject line of the 
email. 

Public Process. Any interested person 
may request a public hearing on this 
determination. A request for a public 
hearing must be received or postmarked 
before October 20, 2022 and addressed 
to the Regional Administrator of EPA 
Region 9, via the following email 
address: R9dw-program@epa.gov, or by 
contacting the EPA Region 9 contact 
person listed above in this notice by 
telephone if you do not have access to 
email. Please note ‘‘Arizona Program 
Revision Determination’’ in the subject 
line of the email. The Regional 
Administrator may deny frivolous or 
insubstantial requests for a hearing. If a 
timely request for a public hearing is 
made, then EPA Region 9 may hold a 
public hearing. Any request for a public 
hearing shall include the following 
information: 1. The name, address, and 
telephone number of the individual, 
organization, or other entity requesting 
a hearing; 2. A brief statement of the 
requesting person’s interest in the 
Regional Administrator’s determination 

and of information that the requesting 
person intends to submit at such 
hearing; and 3. The signature of the 
individual making the request, or, if the 
request is made on behalf of an 
organization or other entity, the 
signature of a responsible official of the 
organization or other entity. 

If EPA Region 9 does not receive a 
timely request for a hearing or a request 
for a hearing was denied by the Regional 
Administrator for being frivolous or 
insubstantial, and the Regional 
Administrator does not elect to hold a 
hearing on their own motion, EPA’s 
approval shall become final and 
effective on October 20, 2022, and no 
further public notice will be issued. 

Authority: Section 1413 of the Safe 
Drinking Water Act, as amended, 42 
U.S.C. 300g–2 (1996), and 40 CFR part 
142 of the National Primary Drinking 
Water Regulations. 

Dated: September 13, 2022. 
Deborah Jordan, 
Acting Regional Administrator, EPA Region 
9. 
[FR Doc. 2022–20263 Filed 9–19–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPP–2021–0083; FRL–9409–05– 
OCSPP] 

Pesticide Product Registration; 
Receipt of Applications for New Active 
Ingredients (August 2022) 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: EPA has received applications 
to register pesticide products containing 
active ingredients not included in any 
currently registered pesticide products. 
Pursuant to the Federal Insecticide, 
Fungicide, and Rodenticide Act 
(FIFRA), EPA is hereby providing notice 
of receipt and opportunity to comment 
on these applications. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before October 21, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPP–2021–0083, 
through the Federal eRulemaking Portal 
at https://www.regulations.gov. Follow 
the online instructions for submitting 
comments. Do not submit electronically 
any information you consider to be 
Confidential Business Information (CBI) 
or other information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Additional 
instructions on commenting and visiting 
the docket, along with more information 

about dockets generally, is available at 
https://www.epa.gov/dockets. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Charles Smith, Biopesticides and 
Pollution Prevention Division (BPPD) 
(7511M), main telephone number: (202) 
566–1400, email address: 
BPPDFRNotices@epa.gov. The mailing 
address for each contact person is Office 
of Pesticide Programs, Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave. NW, Washington, DC 20460–0001. 
As part of the mailing address, include 
the contact person’s name, division, and 
mail code. The division to contact is 
listed at the end of each application 
summary. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. General Information 

A. Does this action apply to me? 

You may be potentially affected by 
this action if you are an agricultural 
producer, food manufacturer, or 
pesticide manufacturer. The following 
list of North American Industrial 
Classification System (NAICS) codes is 
not intended to be exhaustive, but rather 
provides a guide to help readers 
determine whether this document 
applies to them. Potentially affected 
entities may include: 

• Crop production (NAICS code 111). 
• Animal production (NAICS code 

112). 
• Food manufacturing (NAICS code 

311). 

B. What should I consider as I prepare 
my comments for EPA? 

1. Submitting CBI. Do not submit this 
information to EPA through 
regulations.gov or email. Clearly mark 
the part or all of the information that 
you claim to be CBI. For CBI 
information in a disk or CD–ROM that 
you mail to EPA, mark the outside of the 
disk or CD–ROM as CBI and then 
identify electronically within the disk or 
CD–ROM the specific information that 
is claimed as CBI. In addition to one 
complete version of the comment that 
includes information claimed as CBI, a 
copy of the comment that does not 
contain the information claimed as CBI 
must be submitted for inclusion in the 
public docket. Information so marked 
will not be disclosed except in 
accordance with procedures set forth in 
40 CFR part 2. 

2. Tips for preparing your comments. 
When preparing and submitting your 
comments, see the commenting tips at 
https://www.epa.gov/dockets/ 
commenting-epa-dockets. 
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II. Registration Applications 

EPA has received applications to 
register pesticide products containing 
active ingredients not included in any 
currently registered pesticide products. 
Pursuant to the provisions of FIFRA 
section 3(c)(4) (7 U.S.C. 136a(c)(4)), EPA 
is hereby providing notice of receipt and 
opportunity to comment on these 
applications. Notice of receipt of these 
applications does not imply a decision 
by the Agency on these applications. 
For actions being evaluated under EPA’s 
public participation process for 
registration actions, there will be an 
additional opportunity for public 
comment on the proposed decisions. 
Please see EPA’s public participation 
website for additional information on 
this process (https://www2.epa.gov/ 
pesticide-registration/public- 
participation-process-registration- 
actions). 

New Active Ingredients 

1. File Symbol: 94473–R, E, G. Docket 
ID number: EPA–HQ–OPP–2022–0504. 
Applicant: Crop Enhancement, 2186 
Bering Drive, San Jose, California 95131. 
Product name: Raw Linseed Oil 
Technical (technical grade active 
ingredient), Cropcoat CX1098 (end use 
product), and Cropcoat (end use 
product). Active ingredient: Linseed oil 
at 99.7%, 54.0%, and 70.0%. Proposed 
classification/use: For control of mites 
and insects on terrestrial food crops, 
terrestrial non-food crops, turfs and 
ornamentals. Contact: BPPD. 

2. File Symbol: 99269–R. Docket ID 
number: EPA–HQ–OPP–2022–0743. 
Applicant: Columbia River Carbonates, 
300 North Pekin Road, Woodland, 
Washington 98674. Product name: 
MICRONA Shield WP. Active 
ingredient: Biochemical—Calcium 
carbonate at 98.8%. Proposed use: For 
use as a protective barrier against 
insects, sunburn, and heat stress. 
Contact: BPPD. 

Authority: 7 U.S.C. 136 et seq. 
Dated: September 14, 2022. 

Delores Barber, 
Director, Information Technology and 
Resources Management Division, Office of 
Program Support. 
[FR Doc. 2022–20327 Filed 9–19–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 

Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The public portions of the 
applications listed below, as well as 
other related filings required by the 
Board, if any, are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank(s) indicated below and at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
This information may also be obtained 
on an expedited basis, upon request, by 
contacting the appropriate Federal 
Reserve Bank and from the Board’s 
Freedom of Information Office at 
https://www.federalreserve.gov/foia/ 
request.htm. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on the 
standards enumerated in the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). 

Comments regarding each of these 
applications must be received at the 
Reserve Bank indicated or the offices of 
the Board of Governors, Ann E. 
Misback, Secretary of the Board, 20th 
Street and Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20551–0001, not later 
than October 19, 2022. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of St. Louis 
(Holly A. Rieser, Senior Manager) P.O. 
Box 442, St. Louis, Missouri 63166– 
2034. Comments can also be sent 
electronically to 
Comments.applications@stls.frb.org: 

1. First Waterloo Bancshares, Inc., 
Waterloo, Illinois; to merge with Village 
Bancshares, Inc., and thereby indirectly 
acquire The Village Bank, both of Saint 
Libory, Illinois. 

B. Federal Reserve Bank of Kansas 
City (Jeffrey Imgarten, Assistant Vice 
President) 1 Memorial Drive, Kansas 
City, Missouri 64198–0001: 

1. AllBank Holding Company, Inc., 
Tulsa, Oklahoma; to become a bank 
holding company by acquiring the Bank 
of Locust Grove, Locust Grove, 
Oklahoma. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System. 

Michele Taylor Fennell, 
Deputy Associate Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2022–20238 Filed 9–19–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Change in Bank Control Notices; 
Acquisitions of Shares of a Bank or 
Bank Holding Company 

The notificants listed below have 
applied under the Change in Bank 
Control Act (Act) (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)) and 
§ 225.41 of the Board’s Regulation Y (12 
CFR 225.41) to acquire shares of a bank 
or bank holding company. The factors 
that are considered in acting on the 
applications are set forth in paragraph 7 
of the Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)(7)). 

The public portions of the 
applications listed below, as well as 
other related filings required by the 
Board, if any, are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank(s) indicated below and at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
This information may also be obtained 
on an expedited basis, upon request, by 
contacting the appropriate Federal 
Reserve Bank and from the Board’s 
Freedom of Information Office at 
https://www.federalreserve.gov/foia/ 
request.htm. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on the 
standards enumerated in paragraph 7 of 
the Act. 

Comments regarding each of these 
applications must be received at the 
Reserve Bank indicated or the offices of 
the Board of Governors, Ann E. 
Misback, Secretary of the Board, 20th 
Street and Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20551–0001, not later 
than October 5, 2022. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Cleveland 
(Bryan S. Huddleston, Vice President) 
1455 East Sixth Street, Cleveland, Ohio 
44101–2566, or electronically to 
Comments.applications@clev.frb.org: 

1. The John Romer Trust B, David J. 
Romer, individually, and as trustee, 
both of St. Henry, Ohio; to join the 
Romer Family Control Group, a group 
acting in concert, to retain voting shares 
of The St Henry Bancorp, Inc., and 
thereby indirectly retain voting shares of 
The St Henry Bank, both of Saint Henry, 
Ohio. 

B. Federal Reserve Bank of Chicago 
(Colette A. Fried, Assistant Vice 
President) 230 South LaSalle Street, 
Chicago, Illinois 60690–1414: 

1. Justin B. Danover, San Jose, 
California; Jeremy A. Danover, Los 
Angeles, California; Jacquelyn N. 
Danover, Catheryn J. Cooper, and Carli 
L. Cooper, all of Marion, Iowa; Cole D. 
Cooper, Denver, Colorado; Anne E. 
Gothard, Scottsdale, Arizona; Hallie S. 
Cooper and Bennett C. Cooper, both of 
Cedar Rapids, Iowa; Riley J. Cooper, 
Tyler N. Cooper, and a minor 
shareholder, all of Batavia, Illinois; to 
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