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accepting comments by mail. However, 
if you are unable to comment via 
regulations.gov, you may email us at 
request.schedule@nara.gov for 
instructions on submitting your 
comment. You must cite the control 
number of the schedule you wish to 
comment on. You can find the control 
number for each schedule in 
parentheses at the end of each 
schedule’s entry in the list at the end of 
this notice. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Kimberly Keravuori, Regulatory and 
External Policy Program Manager, by 
email at regulation_comments@
nara.gov. For information about records 
schedules, contact Records Management 
Operations by email at 
request.schedule@nara.gov or by phone 
at 301–837–1799. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Public Comment Procedures 

We are publishing notice of records 
schedules in which agencies propose to 
dispose of records they no longer need 
to conduct agency business. We invite 
public comments on these records 
schedules, as required by 44 U.S.C. 
3303a(a), and list the schedules at the 
end of this notice by agency and 
subdivision requesting disposition 
authority. 

In addition, this notice lists the 
organizational unit(s) accumulating the 
records or states that the schedule has 
agency-wide applicability. It also 
provides the control number assigned to 
each schedule, which you will need if 
you submit comments on that schedule. 
We have uploaded the records 
schedules and accompanying appraisal 
memoranda to the regulations.gov 
docket for this notice as ‘‘other’’ 
documents. Each records schedule 
contains a full description of the records 
at the file unit level as well as their 
proposed disposition. The appraisal 
memorandum for the schedule includes 
information about the records. 

We will post comments, including 
any personal information and 
attachments, to the public docket 
unchanged. Because comments are 
public, you are responsible for ensuring 
that you do not include any confidential 
or other information that you or a third 
party may not wish to be publicly 
posted. If you want to submit a 
comment with confidential information 
or cannot otherwise use the 
regulations.gov portal, you may contact 
request.schedule@nara.gov for 
instructions on submitting your 
comment. 

We will consider all comments 
submitted by the posted deadline and 

consult as needed with the Federal 
agency seeking the disposition 
authority. After considering comments, 
we will post on regulations.gov a 
‘‘Consolidated Reply’’ summarizing the 
comments, responding to them, and 
noting any changes we have made to the 
proposed records schedule. We will 
then send the schedule for final 
approval by the Archivist of the United 
States. You may elect at regulations.gov 
to receive updates on the docket, 
including an alert when we post the 
Consolidated Reply, whether or not you 
submit a comment. If you have a 
question, you can submit it as a 
comment, and can also submit any 
concerns or comments you would have 
to a possible response to the question. 
We will address these items in 
consolidated replies along with any 
other comments submitted on that 
schedule. 

We will post schedules on our 
website in the Records Control Schedule 
(RCS) Repository, at https://
www.archives.gov/records-mgmt/rcs, 
after the Archivist approves them. The 
RCS contains all schedules approved 
since 1973. 

Background 

Each year, Federal agencies create 
billions of records. To control this 
accumulation, agency records managers 
prepare schedules proposing retention 
periods for records and submit these 
schedules for NARA’s approval. Once 
approved by NARA, records schedules 
provide mandatory instructions on what 
happens to records when no longer 
needed for current Government 
business. The records schedules 
authorize agencies to preserve records of 
continuing value in the National 
Archives or to destroy, after a specified 
period, records lacking continuing 
administrative, legal, research, or other 
value. Some schedules are 
comprehensive and cover all the records 
of an agency or one of its major 
subdivisions. Most schedules, however, 
cover records of only one office or 
program or a few series of records. Many 
of these update previously approved 
schedules, and some include records 
proposed as permanent. 

Agencies may not destroy Federal 
records without the approval of the 
Archivist of the United States. The 
Archivist grants this approval only after 
thorough consideration of the records’ 
administrative use by the agency of 
origin, the rights of the Government and 
of private people directly affected by the 
Government’s activities, and whether or 
not the records have historical or other 
value. Public review and comment on 

these records schedules is part of the 
Archivist’s consideration process. 

Schedules Pending 

1. Department of Agriculture, 
Agricultural Marketing Service, Federal 
Milk Marketing Order Statistics Records 
(DAA–0136–2021–0007). 

2. Department of Defense, Office of 
the Secretary of Defense, Office of 
People Analytics Survey Files (DAA– 
0330–2021–0008). 

3. Department of Homeland Security, 
Science and Technology Directorate, 
Office of National Laboratories Records 
(DAA–0563–2019–0005). 

4. Securities and Exchange 
Commission, Office of International 
Affairs, Case Files (DAA–0266–2021– 
0009). 

Laurence Brewer, 
Chief Records Officer for the U.S. 
Government. 
[FR Doc. 2022–00933 Filed 1–18–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7515–01–P 

NATIONAL FOUNDATION ON THE 
ARTS AND THE HUMANITIES 

National Endowment for the Arts 

Notice per OMB Memoranda 22–08: 
Identification of Federal Financial 
Assistance Infrastructure Programs 
Subject to the Build America, Buy 
America Provisions of the 
Infrastructure Investment and Jobs Act 

AGENCY: National Foundation for the 
Arts and Humanities; National 
Endowment for the Arts. 
ACTION: Notice of report. 

SUMMARY: Per the ‘‘Build America, Buy 
America Act’’ (the ‘‘Act’’), federal 
entities are required to provide OMB 
and Congress a report listing all Federal 
financial assistance programs for 
infrastructure administered by the 
agency. This report is required to be 
published in the Federal Register. The 
NEA has no programs for infrastructure 
within the definition of the Act. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Brenna Berger, Director of Grants, 
National Endowment for the Arts, 400 
7th St. SW, Washington, DC 20506, 
Telephone: 202–682–5400. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: On 
November 15, 2021, President Biden 
signed into law the Infrastructure 
Investment and Jobs Act (IIJA), which 
includes the ‘‘Build America, Buy 
America Act’’ (the Act). This Act 
ensures that Federal infrastructure 
programs require the use of materials 
produced in the United States, increases 
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1 See Notice of the United States Postal Service 
of Submission of the Calculation of the FY 2021 
Assumed Federal Income Tax on Competitive 
Products, January 12, 2022. 

1 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(1). 
2 17 CFR 240.19b–4. 

the requirement for American-made 
content, and strengthens the waiver 
process associated with Buy American 
provisions. 

The Act requires that within 60 days 
of its enactment, each agency must 
submit to the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) and Congress a report 
(‘‘60-day report’’) listing all Federal 
financial assistance programs for 
infrastructure administered by the 
agency. In these 60-day reports, agencies 
are required to identify and provide a 
list of which of these programs are 
‘‘deficient,’’ as defined in the Act. 3 
These agency reports must also be 
published in the Federal Register. 

The NEA has reviewed its Federal 
financial assistance programs and has 
determined that it does not administer 
any financial assistance programs for 
infrastructure as defined under the Act. 
Nor were any deficient programs, as 
defined under the Act, identified. This 
information has been reported to 
Congress and OMB as required by the 
Act. 

Authority: 20 U.S.C. 959; Pub. L. 117– 
58 70913(a)(2). 

Dated: January 13, 2022. 
Meghan Jugder, 
Support Services Specialist, Office of 
Administrative Services & Contracts National 
Endowment for the Arts. 
[FR Doc. 2022–00926 Filed 1–18–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7537–01–P 

POSTAL REGULATORY COMMISSION 

[Docket No. T2022–1; Order No. 6091] 

Income Tax Review 

AGENCY: Postal Regulatory Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Commission is 
recognizing a recent Postal Service filing 
concerning the calculation of the 
assumed Federal income tax on 
competitive products income for Fiscal 
Year 2021. This notice informs the 
public of the filing, invites public 
comment, and takes other 
administrative steps. 
DATES: Comments are due: March 3, 
2022. 

ADDRESSES: Submit comments 
electronically via the Commission’s 
Filing Online system at http://
www.prc.gov. Those who cannot submit 
comments electronically should contact 
the person identified in the FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT section by 
telephone for advice on filing 
alternatives. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
David A. Trissell, General Counsel, at 
202–789–6820. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Table of Contents 

I. Introduction 
II. Notice of Commission Action 
III. Ordering Paragraphs 

I. Introduction 

In accordance with 39 U.S.C. 3634 
and 39 CFR 3060.40 et seq., the Postal 
Service filed its calculation of the 
assumed Federal income tax on 
competitive products income for Fiscal 
Year (FY) 2021.1 The calculation details 
the FY 2021 competitive product 
revenue and expenses, the competitive 
products net income before tax, and the 
assumed Federal income tax on that net 
income. 

II. Notice of Commission Action 

In accordance with 39 CFR 3060.42, 
the Commission establishes Docket No. 
T2022–1 to review the calculation of the 
assumed Federal income tax and 
supporting documentation. 

The Commission invites comments on 
whether the Postal Service’s filing in 
this docket is consistent with the 
policies of 39 U.S.C. 3634 and 39 CFR 
3060.40 et seq. Comments are due no 
later than March 3, 2022. The Postal 
Service’s filing can be accessed via the 
Commission’s website (http://
www.prc.gov). 

The Commission appoints Jennaca D. 
Upperman to serve as Public 
Representative in this docket. 

III. Ordering Paragraphs 

It is ordered: 
1. The Commission establishes Docket 

No. T2022–1 to consider the calculation 
of the assumed Federal income tax on 
competitive products for FY 2021. 

2. Pursuant to 39 U.S.C. 505, Jennaca 
D. Upperman is appointed to serve as an 
officer of the Commission to represent 
the interests of the general public in this 
proceeding (Public Representative). 

3. Comments are due no later than 
March 3, 2022. 

4. The Secretary shall arrange for 
publication of this Order in the Federal 
Register. 

By the Commission. 
Erica A. Barker, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–00931 Filed 1–18–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7710–FW–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[Release No. 34–93961; SR–MIAX–2022–03] 

Self-Regulatory Organizations: Notice 
of Filing and Immediate Effectiveness 
of a Proposed Rule Change by Miami 
International Securities Exchange, LLC 
To Amend Exchange Rule 521, 
Nullification and Adjustment of 
Options Transactions Including 
Obvious Errors 

January 12, 2022. 

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 
19(b)(1) of the Securities Exchange Act 
of 1934 (‘‘Act’’) 1 and Rule 19b–4 
thereunder,2 notice is hereby given that 
on January 06, 2022, Miami 
International Securities Exchange, LLC 
(‘‘MIAX Options’’ or the ‘‘Exchange’’) 
filed with the Securities and Exchange 
Commission (‘‘Commission’’) a 
proposed rule change as described in 
Items I, II, and III below, which Items 
have been prepared by the Exchange. 
The Commission is publishing this 
notice to solicit comments on the 
proposed rule change from interested 
persons. 

I. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Terms of Substance of 
the Proposed Rule Change 

The Exchange is filing a proposal to 
make a technical amendment to 
Exchange Rule 521, Nullification and 
Adjustment of Options Transactions 
Including Obvious Errors. 

The text of the proposed rule change 
is available on the Exchange’s website at 
http://www.miaxoptions.com/rule- 
filings/ at MIAX Options’ principal 
office, and at the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room. 

II. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Purpose of, and 
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule 
Change 

In its filing with the Commission, the 
Exchange included statements 
concerning the purpose of and basis for 
the proposed rule change and discussed 
any comments it received on the 
proposed rule change. The text of these 
statements may be examined at the 
places specified in Item IV below. The 
Exchange has prepared summaries, set 
forth in sections A, B, and C below, of 
the most significant aspects of such 
statements. 
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