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capabilities to support continued and 
substantial participation, possibly due 
to economic, regulatory, or other 
barriers. To be eligible to participate in 
the western Pacific community 
development program, a community 
must meet the criteria set forth in 50 
CFR part 665.20, and submit a 
community development plan that 
describes the purposes and goals of the 
plan, the justification for proposed 
fishing activities, and the degree of 
involvement by the indigenous 
community members, including contact 
information. 

This collection of information 
provides NMFS and the Western Pacific 
Fishery Management Council with data 
to determine whether a community that 
submits a community development plan 
meets the regulatory requirements for 
participation in the program, and 
whether the activities proposed under 
the plan are consistent with the intent 
of the program, the Magnuson-Stevens 
Fishery Conservation and Management 
Act, and other applicable laws. The 
information is also important for 
evaluating potential impacts of the 
proposed community development plan 
activities on fish stocks, endangered 
species, marine mammals, and other 
components of the affected environment 
for the purposes of compliance with the 
National Environmental Policy Act, the 
Endangered Species Act and other 
applicable laws. 

Affected Public: Business or other for- 
profit organizations. 

Frequency: On occasion. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Required to 

obtain or maintain benefits. 
OMB Desk Officer: OIRA_

Submission@omb.eop.gov. 
Copies of the above information 

collection proposal can be obtained by 
calling or writing Jennifer Jessup, 
Departmental Paperwork Clearance 
Officer, (202) 482–0336, Department of 

Commerce, Room 6616, 14th and 
Constitution Avenue NW., Washington, 
DC 20230 (or via the Internet at JJessup@
doc.gov). 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to OIRA_Submission@
omb.eop.gov. 

Dated: August 27, 2013. 
Gwellnar Banks, 
Management Analyst, Office of the Chief 
Information Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2013–21303 Filed 8–30–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–22–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[B–37–2013] 

Foreign-Trade Zone 26—Atlanta, 
Georgia, Authorization of Production 
Activity PBR, Inc. d/b/a SKAPS 
Industries (Polypropylene Geotextiles), 
Athens, Georgia 

On April 8, 2013, Georgia Foreign- 
Trade Zone, Inc., grantee of FTZ 26, 
submitted a notification of proposed 
production activity to the Foreign-Trade 
Zones (FTZ) Board on behalf of PBR, 
Inc. d/b/a SKAPS Industries (SKAPS 
Industries), in Athens, Georgia. 

The notification was processed in 
accordance with the regulations of the 
FTZ Board (15 CFR part 400), including 
notice in the Federal Register inviting 
public comment (78 FR 25253, 4–30– 
2013). The FTZ Board has determined 
that no further review of the activity is 
warranted at this time. The production 
activity described in the notification is 
authorized for an initial period of five 
years (to 8–23–2018), subject to the FTZ 
Act and the FTZ Board’s regulations, 
including Section 400.14, and further 

subject to a restriction requiring that 
SKAPS Industries admit all foreign- 
status polypropylene fiber to the zone 
under privileged foreign status (19 CFR 
146.41) 

Dated: August 23, 2013. 
Andrew McGilvray, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2013–21235 Filed 8–30–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

Antidumping or Countervailing Duty 
Order, Finding, or Suspended 
Investigation; Advance Notification of 
Sunset Reviews 

AGENCY: Import Administration, 
International Trade Administration, 
Department of Commerce. 

Background 

Every five years, pursuant to section 
751(c) of the Tariff Act of 1930, as 
amended (‘‘the Act’’), the Department of 
Commerce (‘‘the Department’’) and the 
International Trade Commission 
automatically initiate and conduct a 
review to determine whether revocation 
of a countervailing or antidumping duty 
order or termination of an investigation 
suspended under section 704 or 734 of 
the Act would be likely to lead to 
continuation or recurrence of dumping 
or a countervailable subsidy (as the case 
may be) and of material injury. 

Upcoming Sunset Reviews for October 
2013 

The following Sunset Reviews are 
scheduled for initiation in October 2013 
and will appear in that month’s Notice 
of Initiation of Five-Year Sunset Review 
(‘‘Sunset Review’’). 

Department contact 

Antidumping duty proceedings 
Polyethylene Terephthalate (Pet) Film from Brazil (A–351–841) (1st Review) ..................................................... Dana Mermelstein (202) 482– 

1391. 
Polyethylene Terephthalate (Pet) Film from China (A–570–924) (1st Review) ..................................................... Dana Mermelstein (202) 482– 

1391. 
Lightweight Thermal Paper from China (A–570–920) (1st Review) ...................................................................... David Goldberger (202) 482– 

4136. 
Lightweight Thermal Paper from Germany (A–428–840) (1st Review) ................................................................. David Goldberger (202) 482– 

4136. 
Polyethylene Terephthalate (Pet) Film from United Arab Emirates (1st Review) (A–520–803) ............................ Dana Mermelstein (202)482– 

1391. 

Countervailing Duty Proceedings 
Lightweight Thermal Paper from China (1st Review) (C–570–921) ...................................................................... David Goldberger (202) 482– 

4136. 

Suspended Investigations 
No Sunset Review of suspended investigations is scheduled for initiation in October 2013..
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