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contaminated prey items, and (3) how 
the harm to the natural resources has 
impacted the people that use these 
resources. Concurrent with the damage 
assessment, the Trustee Council is 
conducting restoration planning. 

By identifying criteria and guidance 
to be used in selecting feasible 
restoration projects, the Restoration Plan 
provides a framework to maximize the 
benefits of restoration projects to the 
affected resources and services in the 
defined areas of the Lower Willamette 
River. The Trustee Council analyzed 
three alternatives including: (1) 
(Preferred) integrated habitat restoration 
actions that will benefit multiple 
species and services (those species 
listed above as potentially affected by 
releases of hazardous substances, such 
as salmon and resident fish, mammals 
such as mink and river otter, and 
aquatic-dependent birds such as osprey 
and bald eagle); (2) species-specific 
restoration actions (for example, 
augmenting a species population 
through artificial production); and (3) a 
no-action alternative (no action takes 
place and the public is not 
compensated). A fourth alternative for 
restoration without a limited geographic 
boundary was also considered, but was 
not moved forward for detailed study 
because it did not meet the purpose and 
need for the project. 

The Trustee Council has opened an 
Administrative Record (Record). The 
Record includes documents that the 
Trustees relied upon during the 
development of the Draft Restoration 
Plan and Draft PEIS. The Record is on 
file at the offices of Parametrix, a 
contractor to NOAA. The Record is also 
available at: http://www.fws.gov/ 
oregonfwo/contaminants/ 
PortlandHarbor/default.asp. 

Dated: June 29, 2012. 
Brian T. Pawlak, 
Acting Director, Office of Habitat 
Conservation, National Marine Fisheries 
Service. 
[FR Doc. 2012–16490 Filed 7–3–12; 8:45 am] 
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ACTION: Notice. 

The Department of Defense has 
submitted to OMB for clearance, the 
following proposal for collection of 

information under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (44 U.S.C. 
chapter 35). 
DATES: Consideration will be given to all 
comments received by August 6, 2012. 

Title, Form, and OMB Number: 
Defense Sexual Assault Incident 
Database (DSAID); OMB Control 
Number 0704–0482. 

Type of Request: Extension. 
Number of Respondents: 3,200. 
Responses per Respondent: 1. 
Annual Responses: 3,200. 
Average Burden per Response: 1 hour. 
Annual Burden Hours: 3,200 hours. 
Needs and Uses: DSAID is a DoD 

database that captures uniform data 
provided by the Military Services and 
maintains all sexual assault data 
collected by the Military Services. This 
database shall be a centralized, case- 
level database for the uniform collection 
of data regarding incidence of sexual 
assaults involving persons covered by 
DoDD 6495.01 and DoDI 6495.02. 
DSAID will include information when 
available, or when not limited by 
Restricted Reporting, or otherwise 
prohibited by law, about the nature of 
the assault, the victim, the offender, and 
the disposition of reports associated 
with the assault. Information in the 
DSAID will be used to respond to 
congressional reporting requirements, 
support Military Service SAPR Program 
management, and inform DoD SAPRO 
oversight activities. 

Affected Public: Federal Government; 
Individuals or Households; Business or 
Other For-Profit; Not-For-Profit 
Institutions; Farms; State, Local or 
Tribal Government. 

Frequency: On occasion. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Voluntary. 
OMB Desk Officer: Ms. Jasmeet 

Seehra. 
Written comments and 

recommendations on the proposed 
information collection should be sent to 
Ms. Seehra at the Office of Management 
and Budget, Desk Officer for DoD, Room 
10236, New Executive Office Building, 
Washington, DC 20503. 

You may also submit comments, 
identified by docket number and title, 
by the following method: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name, docket 
number and title for this Federal 
Register document. The general policy 
for comments and other submissions 
from members of the public is to make 
these submissions available for public 
viewing on the Internet at http:// 
www.regulations.gov as they are 

received without change, including any 
personal identifiers or contact 
information. 

DOD Clearance Officer: Ms. Patricia 
Toppings. 

Written requests for copies of the 
information collection proposal should 
be sent to Ms. Toppings at WHS/ESD/ 
Information Management Division, 4800 
Mark Center Drive, East Tower, Suite 
02G09, Alexandria, VA 22350–3100. 

Dated: June 28, 2012. 
Patricia L. Toppings, 
OSD Federal Register Liaison Officer, 
Department of Defense. 
[FR Doc. 2012–16413 Filed 7–3–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–06–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Office of the Secretary 

[Docket ID: DoD–2012–OS–0082] 

Proposed Collection; Comment 
Request 

AGENCY: Office of the Under Secretary of 
Defense for Personnel and Readiness, 
DoD. 
ACTION: Notice. 

In compliance with Section 
3506(c)(2)(A) of the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995, the Office of the 
Under Secretary of Defense for 
Personnel and Readiness announces a 
proposed public information collection 
and seeks public comment on the 
provisions thereof. Comments are 
invited on: (a) Whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information shall have 
practical utility; (b) the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed information collection; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the information collection on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
DATES: Consideration will be given to all 
comments received by September 4, 
2012. 

ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by docket number and title, 
by any of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Mail: Federal Docket Management 
System Office, 4800 Mark Center Drive, 
East Tower, Suite 02G09, Alexandria, 
VA 22350–3100. 
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