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EPA Science Advisory Board (1400A),
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency,
1200 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW,
Washington, DC 20460; telephone (202)
564–4547; FAX (202) 501–0582; or via
e-mail at fowle.jack@epa.gov. Requests
for oral comments must be in writing (e-
mail, fax or mail) and received by Dr.
Fowle no later than noon Eastern
Standard Time on February 13, 2002.

Providing Oral or Written Comments at
SAB Meetings

It is the policy of the EPA Science
Advisory Board to accept written public
comments of any length, and to
accommodate oral public comments
whenever possible. The EPA Science
Advisory Board expects that public
statements presented at its meetings will
not be repetitive of previously
submitted oral or written statements.
Oral Comments: In general, each
individual or group requesting an oral
presentation at a face-to-face meeting
will be limited to a total time of ten
minutes (unless otherwise indicated).
For teleconference meetings,
opportunities for oral comment will
usually be limited to no more than three
minutes per speaker and no more than
fifteen minutes total. Deadlines for
getting on the public speaker list for a
meeting are given above. Speakers
should bring at least 35 copies of their
comments and presentation slides for
distribution to the reviewers and public
at the meeting. Written Comments:
Although the SAB accepts written
comments until the date of the meeting
(unless otherwise stated), written
comments should be received in the
SAB Staff Office at least one week prior
to the meeting date so that the
comments may be made available to the
committee for their consideration.
Comments should be supplied to the
appropriate DFO at the address/contact
information noted above in the
following formats: one hard copy with
original signature, and one electronic
copy via e-mail (acceptable file format:
WordPerfect, Word, or Rich Text files
(in IBM–PC/Windows 95/98 format).
Those providing written comments and
who attend the meeting are also asked
to bring 25 copies of their comments for
public distribution.

General Information—Additional
information concerning the EPA Science
Advisory Board, its structure, function,
and composition, may be found on the
SAB Website (http://www.epa.gov/sab)
and in The FY2000 Annual Report of
the Staff Director which is available
from the SAB Publications Staff at (202)
564–4533 or via fax at (202) 501–0256.
Committee rosters, draft Agendas and

meeting calendars are also located on
our website.

Meeting Access—Individuals
requiring special accommodation at this
meeting, including wheelchair access to
the conference room, should contact the
appropriate DFO at least five business
days prior to the meeting so that
appropriate arrangements can be made.

Dated: January 11, 2002.
Donald G. Barnes,
Staff Director, EPA Science Advisory Board.
[FR Doc. 02–1245 Filed 1–16–02; 8:45 am]
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Draft Recommendations for
Implementing EPA’s Public
Involvement Policy

AGENCY: Environmental Protection
Agency.
ACTION: Notice.

SUMMARY: EPA seeks public comment on
the 12-page document ‘‘Draft
Recommendations for Implementing
EPA’s Public Involvement Policy.’’ The
document recommends specific EPA
actions to enhance adoption of the
Agency’s Public Involvement Policy by
EPA staff and managers. EPA published
its Draft 2000 Public Involvement Policy
in the Federal Register in December,
2000 (65 FR 82335, Dec. 28, 2000) and
is currently writing the final policy and
response to comments, both of which
will be released in the Spring of 2002.
The recommended implementation
actions include: creating a
communication network and
mechanisms that allow EPA staff to
exchange public involvement
information; creating an electronic
database that includes public
involvement training opportunities, case
studies and other helpful resources;
providing public involvement training
to EPA staff and managers; developing
evaluation measures and tools to
measure the effectiveness of EPA’s
public involvement activities; and
evaluating the Agency’s adoption of the
Public Involvement Policy over time.
EPA seeks public comment on this
document for 60 days following
publication on EPA’s web page and
notice in the Federal Register. After
reviewing public comments, EPA will
begin implementing many of these
recommended activities. The revised
document will be issued along with the
Final Public Involvement Policy in the
Spring of 2002. The draft

recommendations document and future
updates will be posted on the Agency’s
Web site at http://www.epa.gov/
stakeholders.

DATES: Comments will be accepted until
March 18, 2002.
ADDRESSES: Submit comments to
Patricia A. Bonner, United States
Environmental Protection Agency,
Office of Policy, Economics and
Innovation (MC 1807), 1200
Pennsylvania Ave, NW., Washington,
DC 20460, by facsimile at 202–260–4903
or by electronic mail to
bonner.patricia@epa.gov or to
stakeholders@epa.gov.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Patricia Bonner at 202–260–0599. To
request a mailed copy, call Loretta
Schumacher at 202–260–3096 or e-mail
a request to stakeholders@epa.gov. The
draft recommendations document and
the Draft Public Involvement Policy may
be viewed or downloaded from [http://
www.epa.gov/stakeholders].

Thomas J. Gibson,
Associate Administrator, Office of Policy,
Economics and Innovation.
[FR Doc. 02–1243 Filed 1–16–02; 8:45 am]
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Certain New Chemicals; Receipt and
Status Information

AGENCY: Environmental Protection
Agency (EPA).
ACTION: Notice.

SUMMARY: Section 5 of the Toxic
Substances Control Act (TSCA) requires
any person who intends to manufacture
(defined by statute to include import) a
new chemical (i.e., a chemical not on
the TSCA Inventory) to notify EPA and
comply with the statutory provisions
pertaining to the manufacture of new
chemicals. Under sections 5(d)(2) and
5(d)(3) of TSCA, EPA is required to
publish a notice of receipt of a
premanufacture notice (PMN) or an
application for a test marketing
exemption (TME), and to publish
periodic status reports on the chemicals
under review and the receipt of notices
of commencement to manufacture those
chemicals. This status report, which
covers the period from December 1,
2001 to December 22, 2001, consists of
the PMNs and TMEs, both pending or
expired, and the notices of
commencement to manufacture a new
chemical that the Agency has received
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