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III. Regulatory Flexibility Act 

NASA certifies that this proposed rule 
will not have a significant economic 
impact on a substantial number of small 
entities within the meaning of the 
Regulatory Flexibility Act, 5 U.S.C. 601, 
et seq., because the proposed rule does 
not impose any additional requirements 
on small entities and, more importantly, 
the proposed rule serves to deregulate 
internal agency operating procedures 
which will eliminate unnecessary 
regulation. 

IV. Paperwork Reduction Act 

The Paper Reduction Act (Pub. L. 
104–13) is not applicable because the 
removal of the delegation of 
administration procedures does not 
require the submission of any 
information by recipients that requires 
the approval of the Office of 
Management and Budget under 44 
U.S.C. 3501, et seq. 

List of Subjects in 14 CFR Parts 1260 
and 1274 

Colleges and universities, Business 
and industry, Grant programs, Grants 
administration, Cooperative agreements, 
State and local governments, Non-profit 
organizations, Commercial firms, 
Recipients, Delegation of 
administration, Property administration, 
Plant clearance, Indirect cost rates, 
Cognizant agency, Recipient reporting. 

Ronald Poussard, 
Acting Assistant Administrator for 
Procurement. 

Accordingly, 14 CFR parts 1260 and 
1274 are proposed to be amended as 
follows: 

PART 1260—GRANTS AND 
COOPERATIVE AGREEMENTS 

■ 1. The authority citation for 14 CFR 
part 1260 continues to read as follows: 

Authority: 42 U.S.C. 2473(c)(1), Pub. L. 97– 
258, 96 Stat. 1003 (31 U.S.C. 6301 et seq.), 
and OMB Circular No. A–110. 

§ 1260.70 [Removed and Reserved] 

■ 2. Section 1260.70 is removed and 
reserved. 

PART 1274—COOPERATIVE 
AGREEMENTS WITH COMMERCIAL 
FIRMS 

■ 3. The authority citation for 14 CFR 
part 1274 continues to read as follows: 

Authority: 31 U.S.C. 6301 to 6308; 42 
U.S.C. 2451 et seq. 

§ 1274.301 [Removed and Reserved] 
■ 4. Section 1274.301 is removed and 
reserved. 
[FR Doc. 2013–27232 Filed 11–13–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7510–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

40 CFR Part 52 

[EPA–R05–OAR–2010–0997; FRL–9901– 
37–Region 5] 

Approval and Promulgation of Air 
Quality Implementation Plans; Ohio; 
Ohio NOX SIP Call Rule Revisions 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Proposed rule. 

SUMMARY: On November 15, 2010, Ohio 
EPA submitted to EPA revisions to Ohio 
OAC 3745–14. EPA is proposing to 
approve these revisions under the Clean 
Air Act, which allows for Ohio’s Clean 
Air Interstate Rule (CAIR) NOX Ozone 
Season Trading Program rules to 
supersede Ohio’s nitrogen oxides (NOX) 
State Implementation Plan (SIP) Call 
Budget Trading Program rules, but leave 
other requirements of the NOX SIP Call 
in place for units not covered by CAIR. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before December 16, 2013. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by Docket ID No. EPA–R05– 
OAR–2010–0997, by one of the 
following methods: 

1. www.regulations.gov: Follow the 
on-line instructions for submitting 
comments. 

2. Email: aburano.douglas@epa.gov. 
3. Fax: (312) 408–2279. 
4. Mail: Douglas Aburano, Chief, 

Attainment Planning and Maintenance 
Section, Air Programs Branch (AR–18J), 
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency, 
77 West Jackson Boulevard, Chicago, 
Illinois 60604. 

5. Hand Delivery: Douglas Aburano, 
Chief, Attainment Planning and 
Maintenance Section, Air Programs 
Branch (AR–18J), U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency, 77 West Jackson 
Boulevard, Chicago, Illinois 60604. 
Such deliveries are only accepted 
during the Regional Office normal hours 
of operation, and special arrangements 
should be made for deliveries of boxed 
information. The Regional Office official 
hours of business are Monday through 
Friday, 8:30 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., excluding 
Federal holidays. 

Please see the direct final rule which 
is located in the Rules section of this 
Federal Register for detailed 

instructions on how to submit 
comments. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Sarah Arra, Environmental Scientist, 
Attainment Planning and Maintenance 
Section, Air Programs Branch (AR–18J), 
Environmental Protection Agency, 
Region 5, 77 West Jackson Boulevard, 
Chicago, Illinois 60604, (312) 886–9401, 
Arra.Sarah@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In the 
Final Rules section of this Federal 
Register, EPA is approving the State’s 
SIP submittal as a direct final rule 
without prior proposal because the 
Agency views this as a noncontroversial 
submittal and anticipates no adverse 
comments. A detailed rationale for the 
approval is set forth in the direct final 
rule. If no adverse comments are 
received in response to this rule, no 
further activity is contemplated. If EPA 
receives adverse comments, the direct 
final rule will be withdrawn and all 
public comments received will be 
addressed in a subsequent final rule 
based on this proposed rule. EPA will 
not institute a second comment period. 
Any parties interested in commenting 
on this action should do so at this time. 
Please note that if EPA receives adverse 
comment on an amendment, paragraph, 
or section of this rule and if that 
provision may be severed from the 
remainder of the rule, EPA may adopt 
as final those provisions of the rule that 
are not the subject of an adverse 
comment. For additional information, 
see the direct final rule which is located 
in the Rules section of this Federal 
Register. 

Dated: September 16, 2013. 
Susan Hedman, 
Regional Administrator, Region 5. 
[FR Doc. 2013–27144 Filed 11–13–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

40 CFR Part 52 

[EPA–R03–OAR–2013–0407; FRL–9902–54– 
Region 3] 

Approval and Promulgation of Air 
Quality Implementation Plans; Virginia; 
Removal of the Regulation for the 
National Low Emission Vehicle 
Program 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Proposed rule. 

SUMMARY: EPA proposes to approve the 
State Implementation Plan (SIP) 
revision submitted by the 
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Commonwealth of Virginia that serves 
to remove from the SIP Virginia’s 
repealed regulation for the National Low 
Emission Vehicle (NLEV) program. 
Virginia repealed its regulation in 
December 2011, because the Virginia 
NLEV program regulation had by then 
expired and was superseded by more 
stringent federal Tier 2 passenger car 
and light-duty truck standards, which 
were promulgated by EPA on February 
10, 2000. More stringent federal Tier 2 
vehicle emission standards were 
implemented, on a phased-in basis, 
between model years 2004 and 2006, 
taking the place of the NLEV program. 
In the Final Rules section of this 
Federal Register, EPA is approving the 
Commonwealth’s SIP submittal as a 
direct final rule without prior proposal 
because the Agency views this as a 
noncontroversial submittal and 
anticipates no adverse comments. A 
detailed rationale for the approval is set 
forth in the direct final rule. If no 
adverse comments are received in 
response to this action, no further 
activity is contemplated. If EPA receives 
adverse comments, the direct final rule 
will be withdrawn and all public 
comments received will be addressed in 
a subsequent final rule based on this 
proposed rule. EPA will not institute a 
second comment period. Any parties 
interested in commenting on this action 
should do so at this time. 
DATES: Comments must be received in 
writing by December 16, 2013. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by Docket ID Number EPA– 
R03–OAR–2013–0407 by one of the 
following methods: 

A. www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
on-line instructions for submitting 
comments. 

B. Email: fernandez.cristina@epa.gov. 
C. Mail: EPA–R03–OAR–2013–0407, 

Cristina Fernandez, Associate Director, 
Office of Air Program Planning, 
Mailcode 3AP30, U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency, Region III, 1650 
Arch Street, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 
19103. 

D. Hand Delivery: At the previously- 
listed EPA Region III address. Such 
deliveries are only accepted during the 
Docket’s normal hours of operation, and 
special arrangements should be made 
for deliveries of boxed information. 

Instructions: Direct your comments to 
Docket ID No. EPA–R03–OAR–2013– 
0407. EPA’s policy is that all comments 
received will be included in the public 
docket without change, and may be 
made available online at 
www.regulations.gov, including any 
personal information provided, unless 
the comment includes information 

claimed to be Confidential Business 
Information (CBI) or other information 
whose disclosure is restricted by statute. 
Do not submit information that you 
consider to be CBI or otherwise 
protected through www.regulations.gov 
or email. The www.regulations.gov Web 
site is an ‘‘anonymous access’’ system, 
which means EPA will not know your 
identity or contact information unless 
you provide it in the body of your 
comment. If you send an email 
comment directly to EPA without going 
through www.regulations.gov, your 
email address will be automatically 
captured and included as part of the 
comment that is placed in the public 
docket and made available on the 
Internet. If you submit an electronic 
comment, EPA recommends that you 
include your name and other contact 
information in the body of your 
comment and with any disk or CD–ROM 
you submit. If EPA cannot read your 
comment due to technical difficulties 
and cannot contact you for clarification, 
EPA may not be able to consider your 
comment. Electronic files should avoid 
the use of special characters, any form 
of encryption, and be free of any defects 
or viruses. 

Docket: All documents in the 
electronic docket are listed in the 
www.regulations.gov index. Although 
listed in the index, some information is 
not publicly available, i.e., CBI or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Certain other 
material, such as copyrighted material, 
is not placed on the Internet and will be 
publicly available only in hard copy 
form. Publicly available docket 
materials are available either 
electronically in www.regulations.gov or 
in hard copy during normal business 
hours at the Air Protection Division, 
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency, 
Region III, 1650 Arch Street, 
Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 19103. 
Copies of the State submittal are 
available at the Virginia Department of 
Environmental Quality, 629 East Main 
Street, Richmond, Virginia 23219. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Brian Rehn, (215) 814–2176, or by email 
at rehn.brian@epa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: For 
further information, please see the 
information provided in the direct final 
action, also titled ‘‘Removal of the 
Regulation for the National Low 
Emission Vehicle Program,’’ which is 
located in the ‘‘Rules and Regulations’’ 
section of this Federal Register 
publication. 

Dated: September 30, 2013. 
W.C. Early, 
Acting Regional Administrator, Region III. 
[FR Doc. 2013–27028 Filed 11–13–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

40 CFR Part 52 

[EPA–R05–OAR–2013–0046; FRL–9902– 
91-Region 5] 

Approval and Promulgation of Air 
Quality Implementation Plans; Illinois; 
Amendments to Vehicle Inspection and 
Maintenance Program for Illinois 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Proposed rule. 

SUMMARY: EPA is proposing to approve 
a state implementation plan (SIP) 
revision submitted by the Illinois 
Environmental Protection Agency 
(IEPA) on November 29, 2012, 
concerning the state’s vehicle inspection 
and maintenance (I/M) program in the 
Chicago and Metro-East St. Louis ozone 
nonattainment areas in Illinois. The 
revision amends I/M program 
requirements in the active control 
measures portion of the ozone SIP to 
reflect changes that have been 
implemented at the state level since 
EPA fully approved the I/M program on 
February 22, 1999. The submittal also 
includes a demonstration under section 
110(l) of the Clean Air Act (CAA) 
addressing lost emission reductions 
associated with the program changes. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before December 16, 2013. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by Docket ID No. EPA–R05– 
OAR–2013–0046, by one of the 
following methods: 

1. www.regulations.gov: Follow the 
on-line instructions for submitting 
comments. 

2. Email: blakley.pamela@epa.gov. 
3. Fax: (312)692–2450. 
4. Mail: Pamela Blakley, Chief, 

Control Strategies Section, Air Programs 
Branch (AR–18J), U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency, 77 West Jackson 
Boulevard, Chicago, Illinois 60604. 

5. Hand Delivery: Pamela Blakley, 
Chief, Control Strategies Section, Air 
Programs Branch (AR–18J), U.S. 
Environmental Protection Agency, 77 
West Jackson Boulevard, Chicago, 
Illinois 60604. Such deliveries are only 
accepted during the Regional Office 
normal hours of operation, and special 
arrangements should be made for 
deliveries of boxed information. The 
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