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nondisclosure of the information and for 
treating it in accordance with the DOE’s 
Freedom of Information regulations (10 
CFR 1004.11). 

Note: Delivery of the U.S. Postal Service 
mail to DOE may be delayed by several 
weeks due to security screening. DOE, 
therefore, encourages those wishing to 
comment to submit comments electronically 
by email. If comments are submitted by 
regular mail, the Department requests that 
they be accompanied by a CD or diskette 
containing electronic files of the submission. 

Minutes: The minutes of the EAC 
meeting will be posted on the EAC Web 
page at http://energy.gov/oe/services/
electricity-advisory-committee-eac. 
They can also be obtained by contacting 
Mr. Matthew Rosenbaum at the address 
above. 

Issued in Washington, DC, on December 
17, 2013. 
LaTanya R. Butler, 
Deputy Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2013–30492 Filed 12–20–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Office of Energy Efficiency and 
Renewable Energy 

State Energy Advisory Board (STEAB) 

AGENCY: Office of Energy Efficiency and 
Renewable Energy, Department of 
Energy. 
ACTION: Notice of Open Teleconference. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces a 
teleconference call of the State Energy 
Advisory Board (STEAB). The Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (Public Law 
92–463; 86 Stat. 770) requires that 
public notice of these meetings be 
announced in the Federal Register. 
DATES: Thursday, January 16, 2014 from 
3:30 p.m. to 4:00 p.m. (EDT). To receive 
the call-in number and passcode, please 
contact the Board’s Designated Federal 
Officer (DFO) at the address or phone 
number listed below. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Julie 
Hughes, STEAB Designated Federal 
Officer, Policy Advisor, U.S. 
Department of Energy, Office of Energy 
Efficiency and Renewable Energy, 1000 
Independence Ave. SW., Washington, 
DC 20585. Phone number 202–320– 
9703, and email Julie.Hughes@
ee.doe.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Purpose of the Board: To make 

recommendations to the Assistant 
Secretary for the Office of Energy 
Efficiency and Renewable Energy 
regarding goals and objectives, 

programmatic and administrative 
policies, and to otherwise carry out the 
Board’s responsibilities as designated in 
the State Energy Efficiency Programs 
Improvement Act of 1990 (Pub. L. No. 
101–440). 

Tentative Agenda: Review the 
responses and feedback from EERE on a 
2014 engagement plan between STEAB 
and EERE, review the five main focus 
areas for 2014 and report on progress 
made in those areas, provide an update 
to the Board on routine business 
matters, and begin planning and 
discussing the agenda and logistics for 
the upcoming March 2014 meeting. 

Public Participation: The meeting is 
open to the public. Written statements 
may be filed with the Board either 
before or after the meeting. Members of 
the public who wish to make oral 
statements pertaining to agenda items 
should contact Julie Hughes at the 
address or telephone number listed 
above. Requests to make oral comments 
must be received five days prior to the 
meeting; reasonable provision will be 
made to include requested topic(s) on 
the agenda. The Chair of the Board is 
empowered to conduct the meeting in a 
fashion that will facilitate the orderly 
conduct of business. 

Minutes: The minutes of the meeting 
will be available for public review and 
copying within 60 days on the STEAB 
Web site at: www.steab.org. 

Issued at Washington, DC, on December 17, 
2013. 
LaTanya R. Butler, 
Deputy Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2013–30493 Filed 12–20–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP14–25–000] 

Natural Gas Pipeline Company of 
America LLC; Stingray Pipeline 
Company, L.L.C.; Notice of Application 

Take notice that on December 4, 2013, 
Natural Gas Pipeline Company of 
America LLC (Natural), 3250 Lacey 
Road, 7th Floor, Downers Grove, Illinois 
60515–7918 and Stingray Pipeline 
Company, L.L.C. (Stingray), 110 
Louisiana Street, Suite 3300, Houston, 
Texas 77002, filed a joint application in 
Docket No. CP14–25–000 pursuant to 
section 7(b) and section7(c) of the 
Natural Gas Act (NGA), and Part 157 of 
the Commission’s regulations, for a 
certificate of public convenience and 
necessity requesting: (1) Approval for 

Natural to abandon by sale to Stingray 
the offshore, West Cameron 148 Lateral, 
the West Cameron 148 Platform, related 
appurtenances, and the onshore 
Compressor Station 701 land; (2) 
approval for Natural to abandon by sale 
to Stingray the offshore, West Cameron 
144 Lateral, the West Cameron 144 
Meter and related appurtenances; (3) to 
abandon Natural’s Rate Schedule X–50, 
the long term lease for the 
aforementioned facilities and land; and 
(4) a certificate of public convenience 
and necessity for Stingray to acquire 
from Natural, and to own and operate 
the above listed facilities and land, all 
as more fully set forth in the application 
which is on file with the Commission 
and open for public inspection. The 
filing may also be viewed on the web at 
http://www.ferc.gov using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link. Enter the docket 
number excluding the last three digits in 
the docket number field to access the 
document. For assistance, contact FERC 
at FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (866) 208–3676 or TTY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Any questions regarding the 
applications should be directed Bruce 
H. Newsome, Vice President, Natural 
Gas Pipeline Company of America LLC, 
3250 Lacey Road, 7th Floor, Downers 
Grove, Illinois 60515–7918, telephone: 
630–725–3070, or email: bruce_
newsome@kindermorgan.com or to 
Cynthia Roney, Manager, Regulatory 
Compliance, Stingray Pipeline 
Company, L.L.C., 1100 Louisiana, Suite 
3300, Houston, Texas 77002, telephone: 
832–214–9334, or email Cynthia.roney@
enbridge.com. 

Pursuant to section 157.9 of the 
Commission’s rules, 18 CFR 157.9, 
within 90 days of this Notice the 
Commission staff will either: Complete 
its environmental assessment (EA) and 
place it into the Commission’s public 
record (eLibrary) for this proceeding; or 
issue a Notice of Schedule for 
Environmental Review. If a Notice of 
Schedule for Environmental Review is 
issued, it will indicate, among other 
milestones, the anticipated date for the 
Commission staff’s issuance of the final 
environmental impact statement (FEIS) 
or EA for this proposal. The filing of the 
EA in the Commission’s public record 
for this proceeding or the issuance of a 
Notice of Schedule for Environmental 
Review will serve to notify federal and 
state agencies of the timing for the 
completion of all necessary reviews, and 
the subsequent need to complete all 
federal authorizations within 90 days of 
the date of issuance of the Commission 
staff’s FEIS or EA. 

There are two ways to become 
involved in the Commission’s review of 
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this project. First, any person wishing to 
obtain legal status by becoming a party 
to the proceedings for this project 
should, on or before the comment date 
stated below, file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE., Washington, DC 20426, 
a motion to intervene in accordance 
with the requirements of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.214 or 385.211) 
and the Regulations under the NGA (18 
CFR 157.10). A person obtaining party 
status will be placed on the service list 
maintained by the Secretary of the 
Commission and will receive copies of 
all documents filed by the applicant and 
by all other parties. A party must submit 
7 copies of filings made with the 
Commission and must mail a copy to 
the applicant and to every other party in 
the proceeding. Only parties to the 
proceeding can ask for court review of 
Commission orders in the proceeding. 

However, a person does not have to 
intervene in order to have comments 
considered. The second way to 
participate is by filing with the 
Secretary of the Commission, as soon as 
possible, an original and two copies of 
comments in support of or in opposition 
to this project. The Commission will 
consider these comments in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but the filing of a comment alone 
will not serve to make the filer a party 
to the proceeding. The Commission’s 
rules require that persons filing 
comments in opposition to the project 
provide copies of their protests only to 
the party or parties directly involved in 
the protest. 

Persons who wish to comment only 
on the environmental review of this 
project should submit an original and 
two copies of their comments to the 
Secretary of the Commission. 
Environmental commenter’s will be 
placed on the Commission’s 
environmental mailing list, will receive 
copies of the environmental documents, 
and will be notified of meetings 
associated with he Commission’s 
environmental review process. 
Environmental commenter’s will not be 
required to serve copies of filed 
documents on all other parties. 
However, the non-party commentary, 
will not receive copies of all documents 
filed by other parties or issued by the 
Commission (except for the mailing of 
environmental documents issued by the 
Commission) and ill not have the right 
to seek court review of the 
Commission’s final order. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings of comments, protests 
and interventions in lieu of paper using 
the ‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://

www.ferc.gov. Persons unable to file 
electronically should submit an original 
and 5 copies of the protest or 
intervention to the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First Street 
NE., Washington, DC 20426. See, 18 
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the 
instructions on the Commission’s Web 
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on January 7, 2014. 

Dated: December 17, 2013. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2013–30516 Filed 12–20–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP14–27–000] 

Tres Palacios Gas Storage LLC; Notice 
of Application 

Take notice that on December 6, 2013, 
Tres Palacios Gas Storage LLC (Tres 
Palacios) 700 Louisiana Street, Suite 
2060, Houston, Texas 77002, filed in the 
above reference docket application 
pursuant to section 7(b) of the of the 
Natural Gas Act (NGA) and Part 157 of 
the Commission’s regulations, 
requesting authorization for Tres 
Palacios to abandon up to 22.9 Bcf of 
working gas storage capacity in its salt 
cavern natural gas storage facility 
located in Matagorda, Colorado, and 
Wharton Counties, Texas. Tres Palacios 
states that the proposed abandonment of 
storage capacity is intended to respond 
to the current depressed market for Gulf 
Coast region storage services, will better 
align Tres Palacios’ storage capacity 
with its current contractual 
commitments, and will significantly 
reduce Tres Palacios’ operating costs. 
Tres Palacios’ proposal is more fully set 
forth in the application which is on file 
with the Commission and open to 
public inspection. The filing may also 
be viewed on the web at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. For 
assistance, please contact FERC Online 
Support at FERCOnlineSupport@
ferc.gov or toll free at (866) 208–3676, or 
TTY, contact (202) 502–8659. 

Any questions concerning this 
application may be directed to James F. 
Bowe, Jr., King & Spalding, LLP, 1700 
Pennsylvania Avenue NW., Washington, 
DC 20006–4707, by phone at 202–626– 

9601, fax at 202–626–3737, or email at 
jbowe@kslaw.com. 

Pursuant to section 157.9 of the 
Commission’s rules, 18 CFR 157.9, 
within 90 days of this Notice the 
Commission staff will either: Complete 
its environmental assessment (EA) and 
place it into the Commission’s public 
record (eLibrary) for this proceeding; or 
issue a Notice of Schedule for 
Environmental Review. If a Notice of 
Schedule for Environmental Review is 
issued, it will indicate, among other 
milestones, the anticipated date for the 
Commission staff’s issuance of the final 
environmental impact statement (FEIS) 
or EA for this proposal. The filing of the 
EA in the Commission’s public record 
for this proceeding or the issuance of a 
Notice of Schedule for Environmental 
Review will serve to notify federal and 
state agencies of the timing for the 
completion of all necessary reviews, and 
the subsequent need to complete all 
federal authorizations within 90 days of 
the date of issuance of the Commission 
staff’s FEIS or EA. 

There are two ways to become 
involved in the Commission’s review of 
this project. First, any person wishing to 
obtain legal status by becoming a party 
to the proceedings for this project 
should, on or before the comment date 
stated below, file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE., Washington, DC 20426, 
a motion to intervene in accordance 
with the requirements of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.214 or 385.211) 
and the Regulations under the NGA (18 
CFR 157.10). A person obtaining party 
status will be placed on the service list 
maintained by the Secretary of the 
Commission and will receive copies of 
all documents filed by the applicant and 
by all other parties. A party must submit 
an original plus five copies of filings 
made with the Commission and must 
mail a copy to the applicant and to 
every other party in the proceeding. 
Only parties to the proceeding can ask 
for court review of Commission orders 
in the proceeding. 

However, a person does not have to 
intervene in order to have comments 
considered. The second way to 
participate is by filing with the 
Secretary of the Commission, as soon as 
possible, an original and two copies of 
comments in support of or in opposition 
to this project. The Commission will 
consider these comments in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but the filing of a comment alone 
will not serve to make the filer a party 
to the proceeding. The Commission’s 
rules require that persons filing 
comments in opposition to the project 
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