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in excess of $100 million (as calculated 
in accordance with Section 3(c)(10) of 
the Charter). Comments received within 
the comment period specified below 
will be presented to the Ex-Im Bank 
Board of Directors prior to final action 
on this transaction. 

Reference: AP086942XX. 
Purpose and Use: 
Brief description of the purpose of the 

transaction: 
To support the export of U.S.- 

manufactured equipment for an oil 
refinery to be built in Turkey. 

Brief non-proprietary description of 
the anticipated use of the items being 
exported: 

Construction of a new crude oil 
refinery in Turkey. 

To the extent that Ex-Im Bank is 
reasonably aware, the item(s) being 
exported may be used to produce 
exports or provide services in 
competition with the exportation of 
goods or provision of services by a 
United States industry. 

Parties: 
Principal Supplier: Foster Wheeler. 
Obligor: STAR Rafineri A.Ş. 
Guarantor(s): N/A. 
Description of Items Being Exported: 
The items being exported are coker 

heaters, furnaces, flare, and various 
other components. 

Information on Decision: Information 
on the final decision for this transaction 
will be available in the ‘‘Summary 
Minutes of Meetings of Board of 
Directors’’ on http://exim.gov/
newsandevents/boardmeetings/board/. 

Confidential Information: Please note 
that this notice does not include 
confidential or proprietary business 
information; information which, if 
disclosed, would violate the Trade 
Secrets Act; or information which 
would jeopardize jobs in the United 
States by supplying information that 
competitors could use to compete with 
companies in the United States. 

DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before September 13, 2013 to be 
assured of consideration before final 
consideration of the transaction by the 
Board of Directors of Ex-Im Bank. 

ADDRESSES: Comments may be 
submitted through Regulations.gov at 
WWW.REGULATIONS.GOV. To submit 
a comment, enter EIB–2013–0040 under 
the heading ‘‘Enter Keyword or ID’’ and 
select Search. Follow the instructions 
provided at the Submit a Comment 
screen. Please include your name, 

company name (if any) and EIB–2013– 
0040 on any attached document. 

Cristopolis A. Dieguez, 
Program Specialist, Office of the General 
Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2013–20122 Filed 8–16–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6690–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[WC Docket No. 06–122; DA 13–1700] 

Wireline Competition Bureau Seeks 
Comment on Proposed Sample 
Reseller Certification Language for 
FCC Form 499–A Instructions 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In this document, the Federal 
Communications Commission’s 
Wireline Competition Bureau (Bureau) 
seeks comment on a proposal filed by a 
group of 8 industry participants 
(available at http://appsint.fcc.gov/ecfs/ 
document/view?id=7520933957) 
regarding revisions to sample reseller 
certification language and 
accompanying sections of the FCC Form 
499–A instructions. In the 2012 
Wholesaler-Reseller Clarification Order, 
(FCC 12–134), the Commission directed 
the Bureau to revise the sample 
language to reflect the clarifications 
provided in that order, and allowed 
contributors to rely on existing sample 
language through December 31, 2013. 
The Bureau seeks comment on whether 
it should include the industry 
participants’ proposed revisions in the 
2014 FCC Form 499–A instructions. 
DATES: Comments are due on or before 
September 6, 2013 and reply comments 
are due on September 13, 2013. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by WC Docket No. 06–122; 
DA 13–1700, by any of the following 
methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Federal Communications 
Commission’s Web site: http://
fjallfoss.fcc.gov/ecfs2/. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• People with Disabilities: Contact the 
FCC to request reasonable 
accommodations (accessible format 
documents, sign language interpreters, 
CART, etc.) by email: FCC504@fcc.gov 
or phone: (202) 418–0530 or TTY: (202) 
418–0432. 

For detailed instructions for 
submitting comments and additional 

information on the rulemaking process, 
see the SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION 
section of this document. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Carol Pomponio, Wireline Competition 
Bureau, (202) 418–7400 or TTY: (202) 
418–0484. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This is a 
synopsis of the Wireline Competition 
Bureau’s Public Notice in WC Docket 
No. 06–122; DA 13–1700, released 
August 2, 2013. The complete text of 
this document is available for 
inspection and copying during normal 
business hours in the FCC Reference 
Information Center, Portals II, 445 12th 
Street SW., Room CY–A257, 
Washington, DC 20554. The document 
may also be purchased from the 
Commission’s duplicating contractor, 
Best Copy and Printing, Inc. (BCPI), 445 
12th Street SW., Room CY–B402, 
Washington, DC 20554, telephone (800) 
378–3160 or (202) 863–2893, facsimile 
(202) 863–2898, or via the Internet at 
http://www.bcpiweb.com. It is also 
available on the Commission’s Web site 
at http://www.fcc.gov. 

Pursuant to sections 1.415 and 1.419 
of the Commission’s rules, interested 
parties may file comments on or before 
September 6, 2013 and reply comments 
on or before September 13, 2013. All 
pleadings are to reference WC Docket 
06–122. Comments may be filed using 
the Commission’s Electronic Comment 
Filing System (ECFS) or by filing paper 
copies. See Electronic Filing of 
Documents in Rulemaking Proceedings, 
63 FR 24121, May 1, 1998. 

• Electronic Filers: Comments may be 
filed electronically using the Internet by 
accessing the ECFS: http://
fjallfoss.fcc.gov/ecfs2/. 

• Paper Filers: Parties who choose to 
file by paper must file an original and 
one copy of each filing. If more than one 
docket or rulemaking number appears in 
the caption of this proceeding, filers 
must submit two additional copies for 
each additional docket or rulemaking 
number. Filings can be sent by hand or 
messenger delivery, by commercial 
overnight courier, or by first-class or 
overnight U.S. Postal Service mail. All 
filings must be addressed to the 
Commission’s Secretary, Office of the 
Secretary, Federal Communications 
Commission. 

• All hand-delivered or messenger- 
delivered paper filings for the 
Commission’s Secretary must be 
delivered to FCC Headquarters at 445 
12th St. SW., Room TW–A325, 
Washington, DC 20554. The filing hours 
are 8:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. All hand 
deliveries must be held together with 
rubber bands or fasteners. Any 
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envelopes and boxes must be disposed 
of before entering the building. 

• Commercial overnight mail (other 
than U.S. Postal Service Express Mail 
and Priority Mail) must be sent to 9300 
East Hampton Drive, Capitol Heights, 
MD 20743. 

• U.S. Postal Service first-class, 
Express, and Priority mail must be 
addressed to 445 12th Street SW., 
Washington DC 20554. 

• People with Disabilities: To request 
materials in accessible formats for 
people with disabilities (braille, large 
print, electronic files, audio format), 
send an email to fcc504@fcc.gov or call 
the Consumer & Governmental Affairs 
Bureau at 202–418–0530 (voice), 202– 
418–0432 (tty). 

Additional Copies. In addition, we 
request that you send one copy of each 
pleading to each of the following: 

D Carol Pomponio, 
Telecommunications Access Policy 
Division, Wireline Competition Bureau, 
445 12th Street SW., Room 5–A360, 
Washington, DC 20554; email: 
Carol.Pomponio@fcc.gov; and 

D Charles Tyler, Telecommunications 
Access Policy Division, Wireline 
Competition Bureau, 445 12th Street, 
SW., Room 5–A452, Washington, DC 
20554; email: Charles.Tyler@fcc.gov. 

The Bureau seeks comment on a 
proposal filed by eight industry 
participants for revisions to sample 
reseller certification language and 
accompanying sections of the FCC Form 
499–A instructions, available at http://
appsint.fcc.gov/ecfs/document/
view?id=7520933957. In the 2012 
Wholesaler-Reseller Clarification Order, 
(FCC 12–134), 27 FCC Rcd 13780, 
13798, para. 41, the Commission 
directed the Bureau to revise the sample 
language to reflect the clarifications 
provided in that order, and allowed 
contributors to rely on existing sample 
language through December 31, 2013. 
The Bureau seeks comment on whether 
it should include the industry 
participants’ revisions in the 2014 FCC 
Form 499–A instructions. 

Ex Parte Rules. The proceeding this 
Notice initiates shall be treated as a 
‘‘permit-but-disclose’’ proceeding in 
accordance with the Commission’s ex 
parte rules. Persons making ex parte 
presentations must file a copy of any 
written presentation or a memorandum 
summarizing any oral presentation 
within two business days after the 
presentation (unless a different deadline 
applicable to the Sunshine period 
applies). Persons making oral ex parte 
presentations are reminded that 
memoranda summarizing the 
presentation must (1) list all persons 
attending or otherwise participating in 

the meeting at which the ex parte 
presentation was made, and (2) 
summarize all data presented and 
arguments made during the 
presentation. If the presentation 
consisted in whole or in part of the 
presentation of data or arguments 
already reflected in the presenter’s 
written comments, memoranda or other 
filings in the proceeding, the presenter 
may provide citations to such data or 
arguments in his or her prior comments, 
memoranda, or other filings (specifying 
the relevant page and/or paragraph 
numbers where such data or arguments 
can be found) in lieu of summarizing 
them in the memorandum. Documents 
shown or given to Commission staff 
during ex parte meetings are deemed to 
be written ex parte presentations and 
must be filed consistent with rule 
1.1206(b). In proceedings governed by 
rule 1.49(f) or for which the 
Commission has made available a 
method of electronic filing, written ex 
parte presentations and memoranda 
summarizing oral ex parte 
presentations, and all attachments 
thereto, must be filed through the 
electronic comment filing system 
available for that proceeding, and must 
be filed in their native format (e.g., .doc, 
.xml, .ppt, searchable .pdf). Participants 
in this proceeding should familiarize 
themselves with the Commission’s ex 
parte rules. 

For further information, please 
contact Carol Pomponio, 
Telecommunications Access Policy 
Division, Wireline Competition Bureau 
at (202) 418–7400 or TTY (202) 418– 
0484, or Carol.Pomponio@fcc.gov. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Kimberly Scardino, 
Chief, Telecommunications Access Policy 
Division, Wireline Competition Bureau. 
[FR Doc. 2013–20158 Filed 8–16–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL TRADE COMMISSION 

[Docket No. 9355] 

Pinnacle Entertainment, Inc., and 
Ameristar Casinos, Inc.; Analysis of 
Agreement Containing Consent Orders 
To Aid Public Comment 

AGENCY: Federal Trade Commission. 
ACTION: Proposed consent agreement. 

SUMMARY: The consent agreement in this 
matter settles alleged violations of 
federal law prohibiting unfair or 
deceptive acts or practices or unfair 
methods of competition. The attached 
Analysis to Aid Public Comment 
describes both the allegations in the 

complaint and the terms of the consent 
order—embodied in the consent 
agreement—that would settle these 
allegations. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before September 11, 2013. 
ADDRESSES: Interested parties may file a 
comment at https://
ftcpublic.commentworks.com/ftc/
pinnacleentertainconsent online or on 
paper, by following the instructions in 
the Request for Comment part of the 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION section 
below. Write ‘‘Pinnacle, Docket No. 
9355’’ on your comment and file your 
comment online at https://
ftcpublic.commentworks.com/ftc/
pinnacleentertainconsent by following 
the instructions on the web-based form. 
If you prefer to file your comment on 
paper, mail or deliver your comment to 
the following address: Federal Trade 
Commission, Office of the Secretary, 
Room H–113 (Annex D), 600 
Pennsylvania Avenue NW., Washington, 
DC 20580. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Alexis Gilman (202–326–2579), FTC, 
Bureau of Competition, 600 
Pennsylvania Avenue NW., Washington, 
DC 20580. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Pursuant 
to Section 6(f) of the Federal Trade 
Commission Act, 15 U.S.C. 46(f), and 
FTC Rule 3.25, 16 CFR 3.25, notice is 
hereby given that the above-captioned 
consent agreement containing a consent 
orders to cease and desist, having been 
filed with and accepted, subject to final 
approval, by the Commission, has been 
placed on the public record for a period 
of thirty (30) days. The following 
Analysis to Aid Public Comment 
describes the terms of the consent 
agreement, and the allegations in the 
complaint. An electronic copy of the 
full text of the consent agreement 
package can be obtained from the FTC 
Home Page (for August 12, 2013), on the 
World Wide Web, at http://www.ftc.gov/ 
os/actions.shtm. A paper copy can be 
obtained from the FTC Public Reference 
Room, Room 130–H, 600 Pennsylvania 
Avenue NW, Washington, DC 20580, 
either in person or by calling (202) 326– 
2222. 

You can file a comment online or on 
paper. For the Commission to consider 
your comment, we must receive it on or 
before September 11, 2013. Write 
‘‘Pinnacle, Docket No. 9355’’ on your 
comment. Your comment, including 
your name and your state, will be 
placed on the public record of this 
proceeding, including, to the extent 
practicable, on the public Commission 
Web site, at http://www.ftc.gov/os/
publiccomments.shtm. As a matter of 
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