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The Interest Rates are: 

Percent 

Homeowners With Credit Avail-
able Elsewhere ......................... 5.375 

Homeowners Without Credit 
Available Elsewhere .................. 2.687 

Businesses With Credit Available 
Elsewhere ................................. 8.000 

Businesses & Small Agricultural 
Cooperatives Without Credit 
Available Elsewhere .................. 4.000 

Other (Including Non-Profit Orga-
nizations) With Credit Available 
Elsewhere ................................. 5.250 

Businesses and Non-Profit Orga-
nizations Without Credit Avail-
able Elsewhere ......................... 4.000 

The number assigned to this disaster 
for physical damage is 11279 5 and for 
economic injury is 11280 0. 

The States which received an EIDL 
Declaration # are Massachusetts, New 
Hampshire. 
(Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance 
Numbers 59002 and 59008) 

Jovita Carranza, 
Deputy Administrator. 
[FR Doc. E8–13387 Filed 6–12–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 8025–01–P 

SMALL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 

[License No. 09/79–0454] 

Emergence Capital Partners SBIC, 
L.P.; Notice Seeking Exemption Under 
Section 312 of the Small Business 
Investment Act, Conflicts of Interest 

Notice is hereby given that Emergence 
Capital Partners SBIC, L.P., 160 Bovet 
Road, Suite 300, San Mateo, CA 94402, 
a Federal Licensee under the Small 
Business Investment Act of 1958, as 
amended (‘‘the Act’’), in connection 
with the financing of a small concern, 
has sought an exemption under section 
312 of the Act and section 107.730, 
Financings which Constitute Conflicts 
of Interest of the Small Business 
Administration (‘‘SBA’’) Rules and 
Regulations (13 CFR 107.730). 
Emergence Capital Partners SBIC, L.P. 
proposes to provide equity/debt security 
financing to InsideView Technologies, 
Inc., 444 DeHaro Street, Suite 210, San 
Francisco, CA 94107 (‘‘InsideView’’). 

The financing is brought within the 
purview of § 107.730(a)(1) of the 
Regulations because Emergence Capital 
Partners, L.P. and Emergence Capital 
Associates, L.P., all Associates of 
Emergence Capital Partners SBIC, L.P., 
own more than ten percent of 
InsideView, and therefore this 
transaction is considered a financing of 

an Associate requiring prior SBA 
approval. 

Notice is hereby given that any 
interested person may submit written 
comments on the transaction, within 
fifteen days of the date of this 
publication, to the Associate 
Administrator for Investment, U.S. 
Small Business Administration, 409 
Third Street, SW., Washington, DC 
20416. 

May 22, 2008. 
A. Joseph Shepard, 
Associate Administrator for Investment. 
[FR Doc. E8–13342 Filed 6–12–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 8025–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Public Notice 6254] 

Defense Trade Advisory Group; Notice 
of Meetings June 19, 2008 

SUMMARY: On June 4, 2008, a Federal 
Register Notice (73 FR 31908) was 
published announcing the Defense 
Trade Advisory Group’s (DTAG’s) open 
meeting on June 19, 2008 from 9 a.m. to 
12 noon in the East Auditorium at the 
U.S. Department of State, Harry S. 
Truman Building, Washington, DC. This 
notice serves to announce the closed 
meeting being held from 8 a.m. to 
9 a.m. as well as the purpose and topics 
for discussion of the June 19th meetings. 
DATES: There will be two meetings held 
the morning of June 19. The first 
meeting will be held from 8 a.m. to 
9 a.m. and is for DTAG-members only. 
A second meeting will be held from 9 
a.m. to 12 noon and is open to the 
public. 
ADDRESSES: Both meetings on June 19th 
will be held in the East Auditorium at 
the U.S. Department of State, Harry S. 
Truman Building, Washington DC. 
DTAG members and non-member 
observers are required to pre-register 
due to security reasons; for further 
information regarding pre-registration 
requirements please see the notice 
published on June 4, 2008 (73 FR 
31908). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Members of the public who need 
additional information regarding these 
meetings or the DTAG should contact 
the DTAG Executive Secretariat contact 
person, Allie Frantz, PM/DDTC, SA–1, 
12th Floor, Directorate of Defense Trade 
Controls, Bureau of Political-Military 
Affairs, U.S. Department of State, 
Washington, DC 20522–0112; telephone 
(202) 736–9220; FAX (202) 261–8199; or 
e-mail FrantzA@state.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

(a) Background 

The membership of this advisory 
committee consists of private sector 
defense trade representatives, appointed 
by the Assistant Secretary of State for 
Political-Military Affairs, who advise 
the Department on policies, regulations, 
and technical issues affecting defense 
trade. Individuals interested in defense 
trade issues are invited to attend the 
open session and will be able to 
participate in the discussion in 
accordance with the Chair’s 
instructions. Members of the public 
may, if they wish, submit a brief 
statement to the committee in writing. 

June 19, 2008, 8 a.m. to 9 a.m. 
Meeting—The purpose of this DTAG- 
members only meeting is to provide the 
new DTAG membership for the 2008– 
2010 term an overview of administrative 
procedures, and to conclude other 
preparatory work. The meeting will be 
closed in accordance with 41 CFR 102– 
3.160. Individuals who have been 
appointed to the DTAG for the 2008– 
2010 term have already been notified. 

June 19, 2008, 9 a.m. to 12 noon 
Meeting—Topics for discussion and 
assigned time frames are as follows: 
Self-Financing Options available for the 
Directorate of Defense Trade Controls 
0900–1000; UK-US Defense Trade 
Cooperation Treaty Implementing 
Regulations—1000–1100; and the new 
USML Category VIII regulations 
implementing Section 17(c) of the 
Export Administration Act (EAA)— 
1100–1230. 

(b) Availability of Materials for the 
Meetings 

Please visit the Directorate of Defense 
Trade Controls’ Web site at http:// 
pmddtc.state.gov/index.htm for any 
available materials pertaining to the 
topics for discussion. Draft Federal 
Register Notices on the DTAG topics of 
discussion will be posted on the PM/ 
DDTC Web site under the DTAG tab no 
later than June 12, 2008. 

(c) Procedures for Providing Public 
Comments 

The DTAG will accept written public 
comments as well as oral public 
comments. Comments should be 
relevant to the topics for discussion. 
Public participation at the open meeting 
will be based on recognition by the 
chair and may not exceed 5 minutes per 
speaker. Written comments should be 
sent to the DTAG Executive Secretariat 
contact person not later than June 17, 
2008 so that the comments may be made 
available to the DTAG members for 
consideration. Written comments 
should be supplied to the DTAG 

VerDate Aug<31>2005 16:18 Jun 12, 2008 Jkt 214001 PO 00000 Frm 00071 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\13JNN1.SGM 13JNN1rw
ilk

in
s 

on
 P

R
O

D
1P

C
63

 w
ith

 N
O

T
IC

E
S


		Superintendent of Documents
	2010-07-18T11:54:21-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




