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In addition, the Commission offers a 
free service called eSubscription which 
allows you to keep track of all formal 
issuances and submittals in specific 
dockets. This can reduce the amount of 
time you spend researching proceedings 
by automatically providing you with 
notification of these filings, document 
summaries and direct links to the 
documents. Go to http://www.ferc.gov/ 
esubscribenow.htm. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E8–21874 Filed 9–18–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. AC08–161–000] 

Florida Gas Transmission Company, 
LLC; Notice of Filing 

September 11, 2008. 
Take notice that on August 14, 2008, 

Florida Gas Transmission Company, 
LLC (FGT) submitted a filing seeking 
permission to start capitalizing interest 
on its planned Phase VIII Expansion 
Project commensurate with the date of 
its filing, in Docket No. PF08–14–000, of 
its intent to file an application for a 
certificate under the Commission’s Pre- 
filing procedures set forth in 18 CFR 
157.21 (2008), instead of pursuant to 
accounting guidance promulgated in 
Accounting Release No. 5, 
Capitalization of Interest During 
Construction. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. Anyone filing a motion 
to intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant and 
all the parties in this proceeding. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 

888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on September 25, 2008. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E8–21889 Filed 9–18–08; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Revised Notice for Commission Open 
Meeting on September 18, 2008 

September 12, 2008. 

On September 11, 2008, the 
Commission issued a Notice pursuant to 
the Government in the Sunshine Act, 5 
U.S.C. 552b, announcing the agenda for 
the Commission’s open meeting to be 
held on September 18, 2008. 

Take notice that the docket numbers 
for the item listed as ‘‘E–25’’ are revised 
to read as follows: 

E–25; RM06–16–004 and RR08–1–001. 

A corrected version of the Sunshine 
Notice for the September 18, 2008 open 
meeting will be posted in the 
Commission’s eLibrary system and the 
Commission’s Web site. 

This Notice is issued pursuant to the 
Government in the Sunshine Act, 5 
U.S.C. 552b. Chairman Kelliher, 
Commissioners Kelly, Spitzer, Moeller 
and Wellinghoff, voted to issue this 
notice on September 12, 2008. 

Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E8–21869 Filed 9–18–08; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. PR08–29–000] 

Northern Illinois Gas Company; Notice 
of Petition for Rate Approval 

September 11, 2008. 

Take notice that on September 3, 
2008, Northern Illinois Gas Company 
(Nicor Gas) filed an application for rate 
approval pursuant to sections 
284.123(b)(2) and 284.224 of the 
Commission’s regulations. Nicor Gas 
requests that the Commission approve: 
(1) An increase in its currently effective 
rates for services provided pursuant to 
Nicor Gas’ blanket certificate issued in 
Docket No. CP92–481–000; and (2) to 
make certain revisions to its Statement 
of Operating Conditions. 

Any person desiring to participate in 
this rate filing must file in accordance 
with Rules 211 and 214 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, on 
or before the date as indicated below. 
Anyone filing an intervention or protest 
must serve a copy of that document on 
the Applicant. Anyone filing an 
intervention or protest on or before the 
intervention or protest date need not 
serve motions to intervene or protests 
on persons other than the Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 
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