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system is an ‘‘anonymous access’’ 
system, which means EPA will not 
know your identity, email address, or 
other contact information unless you 
provide it in the body of your comment. 

Please ensure that your comments are 
submitted within the specified comment 
period. Comments received after the 
close of the comment period will be 
marked ‘‘late.’’ EPA is not required to 
consider these late comments. 

Jennifer Lewis, 
Acting Associate General Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2023–02351 Filed 2–2–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[FRL OP–OFA–055] 

Environmental Impact Statements; 
Notice of Availability 

Responsible Agency: Office of Federal 
Activities, General Information 202– 
564–5632 or https://www.epa.gov/nepa. 

Weekly receipt of Environmental Impact 
Statements (EIS) 

Filed January 23, 2023 10 a.m. EST 
Through January 30, 2023 10 a.m. EST 

Pursuant to 40 CFR 1506.9. 

Notice: Section 309(a) of the Clean Air 
Act requires that EPA make public its 
comments on EISs issued by other 
Federal agencies. EPA’s comment letters 
on EISs are available at: https://
cdxapps.epa.gov/cdx-enepa-II/public/ 
action/eis/search. 

EIS No. 20230013, Final, USAF, AR, 
Beddown of a Foreign Military Sales 
Pilot Training Center at Ebbing Air 
National Guard Base, Arkansas or 
Selfridge Air National Guard Base, 
Michigan, Review Period Ends: 03/06/ 
2023, Contact: David Martin 210– 
925–4266. 

EIS No. 20230014, Final, STB, MO, 
Canadian Pacific Acquisition of 
Kansas City Southern, Review Period 
Ends: 03/06/2023, Contact: Danielle 
Gosselin 202–245–0300. 

EIS No. 20230015, Final Supplement, 
BLM, AK, Final Supplemental 
Environmental Impact Statement for 
the Willow Master Development Plan, 
Alaska, Review Period Ends: 03/06/ 
2023, Contact: Carrie Cecil 907–271– 
1306. 

EIS No. 20230016, Final Supplement, 
USFS, MT, Gold Butterfly Project, 
Review Period Ends: 03/13/2023, 
Contact: Matthew Anderson 406–363– 
7121. 

Dated: January 30, 2023. 
Cindy S. Barger, 
Director, NEPA Compliance Division, Office 
of Federal Activities. 
[FR Doc. 2023–02319 Filed 2–2–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0056; FR ID 125135] 

Information Collection Being Reviewed 
by the Federal Communications 
Commission 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995, the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
the Commission) invites the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 

The FCC may not conduct or sponsor 
a collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid control 
number. No person shall be subject to 
any penalty for failing to comply with 
a collection of information subject to the 
PRA that does not display a valid Office 
of Management and Budget (OMB) 
control number. 
DATES: Written PRA comments should 
be submitted on or before April 4, 2023. 
If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments, but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contact listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Nicole Ongele, FCC, via email PRA@
fcc.gov and to nicole.ongele@fcc.gov. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection, contact Nicole 
Ongele, (202) 418–2991. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
OMB Control Number: 3060–0056. 
Title: Part 68, Connection of Terminal 

Equipment to the Telephone Network. 
Form Number: N/A. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit. 
Number of Respondents and 

Responses: 41,354 respondents; 44,423 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.25 
hours–40 hours. 

Frequency of Response: On occasion 
reporting requirement, third party 
disclosure requirement, and 
recordkeeping requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. Statutory 
authority for this information collection 
is contained in 47 U.S.C. 151–154, 201– 
205 and 303(r). 

Total Annual Burden: 12,869 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: $508,250. 
Privacy Act Impact Assessment: No 

impact(s). 
Nature and Extent of Confidentiality: 

Part 68 rules do not require respondents 
to provide proprietary, trade secret or 
other confidential information to the 
Commission. If the FCC requests that 
respondents submit information which 
respondents believe is confidential, 
respondents may request confidential 
treatment of such information pursuant 
to section 0.459 of the FCC’s rules, 47 
CFR 0.459. 

Needs and Uses: The purpose of 47 
CFR part 68 is to protect the telephone 
network from certain types of harm and 
prevent interference to subscribers. To 
(1) demonstrate that terminal equipment 
complies with criteria for protecting the 
network and (2) ensure that consumers, 
providers of telecommunications, the 
Commission and others are able to trace 
products to the party responsible for 
ensuring compliance with these criteria; 
it is essential to require manufacturers 
or other responsible parties to provide 
the information required by Part 68. In 
addition, incumbent local exchange 
carriers must provide the information in 
Part 68 to warn their subscribers of 
impending disconnection of service 
when subscriber terminal equipment is 
causing telephone network harm, and to 
inform subscribers of a change in 
network facilities that requires 
modification or alteration of subscribers’ 
terminal equipment. 
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Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–02217 Filed 2–2–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Change in Bank Control Notices; 
Acquisitions of Shares of a Bank or 
Bank Holding Company 

The notificants listed below have 
applied under the Change in Bank 
Control Act (Act) (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)) and 
§ 225.41 of the Board’s Regulation Y (12 
CFR 225.41) to acquire shares of a bank 
or bank holding company. The factors 
that are considered in acting on the 
applications are set forth in paragraph 7 
of the Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)(7)). 

The public portions of the 
applications listed below, as well as 
other related filings required by the 
Board, if any, are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank(s) indicated below and at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
This information may also be obtained 
on an expedited basis, upon request, by 
contacting the appropriate Federal 
Reserve Bank and from the Board’s 
Freedom of Information Office at 
https://www.federalreserve.gov/foia/ 
request.htm. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on the 
standards enumerated in paragraph 7 of 
the Act. 

Comments regarding each of these 
applications must be received at the 
Reserve Bank indicated or the offices of 
the Board of Governors, Ann E. 
Misback, Secretary of the Board, 20th 
Street and Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington DC 20551–0001, not later 
than February 21, 2023. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Kansas 
City (Jeffrey Imgarten, Assistant Vice 
President) 1 Memorial Drive, Kansas 
City, Missouri, 64198: 

1. Deborah Hunkins and Amanda 
Hunkins Newton, both of Cheyenne, 
Wyoming; Blake Hunkins, Grand Island, 
Nebraska; Robert McBride, and The 
Scott F. McBride and Terrie Ann 
McEwen Living Trust, Scott F. McBride 
and Terrie Ann McEwen, both as co- 
trustees and all of Buffalo, Wyoming; 
Shawna McBride, Laramie, Wyoming; 
and Kelly Rickett, Sheridan, Wyoming; 
to become members of the McBride 
Family Group, a group acting in concert, 
to retain voting shares of First National 
Buffalo Bankshares, Inc., and thereby 
indirectly retain voting shares of First 
Northern Bank of Wyoming, both of 
Buffalo, Wyoming, and First State Bank 
of Newcastle, Newcastle, Wyoming. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System. 
Michele Taylor Fennell, 
Deputy Associate Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2023–02308 Filed 2–2–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Centers for Medicare & Medicaid 
Services 

[Document Identifiers CMS–10110 & CMS– 
10537] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request 

AGENCY: Centers for Medicare & 
Medicaid Services, Health and Human 
Services (HHS). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Centers for Medicare & 
Medicaid Services (CMS) is announcing 
an opportunity for the public to 
comment on CMS’ intention to collect 
information from the public. Under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA), federal agencies are required to 
publish notice in the Federal Register 
concerning each proposed collection of 
information (including each proposed 
extension or reinstatement of an existing 
collection of information) and to allow 
60 days for public comment on the 
proposed action. Interested persons are 
invited to send comments regarding our 
burden estimates or any other aspect of 
this collection of information, including 
the necessity and utility of the proposed 
information collection for the proper 
performance of the agency’s functions, 
the accuracy of the estimated burden, 
ways to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected, and the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology to minimize the 
information collection burden. 
DATES: Comments must be received by 
April 4, 2023. 
ADDRESSES: When commenting, please 
reference the document identifier or 
OMB control number. To be assured 
consideration, comments and 
recommendations must be submitted in 
any one of the following ways: 

1. Electronically. You may send your 
comments electronically to http://
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for ‘‘Comment or 
Submission’’ or ‘‘More Search Options’’ 
to find the information collection 
document(s) that are accepting 
comments. 

2. By regular mail. You may mail 
written comments to the following 
address: CMS, Office of Strategic 
Operations and Regulatory Affairs, 
Division of Regulations Development, 
Attention: Document Identifier/OMB 
Control Number: ll, Room C4–26–05, 
7500 Security Boulevard, Baltimore, 
Maryland 21244–1850. 

To obtain copies of a supporting 
statement and any related forms for the 
proposed collection(s) summarized in 
this notice, please access the CMS PRA 
website by copying and pasting the 
following web address into your web 
browser: https://www.cms.gov/ 
Regulations-and-Guidance/Legislation/
PaperworkReductionActof1995/PRA- 
Listing. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
William N. Parham at (410) 786–4669. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Contents 
This notice sets out a summary of the 

use and burden associated with the 
following information collections. More 
detailed information can be found in 
each collection’s supporting statement 
and associated materials (see 
ADDRESSES). 
CMS–10110 Manufacturer Submission 

of Average Sales Price (ASP) Data for 
Medicare Part B Drugs and Biologicals 

CMS–10537 CAHPS Hospice Survey 
Under the PRA (44 U.S.C. 3501– 

3520), federal agencies must obtain 
approval from the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) for each collection of 
information they conduct or sponsor. 
The term ‘‘collection of information’’ is 
defined in 44 U.S.C. 3502(3) and 5 CFR 
1320.3(c) and includes agency requests 
or requirements that members of the 
public submit reports, keep records, or 
provide information to a third party. 
Section 3506(c)(2)(A) of the PRA 
requires federal agencies to publish a 
60-day notice in the Federal Register 
concerning each proposed collection of 
information, including each proposed 
extension or reinstatement of an existing 
collection of information, before 
submitting the collection to OMB for 
approval. To comply with this 
requirement, CMS is publishing this 
notice. 

Information Collection 
1. Type of Information Collection 

Request: Revision of a currently 
approved collection; Title of 
Information Collection: Manufacturer 
Submission of Average Sales Price 
(ASP) Data for Medicare Part B Drugs 
and Biologicals; Use: Section 401 of 
Division CC of Title IV of the 
Consolidated Appropriations Act 
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