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service (TRS) in exercising this 
delegated authority. 

Pursuant to this updated delegated 
authority, the Bureaus released a Public 
Notice, DA 24–918, 89 FR 80449 (rel. 
Sept. 11, 2024) (September 11, 2024 
Public Notice), in which it sought to 
refresh the record on possible revisions 
to the Annual Report instructions, 
templates, and certification form, in 
addition to those proposed in the 
August 3, 2023 Public Notice, and to 
implement the modifications to the 
annual reporting and certification 
requirements adopted by the 
Commission in the 2024 IPCS Order. 
The Bureaus also sought comment on 
any additional modifications the 
Bureaus should consider to make these 
forms consistent with the new IPCS 
rules, including the varied compliance 
dates adopted in the 2024 IPCS Order 
for the Commission’s rate cap and site 
commission reforms. 

On January 8, 2025, the Bureaus 
released an Order, WC Docket Nos. 23– 
62, 12–375, DA 25–23 (rel. Jan. 8, 2025) 
(2025 Annual Reports Order), https://
www.fcc.gov/document/2025-ipcs- 
annual-reports-order, revising the 
instructions and reporting templates for 
the Annual Reports, as well as the 
associated certification form. The 
revisions reflect the proposals contained 
in the August 3, 2023 Public Notice and 
September 11, 2024 Public Notice, with 
refinements and modifications made in 
response to comments in support of 
more streamlined, and therefore less 
burdensome, reporting obligations. The 
revisions also reflect the Commission’s 
expanded authority under the Martha 
Wright-Reed Act, including authority 
over video IPCS, as well as the reporting 
requirements proposed in the August 3, 
2023 Public Notice regarding access to 
IPCS by persons with communication 
disabilities, including access to TRS. 

We note that we are addressing the 
information requirements and burdens 
of this collection in several discrete 
steps. In the first step, we sought OMB 
approval of the requirements in section 
64.6040(c) in order to effectuate the 
improved access to communications 
services for incarcerated people with 
communication disabilities required by 
section 64.6040(c). We received OMB 
approval of those information collection 
requirements on December 14, 2023. See 
89 FR 269 (Jan. 3, 2024). 

In the second step, which is still in 
process, the Federal Register published 
a 60-Day Notice on October 25, 2024, 
inviting comment on the additional 
information collection requirements 
imposed by the 2024 IPCS Order. 
October 25, 2024 60-Day Notice, WC 
Docket Nos. 23–62, 12–375, 89 FR 

85209 (Oct. 25, 2024) (2024 60-Day 
Notice). We will continue to address the 
paperwork burdens associated with that 
portion of this information collection 
separately from the Annual Reports 
burdens addressed here. In the 2024 60- 
Day Notice, we stated that the 
Commission had not yet issued an order 
adopting changes to the instructions, 
templates, and certification form for the 
Annual Reports. We also stated that 
upon release of an order adopting any 
such changes, we would address any 
paperwork burdens arising from those 
changes in a subsequent 60-Day Notice 
under the PRA. 

Accordingly, in this 60-Day Notice, 
we seek comment on the paperwork 
burdens associated with the specific 
revisions to the instructions, reporting 
templates, and certification form 
adopted in the 2025 Annual Reports 
Order. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–03605 Filed 3–5–25; 8:45 am] 
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World Radiocommunication 
Conference Advisory Committee 
Schedules Its Third Meeting on April 
15, 2025 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: This notice advises interested 
persons that the third meeting of the 
World Radiocommunication Conference 
Advisory Committee (WRC Advisory 
Committee) will be held on April 15, 
2025 at the Federal Communications 
Commission (FCC). This third meeting 
of the WRC Advisory Committee will 
consider status reports and 
recommendations from its Informal 
Working Groups (IWG) concerning 
preparation for the 2027 World 
Radiocommunication Conference 
(WRC–27). At the third meeting, the 
WRC Advisory Committee will continue 
its work to finalize the 
Recommendations for WRC–27 Agenda 
Items that do not have yet a WRC 
Advisory Committee Recommendation. 
This meeting is open to the public. The 
meeting will be broadcast live with 
open captioning over the internet from 
the FCC Live web page at www.fcc.gov/ 
live. There will be audience 

participation available; send live 
questions to livequestions@fcc.gov 
during this meeting. The Commission’s 
WRC–27 website (www.fcc.gov/wrc-27) 
contains the latest updated information 
and agendas on all scheduled meetings 
and Advisory Committee matters. 
Comments may be presented at the 
Advisory Committee meeting or in 
advance of the meeting by email to: 
WRC-27@fcc.gov. 

DATES: Tuesday, April 15, 2025 at 11:00 
a.m. 

ADDRESSES: Federal Communications 
Commission, 45 L Street NE, Room 
1.200, Washington, DC 20554. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Gregory Baker, Designated Federal 
Official, World Radiocommunication 
Conference Advisory Committee, Office 
of International Affairs, Global Strategy 
and Negotiation Division, (202)–919– 
0758 or WRC-27@fcc.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The FCC 
established the Advisory Committee to 
provide advice, technical support and 
recommendations relating to the 
preparation of United States proposals 
and positions for the 2027 World 
Radiocommunication Conference 
(WRC–27). 

In accordance with the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act, Public Law 
92–463, as amended, this notice advises 
interested persons of the third meeting 
of the Advisory Committee. The 
Commission’s WRC–27 website 
(www.fcc.gov/wrc-27) contains the latest 
information on the IWG and WAC 
meeting agendas and audience 
participation information, all scheduled 
meeting dates and updates, and WRC– 
27 Advisory Committee matters. The 
second Advisory Committee meeting 
will be broadcast live with open 
captioning over the internet from the 
FCC Live web page at www.fcc.gov/live. 
There will be audience participation 
available; send live questions to 
livequestions@fcc.gov only during this 
meeting. Reasonable accommodations 
for people with disabilities are available 
upon request. Include a description of 
the accommodation you will need and 
tell us how to contact you if we need 
more information. Make your request as 
early as possible. Last minute requests 
will be accepted, but may be impossible 
to fill. Send an email to: FCC504@
fcc.gov or call the Consumer and 
Governmental Affairs Bureau at 202– 
418–0530 (voice). 

The proposed agenda for the third 
WAC meeting is as follows: 
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Agenda 

Third Meeting of the World 
Radiocommunication Conference 
Advisory Committee 

Federal Communications Commission 

Tuesday, April 15, 2025; 11:00 a.m. 

1. Opening Remarks 
2. Approval of Agenda 
3. Approval of the Minutes of the 

Second Meeting 
4. IWG Reports and Consideration 

Documents 
5. Future Meetings 
6. Other Business 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Nese Guendelsberger, 
Deputy Office Chief, Office of International 
Affairs. 
[FR Doc. 2025–03620 Filed 3–5–25; 8:45 am] 
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FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0157, OMB 3060–0996; FR ID 
282810] 

Information Collections Being 
Reviewed by the Federal 
Communications Commission Under 
Delegated Authority 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA), the Federal Communications 
Commission (FCC or Commission) 
invites the general public and other 
Federal agencies to take this 
opportunity to comment on the 
following information collections. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 
The FCC may not conduct or sponsor a 
collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid Office of 

Management and Budget (OMB) control 
number. No person shall be subject to 
any penalty for failing to comply with 
a collection of information subject to the 
PRA that does not display a valid OMB 
control number. 
DATES: Written comments should be 
submitted on or before May 5, 2025. If 
you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments but find it 
difficult to do so within the time period 
allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contacts below as soon as 
possible. 

ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Cathy Williams, FCC, via email PRA@
fcc.gov and to Cathy.Williams@fcc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection, contact Cathy 
Williams at (202) 418–2918. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0157. 
Title: Section 73.99, Presunrise 

Service Authorization (PSRA) and 
Postsunset Service Authorization 
(PSSA). 

Form Number: Not applicable. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit entities. 
Number of Respondents and 

Responses: 200 respondents; 200 
responses. 

Frequency of Response: Annual and 
on occasion reporting requirements. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.25 
hours. 

Total Annual Burden: 50 hours. 
Total Annual Costs: $15,000. 
Obligation to Respond: Required to 

obtain or retain benefits. The statutory 
authority for this collection is contained 
in Section 154(i) of the Communications 
Act of 1934, as amended. 

Needs and Uses: The information 
collection requirements contained in 47 
CFR 73.99(e) requires the licensee of an 
AM broadcast station intending to 
operate with a presunrise or postsunset 
service authorization to submit by letter 
to the Commission the licensee’s name, 
call letters, location, the intended 
service, and a description of the method 
whereby any necessary power reduction 
will be achieved. Upon submission of 
this information, operation may begin 
without further authority. The FCC staff 
uses the letter to maintain complete 
technical information about the station 
to ensure that the licensee is in full 
compliance with the Commission’s 
rules and will not cause interference to 
other stations. 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0996. 
Title: AM Auction Section 307(b) 

Submissions. 

Form Number: N/A. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit entities; Not-for-profit entities; 
State, local or Tribal governments. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 210 respondents; 210 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.5–6 
hours. 

Frequency of Response: On occasion 
reporting requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. Statutory 
authority for the information collection 
requirements is contained in Sections 
154(i), 307(b) and 309 of the 
Communications Act of 1934, as 
amended. 

Total Annual Burden: 1,029 hours. 
Total Annual Costs: $2,126,100. 
Needs and Uses: When Congress 

granted auction authority in the 
Balanced Budget Act for commercial 
broadcast and secondary broadcast 
services, it did not eliminate or revise 
section 307(b) of the Communications 
Act. Section 307(b) requires that the 
Commission effect a fair, efficient, and 
equitable distribution of radio stations 
throughout the United States. 

Section 307(b) information was 
previously collected in the framework of 
comparative hearing proceedings when 
mutually exclusive AM applications 
proposing to serve different 
communities were filed, or when non- 
mutually exclusive AM applications 
proposed a major modification of 
facility change. Since the comparative 
hearing process was discontinued as a 
result of the implementation of 
competitive bidding, the Commission 
now collects the section 307(b) 
information and undertakes a section 
307(b) analysis in the context of auction 
proceedings. For example, for mutually 
exclusive AM applications proposing to 
serve different communities, the process 
is performed prior to conducting the 
auction. 

In order to evaluate section 307(b) 
considerations, the Commission 
requires the submission of supplemental 
information subsequent to the AM 
auction filing window application (FCC 
Form 175, including technical 
information) submission. Section 307(b) 
information is not collected in the 
initial auction filing window 
application because Section 307(b) 
considerations are not pertinent to all 
window filed applications. Section 
307(b) is relevant only when the 
mutually exclusive AM application 
group consists of applications to serve 
different communities of license. 
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