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will meet on the following dates. All 
times listed are in Eastern Standard 
Time. 

1. May 8, 2023, from 9:00 a.m. to 5:00 
p.m. 

2. May 9, 2023, from 8:30 a.m. to 5:00 
p.m. 

3. May 10, 2023, from 8:30 a.m. to 
1:30 p.m. 

Comments: See the section titled 
‘‘Procedures for Providing Public Input’’ 
under SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION for 
instructions and deadlines. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will be 
conducted in person at Hyatt Place 
National Harbor, located at 123 
Waterfront Street, National Harbor, MD 
20745, and virtually. Please refer to the 
SAB website at https://sab.epa.gov for 
information on how to attend the 
meeting. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Any 
member of the public who wants further 
information concerning this notice may 
contact Dr. Zaida Figueroa, Designated 
Federal Officer (DFO), via telephone 
(202) 564–2643, or email at 
figueroa.zaida@epa.gov. General 
information about the SAB, as well as 
any updates concerning the meeting 
announced in this notice, can be found 
on the SAB website at https://
sab.epa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Background: The SAB was 

established pursuant to the 
Environmental Research, Development, 
and Demonstration Authorization Act 
(ERDDAA), codified at 42 U.S.C. 4365, 
to provide independent scientific and 
technical advice to the EPA 
Administrator on the scientific and 
technical basis for agency positions and 
regulations. The SAB is a Federal 
Advisory Committee chartered under 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA), 5 U.S.C. app. 2. The SAB will 
comply with the provisions of FACA 
and all appropriate SAB Staff Office 
procedural policies. Pursuant to FACA 
and EPA policy, notice is hereby given 
that the Science Advisory Board 
EJScreen Review Panel will hold a 
public meeting to discuss responses to 
charge questions, listen to public 
comments and peer review the EPA’s 
EJScreen methodology and updated 
calculations for the environmental 
justice (EJ) indexes released publicly in 
October 2022, as well as other aspects 
of the calculations. The Panel will also 
provide recommendations and expert 
input on other components of the tool. 

Availability of Meeting Materials: All 
meeting materials, including the agenda, 
will be available on the SAB web page 
at https://sab.epa.gov. 

Procedures for Providing Public Input: 
Public comment for consideration by 
EPA’s federal advisory committees and 
panels has a different purpose from 
public comment provided to EPA 
program offices. Therefore, the process 
for submitting comments to a federal 
advisory committee is different from the 
process used to submit comments to an 
EPA program office. Federal advisory 
committees and panels, including 
scientific advisory committees, provide 
independent advice to the EPA. 
Members of the public can submit 
relevant comments pertaining to the 
committee’s charge or meeting 
materials. Input from the public to the 
SAB will have the most impact if it 
provides specific scientific or technical 
information or analysis for the SAB to 
consider or if it relates to the clarity or 
accuracy of the technical information. 
Members of the public wishing to 
provide comment should follow the 
instruction below to submit comments. 

Oral Statements: In general, 
individuals or groups requesting an oral 
presentation at a meeting conducted 
virtually will be limited to three 
minutes and individuals or groups 
requesting an oral presentation at an in- 
person meeting will be limited to five 
minutes. Each person making an oral 
statement should consider providing 
written comments as well as their oral 
statement so that the points presented 
orally can be expanded upon in writing. 
Persons interested in providing oral 
statements should contact the DFO, in 
writing (preferably via email) at the 
contact information noted above by May 
2, 2023, to be placed on the list of 
registered speakers. 

Written Statements: Written 
statements will be accepted throughout 
the advisory process; however, for 
timely consideration by SAB members, 
statements should be submitted to the 
DFO by May 2, 2023, for consideration 
at the May 8–10, 2023, meeting. Written 
statements should be supplied to the 
DFO at the contact information above 
via email. Submitters are requested to 
provide an unsigned version. Members 
of the public should be aware that their 
personal contact information if included 
in any written comments, may be posted 
to the SAB website. Copyrighted 
material will not be posted without the 
explicit permission of the copyright 
holder. 

Accessibility: For information on 
access or services for individuals with 
disabilities, please contact the DFO, at 
the contact information noted above, 
preferably at least ten days prior to the 

meeting, to give the EPA as much time 
as possible to process your request. 

V Khanna Johnston, 
Deputy Director, Science Advisory Board Staff 
Office. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08242 Filed 4–18–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL MARITIME COMMISSION 

Notice of Agreements Filed 

The Commission hereby gives notice 
of filing of the following agreements 
under the Shipping Act of 1984. 
Interested parties may submit 
comments, relevant information, or 
documents regarding the agreements to 
the Secretary by email at Secretary@
fmc.gov, or by mail, Federal Maritime 
Commission, 800 North Capitol Street, 
Washington, DC 20573. Comments will 
be most helpful to the Commission if 
received within 12 days of the date this 
notice appears in the Federal Register, 
and the Commission requests that 
comments be submitted within 7 days 
on agreements that request expedited 
review. Copies of agreements are 
available through the Commission’s 
website (www.fmc.gov) or by contacting 
the Office of Agreements at (202)-523– 
5793 or tradeanalysis@fmc.gov. 

Agreement No.: 201348–003. 
Agreement Name: APL/SWIRE Guam, 

Saipan—S. Korea, Japan Slot Charter 
Agreement. 

Parties: American Presidents Lines, 
LLC; Swire Shipping Pte. Ltd. 

Filing Party: Conte Cicala, Clyde & Co. 
US LLP. 

Synopsis: The Amendment modifies 
the amount of space being chartered 
under the Agreement. 

Proposed Effective Date: 4/10/2023. 
Location: https://www2.fmc.gov/FMC.

Agreements.Web/Public/Agreement
History/34502. 

Agreement No.: 201403. 
Agreement Name: SSPL/NPDL Slot 

Charter Agreement. 
Parties: Neptune Pacific Direct Line 

Pte. Ltd.; Swire Shipping Pte. Ltd. 
Filing Party: Matthew Thomas, Blank 

Rome. 
Synopsis: The Agreement would 

authorize Swire Shipping to charter 
space to Neptune Pacific Direct Line in 
the trade between the United States 
(including American Samoa) on the one 
hand, and Tahiti, Samoa, Tonga, Fiji, 
Australia and New Zealand on the other 
hand. 

Proposed Effective Date: 5/27/2023. 
Location: https://www2.fmc.gov/ 

FMC.Agreements.Web/Public/ 
AgreementHistory/79503. 
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Dated: April 14, 2023. 
JoAnne O’Bryant, 
Program Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08253 Filed 4–18–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6730–02–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The public portions of the 
applications listed below, as well as 
other related filings required by the 
Board, if any, are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank(s) indicated below and at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
This information may also be obtained 
on an expedited basis, upon request, by 
contacting the appropriate Federal 
Reserve Bank and from the Board’s 
Freedom of Information Office at 
https://www.federalreserve.gov/foia/ 
request.htm. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on the 
standards enumerated in the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). 

Comments regarding each of these 
applications must be received at the 
Reserve Bank indicated or the offices of 
the Board of Governors, Ann E. 
Misback, Secretary of the Board, 20th 
Street and Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20551–0001, not later 
than May 19, 2023. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Chicago 
(Colette A. Fried, Assistant Vice 
President) 230 South LaSalle Street, 
Chicago, Illinois 60690–1414: 

1. First Mid Bancshares, Inc., through 
its subsidiary Eagle Sub, LLC, both of 
Mattoon, Illinois, to acquire Blackhawk 
Bancorp, Inc., and thereby indirectly 
acquire Blackhawk Bank, both of Beloit, 
Wisconsin. Additionally, Eagle Sub, 
LLC, to become a bank holding 
company upon the merger (the ‘‘interim 
holding company merger’’) of 
Blackhawk Bancorp, Inc., with and into 
Eagle Sub, LLC. Finally, following the 
interim holding company merger, First 
Mid Bancshares, Inc., to merge with 

Eagle Sub, LLC, with First Mid 
Bancshares, Inc., as the surviving entity. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System. 
Michele Taylor Fennell, 
Deputy Associate Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08261 Filed 4–18–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Agency for Healthcare Research and 
Quality 

Notice of Meeting 

AGENCY: Agency for Healthcare Research 
and Quality (AHRQ), Department of 
Health and Human Services (HHS). 
ACTION: Notice of AHRQ subcommittee 
meeting. 

SUMMARY: The subcommittee listed 
below is a part of AHRQ’s Health 
Services Research Initial Review Group 
(IRG) Committee. Grant applications are 
to be reviewed and discussed at this 
meeting. The subcommittee meeting 
will be closed to the public. 
DATES: See below for date of meeting: 
1. Healthcare Safety and Quality 

Improvement Research (HSQR) 
Date: June 14–15, 2023 
ADDRESSES: Agency for Healthcare 
Research and Quality (Virtual Review), 
5600 Fishers Lane, Rockville, Maryland 
20857. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: (To 
obtain a roster of members, agenda or 
minutes of the non-confidential portions 
of the meeting.) Jenny Griffith, 
Committee Management Officer, Office 
of Extramural Research Education and 
Priority Populations, Agency for 
Healthcare Research and Quality 
(AHRQ), 5600 Fishers Lane, Rockville, 
Maryland 20857, Telephone (301) 427– 
1557. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with section 10 (a)(2) of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (5 
U.S.C. app. 2), AHRQ announces 
meetings of the above-listed scientific 
peer review group, which is a 
subcommittee of AHRQ’s Health 
Services Research Initial Review Group 
Committee. The subcommittee meeting 
will be closed to the public in 
accordance with the provisions set forth 
in 5 U.S.C. App. 2 section 10(d), 5 
U.S.C. 552b(c)(4), and 5 U.S.C. 
552b(c)(6). The grant applications and 
the discussions could disclose 
confidential trade secrets or commercial 
property such as patentable material, 
and personal information concerning 

individuals associated with the grant 
applications, the disclosure of which 
would constitute a clearly unwarranted 
invasion of personal privacy. Agenda 
items for this meeting are subject to 
change as priorities dictate. 

Dated: April 13, 2023. 
Marquita Cullom, 
Associate Director. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08250 Filed 4–18–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4160–90–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Agency for Healthcare Research and 
Quality 

Patient Safety Organizations: 
Voluntary Relinquishment for the 
Emergency Medical Error Reduction 
Group PSO 

AGENCY: Agency for Healthcare Research 
and Quality (AHRQ), Department of 
Health and Human Services (HHS). 

ACTION: Notice of delisting. 

SUMMARY: The Patient Safety and 
Quality Improvement Final Rule 
(Patient Safety Rule) authorizes AHRQ, 
on behalf of the Secretary of HHS, to list 
as a patient safety organization (PSO) an 
entity that attests that it meets the 
statutory and regulatory requirements 
for listing. A PSO can be ‘‘delisted’’ by 
the Secretary if it is found to no longer 
meet the requirements of the Patient 
Safety and Quality Improvement Act of 
2005 (Patient Safety Act) and Patient 
Safety Rule, when a PSO chooses to 
voluntarily relinquish its status as a 
PSO for any reason, or when a PSO’s 
listing expires. AHRQ accepted a 
notification of proposed voluntary 
relinquishment from the Emergency 
Medical Error Reduction Group PSO, 
PSO number P0235, of its status as a 
PSO, and has delisted the PSO 
accordingly. 

DATES: The delisting was effective at 
12:00 Midnight ET (2400) on March 29, 
2023. 
ADDRESSES: The directories for both 
listed and delisted PSOs are ongoing 
and reviewed weekly by AHRQ. Both 
directories can be accessed 
electronically at the following HHS 
website: http://www.pso.ahrq.gov/listed. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Cathryn Bach, Center for Quality 
Improvement and Patient Safety, AHRQ, 
5600 Fishers Lane, MS 06N100B, 
Rockville, MD 20857; Telephone (toll 
free): (866) 403–3697; Telephone (local): 
(301) 427–1111; TTY (toll free): (866) 
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