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Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing should file with the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426, in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s Rules of 
Practice and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 
and 385.214). Protests will be 
considered by the Commission in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but will not serve to make 
protestants parties to the proceeding. 
Any person wishing to become a party 
must file a motion to intervene. All such 
motions or protests should be filed on 
or before the comment date, and, to the 
extent applicable, must be served on the 
applicant and on any other person 
designated on the official service list. 
This filing is available for review at the 
Commission or may be viewed on the 
Commission’s Web site at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘RIMS’’ link, 
select ‘‘Docket #’’ and follow the 
instructions (call 202–208–2222 for 
assistance). Protests and interventions 
may be filed electronically via the 
Internet in lieu of paper; see 18 CFR 
385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the instructions 
on the Commission’s Web site under the 
‘‘e-Filing’’ link. 

Comment Date: July 12, 2002.

Linwood A. Watson, Jr., 
Deputy Secretary.
[FR Doc. 02–16568 Filed 7–01–02; 8:45 am] 
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[Docket No. ER01–3001–003] 

New York Independent System 
Operator, Inc.; Notice of Filing 

June 25, 2002. 
Take notice that on June 20, 2002, the 

New York Independent System 
Operator, Inc. (NYISO) submitted a 
supplemental report on the status of its 
demand side management programs in 
New York State in compliance with the 
Commission’s October 25 Order in the 
above-captioned proceeding. The 
NYISO has served a copy of this filing 
upon all parties that have executed 
service agreements under the NYISO’s 
Open Access Transmission Tariff and 
Market Administration and Control 
Area Services Tariff. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing should file with the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426, in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s Rules of 

Practice and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 
and 385.214). Protests will be 
considered by the Commission in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but will not serve to make 
protestants parties to the proceeding. 
Any person wishing to become a party 
must file a motion to intervene. All such 
motions or protests should be filed on 
or before the comment date, and, to the 
extent applicable, must be served on the 
applicant and on any other person 
designated on the official service list. 
This filing is available for review at the 
Commission or may be viewed on the 
Commission’s Web site at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘RIMS’’ link, 
select ‘‘Docket #’’ and follow the 
instructions (call 202–208–2222 for 
assistance). Protests and interventions 
may be filed electronically via the 
Internet in lieu of paper; see 18 CFR 
385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the instructions 
on the Commission’s Web site under the 
‘‘e-Filing’’ link. 

Comment Date: July 11, 2002.

Linwood A. Watson, Jr., 
Deputy Secretary.
[FR Doc. 02–16550 Filed 7–01–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket Nos. ER02–638–003] 

New York Independent System 
Operator, Inc.; Notice of Filing 

June 21, 2002. 
Take notice that on June 18, 2002, the 

New York Independent System 
Operator, Inc. (NYISO) filed with the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission 
(Commission) corrected revisions to its 
Open Access Transmission and Market 
Administration and Control Area 
Services Tariffs in order to comply with 
the Commission’s Order issued on 
February 26, 2002, in the above-
captioned docket. 

The NYISO has requested an effective 
date of April 11, 2002, for the filing. The 
NYISO has served a copy of this filing 
upon all parties on the official service 
list maintained by the Commission in 
the above-captioned docket. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing should file with the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426, in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s Rules of 
Practice and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 
and 385.214). Protests will be 
considered by the Commission in 

determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but will not serve to make 
protestants parties to the proceeding. 
Any person wishing to become a party 
must file a motion to intervene. All such 
motions or protests should be filed on 
or before the comment date, and, to the 
extent applicable, must be served on the 
applicant and on any other person 
designated on the official service list. 
This filing is available for review at the 
Commission or may be viewed on the 
Commission’s Web site at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘RIMS’’ link, 
select ‘‘Docket #’’ and follow the 
instructions (call 202–208–2222 for 
assistance). Protests and interventions 
may be filed electronically via the 
Internet in lieu of paper; see 18 CFR 
385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the instructions 
on the Commission’s Web site under the 
‘‘e-Filing’’ link. 

Comment Date: July 9, 2002.

Linwood A. Watson, Jr., 
Deputy Secretary.
[FR Doc. 02–16566 Filed 7–01–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RP02–367–000] 

Northern Border Pipeline Company; 
Notice of Proposed Changes in FERC 
Gas Tariff 

June 26, 2002. 
Take notice that on June 21, 2002, 

Northern Border Pipeline Company 
(Northern Border) tendered for filing to 
become part of its FERC Gas Tariff, First 
Revised Volume No. 1, the following 
tariff sheets, with an effective date of 
August 1, 2002:
Third Revised Sheet No. 286C 
Third Revised Sheet No. 287

Northern Border is filing revised tariff 
sheets to set forth clearly the conditions 
under which the Company may elect to 
terminate a temporary capacity release. 
Northern Border states that the 
proposed changes are in response to the 
Commission’s observations as stated in 
an order at Docket No. RP02–206–000 
(95 FERC ¶ 61,182). 

Northern Border states that copies of 
this filing have been sent to all of 
Northern Border’s contracted shippers 
and interested state regulatory 
commissions. 

Any person desiring to be heard or to 
protest said filing should file a motion 
to intervene or a protest with the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
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