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The determination is based on the 
classified nature of discussions related 
to national security. Such classified 
material is so intertwined with the 
unclassified material that it cannot 
reasonably be segregated into separate 
discussions without defeating the 
effectiveness and meaning of the overall 
meeting. To permit this portion of the 
meeting to be open to the public would 
preclude discussion of such matters and 
would greatly diminish the ultimate 
utility of the DIB’s findings and 
recommendations to the SecDef and 
USD(R&E). 

Written Statements: Pursuant to 41 
CFR 102–3.105(l) and 102–3.140(a)(3) 
and section 1009(a)(3) of the FACA, the 
public or interested organizations may 
submit written comments or statements 
to the DIB in response to the stated 
agenda of the meeting or regarding the 
DIB’s mission in general. Written 
comments or statements should be 
submitted to Dr. Marina Theodotou, the 
DFO, via email to osd.pentagon.ousd-r- 
e.mbx.dib2@mail.mil. Comments or 
statements must include the author’s 
name, title or affiliation, address, and 
daytime phone number. The DFO must 
receive written comments or statements 
being submitted in response to the 
agenda set forth in this notice by 12:00 
p.m. on Friday, July 12th, 2024, to be 
considered by the DIB. The DFO will 
review all timely submitted written 
comments or statements with the DIB 
Chair and ensure the comments are 
provided to all members before the 
meeting. Written comments or 
statements received after this date may 
not be provided to the DIB until its next 
scheduled meeting. Please note that all 
submitted comments and statements 
will be treated as public documents and 
will be made available for public 
inspection, including, but not limited 
to, being posted on the DIB’s website. 

Dated: July 3, 2024. 
Aaron T. Siegel, 
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison 
Officer, Department of Defense. 
[FR Doc. 2024–15049 Filed 7–8–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6001–FR–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Office of the Secretary 

[Docket ID: DoD–2024–HA–0075] 

Proposed Collection; Comment 
Request 

AGENCY: The Office of the Assistant 
Secretary of Defense for Health Affairs 
(OASD(HA)), Department of Defense 
(DoD). 

ACTION: 60-Day information collection 
notice. 

SUMMARY: In compliance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, the 
Defense Health Agency (DHA) 
announces a proposed public 
information collection and seeks public 
comment on the provisions thereof. 
Comments are invited on: whether the 
proposed collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the agency, including 
whether the information shall have 
practical utility; the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed information collection; ways 
to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and ways to minimize the 
burden of the information collection on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
DATES: Consideration will be given to all 
comments received by September 9, 
2024. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by docket number and title, 
by any of the following methods: 

Federal eRulemaking Portal: http://
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

Mail: Department of Defense, Office of 
the Assistant to the Secretary of Defense 
for Privacy, Civil Liberties, and 
Transparency, Regulatory Directorate, 
4800 Mark Center Drive, Mailbox #24, 
Suite 08D09, Alexandria, VA 22350– 
1700. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name, docket 
number and title for this Federal 
Register document. The general policy 
for comments and other submissions 
from members of the public is to make 
these submissions available for public 
viewing on the internet at http://
www.regulations.gov as they are 
received without change, including any 
personal identifiers or contact 
information. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: To 
request more information on this 
proposed information collection or to 
obtain a copy of the proposal and 
associated collection instruments, 
please write to Defense Health Agency, 
7700 Arlington Blvd., Falls Church, VA 
22042, Amanda Grifka, 703–681–1771. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title; Associated Form; and OMB 
Number: Joint Outpatient Experience 
Surveys (JOES); OMB Control Number 
0720–JOES. 

Needs and Uses: The core objective of 
the JOES surveys is to systematically 
assess Military Health System (MHS) 

beneficiaries’ perceptions of their 
outpatient care quality when received 
directly at Military Treatment Facilities 
and through civilian network providers 
reimbursed by the MHS. Data insights 
guide efforts to optimize care delivery 
across the MHS. The JOES survey suite 
leverages industry best practices to 
regularly measure patient satisfaction 
across the facets of outpatient care. 
Data-driven insights from this 
comprehensive assessment inform 
systematic quality improvement efforts 
for healthcare delivery optimization 
across the MHS. JOES instruments 
include: JOES, JOES–CAHPS, JOES- 
Dental, JOES-Ambulatory, JOES Walk-in 
Contraceptive Clinic, and JOES- 
Emergency Department. The JOES– 
CAHPS surveys adhere to industry 
protocols outlined by the Clinician & 
Group Consumer Assessment of 
Healthcare Providers and Systems (CG– 
CAHPS) for measuring patient 
satisfaction. 

Affected Public: Individuals or 
households. 

Annual Burden Hours: 25,833. 
Number of Respondents: 310,000. 
Responses per Respondent: 1. 
Annual Responses: 310,000. 
Average Burden per Response: 5 

minutes. 
Frequency: On occasion. 
Dated: July 2, 2024. 

Aaron T. Siegel, 
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison 
Officer, Department of Defense. 
[FR Doc. 2024–15043 Filed 7–8–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6001–FR–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Office of the Secretary 

Meeting Notice—Military Justice 
Review Panel 

AGENCY: Department of Defense (DoD). 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: The DoD is publishing this 
notice to announce that the following 
meeting of the Military Justice Review 
Panel (MJRP) will take place. 
DATES: July 16–18, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: This meeting will be held in 
the National Capital Region. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Mr. 
L. Peter Yob, 703–693–3857 (Voice), 
louis.p.yob.civ@mail.mil (Email). 
Mailing address is MJRP, One Liberty 
Center, 875 N Randolph Street, Suite 
150, Arlington, Virginia 22203. 
Information about the Military Justice 
Review Panel can be found on the 
website: https://mjrp.osd.mil. 
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SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Pursuant 
to 5521 of the National Defense 
Authorization Act (NDAA) for Fiscal 
Year (FY) 2017, as amended by 531(k) 
of the FY 2018 NDAA, the Secretary of 
Defense established this panel to 
conduct independent periodic reviews 
and assessments of the operation of the 
Uniform Code of Military Justice 
(UCMJ), 10 U.S.C. 946, Article 146 
(effective January 1, 2019). 

Purpose of the Meeting: Pursuant to 
UCMJ Article 146, the MJRP shall 
conduct independent periodic reviews 
and assessments of the operation of the 
UCMJ. This will be the eleventh meeting 
held by the MJRP during which the 
members will work and deliberate on 
their comprehensive review which will 
be submitted to Congress at the end of 
this calendar year. At this meeting the 
MJRP will conduct closed sessions for 
MJRP members only. 

Dated: July 3, 2024. 
Aaron T. Siegel, 
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison 
Officer, Department of Defense. 
[FR Doc. 2024–15052 Filed 7–8–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6001–FR–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Department of the Army, Corps of 
Engineers 

Notice of Intent To Prepare a Draft 
Feasibility Report and Environmental 
Impact Statement for the Collier 
County Coastal Storm Risk 
Management Project, Collier County, 
Florida 

AGENCY: U.S. Army Corps of Engineers, 
Department of the Army, DoD. 
ACTION: Notice of intent. 

SUMMARY: Pursuant to the National 
Environmental Policy Act of 1969, the 
U.S. Army Corps of Engineers (USACE) 
plans to prepare a draft Integrated 
Feasibility Study and Environmental 
Impact Statement (IFR/EIS) for the 
Collier County Coastal Storm Risk 
Management Study. This study will 
investigate the feasibility of managing 
coastal storm risks to nearshore areas of 
Collier County, Florida, from hurricanes 
and other storms with their associated 
wind, storm surge, and coastal flooding. 
This notice announces USACE’s intent 
to determine the scope of the issues to 
be addressed and identify the significant 
issues related to a proposed action. 
DATES: Scoping comments may be 
submitted until August 8, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: The public is invited to 
submit National Environmental Policy 
Act (NEPA) scoping comments to Mrs. 

Kathy Hanes, Department of the Army, 
USACE Norfolk District at Fort Norfolk, 
803 Front St., Norfolk, VA 23510 or via 
email: Collier-csrm@usace.army.mil. 
The project title, USACE–CW Planning- 
NAD/SAD–NAO–476674, and the 
commenter’s contact information should 
be included with submitted comments. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Mrs. 
Kathy Hanes, (757) 201–7218. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: USACE is 
issuing this notice pursuant to 42 U.S.C. 
4321 et seq., as implemented by the 
Council on Environmental Quality 
Regulations (40 CFR parts 1500–1508) 
and 54 U.S.C. 300101 et seq., as 
implemented by Advisory Council on 
Historic Preservation regulations (36 
CFR part 800). The study authority is 
provided in Section 4033 of the Water 
Resources Development Act of 2007 
(Pub. L. 110–114), which authorizes a 
study to determine the feasibility of 
carrying out a project for hurricane and 
storm risk management and flood risk 
management in the vicinity of 
Vanderbilt, Park Shore, and Naples 
beaches, Collier County, Florida. The 
greater Study Area includes the 
nearshore, shoreline, back bays, 
connecting waters, and inland areas 
within the jurisdictional boundary of 
Collier County, Florida. The Study Area 
also includes any material borrow areas 
located within Federal waters of the 
Outer Continental Shelf (OCS) not 
within Collier County. The focused 
Study Area is separated into four 
different Planning Areas to help stream- 
line plan formulation and numeric 
modeling exercises. The four separable 
Planning Areas (PAs) are (1) North 
County Beaches, (2) Naples, (3) 
Goodland, and (4) Marco Island. 
Additionally, and not limited to only 
within these PAs, is analysis and 
inclusion of risk management measures 
for Critical Infrastructure. 

The study will investigate the 
feasibility of addressing storm and flood 
risks to vulnerable populations, 
property, infrastructure, and ecosystems 
along coastlines in Collier County, and 
develop and evaluate various 
alternatives aimed at managing those 
risks and increasing coastal resiliency 
against storm surge. 

Several alternatives are currently 
being considered, including a no action 
alternative and various combinations of 
nonstructural measures and nature- 
based solutions for managing risks and 
damages caused by coastal storms in the 
Study Area in Collier County, Florida. 
Measures being considered include 
nature-based solutions such as beach 
nourishment berms and vegetated 
dunes, (sometimes considered ‘‘soft’’ 

structural measures), mangrove 
restoration, and living shorelines; and 
nonstructural measures such as 
elevations of residences, dry and wet 
flood-proofing of buildings and critical 
infrastructure, and early warning 
systems. 

Effects to be considered include but 
are not limited to the following: 
temporary and permanent social effects 
on disadvantaged or underserved 
communities due to nonstructural 
measures; potential primary or 
secondary effects on or near nearshore 
hardbottom resources threatened/ 
endangered species, Essential Fish 
Habitat, and other benthic and aquatic 
resources, water quality, hydraulics and 
hydrology; temporary and or permanent 
effects on recreational use; effects on 
cultural resources; air quality and 
greenhouse gas emissions, and other 
relevant social and environmental 
effects. 

USACE is the lead Federal agency and 
Collier County is the non-Federal 
sponsor for the study effort. The Cities 
of Naples and Marco Island were also 
invited to participate in regular study 
coordination with Collier County as key 
stakeholders. Cooperating agencies 
include the Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA), the Bureau of Ocean 
Energy Management (BOEM), and the 
National Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration (NOAA). Participating 
agencies include the U.S. Fish and 
Wildlife Service (USFWS), Advisory 
Council on Historic Properties (ACHP), 
Florida Department of Environmental 
Protection (FDEP), the Florida 
Department of State Division of Historic 
Resources (DHR), Florida Fish and 
Wildlife Conservation Commission 
(FWC), Florida Division of Emergency 
Management (FDEM), Florida 
Department of Transportation (FDOT), 
the Seminole Tribe of Oklahoma, the 
Seminole Tribe of Florida, the 
Miccosukee Tribe of Indians in Florida, 
and the Thlopthlocco Tribal Town. 

USACE anticipates that the following 
permits will be required: water quality 
certification pursuant to section 401 of 
the Clean Water Act, a Federal 
consistency determination pursuant to 
the Coastal Zone Management Act 
(CZMA), and leases from BOEM for use 
of offshore borrow areas. Coordination 
with environmental agencies will be 
conducted under the Endangered 
Species Act, the Magnuson-Stevens 
Fishery Conservation Act, the Fish and 
Wildlife Coordination Act, the National 
Historic Preservation Act, and other 
Federal and State laws and regulations. 

Public NEPA scoping meetings were 
held on the following dates: 18 April 
2023 via Zoom; in person on 26 April 
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