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the HHS Executive Development 
Program, including developmental 
activities, rotational assignments, and 
the Candidate Development Program; 
and (13) advises on development of 
executive succession planning 
activities. 

Title 42 and Immigration Activity 
(CAJQG3). (1) Provides leadership, 
technical assistance, guidance, and 
consultation in the administration of 
policies and procedures for 
appointment of individuals through the 
distinguished consultants, experts, 
consultants, and fellows under Title 42 
appointment authorities; (2) provides 
technical guidance and visa-assistance 
for employment based, CDC-sponsored 
visas; (3) administers and manages the 
Exchange Visitor Program; (4) works 
closely with the US Office of Exchange 
and Cultural Affairs, US Citizenship and 
Immigration Services, US Department of 
Homeland Security, US Department of 
State, Office of the Secretary/DHHS, and 
US Department of Labor) to facilitate 
immigration procedures; (5) reviews, 
processes and files H–1B, 0–1, and 
Green Card (I–140) Petitions with the 
U.S. Citizenship and Immigration 
Services; (6) provides advisory services 
and guidance on employment based 
green card petitions in the Alien of 
Extraordinary Ability category; (7) 
issues DS–2019s (Certificate of 
Eligibility for J–1 Exchange Visitor 
Status) through the Student and 
Exchange Visitor Information System to 
non US citizens seeking CDC J–1 visa 
sponsorship; (8) coordinates and 
provides consultations and guidance on 
Interested Government Agency Waivers; 
(9) provides Immigration Training 
Workshops to CDC/ATSDR 
Administrative Staff; (10) determines 
the appointment mechanism, legal 
status, and work authorizations for 
5,000+ non US citizens through the 
Visitors and Management System; and 
(11) administers and manages the Guest 
Researcher and Oak Ridge Institute for 
Science and Education Program. 

Dated: April 22, 2014. 
Sherri A. Berger, 
MSPH, Chief Operating Officer, Centers for 
Disease Control and Prevention. 
[FR Doc. 2014–10178 Filed 5–5–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4163–18–M 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Administration for Children and 
Families 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

Title: Request for Assistance for Child 
Victims of Human Trafficking. 

OMB No.: 0970–0362. 
Description: The William Wilberforce 

Trafficking Victims Protection 
Reauthorization Act (TVPRA) of 2008, 
Public Law 110–457, directs the U.S. 
Secretary of Health and Human Services 
(HHS), upon receipt of credible 
information that an alien child may 
have been subjected to a severe form of 
trafficking in persons and is seeking 
Federal assistance available to victims 
of trafficking, to promptly determine if 
the child is eligible for interim 
assistance. The law further directs the 
Secretary of HHS to determine if a child 
receiving interim assistance is eligible 
for assistance as a victim of a severe 
form of trafficking in persons after 
consultation with the Attorney General, 
the Secretary of Homeland Security, and 
nongovernmental organizations with 
expertise on victims of severe form of 
trafficking. 

In developing procedures for 
collecting the necessary information 
from potential child victims of 
trafficking, their case managers, 
attorneys, or other representatives to 
allow HHS to grant interim eligibility, 
HHS devised a form. HHS has 
determined that the use of a standard 
form to collect information is the best 
way to ensure requestors are notified of 
their option to request assistance for 
child victims of trafficking and to make 

prompt and consistent determinations 
about the child’s eligibility for 
assistance. 

Specifically, the form asks the 
requestor for his/her identifying 
information, for information on the 
child, information describing the type of 
trafficking and circumstances 
surrounding the situation, and the 
strengths and needs of the child. The 
form also asks the requestor to verify the 
information contained in the form 
because the information could be the 
basis for a determination of an alien 
child’s eligibility for federally funded 
benefits. Finally, the form takes into 
consideration the need to compile 
information regarding a child’s 
circumstances and experiences in a non- 
directive, child-friendly way, and assists 
the requestor in assessing whether the 
child may have been subjected to 
trafficking in persons. 

The information provided through the 
completion of a Request for Assistance 
for Child Victims of Human Trafficking 
form will enable HHS to make prompt 
determinations regarding the eligibility 
of an alien child for interim assistance, 
inform HHS’ determination regarding 
the child’s eligibility for assistance as a 
victim of a severe form of trafficking in 
persons, facilitate the required 
consultation process, and enable HHS to 
assess potential child protection issues. 
HHS proposes to make several small, 
technical changes to the form, including 
the elimination of an unnecessary 
paragraph and updated references to the 
Trafficking Victims Protection Act of 
2000, as amended, to reflect changes to 
that law. 

Respondents: Representatives of 
governmental and nongovernmental 
entities providing social, legal, or 
protective services to alien persons 
under the age of 18 (children) in the 
United States who are neither U.S. 
citizens nor Lawful Permanent 
Residents and who may have been 
subjected to severe forms of trafficking 
in persons. 

ANNUAL BURDEN ESTIMATES 

Instrument Number of 
respondents 

Number of 
responses per 

respondent 

Average 
burden hours 
per response 

Total burden 
hours 

Request for Assistance for Child Victims of Human Trafficking ..................... 40 1 1 40 

Estimated Total Annual Burden 
Hours: 40. 

Additional Information: Copies of the 
proposed collection may be obtained by 
writing to the Administration for 
Children and Families, Office of 

Planning, Research and Evaluation, 370 
L’Enfant Promenade SW., Washington, 
DC 20447, Attn: ACF Reports Clearance 
Officer. All requests should be 
identified by the title of the information 

collection. Email address: 
infocollection@acf.hhs.gov. 

OMB Comment: OMB is required to 
make a decision concerning the 
collection of information between 30 
and 60 days after publication of this 
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document in the Federal Register. 
Therefore, a comment is best assured of 
having its full effect if OMB receives it 
within 30 days of publication. Written 
comments and recommendations for the 
proposed information collection should 
be sent directly to the following: Office 
of Management and Budget, Paperwork 
Reduction Project, Fax: 202–395–7285, 
Email: OIRA_SUBMISSION@
OMB.EOP.GOV, Attn: Desk Officer for 
the Administration for Children and 
Families. 

Robert Sargis, 
Reports Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2014–10307 Filed 5–5–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4184–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Food and Drug Administration 

[Docket No. FDA–2014–N–0530] 

Center for Devices and Radiological 
Health Guidance Development and 
Prioritization; Public Workshop; 
Requests for Comments 

AGENCY: Food and Drug Administration, 
HHS. 
ACTION: Notice of public workshop; 
request for comments. 

The Food and Drug Administration 
(FDA) is announcing the following 
public workshop entitled ‘‘Center for 
Devices and Radiological Health 
Guidance Development and 
Prioritization Public Workshop.’’ The 
topics to be discussed include the FDA’s 
Center for Devices and Radiological 
Health’s (CDRH) guidance development 
process, guidance development best 
practices for FDA, CDRH, and CDRH 
stakeholders, and CDRH guidance 
priorities and priority development. 

Date and Time: The public workshop 
will be held on June 5, 2014, from 9 a.m. 
to 3 p.m. 

Location: The public workshop will 
be held at the FDA White Oak Campus, 
10903 New Hampshire Ave., Bldg. 31 
Conference Center, the Great Room (rm. 
1503A), Silver Spring, MD 20993–0002. 
Entrance for public workshop 
participants (non-FDA employees) is 
through Building 1, where routine 
security check procedures will be 
performed. For parking and security 
information, please refer to http://
www.fda.gov/AboutFDA/
WorkingatFDA/BuildingsandFacilities/
WhiteOakCampusInformation/
ucm241740.htm. 

Contact Person: Cathy Norcio, Center 
for Devices and Radiological Health, 

Food and Drug Administration, 10903 
New Hampshire Ave., Bldg. 66, rm. 
5448, Silver Spring, MD 20993–0002, 
301–796–5446, email: 
Catherine.norcio@fda.hhs.gov. 

Registration: Registration is free and 
available on a first-come, first-served 
basis. Persons interested in attending 
this public workshop must register 
online by 5 p.m., EDT, May 29, 2014. 
Early registration is recommended 
because facilities are limited and, 
therefore, FDA may limit the number of 
participants from each organization. If 
time and space permits, onsite 
registration on the day of the workshop 
will be provided beginning at 8 a.m. 

If you need special accommodations 
due to a disability, please contact Susan 
Monahan (301–796–5661 or email: 
susan.monahan@fda.hhs.gov) no later 
than May 22, 2014. 

To register for the public workshop, 
please visit FDA’s Medical Devices 
News & Events—Workshops & 
Conferences calendar at http://
www.fda.gov/MedicalDevices/
NewsEvents/WorkshopsConferences/
default.htm. (Select this public 
workshop from the posted events list.) 
Please provide complete contact 
information for each attendee, including 
name, title, affiliation, email, and 
telephone number. Those without 
Internet access should contact Susan 
Monahan to register (see Registration 
contact for special accommodations). 
Registrants will receive confirmation 
after they have been accepted. You will 
be notified if you are on a waiting list. 

Streaming Webcast of the Public 
Workshop: This public workshop will 
also be Webcast. Persons interested in 
viewing the Webcast must register 
online by 5 p.m., EDT, May 29, 2014. 
Early registration is recommended 
because Webcast connections are 
limited. Organizations are requested to 
register all participants, but to view 
using one connection per location. 
Webcast participants will be sent 
technical system requirements after 
registration and will be sent connection 
access information no later than June 2, 
2014. If you have never attended a 
Connect Pro event before, test your 
connection at https://
collaboration.fda.gov/common/help/en/
support/meeting_test.htm. To get a 
quick overview of the Connect Pro 
program, visit http://www.adobe.com/
go/connectpro_overview. (FDA has 
verified the Web site addresses in this 
document, but FDA is not responsible 
for any subsequent changes to the Web 
sites after this document publishes in 
the Federal Register.) 

Comments: FDA is holding this public 
workshop to obtain feedback on CDRH’s 

guidance development and guidance 
prioritization processes. In order to 
permit the widest possible opportunity 
to obtain public comment, FDA is 
soliciting either electronic or written 
comments on all aspects of the public 
workshop topics. The deadline for 
submitting comments related to this 
public workshop is July 7, 2014. 

Regardless of attendance at the public 
workshop, interested persons may 
submit either electronic comments 
regarding this document to http://
www.regulations.gov or written 
comments to the Division of Dockets 
Management (HFA–305), Food and Drug 
Administration, 5630 Fishers Lane, rm. 
1061, Rockville, MD 20852. It is only 
necessary to send one set of comments. 
Please identify comments with the 
docket number found in brackets in the 
heading of this document. Received 
comments may be viewed in person in 
the Division of Dockets Management 
between 9 a.m. and 4 p.m., Monday 
through Friday, and will be posted to 
the docket at http://
www.regulations.gov. 

Transcripts: Please be advised that as 
soon as a transcript is available, it will 
be accessible at http://
www.regulations.gov. It may be viewed 
at the Division of Dockets Management 
(see Comments). A transcript will also 
be available in either hardcopy or on 
CD–ROM, after submission of a 
Freedom of Information request. Written 
requests are to be sent to the Division 
of Freedom of Information (ELEM– 
1029), Food and Drug Administration, 
12420 Parklawn Dr., Element Bldg., 
Rockville, MD 20857. A link to the 
transcripts will also be available 
approximately 45 days after the public 
workshop on the Internet at http://
www.fda.gov/MedicalDevices/
NewsEvents/WorkshopsConferences/
default.htm. (Select this public 
workshop from the posted events list.) 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Background 
Guidance documents are documents 

issued by FDA and prepared for FDA 
staff and/or FDA stakeholders. They 
describe the Agency’s interpretation of, 
or policy on, a regulatory issue (see 
§ 10.115(b) (21 CFR 10.115(b))). Unlike 
statutes and regulations, guidances 
themselves do not create legally binding 
requirements (see § 10.115(d)). 
Nevertheless, guidance documents are 
important because they assist both staff 
and industry in understanding FDA’s 
current thinking on certain topics. 
FDA’s Good Guidance Practices 
regulation (§ 10.115) governs the 
development and issuance of guidance, 
and it gives interested parties a number 
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