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DC 20585–0121 or by email to 
Chris.Early@ee.doe.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
information collection request contains: 
(1) OMB No. 1910–5184; (2) Information 
Collection Request Title: Programs for 
Improving Energy Efficiency in 
Buildings; (3) Type of Request: 
{Renewal} (4) Purpose: The proposed 
collection will enable DOE to better 
understand and improve building 
energy load management programs 
including the following four voluntary 
programs aimed at reducing energy 
costs and improving occupant comfort 
in buildings: The Home Performance 
with ENERGY STAR Program, the Home 
Energy Score Program, the Better 
Buildings Residential Network, and the 
Zero Energy Ready Home Program. DOE 
encourages and assists the people and 
organizations that voluntarily 
participate in these energy efficiency 
programs to build or renovate buildings 
for the purposes of improved efficiency, 
reliability, and affordability. The 
partners who voluntarily participate in 
the programs include: Home builders, 
building trades and building-related 
associations, home design professionals, 
home energy raters and auditors, home 
inspectors, building consultants, 
manufacturers of building products, 
retailers, utility companies, financial 
institutions, non-profit organizations, 
educational institutions, energy program 
administrators and implementers, Home 
Performance with ENERGY STAR 
sponsors, state or local government 
energy offices or agencies, and other 
organizations that believe peer sharing 
will help them improve their 
effectiveness in encouraging effective 
energy upgrades. DOE proposes to 
continue to collect information such as 
names and addresses of voluntary 
program participants and organizations; 
estimates of how many homes these 
program implementers can get to 
participate in the programs, and 
information about building stock (no 
building owner or occupant information 
is collected) and load management 
strategies. The collected information 
helps DOE understand the participating 
partners’ activities and their progress 
toward achieving scheduled milestones. 
This, in turn, enables DOE to respond to 
partners’ needs and assist them in 
improving their operations to lower 
energy consumption and improve 
affordability. DOE published a notice 
and request for comments related to this 
current request for OMB clearance to 
collect information on August 16, 2019 
(84 FR 41987) and received no 
comments; (5) Annual Estimated 
Number of Respondents: 962; (6) 

Annual Estimated Number of Total 
Responses: 92,584; (7) Annual 
Estimated Number of Burden Hours: 
14,383; (8) Annual Estimated Reporting 
and Recordkeeping Cost Burden: zero 
dollars. 

Statutory Authority: 42 U.S.C. 16191. 

Signed in Washington, DC on December 4, 
2019. 
Alexander N. Fitzsimmons, 
Deputy Assistant Secretary For Energy 
Efficiency, Energy Efficiency and Renewable 
Energy. 
[FR Doc. 2019–26680 Filed 12–10–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. ER20–517–000] 

Supplemental Notice That Initial 
Market-Based Rate Filing Includes 
Request for Blanket Section 204 
Authorization; Crooked Run Solar, LLC 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced proceeding of Crooked 
Run Solar, LLC’s application for market- 
based rate authority, with an 
accompanying rate tariff, noting that 
such application includes a request for 
blanket authorization, under 18 CFR 
part 34, of future issuances of securities 
and assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability, is December 26, 
2019. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http://
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 5 copies 

of the intervention or protest to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. 

The filings in the above-referenced 
proceeding are accessible in the 
Commission’s eLibrary system by 
clicking on the appropriate link in the 
above list. They are also available for 
electronic review in the Commission’s 
Public Reference Room in Washington, 
DC. There is an eSubscription link on 
the website that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov. or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Dated: December 5, 2019. 
Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2019–26659 Filed 12–10–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings 

Take notice that the Commission has 
received the following Natural Gas 
Pipeline Rate and Refund Report filings: 

Docket Number: PR20–14–000. 
Applicants: Louisville Gas and 

Electric Company. 
Description: Tariff filing per 

284.123(b),(e)/: Revised SOC DDC and 
LAUFG to be effective 11/1/2019. 

Filed Date: 12/2/19. 
Accession Number: 201912025007. 
Comments/Protests Due: 5 p.m. ET 

12/23/19. 
Docket Numbers: RP20–314–000. 
Applicants: Young Gas Storage 

Company, Ltd. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: ATC 

Rate Adjustment (2019–2020) to be 
effective 12/1/2019. 

Filed Date: 12/4/19. 
Accession Number: 20191204–5149. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 12/16/19. 
The filings are accessible in the 

Commission’s eLibrary system by 
clicking on the links or querying the 
docket number. 

Any person desiring to intervene or 
protest in any of the above proceedings 
must file in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s 
Regulations (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified date(s). Protests 
may be considered, but intervention is 
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1 ANR states that the Mermentau River GCX 
Meter Station will be installed pursuant to the 
automatic provisions of its blanket certificate. 

2 ANR’s Head Station is a pooling point where 
natural gas is aggregated from many receipt points. 

necessary to become a party to the 
proceeding. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

Dated: December 5, 2019. 
Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2019–26660 Filed 12–10–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP20–8–000] 

Notice of Intent To Prepare an 
Environmental Assessment for the 
Proposed ANR Pipeline Company 
Grand Chenier Xpress Project and 
Request for Comments on 
Environmental Issues 

The staff of the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission (FERC or 
Commission) will prepare an 
environmental assessment (EA) that will 
discuss the environmental impacts of 
the Grand Chenier XPress Project 
involving construction and operation of 
facilities by ANR Pipeline Company 
(ANR) in Acadia, Jefferson Davies, and 
Cameron Parishes, Louisiana. The 
Commission will use this EA in its 
decision-making process to determine 
whether the project is in the public 
convenience and necessity. 

This notice announces the opening of 
the scoping process the Commission 
will use to gather input from the public 
and interested agencies about issues 
regarding the project. The National 
Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) 
requires the Commission to take into 
account the environmental impacts that 
could result from its action whenever it 
considers the issuance of a Certificate of 
Public Convenience and Necessity. 
NEPA also requires the Commission to 
discover concerns the public may have 
about proposals. This process is referred 
to as ‘‘scoping.’’ The main goal of the 
scoping process is to focus the analysis 
in the EA on the important 
environmental issues. By this notice, the 
Commission requests public comments 
on the scope of issues to address in the 
EA. To ensure that your comments are 
timely and properly recorded, please 
submit your comments so that the 
Commission receives them in 

Washington, DC, on or before 5:00 p.m. 
Eastern Time on January 6, 2020. 

You can make a difference by 
submitting your specific comments or 
concerns about the project. Your 
comments should focus on the potential 
environmental effects, reasonable 
alternatives, and measures to avoid or 
lessen environmental impacts. Your 
input will help the Commission staff 
determine what issues they need to 
evaluate in the EA. Commission staff 
will consider all filed comments during 
the preparation of the EA. 

If you sent comments on this project 
to the Commission before the opening of 
this docket on October 28, 2019, you 
will need to file those comments in 
Docket No. CP20–8–000 to ensure they 
are considered as part of this 
proceeding. 

This notice is being sent to the 
Commission’s current environmental 
mailing list for this project. State and 
local government representatives should 
notify their constituents of this 
proposed project and encourage them to 
comment on their areas of concern. 

If you are a landowner receiving this 
notice, a pipeline company 
representative may contact you about 
the acquisition of an easement to 
construct, operate, and maintain the 
proposed facilities. The company would 
seek to negotiate a mutually acceptable 
easement agreement. You are not 
required to enter into an agreement. 
However, if the Commission approves 
the project, that approval conveys with 
it the right of eminent domain. 
Therefore, if you and the company do 
not reach an easement agreement, the 
pipeline company could initiate 
condemnation proceedings in court. In 
such instances, compensation would be 
determined by a judge in accordance 
with state law. 

ANR provided landowners with a fact 
sheet prepared by the FERC entitled 
‘‘An Interstate Natural Gas Facility On 
My Land? What Do I Need To Know?’’ 
This fact sheet addresses a number of 
typically asked questions, including the 
use of eminent domain and how to 
participate in the Commission’s 
proceedings. It is also available for 
viewing on the FERC website 
(www.ferc.gov) at https://www.ferc.gov/ 
resources/guides/gas/gas.pdf. 

Public Participation 
The Commission offers a free service 

called eSubscription which makes it 
easy to stay informed of all issuances 
and submittals regarding the dockets/ 
projects to which you subscribe. These 
instant email notifications are the fastest 
way to receive notification and provide 
a link to the document files which can 

reduce the amount of time you spend 
researching proceedings. To sign up go 
to www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
esubscription.asp. 

For your convenience, there are three 
methods you can use to submit your 
comments to the Commission. The 
Commission encourages electronic filing 
of comments and has staff available to 
assist you at (866) 208–3676 or 
FercOnlineSupport@ferc.gov. Please 
carefully follow these instructions so 
that your comments are properly 
recorded. 

(1) You can file your comments 
electronically using the eComment 
feature, which is located on the 
Commission’s website (www.ferc.gov) 
under the link to Documents and 
Filings. Using eComment is an easy 
method for submitting brief, text-only 
comments on a project; 

(2) You can file your comments 
electronically by using the eFiling 
feature, which is also on the 
Commission’s website (www.ferc.gov) 
under the link to Documents and 
Filings. With eFiling, you can provide 
comments in a variety of formats by 
attaching them as a file with your 
submission. New eFiling users must 
first create an account by clicking on 
‘‘eRegister.’’ You will be asked to select 
the type of filing you are making; a 
comment on a particular project is 
considered a ‘‘Comment on a Filing’’; or 

(3) You can file a paper copy of your 
comments by mailing them to the 
following address. Be sure to reference 
the project docket number (CP20–8– 
000) with your submission: Kimberly D. 
Bose, Secretary, Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First Street 
NE, Room 1A, Washington, DC 20426. 

Summary of the Proposed Project 

ANR’s project consist of: (i) 
Modifications to its existing Eunice and 
Grand Chenier Compressor Stations, (ii) 
construction and operation of a new 
greenfield compressor station 
(Mermentau Compressor Station), (iii) 
modifications to ANR’s Mermentau 
River GCX Meter Station,1 and (iv) 
installation of various appurtenant and 
auxiliary facilities. The project would 
provide an additional 400 million cubic 
feet per day of incremental natural gas 
capacity from ANR’s Southeast Head 
Station 2 to the Mermentau River GCX 
Meter Station. 

The Grand Chenier XPress Project 
would consist of the following facilities: 
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