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containing lesson plans, fact sheets, 
presentations, maps, and other 
educational materials. Also included 
will be a computer disk containing 
several environmental-related 
documents and a copy of the 40-page 
‘‘Educational Resource Guide,’’ which 
was developed by the SSAB last year. 

Public Participation: The meeting is 
open to the public. Written statements 
may be filed with the Committee either 
before or after the meeting. Individuals 
who wish to make oral statements 
pertaining to agenda items should 
contact Pat Halsey at the address or 
telephone number listed above. 
Requests must be received five days 
prior to the meeting and reasonable 
provision will be made to include the 
presentation in the agenda. The Deputy 
Designated Federal Officer is 
empowered to conduct the meeting in a 
fashion that will facilitate the orderly 
conduct of business. Each individual 
wishing to make public comment will 
be provided a maximum of five minutes 
to present their comments. 

Minutes: Minutes of this meeting will 
be available for public review and 
copying at the Department of Energy’s 
Information Center at 475 Oak Ridge 
Turnpike, Oak Ridge, TN between 8 
a.m. and 5 p.m. Monday through Friday, 
or by writing to Pat Halsey, Department 
of Energy Oak Ridge Operations Office, 
P.O. Box 2001, EM–90, Oak Ridge, TN 
37831, or by calling her at (865) 576–
4025.

Issued at Washington, DC, on May 17, 
2004. 
Rachel M. Samuel, 
Deputy Advisory Committee Management 
Officer
[FR Doc. 04–11521 Filed 5–20–04; 8:45 am] 
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May 13, 2004. 
Take notice that on May 7, 2004, 

Columbia Gas Transmission Corporation 
(Columbia) tendered for filing as part of 
its FERC Gas Tariff, Second Revised 
Volume No. 1, Twelfth Revised Sheet 
No. 281, a proposed effective date of 
April 22, 2004. 

Columbia states that on March 23, 
2004, it filed a revised tariff sheet 
regarding its right of first refusal 

provisions. On April 22, 2004, the 
Commission accepted Columbia’s 
proposed revised tariff sheet subject to 
Columbia making certain tariff sheet 
revisions. 

Columbia states that copies of its 
filing have been mailed to all firm 
customers, interruptible customers, and 
affected State commissions. 

Any person desiring to protest said 
filing should file a protest with the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426, in accordance with section 
385.211 of the Commission’s rules and 
regulations. All such protests must be 
filed in accordance with section 154.210 
of the Commission’s regulations. 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceedings. This filing is available 
for review at the Commission in the 
Public Reference Room or may be 
viewed on the Commission’s Web site at 
http://www.ferc.gov using the eLibrary 
link. Enter the docket number excluding 
the last three digits in the docket 
number field to access the document. 
For assistance, please contact FERC 
Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or toll-
free at (866) 208–3676, or TTY, contact 
(202) 502–8659. The Commission 
strongly encourages electronic filings. 
See 18 CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the 
instructions on the Commission’s Web 
site under the e-Filing link.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–1196 Filed 5–20–04; 8:45 am] 
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Columbia Gas Transmission 
Corporation; Notice of Application 

May 12, 2004. 
Take notice that on May 7, 2004, 

Columbia Gas Transmission Corporation 
(Columbia) filed an application 
pursuant to section 7(b) of the Natural 
Gas Act. Columbia states that it is 
seeking authorization to abandon 
certain natural gas storage facilities in 
its Dundee Storage Field in Steuben 
County, New York. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing should file with the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 

20426, in accordance with rules 211 and 
214 of the Commission’s rules of 
practice and procedure (18 CFR 385.211 
and 385.214) on or prior to the comment 
date below. Protests will be considered 
by the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a motion to 
intervene. All such motions or protests 
should be filed on or before the 
comment date and, to the extent 
applicable, must be served on the 
applicant and on any other person 
designated on the official service list. 
This filing is available for review at the 
Commission or may be viewed on the 
Commission’s Web site at http://
www.ferc.gov, using the ‘‘e-Library’’ 
(FERRIS) link. Enter the docket number 
excluding the last three digits in the 
docket number field to access the 
document. For assistance, please contact 
FERC Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or toll-
free at (866) 208–3676, or for TTY, 
contact (202) 502–8659. Protests and 
interventions may be filed electronically 
via the Internet in lieu of paper; see 18 
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the 
instructions on the Commission’s Web 
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link. The 
Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings. 

Comment Date: June 3, 2004.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–1197 Filed 5–20–04; 8:45 am] 
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[Docket No. RP04–226–001] 

Columbia Gulf Transmission 
Company; Notice of Compliance Filing 

May 13, 2004. 
Take notice that on May 7, 2004, 

Columbia Gulf Transmission Company 
(Columbia Gulf), tendered for filing as 
part of its FERC Gas Tariff, Second 
Revised Volume No. 1, Eighth Revised 
Sheet No. 145, with a proposed effective 
date of April 22, 2004. 

Columbia Gulf states that on March 
23, 2004, it filed a revised tariff sheet 
regarding its right of first refusal 
provisions. On April 22, 2004, the 
Commission accepted Columbia Gulf’s 
proposed revised tariff sheet subject to 
Columbia Gulf making certain tariff 
sheet revisions. 
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