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20426. Hand delivered submissions in 
docketed proceedings should be 
delivered to Health and Human 
Services, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
www.ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. At this 
time, the Commission has suspended 
access to the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, environmental justice 
communities, Tribal members and 
others, access publicly available 
information and navigate Commission 
processes. For public inquiries and 
assistance with making filings such as 
interventions, comments, or requests for 
rehearing, the public is encouraged to 
contact OPP at (202) 502–6595 or OPP@
ferc.gov. 

Dated: August 11, 2023. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–17694 Filed 8–16–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 2315–175] 

Dominion Energy South Carolina, Inc.; 
Notice of Application Accepted for 
Filing and Soliciting Comments, 
Motions To Intervene, and Protests 

Take notice that the following 
hydroelectric application has been filed 
with the Commission and is available 
for public inspection. 

a. Type of Application: Request for a 
temporary amendment of the reservoir 
drawdown limit. 

b. Project No.: 2315–175. 
c. Date Filed: July 10, 2023. 
d. Applicant: Dominion Energy South 

Carolina, Inc. 
e. Name of Project: Neal Shoals 

Hydroelectric Project. 
f. Location: The project is located on 

the Broad River in Union and Chester 
Counties, South Carolina. 

g. Filed Pursuant to: Federal Power 
Act, 16 U.S.C. 791 (a)–825(r). 

h. Applicant Contact: Ms. Amy 
Bresnahan, Dominion Energy South 
Carolina, Inc., 220 Operations Way, MC 
B223, Cayce, SC 29033, (803) 217–9965. 

i. FERC Contact: Mr. Steven Sachs, 
(202) 502–8666, Steven.Sachs@ferc.gov. 

j. Deadline for filing comments, 
motions to intervene, and protests is 30 
days from the issuance of this notice by 
the Commission. The Commission 
strongly encourages electronic filing. 
Please file comments, motions to 
intervene, and protests using the 
Commission’s eFiling system at http://
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/efiling.asp. 
Commenters can submit brief comments 
up to 6,000 characters, without prior 
registration, using the eComment system 
at http://www.ferc.gov/doc-sfiling/ 
ecomment.asp. You must include your 
name and contact information at the end 
of your comments. For assistance, 
please contact FERC Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, (866) 
208–3676 (toll free), or (202) 502–8659 
(TTY). In lieu of electronic filing, you 
may submit a paper copy. Submissions 
sent via the U.S. Postal Service must be 
addressed to: Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 888 First Street NE, Room 
1A, Washington, DC 20426. 
Submissions sent via any other carrier 
must be addressed to: Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, MD 20852. The first page of 
any filing should include docket 
number P–2315–175. 

The Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure require all intervenors 
filing documents with the Commission 
to serve a copy of that document on 
each person on the official service list 
for the project. Further, if an intervenor 
files comments or documents with the 
Commission relating to the merits of an 
issue that may affect the responsibilities 
of a particular resource agency, they 
must also serve a copy of the document 
on that resource agency. 

k. Description of Request: The 
applicant requests a temporary 
amendment of its maximum reservoir 
drawdown limit from October 1 through 
December 31, 2023. The applicant plans 
to exceed the normal 4-foot drawdown 
limit by draining the reservoir in a 

phased approach by at least 14 feet to 
dewater it. The applicant states the 
drawdown is necessary to finish 
maintenance on head gates and 
complete the installation of low-level 
sluice gates. 

l. In addition to publishing the full 
text of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. For 
assistance, contact FERC at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

m. Individuals desiring to be included 
on the Commission’s mailing list should 
so indicate by writing to the Secretary 
of the Commission. 

n. Comments, Motions to Intervene, or 
Protests: Anyone may submit 
comments, a motion to intervene, or a 
protest in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214. 
In determining the appropriate action to 
take, the Commission will consider all 
protests or other comments filed, but 
only those who file a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
Commission’s Rules may become a 
party to the proceeding. Any comments, 
motions to intervene, or protests must 
be received on or before the specified 
comment date for the particular 
application. 

o. Filing and Service of Responsive 
Documents: Any filing must (1) bear in 
all capital letters the title 
‘‘COMMENTS’’, ‘‘MOTION TO 
INTERVENE’’, or ‘‘PROTEST’’ as 
applicable; (2) set forth in the heading 
the name of the applicant and the 
project number(s) of the application to 
which the filing responds; (3) furnish 
the name, address, and telephone 
number of the person intervening or 
protesting; and (4) otherwise comply 
with the requirements of 18 CFR 
385.2001 through 385.2005. All 
comments, motions to intervene, or 
protests must set forth their evidentiary 
basis. A copy of all other filings in 
reference to this application must be 
accompanied by proof of service on all 
persons listed in the service list 
prepared by the Commission in this 
proceeding, in accordance with 18 CFR 
385.2010. 
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1 18 CFR (Code of Federal Regulations) 157.9. 

Dated: August 11, 2023. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–17697 Filed 8–16–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. ER23–2567–000] 

EnerSmart Los Coches BESS LLC; 
Supplemental Notice That Initial 
Market-Based Rate Filing Includes 
Request for Blanket Section 204 
Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced proceeding of 
EnerSmart Los Coches BESS LLC’s 
application for market-based rate 
authority, with an accompanying rate 
tariff, noting that such application 
includes a request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability, is August 31, 
2023. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http://
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
may mail similar pleadings to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. Hand delivered submissions in 
docketed proceedings should be 
delivered to Health and Human 
Services, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
www.ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. At this 
time, the Commission has suspended 
access to the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, environmental justice 
communities, Tribal members and 
others, access publicly available 
information and navigate Commission 
processes. For public inquiries and 
assistance with making filings such as 
interventions, comments, or requests for 
rehearing, the public is encouraged to 
contact OPP at (202)502–6595 or OPP@
ferc.gov. 

Dated: August 11, 2023. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–17695 Filed 8–16–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP23–523–000] 

ANR Pipeline Company; Notice of 
Application and Establishing 
Intervention Deadline 

Take notice that on August 1, 2023, 
ANR Pipeline Company (ANR), 700 
Louisiana Street, Suite 1300, Houston, 
Texas 77002–2700, filed an application 
under sections 7(b) and 7(c) of the 
Natural Gas Act (NGA), and Part 157 of 
the Commission’s regulations, 
requesting authorization for its Oak 
Grove Enhancement Project (Project), 
located in Richland and West Carroll 
Parishes, Louisiana. The Project consists 
of ANR replacing approximately 33 
miles of its existing 30-inch diameter 

natural gas pipeline Line 0–501 with 
new 30-inch diameter natural gas 
pipeline. ANR states that it is 
undertaking the Project to improve the 
integrity and reliability of its system 
through the replacement of vintage 
pipeline facilities installed in the 1950’s 
that contain a high concentration of 
external corrosion. ANR estimates the 
total cost of the Project to be 
$338,068,811 and requests a pre- 
determination of rolled-in treatment for 
the costs associated with the Project, all 
as more fully set forth in the application 
which is on file with the Commission 
and open for public inspection. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page 
(www.ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ 
link. Enter the docket number excluding 
the last three digits in the docket 
number field to access the document. At 
this time, the Commission has 
suspended access to the Commission’s 
Public Reference Room. For assistance, 
contact the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission at FercOnlineSupport@
ferc.gov or call toll-free, (886) 208–3676 
or TTY (202) 502–8659. 

Any questions regarding the proposed 
project should be directed to David A. 
Alonzo, Manager, Project 
Authorizations, ANR Pipeline 
Company, 700 Louisiana Street, Suite 
1300, Houston, Texas 77002–2700 by 
phone at (832) 320–5477, or by email at 
david_alonzo@tcenergy.com. 

Pursuant to section 157.9 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure,1 within 90 days of this 
Notice the Commission staff will either: 
complete its environmental review and 
place it into the Commission’s public 
record (eLibrary) for this proceeding; or 
issue a Notice of Schedule for 
Environmental Review. If a Notice of 
Schedule for Environmental Review is 
issued, it will indicate, among other 
milestones, the anticipated date for the 
Commission staff’s issuance of the final 
environmental impact statement (FEIS) 
or environmental assessment (EA) for 
this proposal. The filing of an EA in the 
Commission’s public record for this 
proceeding or the issuance of a Notice 
of Schedule for Environmental Review 
will serve to notify Federal and State 
agencies of the timing for the 
completion of all necessary reviews, and 
the subsequent need to complete all 
Federal authorizations within 90 days of 
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