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Comment Dated: 5 p.m. eastern time 
December 6, 2006. 

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E6–20604 Filed 12–5–06; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RP06–200–015] 

Rockies Express Pipeline LLC; Notice 
of Negotiated Rate 

November 29, 2006. 
Take notice that on November 22, 

2006, pursuant to 18 CFR 154.7 and 
154.203, and in compliance with the 
Commission’s letter order issued August 
9, 2005, in Docket No. CP04–413–000, 
Rockies Express Pipeline LLC (REX) 
tendered for filing and acceptance 
certain tariff sheets of its FERC Gas 
Tariff to be effective November 23, 2006. 

REX stated that a copy of this filing 
has been served upon all parties to this 
proceeding, REX’s customers, the 
Colorado Public Utilities Commission 
and the Wyoming Public Service 
Commission. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed in accordance 
with the provisions of § 154.210 of the 
Commission’s regulations (18 CFR 
154.210). Anyone filing an intervention 
or protest must serve a copy of that 
document on the Applicant. Anyone 
filing an intervention or protest on or 
before the intervention or protest date 
need not serve motions to intervene or 
protests on persons other than the 
Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible online at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E6–20603 Filed 12–5–06; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RP07–78–000] 

Southern Star Central Gas Pipeline, 
Inc.; Notice of Proposed Changes in 
FERC Gas Tariff 

November 29, 2006. 
Take notice that on November 22, 

2006, Southern Star Central Gas 
Pipeline, Inc. tendered for filing as part 
of its FERC Gas Tariff, Volume No. 1, 
the following tariff sheets, to become 
effective December 1, 2006: 
Fifth Revised Sheet No. 10 
Original Sheet No. 10A 
Eighth Revised Sheet No. 11. 

Southern Star states that copies of the 
tariff sheets are being provided to 
Southern Star’s jurisdictional customers 
and interested state commissions. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed in accordance 
with the provisions of Section 154.210 
of the Commission’s regulations (18 CFR 
154.210). Anyone filing an intervention 
or protest must serve a copy of that 
document on the Applicant. Anyone 
filing an intervention or protest on or 
before the intervention or protest date 
need not serve motions to intervene or 
protests on persons other than the 
Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E6–20593 Filed 12–5–06; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RP07–77–000] 

Williston Basin Interstate Pipeline 
Company; Notice of Tariff Filing 

November 29, 2006. 
Take notice that on November 22, 

2006, Williston Basin Interstate Pipeline 
Company (Williston Basin) tendered for 
filing as part of its FERC Gas Tariff, 
Second Revised Volume No. 1, First 
Revised Sheet No. 387, to become 
effective December 22, 2006. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed in accordance 
with the provisions of Section 154.210 
of the Commission’s regulations (18 CFR 
154.210). Anyone filing an intervention 
or protest must serve a copy of that 
document on the Applicant. Anyone 
filing an intervention or protest on or 
before the intervention or protest date 
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need not serve motions to intervene or 
protests on persons other than the 
Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E6–20606 Filed 12–5–06; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Notice of Application for Transfer of 
License and Soliciting Comments, 
Motions To Intervene, and Protests 

November 29, 2006. 
Take notice that the following 

hydroelectric application has been filed 
with the Commission and is available 
for public inspection: 

a. Application Type: Transfer of 
License. 

b. Project No.: 2161–023. 
c. Date Filed: November 21, 2006. 
d. Applicants: Rhinelander Paper 

Company (RPC) and Wausau Paper 
Specialty Products, LLC (WPSP, LLC). 

e. Name and Location of Project: The 
Rhinelander Project is located on the 
Wisconsin River, in Oneida County, 
Wisconsin. 

f. Filed Pursuant to: Federal Power 
Act, 16 U.S.C. 791(a)–825(r). 

g. Applicant Contacts: For RPC and 
WPSP, LLC: Ms. Cara Kurtenbach, 
Director of Environmental Affairs, 
Wausau Paper, 100 Paper Place, 
Mosinee, WI 54455, (715) 692–2023. Ms. 
Elizabeth W. Whittle, Nixon Peabody, 
LLP, 401 Ninth Street, NW., Suite 900, 
Washington, DC 20004, (202) 585–8338. 

h. FERC Contact: Etta L. Foster (202) 
502–8769. 

i. Deadline for filing comments, 
protests, and motions to intervene: 
December 15, 2006. 

All documents (original and eight 
copies) should be filed with Magalie R. 
Salas, Secretary, Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First 
Street, NE., Washington, DC 20426. 
Comments, protests, and interventions 
may be filed electronically via the 
Internet in lieu of paper, see 18 CFR 
385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the instructions 
on the Commission’s web-site under the 
‘‘e-Filing’’ link. The Commission 
strongly encourages electronic filings. 
Please include the project number (P– 
2161–023) on any comments, protests, 
or motions filed. The Commission’s 
Rules of Practice and Procedure require 
all interveners filing a document with 
the Commission to serve a copy of that 
document on each person in the official 
service list for the project. Further, if an 
intervener files comments or documents 
with the Commission relating to the 
merits of an issue that may affect the 
responsibilities of a particular resource 
agency, they must also serve a copy of 
the documents on that resource agency. 

j. Description of Application: 
Applicants request approval, under 
Section 8 of the Federal Power Act, of 
a transfer of license for the Rhinelander 
Project No. 2161 from the Rhinelander 
Paper Corporation to the Wausau Paper 
Specialty Products, LLC. 

k. This filing is available for review at 
the Commission in the Public Reference 
Room or may be viewed on the 
Commission’s Web site at http:// 
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘FERRIS’’ link. 
Enter the project number excluding the 
last three digits (P–2161) in the docket 
number field to access the document. 
For online assistance, contact 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free (866) 208–3676, for TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. A copy is also available 
for inspection and reproduction at the 
addresses in item g. 

l. Individual desiring to be included 
on the Commission’s mailing list should 
so indicate by writing to the Secretary 
of the Commission. 

m. Comments, Protests, or Motions to 
Intervene: Anyone may submit 
comments, a protest, or a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214. 
In determining the appropriate action to 
take, the Commission will consider all 
protests or other comments filed, but 
only those who file a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
Commission’s Rules may become a 
party to the proceeding. Any comments, 

protests, or motions to intervene must 
be received on or before the specified 
comment date for the particular 
application. 

n. Filing and Service of Responsive 
Documents: Any filings must bear in all 
capital letters the title ‘‘COMMENTS’’, 
‘‘PROTESTS’’, OR ‘‘MOTION TO 
INTERVENE’’, as applicable, and the 
Project Number of the particular 
application to which the filing refers. 
Any of the above-named documents 
must be filed by providing the original 
and the number of copies provided by 
the Commission’s regulations to: The 
Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 888 First Street, NE., 
Washington, DC 20426. A copy of any 
motion to intervene must also be served 
upon each representative of the 
Applicant specified in the particular 
application. 

o. Agency Comments: Federal, State, 
and local agencies are invited to file 
comments on the described application. 
A copy of the application may be 
obtained by agencies directly from the 
Applicant. If an agency does not file 
comments within the time specified for 
filling comments, it will be assumed to 
have no comments. One copy of an 
agency’s comments must also be sent to 
the Applicant’s representatives. 

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E6–20597 Filed 12–5–06; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Notice of Application for Transfer of 
License and Soliciting Comments, 
Motions To Intervene, and Protests 

November 29, 2006. 
Take notice that the following 

hydroelectric application has been filed 
with the Commission and is available 
for public inspection: 

a. Application Type: Transfer of 
License. 

b. Project No.: 2207–030. 
c. Date Filed: November 21, 2006. 
d. Applicants: Mosinee Paper 

Corporation (MPC) and Wausau Paper 
Specialty Products, LLC (WPSP, LLC). 

e. Name and Location of Project: The 
Mosinee Project is located on the 
Wisconsin River, in Marathon County, 
Wisconsin. f. Filed Pursuant to: Federal 
Power Act, 16 U.S.C. 791(a)–825(r). 

g. Applicant Contacts: For MPC and 
WPSP, LLC: Ms. Cara Kurtenbach, 
Director of Environmental Affairs, 
Wausau Paper, 100 Paper Place, 
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