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1 Hilco filed a notice of exemption to acquire and 
operate the Line, which was served and published 
in the Federal Register on April 26, 2013. Hilco SP 
Rail, LLC—Acquisition and Operation Exemption— 
RG Steel Railroad Holding, LLC, FD 35734 (STB 
served Apr. 26, 2013); 78 FR 24,803 (Apr. 26, 2013). 

submitting the comment (or signing the 
comment, if submitted on behalf of an 
association, business, labor union, etc.). 
Therefore, you may want to review 
DOT’s complete Privacy Act Statement 
in the Federal Register published on 
April 11, 2000 (65 FR 19477) or visit 
http://www.regulations.gov before 
submitting any such comments. 

Docket: For access to the docket or to 
read background documents or 
comments, go to http:// 
www.regulations.gov at any time or to 
Room W12–140 on the ground level of 
the West Building, 1200 New Jersey 
Avenue SE., Washington, DC, between 
9:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday 
through Friday, except Federal holidays. 
If you wish to receive confirmation of 
receipt of your written comments, 
please include a self-addressed, 
stamped postcard with the following 
statement: ‘‘Comments on PHMSA– 
2010–0088.’’ The Docket Clerk will date 
stamp the postcard prior to returning it 
to you via the U.S. mail. Please note that 
due to delays in the delivery of U.S. 
mail to Federal offices in Washington, 
DC, we recommend that persons 
consider an alternative method 
(internet, fax, or professional delivery 
service) of submitting comments to the 
docket and ensuring their timely receipt 
at DOT. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Angela Dow by telephone at 202–366– 
1246, by fax at 202–366–4566, or by 
mail at U.S. Department of 
Transportation, Pipeline and Hazardous 
Materials Safety Administration, 1200 
New Jersey Avenue SE., PHP–30, 
Washington, DC 20590–0001. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Section 
1320.8(d), Title 5, Code of Federal 
Regulations requires PHMSA to provide 
interested members of the public and 
affected agencies an opportunity to 
comment on information collection and 
recordkeeping requests. This notice 
identifies an information collection 
request that PHMSA will be submitting 
to OMB for renewal and extension. This 
information collection is contained in 
the pipeline safety regulations at 49 CFR 
Parts 190–199. The following 
information is provided for each 
information collection: (1) Title of the 
information collection; (2) OMB control 
number; (3) type of request; (4) abstract 
of the information collection activity; (5) 
description of affected public; (6) 
estimate of total annual reporting and 
recordkeeping burden; and (7) 
frequency of collection. PHMSA will 
request a three year term of approval for 
each information collection activity. 

PHMSA requests comments on the 
following information collection: 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Title: National Pipeline Mapping 

Program. 
OMB Control Number: 2137–0596. 
Type of Request: Renewal of a 

Previously Approved Information 
Collection. 

Abstract: Each operator of a pipeline 
facility (except distribution lines and 
gathering lines) must provide PHMSA 
contact information and geospatial data 
on their pipeline system. This 
information should be updated on an 
annual basis. The provided information 
is incorporated into the National 
Pipeline Mapping System (NPMS) to 
support various regulatory programs, 
pipeline inspections, and authorized 
external customers. The updates of 
operator pipeline data inform the NPMS 
of any changes to the data over the 
previous year and allow PHMSA to 
maintain and improve the accuracy of 
the information. 

Affected Public: Operators of pipeline 
facilities (except distribution lines and 
gathering lines). 

Estimated Number of Responses: 894. 
Annual Estimated Total Annual 

Burden Hours: 16,312 hours. 
Frequency of Collection: Annual. 
Comments are invited on: Whether 

the proposed collection of information 
is necessary for the proper performance 
of the functions of the Department, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility, the accuracy of 
the Department’s estimate of the burden 
of the proposed information collection, 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected, and ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 
on respondents, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
A comment to OMB is most effective if 
OMB receives it within 30 days of the 
date of publication in the Federal 
Register. 

Authority: The Paperwork Reduction Act 
of 1995; 44 U.S.C. Chapter 35, as amended; 
and 49 CFR 1:48. 

Issued in Washington, DC, on June 11, 
2013. 

John A. Gale, 
Director, Office of Standards and 
Rulemaking. 
[FR Doc. 2013–14155 Filed 6–13–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–60–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Surface Transportation Board 

[Docket No. FD 35725] 

MCM Rail Services LLC, d/b/a 
Baltimore Industrial Railroad— 
Operation Exemption—Hilco SP Rail, 
LLC 

MCM Rail Services LLC, d/b/a 
Baltimore Industrial Railroad (MCM), a 
noncarrier, has filed a verified notice of 
exemption under 49 CFR 1150.31 to 
operate as a common carrier over an 
approximately 12-mile line of railroad 
in Sparrows Point, Baltimore County, 
Md. (the Line), pursuant to an 
agreement with Hilco SP Rail, LLC 
(Hilco).1 MCM states that there are no 
mileposts on the Line. 

MCM’s notice was held in abeyance 
by decision served April 5, 2013, 
because, among other things, MCM had 
previously filed a petition for exemption 
in MCM Rail Services LLC—Petition for 
Retroactive Exemption—In Sparrows 
Point, Md., Docket No. FD 35707, 
requesting essentially the same 
authority sought here. In a decision 
served June 11, 2013, the Board granted 
MCM’s motion to withdraw that petition 
for exemption, and concurrently lifted 
the abeyance in this proceeding. 

According to MCM, it has entered into 
a Railroad Services Agreement 
(Agreement) with Hilco to operate the 
Line until March 14, 2016, and, unless 
the Agreement is extended or MCM is 
otherwise able to continue service, 
MCM shall seek discontinuance 
authority from the Board prior to 
discontinuing service over the Line. 

MCM states that there are no 
interchange commitments or paper 
barriers in the Agreement. MCM also 
states it will interchange traffic with 
CSX Transportation, Inc. (CSXT) and 
Norfolk Southern Railway Company 
(NSR) and that there will not be any 
interchange commitments or paper 
barriers between MCM and CSXT or 
MCM and NSR. 

The transaction may be consummated 
on or after June 28, 2013 (the effective 
date of this exemption). 

MCM certifies that that the projected 
annual revenues as a result of this 
transaction will not exceed those that 
would qualify it as a Class III rail carrier 
and further certifies that its projected 
annual revenue will not exceed $5 
million. 
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If the verified notice contains false or 
misleading information, the exemption 
is void ab initio. Petitions to revoke the 
exemption under 49 U.S.C. 10502(d) 
may be filed at any time. The filing of 
a petition to revoke will not 
automatically stay the effectiveness of 
the exemption. Petitions for stay must 
be filed no later than June 21, 2013 (at 
least seven days before the exemption 
becomes effective). 

An original and 10 copies of all 
pleadings, referring to Docket No. FD 
35725, must be filed with the Surface 
Transportation Board, 395 E Street SW., 
Washington, DC 20423–0001. In 
addition, a copy of each pleading must 
be served on Louis E. Gitomer, Law 
Offices of Louis E. Gitomer LLC, 600 
Baltimore Avenue, Suite 301, Towson, 
MD 21204. 

Board decisions and notices are 
available on our Web site at 
‘‘www.stb.dot.gov.’’ 

Decided: June 11, 2013. 
By the Board, Rachel D. Campbell, 

Director, Office of Proceedings. 
Jeffrey Herzig, 
Clearance Clerk. 
[FR Doc. 2013–14178 Filed 6–13–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4915–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE TREASURY 

Community Development Financial 
Institutions Fund 

Bond Guarantee Program; Notice of 
Guarantee Availability (NOGA) Inviting 
Qualified Issuer Applications and 
Guarantee Applications 

Announcement Type: Announcement 
of opportunity to submit Qualified 
Issuer Applications and Guarantee 
Applications. 

Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance 
(CFDA) Number: 21.011. 

DATES: Qualified Issuer Applications 
and Guarantee Applications may be 
submitted to the CDFI Fund starting on 
the date of publication of this NOGA. 
Applications will be reviewed by the 
CDFI Fund on an ongoing basis, in the 
order in which they are received or by 
such other criteria that the CDFI Fund 
may establish and publish, in its sole 
discretion. In order to be considered for 
the issuance of a Guarantee under FY 
2013 program authority, Qualified 
Issuer Applications and Guarantee 
Applications must be submitted by July 
17, 2013. Subject to Congressional 
authorization to issue Guarantees in FY 
2014, Qualified Issuer Applications and 
Guarantee Applications received after 

July 17, 2013 may be considered under 
FY 2014 authority. 

Executive Summary: This NOGA is 
published in connection with the CDFI 
Bond Guarantee Program, administered 
by the Community Development 
Financial Institutions Fund (CDFI 
Fund), a wholly owned government 
corporation within the U.S. Department 
of the Treasury (Treasury). The purpose 
of this NOGA is to notify the public 
that: (i) Parties interested in being 
approved as Qualified Issuers may 
submit Qualified Issuer Applications 
and (ii) Qualified Issuers may submit 
Guarantee Applications to be approved 
for a Guarantee under the CDFI Bond 
Guarantee Program. This NOGA also 
explains application submission and 
evaluation requirements and processes, 
agency contacts, and information on 
CDFI Bond Guarantee Program outreach. 

I. Guarantee Opportunity Description 

A. Authority; Program Summary; 
Additional Reference Documents; 
Definitions 

1. Authority. The CDFI Bond 
Guarantee Program is authorized by the 
Small Business Jobs Act of 2010 (Pub. 
L. 111–240; 12 U.S.C. 4713a) (the Act). 
Section 1134 of the Act amended the 
Riegle Community Development and 
Regulatory Improvement Act of 1994 (12 
U.S.C. 4701, et seq.) to provide authority 
to the Secretary of the Treasury to 
establish and administer the CDFI Bond 
Guarantee Program. 

2. Program summary. The purpose of 
the CDFI Bond Guarantee Program is to 
support CDFI lending by providing 
Guarantees for Bonds issued for Eligible 
Community or Economic Development 
Purposes, as authorized by section 1134 
and 1703 of the Act. The Secretary, as 
the Guarantor of the Bonds, will provide 
a 100 percent Guarantee for the 
repayment of the Verifiable Principal, 
Interest, and Call Premium of Bonds 
issued by Qualified Issuers. As the CDFI 
Bond Guarantee Program has been 
structured, a Qualified Issuer, approved 
by the CDFI Fund, will issue Bonds that 
will be purchased by the Federal 
Financing Bank. The Qualified Issuer 
will use Bond Proceeds to provide Bond 
Loans to Eligible CDFIs. The Eligible 
CDFIs will use Bond Loan proceeds to 
provide Secondary Loans to Secondary 
Borrowers. 

In FY 2013, the Secretary may 
guarantee up to five Bond Issues, or up 
to $500 million with a minimum 
Guarantee of $100 million per Bond 
Issue. The maximum maturity of the 
Bonds will be 30 years; the Bonds will 
be taxable. The Bonds will support CDFI 
lending in Investment Areas by 

providing a source of low-cost, long- 
term capital to CDFIs. 

3. Guarantee availability. Pursuant to 
this NOGA, the Guarantor may provide 
Guarantees in the aggregate amount of 
up to $500 million in FY 2013. 
Additional authority to provide 
Guarantee for Bonds in FY 2014 may be 
made available subject to Congressional 
action. 

4. Additional reference documents. In 
addition to this NOGA, the CDFI Fund 
encourages interested parties and 
applicants to review the following 
documents, which will be posted on the 
CDFI Bond Guarantee Program page of 
the CDFI Fund’s Web site at http:// 
www.cdfifund.gov. (a) CDFI Bond 
Guarantee Program Regulations. The 
interim rule that governs the CDFI Bond 
Guarantee Program was published on 
February 5, 2013 (78 FR 8296; 12 CFR 
part 1808) (the Regulations) and 
provides the regulatory requirements 
and parameters for CDFI Bond 
Guarantee Program implementation and 
administration including general 
provisions, eligibility, eligible activities, 
applications for Guarantee and 
Qualified Issuer, evaluation and 
selection, terms and conditions of the 
Guarantee, Bonds, Bond Loans, and 
Secondary Loans. In addition to the 
Regulations, the CDFI Fund has 
provided a document that summarizes 
certain program terms and conditions, 
which may be found on the CDFI Fund’s 
Web site. 

(b) Application materials. Details 
regarding Qualified Issuer Application 
and Guarantee Application content 
requirements are found in this NOGA 
and the respective applications 
materials. 

(c) Program documentation. 
Interested parties should review certain 
CDFI Bond Guarantee Program template 
documents, which will be used in 
connection with each Guarantee and 
will be posted on the CDFI Fund’s Web 
site for review. Such documents 
include, among others: 

(i) The Agreement to Guarantee, 
which describes the roles and 
responsibilities of the Qualified Issuer, 
will be signed by the Qualified Issuer 
and the Guarantor and will include term 
sheets as appendices that will be signed 
by each individual Eligible CDFI; 

(ii) The Bond Trust Indenture, which 
describes responsibilities of the Master 
Servicer/Trustee in overseeing the 
servicing of the Bonds and will be 
entered into by the Qualified Issuer and 
the Master Servicer/Trustee (to be 
selected by the CDFI Fund); 

(iii) The Bond Loan Agreement, 
which describes the terms and 
conditions of Bond Loans and will be 
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