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independent evaluator to assist in 
developing an evaluation plan and 
collecting, storing, and managing data 
required to fulfill that evaluation plan. 

i. Mobility Metrics 
Projects funded under this notice will 

be required to support the efforts of FTA 
or its designee to evaluate the project 
and its outcomes against mobility- 
specific metrics. FTA will work with the 
project team to implement evaluation 
plans that are consistent with FTA’s 
mobility-specific metrics as detailed in 
the FTA report, Mobility Performance 
Metrics (MPM) For Integrated Mobility 
and Beyond (February 2020), available 
at https://www.transit.dot.gov/sites/ 
fta.dot.gov/files/docs/research- 
innovation/147791/mobility- 
performance-metrics-integrated- 
mobility-and-beyond-fta-report-no- 
0152.pdf. 

j. Software Provisions 
Any software developed as a part of 

this solicitation will be subject to 
provisions of FTA’s Master Agreement 
related to patent rights and rights in 
data and copyrights and may be 
disseminated to public transit agencies 
for their use. 

3. Reporting 
Post-award reporting requirements 

include the electronic submission of 
Federal Financial Reports and Milestone 
Progress Reports in FTA’s electronic 
grants management system, TrAMS. 
Applicants should include any goals, 
targets, and indicators referenced in 
their application in the Executive 
Summary of the TrAMS application. 

As part of completing the annual 
certifications and assurances required of 
FTA grant recipients, a successful 
applicant must report on the suspension 
or debarment status of itself and its 
principals. If the award recipient’s 
active grants, cooperative agreements, 
and procurement contracts from all 
Federal awarding agencies exceed 
$10,000,000 for any period during the 
period of performance of an award made 
pursuant to this Notice, the recipient 
must comply with the Recipient 
Integrity and Performance Matters 
reporting requirements described in 
Appendix XII to 2 CFR part 200. 

4. Termination for Failure To Make 
Progress on an Award 

After providing written notice to the 
recipient of a project selected for 
funding, FTA may withdraw its support 
for the selected project if a cooperative 
agreement has not yet been awarded or 
suspend or terminate all or any part of 
the federal assistance for the award if 

the recipient has failed to make 
reasonable progress implementing the 
project. 

G. Federal Awarding Agency Contacts 
For further information concerning 

this notice, please contact Natalie 
Covill-Fontaine, FTA Office of Research, 
Demonstration, and Innovation, by 
phone at 202–366–7564 or by email at 
n.covillfontaine@dot.gov. A TDD is 
available for individuals who are deaf or 
hard of hearing at 800–877–8339. In 
addition, FTA may post answers to 
questions and requests for clarifications 
on FTA’s website at https://
www.transit.dot.gov/funding/grants/ 
EMI. To ensure applicants receive 
accurate information about eligibility or 
the program, applicants are encouraged 
to contact FTA directly rather than 
through intermediaries or third parties. 
FTA staff may also conduct briefings on 
the FY 2024 competitive grants 
selection and award process upon 
request. 

For issues with GRANTS.GOV, please 
contact GRANTS.GOV by phone at 1– 
800–518–4726 or by email at support@
grants.gov. 

H. Other Information 
This program is not subject to 

Executive Order 12372, 
‘‘Intergovernmental Review of Federal 
Programs.’’ 

The Department may share 
application information within the 
Department or with other Federal 
agencies if the Department determines 
that sharing is relevant to the respective 
program’s objectives. All applications 
and supporting materials submitted to 
FTA will become the records of FTA. If 
an applicant submits information the 
applicant considers to be a trade secret 
or confidential commercial or financial 
information, the applicant must provide 
that information in a separate 
document, which the applicant may 
cross-reference from the application 
narrative or other portions of the 
application. For the separate document 
containing confidential information, the 
applicant must state on the cover of the 
document that it ‘‘Contains Confidential 
Business Information (CBI),’’ mark each 
page that contains confidential 
information with ‘‘CBI,’’ and highlight 
or otherwise identify the confidential 
content on each page. FTA will protect 
confidential information, complying 
with these requirements to the extent 
required under applicable law. If FTA 
receives a Freedom of Information Act 
(FOIA) request for the information that 
the applicant has marked in accordance 
with this section, FTA will follow the 
procedures described in U.S. DOT’s 

FOIA regulation at 49 CFR 7.29. Only 
information that is in the separate 
document, marked in accordance with 
this section, and ultimately determined 
to be confidential under section 7.29 
will be exempt from disclosure under 
FOIA. 

Veronica Vanterpool, 
Acting Administrator. 
[FR Doc. 2024–14429 Filed 6–28–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–57–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

[Docket No. DOT–OST–2023–0049] 

Opportunities and Challenges of 
Artificial Intelligence (AI) in 
Transportation; Request for 
Information; Extension of Comment 
Period 

AGENCY: Department of Transportation 
(DOT). 
ACTION: Notice; request for information 
(RFI); extension of comment period. 

SUMMARY: On May 3, 2024, the Office of 
the Assistant Secretary for Research and 
Technology (OST–R) of the Department 
of Transportation (DOT) published in 
the Federal Register a request for 
information seeking comments on the 
potential applications of artificial 
intelligence (AI) in transportation, as 
well as emerging challenges and 
opportunities in creating and deploying 
AI technologies in applications across 
all modes of transportation. That request 
established a 60-day comment period 
closing on July 2, 2024. DOT is 
extending the public comment period 
until August 1, 2024. 
DATES: The comment period for the 
notice published on May 3, 2024 (89 FR 
36848) is extended. The due date for 
submitting comments is August 1, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Please submit any written 
comments to Docket Number DOT– 
OST–2024–0049 electronically through 
the Federal eRulemaking Portal at 
https://regulations.gov. Go to https://
regulations.gov and select ‘‘Department 
of Transportation (DOT)’’ from the 
agency menu to submit or view public 
comments. Note that, except as 
provided below, all submissions 
received, including any personal 
information provided, will be posted 
without change and will be available to 
the public on https://
www.regulations.gov. You may review 
DOT’s complete Privacy Act Statement 
in the Federal Register published on 
April 11, 2000 (65 FR 19477) or at 
https://www.transportation.gov/privacy. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
further information contact Mr. Timothy 
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A. Klein, Director, Technology Policy 
and Outreach, Office of the Assistant 
Secretary for Research and Technology 
(202–366–0075) or by email at 
timothy.klein@dot.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: DOT 
published a request for information in 
the Federal Register on May 3, 2024 (89 
FR 36848) seeking comments on the 
potential applications of artificial 
intelligence (AI) in transportation, as 
well as emerging challenges and 
opportunities in creating and deploying 
AI technologies in applications across 
all modes of transportation. The public 
comment period is extended to August 
1, 2024. All other information in the 
notice from May 3, 2024 remains the 
same. 

Confidential Business Information: Do 
not submit information disclosure of 
which is restricted by statute, such as 
trade secrets and commercial or 
financial information (hereinafter 
referred to as Confidential Business 
Information ‘‘CBI’’) to Regulations.gov. 
Comments submitted through 
Regulations.gov cannot be claimed as 
CBI. Comments received through the 
website will waive any CBI claims for 
the information submitted. 

Issued in Washington, DC, on June 26, 
2024. 
Robert C. Hampshire, 
Deputy Assistant Secretary for Research and 
Technology. 
[FR Doc. 2024–14436 Filed 6–28–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–9X–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE TREASURY 

Community Development Financial 
Institutions Fund 

Notice of Information Collection and 
Request for Public Comment 

ACTION: Notice and request for public 
comment. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Department of the 
Treasury, as part of a continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork and respondent 
burden, invites the general public and 
other Federal agencies to take this 
opportunity to comment on proposed 
and/or continuing information 
collections, as required by the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) of 
1995. Currently, the Community 
Development Financial Institutions 
Fund (CDFI Fund), Department of the 
Treasury, is soliciting comments 
concerning the Capital Magnet Fund 
(CMF) reporting and record retention 
requirements of the CMF Annual 
Performance Report (CMF Performance 
Report). The CMF Performance Report is 

an online form submitted through the 
CDFI Fund’s Awards Management 
Information System (AMIS). 
DATES: Written comments must be 
received on or before August 30, 2024. 
Comments can be submitted 
electronically via the e-Rulemaking 
Portal: www.regulations.gov. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments 
concerning the CMF Performance 
Report via the Federal e-Rulemaking 
Portal at www.regulations.gov. Follow 
the instructions on the website for the 
submission of comments. In general, all 
comments will be available for 
inspection at www.regulations.gov. 
Comments, including attachments and 
other supporting materials, are part of 
the public record. Do not submit any 
information in your comments or 
supporting materials that you consider 
confidential or inappropriate for public 
disclosure. Information regarding the 
CDFI Fund and its programs may be 
obtained through the CDFI Fund’s 
website at http://www.cdfifund.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Heather Hunt, OCME Program Manager, 
CDFI Fund, U.S. Department of the 
Treasury, 1500 Pennsylvania Avenue 
NW, Washington DC 20220, (202) 453– 
2044 (not a toll-free number). Other 
information regarding the CDFI Fund 
and its programs may be obtained on the 
CDFI Fund website at https://
www.cdfifund.gov. The CMF 
Performance Report Data Points are 
provided to aid the public in providing 
comments requested by this notice, and 
presents the information proposed to be 
collected in the online CMF 
Performance Report. Changes being 
made to the CMF Performance Report 
are identified in the second column of 
the data point guidance, including 
proposed deletions, additions, and 
updates. The CMF Performance Report 
Data Points may be obtained from the 
CMF compliance page of the CDFI Fund 
website at https://www.cdfifund.gov/ 
programs-training/programs/cmf/ 
compliance-step. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title: Capital Magnet Fund 
Performance Report. 

OMB Number: 1559–NEW. 
Type of Review: Regular Review. 
Abstract: The Capital Magnet Fund 

was established through the Housing 
and Economic Recovery Act of 2008 
(HERA) (Pub. L. 110–289), as a 
competitive grant program administered 
by the CDFI Fund. Through CMF, the 
CDFI Fund provides financial assistance 
grants to Certified Community 
Development Financial Institutions 
(CDFIs) and qualified Nonprofit 
Organizations that have the 

development or management of 
Affordable Housing, as defined in 12 
CFR 1807, as one of their principal 
purposes. Capitalized terms not defined 
in this Notice (other than titles) have the 
meaning set forth in the CMF Interim 
Rule (12 CFR 1807). CMF Awards must 
be used to attract private financing for 
and increase investment in: (i) the 
Development, Preservation, 
Rehabilitation, and Purchase of 
Affordable Housing for primarily 
Extremely Low-, Very Low-, and Low- 
Income Families; and (ii) Economic 
Development Activities which, in 
conjunction with Affordable Housing 
Activities, will implement a Concerted 
Strategy to stabilize or revitalize a Low- 
Income Area or an Underserved Rural 
Area. CMF Award Recipients enter into 
Assistance Agreements with the CDFI 
Fund that set forth required terms and 
conditions of the Award, including 
reporting and data collection 
requirements. The Assistance 
Agreement requires the submission of 
an annual CMF Performance Report. 
The information collected in the CMF 
Performance Report is reviewed to 
ensure the Recipient’s compliance with 
its Performance Goals and contractual 
obligations, as well as the overall 
performance of the program. Data 
collected through the CMF Performance 
Report consists of three categories of 
data: (1) mandatory data points, (2) 
conditionally required data points based 
on project characteristics, financing type 
or other condition, and (3) optional data 
points. For most compliance measures, 
AMIS calculates whether the Recipient 
is compliant or noncompliant based on 
the data reported into the system. When 
the system determines that a 
noncompliance has occurred, the 
Recipient is required to complete an 
explanation of noncompliance prior to 
submitting the report to the CDFI Fund. 
This notice requests PRA approval for 
the CMF Performance Report. This 
report is a modified version of the 
previous CMF Performance Report, 
which was under OMB Number 1559– 
0036. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
330. 

Estimated Annual Time per 
Respondent: 20 hours. 

Estimated Annual Burden Hours: 
6,600 hours. 

Request for Comments: Comments 
submitted in response to this Notice 
will be summarized and/or included in 
the request for Office of Management 
and Budget approval. All comments will 
become a matter of public record and 
may be published on the CDFI Fund 
website at https://www.cdfifund.gov. 
The CDFI Fund is seeking input on the 
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