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to avoid disclosure of the name of the 
appealing institution and exempt 
information. In cases in which redaction 
is deemed insufficient to prevent 
improper disclosure, published 
decisions may be presented in summary 
form. Published Office decisions may be 
cited as precedent in appeals to the 
Office. Annual reports on Division 
Directors’ decisions with respect to 
institutions’ requests for review of 
material supervisory determinations 
also will be published. 

I. Appeal Guidelines Generally 

Appeals to the Office will be governed 
by these Guidelines. The Office, with 
the concurrence of the Legal Division, 
will retain discretion to waive any 
provision of the Guidelines for good 
cause. Supplemental rules governing the 
Office’s operations may be adopted. 

J. Limitation on Agency Ombudsman 

The subject matter of a material 
supervisory determination for which 
either an appeal to the Office has been 
filed, or a final Office decision issued, 
is not eligible for consideration by the 
Ombudsman. However, pursuant to 
Section (G)(4) of these Guidelines, the 
Ombudsman may submit views to the 
Office for its consideration in 
connection with any pending appeal. 

K. Coordination With State Regulatory 
Authorities 

In the event that a material 
supervisory determination subject to a 
request for review is the joint product of 
the FDIC and a State regulatory 
authority, the Director, DCP, the 
Director, RMS, or the Director, CISR, as 
appropriate, will promptly notify the 
appropriate State regulatory authority of 
the request, provide the regulatory 
authority with a copy of the institution’s 
request for review and any other related 
materials, and solicit the regulatory 
authority’s views regarding the merits of 
the request before making a 
determination. In the event that an 
appeal is subsequently filed with the 
Office, the Office will notify the 
institution and the State regulatory 
authority of its decision. Once the Office 
has issued its determination, any other 
issues that may remain between the 
institution and the State authority will 
be left to those parties to resolve. 

L. Effect on Supervisory or Enforcement 
Actions 

The use of the procedures set forth in 
these Guidelines by any institution will 
not affect, delay, or impede any formal 
or informal supervisory or enforcement 
action in progress during the appeal or 
affect the FDIC’s authority to take any 

supervisory or enforcement action 
against that institution. 

M. Effect on Applications or Requests 
for Approval 

Any application or request for 
approval made to the FDIC by an 
institution that has appealed a material 
supervisory determination that relates 
to, or could affect the approval of, the 
application or request will not be 
considered until a final decision 
concerning the appeal is made unless 
otherwise requested by the institution. 

N. Prohibition on Examiner Retaliation 
The FDIC has an experienced 

examination workforce and is proud of 
its professionalism and dedication. 
FDIC policy prohibits any retaliation, 
abuse, or retribution by an agency 
examiner or any FDIC personnel against 
an institution. Such behavior against an 
institution that appeals a material 
supervisory determination constitutes 
unprofessional conduct and will subject 
the examiner or other personnel to 
appropriate disciplinary or remedial 
action. Institutions that believe they 
have been retaliated against are 
encouraged to contact the Regional 
Director for the appropriate FDIC region. 
Any institution that believes or has any 
evidence that it has been subject to 
retaliation may file a complaint with the 
Director, Office of the Ombudsman, 
Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation, 
3501 Fairfax Drive, Suite E–2022, 
Arlington, VA 22226, explaining the 
circumstances and the basis for such 
belief or evidence and requesting that 
the complaint be investigated and 
appropriate disciplinary or remedial 
action taken. The Office of the 
Ombudsman will work with the 
appropriate Division Director to resolve 
the allegation of retaliation. 
Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation. 

By order of the Board of Directors. 
Dated at Washington, DC, on August 21, 

2020. 
James P. Sheesley, 
Acting Assistant Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–19276 Filed 8–31–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6714–01–P 

FEDERAL FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS 
EXAMINATION COUNCIL 

[Docket No. AS20–09] 

Appraisal Subcommittee Notice of 
Meeting 

AGENCY: Appraisal Subcommittee of the 
Federal Financial Institutions 
Examination Council. 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

Description: In accordance with 
Section 1104 (b) of Title XI of the 
Financial Institutions Reform, Recovery, 
and Enforcement Act of 1989, as 
amended, notice is hereby given that the 
Appraisal Subcommittee (ASC) will 
meet in open session for its regular 
meeting: 

Location: Due to the COVID–19 
Pandemic, the meeting will be open to 
the public via live webcast only. Visit 
the agency’s homepage (www.asc.gov) 
and access the provided registration link 
in the What’s New box. You MUST 
register in advance to attend this 
Meeting. 

Date: September 9, 2020. 
Time: 10:00 a.m. ET. 
Status: Open. 

Reports 

Chairman 
Executive Director 
Delegated State Compliance Reviews 
Grants Director 
Financial Manager 
Notation Vote 

Action and Discussion Items 
Approval of Minutes 
May 13, 2020 Open Session 
July 29, 2020 Special Meeting 
Notice of Funding Availability; 

development of training for State 
Appraiser and AMC Regulatory 
Programs 

FY21 ASC Budget Proposal 

How To Attend and Observe an ASC 
Meeting 

Due to the COVID–19 Pandemic, the 
meeting will be open to the public via 
live webcast only. Visit the agency’s 
homepage (www.asc.gov) and access the 
provided registration link in the What’s 
New box. The meeting space is intended 
to accommodate public attendees. 
However, if the space will not 
accommodate all requests, the ASC may 
refuse attendance on that reasonable 
basis. The use of any video or audio 
tape recording device, photographing 
device, or any other electronic or 
mechanical device designed for similar 
purposes is prohibited at ASC Meetings. 

James R. Park, 
Executive Director. 
[FR Doc. 2020–19184 Filed 8–31–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6700–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
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Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The public portions of the 
applications listed below, as well as 
other related filings required by the 
Board, if any, are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank(s) indicated below and at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
This information may also be obtained 
on an expedited basis, upon request, by 
contacting the appropriate Federal 
Reserve Bank and from the Board’s 
Freedom of Information Office at 
https://www.federalreserve.gov/foia/ 
request.htm. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on the 
standards enumerated in the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). 

Comments regarding each of these 
applications must be received at the 
Reserve Bank(s) indicated or the offices 
of the Board of Governors, Ann E. 
Misback, Secretary of the Board, 20th 
Street and Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20551–0001, not later 
than October 1, 2020. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Atlanta 
(Kathryn Haney, Assistant Vice 
President) 1000 Peachtree Street NE, 
Atlanta, Georgia 30309. Comments can 
also be sent electronically to 
Applications.Comments@atl.frb.org: 

1. Citizens Bancorp Investment, Inc., 
Lafayette, Tennessee; to merge with 
American Bancshares Corp., and 
thereby indirectly acquire American 
Bank and Trust of the Cumberlands, 
both of Livingston, Tennessee. 

B. Federal Reserve Bank of Dallas 
(Robert L. Triplett III, Senior Vice 
President) 2200 North Pearl Street, 
Dallas, Texas 75201–2272: 

1. Abilene Holdco, Inc., Abilene, 
Texas; to become a bank holding 
company by acquiring BSA Bankshares, 
Inc., Abilene, Texas, and BSA Delaware, 
Inc., Wilmington, Delaware, and thereby 
indirectly acquire First State Bank, 
Abilene, Texas. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, August 27, 2020. 

Yao-Chin Chao, 
Assistant Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2020–19302 Filed 8–31–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Change in Bank Control Notices; 
Acquisitions of Shares of a Bank or 
Bank Holding Company 

The notificants listed below have 
applied under the Change in Bank 
Control Act (Act) (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)) and 
§ 225.41 of the Board’s Regulation Y (12 
CFR 225.41) to acquire shares of a bank 
or bank holding company. The factors 
that are considered in acting on the 
applications are set forth in paragraph 7 
of the Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)(7)). 

The public portions of the 
applications listed below, as well as 
other related filings required by the 
Board, if any, are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank(s) indicated below and at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
This information may also be obtained 
on an expedited basis, upon request, by 
contacting the appropriate Federal 
Reserve Bank and from the Board’s 
Freedom of Information Office at 
https://www.federalreserve.gov/foia/ 
request.htm. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on the 
standards enumerated in paragraph 7 of 
the Act. 

Comments regarding each of these 
applications must be received at the 
Reserve Bank(s) indicated or the offices 
of the Board of Governors, Ann E. 
Misback, Secretary of the Board, 20th 
Street and Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20551–0001, not later 
than September 16, 2020. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of St. Louis 
(David L. Hubbard, Senior Manager) 
P.O. Box 442, St. Louis, Missouri 
63166–2034. Comments can also be sent 
electronically to 
Comments.applications@stls.frb.org: 

1. Walkenbach Investments, LP 
(WILP); Walkenbach Management 
Company, LLC (WMC); the William 
Walkenbach Revocable Living Trust; the 
Claudia Walkenbach Revocable Living 
Trust; the Brad W. Walkenbach 
Revocable Living Trust; two minor 
trusts; the Corey G. Walkenbach 
Revocable Trust; William Walkenbach, 
as trustee of the William Walkenbach 
Revocable Living Trust, limited partner 
of WILP, and managing member of 
WMC; Claudia Walkenbach, as trustee 
of the Claudia Walkenbach Revocable 
Living Trust, limited partner of WILP, 
and managing member of WMC; Brad. 
W. Walkenbach, as trustee of the Brad 
W. Walkenbach Revocable Living Trust 
and two minor trusts, limited partner of 
WILP, and managing member of WMC; 
and Corey G. Walkenbach, as trustee of 
the Corey G. Walkenbach Revocable 
Trust, limited partner of WILP, and 

managing member of WMC, all of 
Hermann, Missouri; to acquire voting 
shares of Rhineland Bancshares, Inc., 
and thereby indirectly acquire voting 
shares of Peoples Savings Bank of 
Rhineland, both of Rhineland, Missouri. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, August 27, 2020. 
Yao-Chin Chao, 
Assistant Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2020–19301 Filed 8–31–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

GENERAL SERVICES 
ADMINISTRATION 

[Notice-MV–2020–04; Docket No. 2020– 
0002; Sequence No. 31] 

Public Availability of General Services 
Administration Fiscal Year 2017 and 
Fiscal Year 2018 Service Contract 
Inventories 

AGENCY: Office of Governmentwide 
Policy; General Services 
Administration, (GSA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with The Fiscal 
Year (FY) 2010 Consolidated 
Appropriations Act, GSA is publishing 
this notice to advise the public of the 
availability of the FY 2017 and Fiscal 
Year 2018 Service Contract Inventories. 
DATES: Applicable: September 1, 2020. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Questions regarding the Service 
Contract Inventory should be directed to 
Mr. Jeffrey Pitts in the Office of 
Acquisition Policy at 202–501–0712 or 
jeffrey.pitts@gsa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with section 743 of Division 
C of the FY 2010 Consolidated 
Appropriations Act (Pub. L. 111–117), 
GSA is publishing this notice to advise 
the public of the availability of the 
Fiscal Year 2017 and Fiscal Year 2018 
Service Contract Inventories. These 
inventories are available at https://
www.acquisition.gov/service-contract- 
inventory. The inventories provide 
information on governmentwide service 
contract actions over $25,000 that were 
made in FY 2017 and FY 2018. The 
service contract inventory information 
located on acquisition.gov can be 
filtered by agency and component to 
show how contracted resources are 
distributed throughout any agency. 

The inventory has been developed in 
accordance with the guidance issued on 
December 19, 2011, by the Office of 
Management and Budget’s Office of 
Federal Procurement Policy (OFPP). 
OFPP’s guidance is available at: https:// 
obamawhitehouse.archives.gov/omb/ 
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