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• Review of NASA Unmanned 
Aircraft System (UAS) Integration into 
the National Airspace System (NAS) 
Phase 2 Activity Selection 

• Discussion on Research Efforts on 
Autonomy 

• Discussion on Final 
Recommendations Towards Future/ 
Follow On Projects 

It is imperative that these meetings be 
held on this date to accommodate the 
scheduling priorities of the key 
participants. Attendees will be 
requested to sign a register and to 
comply with NASA security 
requirements, including the 
presentation of a valid photo ID to 
Security before access to NASA 
Headquarters. Foreign nationals 
attending this meeting will be required 
to provide a copy of their passport and 
visa in addition to providing the 
following information no less than 10 
working days prior to the meeting: Full 
name; gender; date/place of birth; 
citizenship; visa information (number, 
type, expiration date); passport 
information (number, country, 
expiration date); employer/affiliation 
information (name of institution, 
address, country, telephone); title/ 
position of attendee; and home address 
to Ms. Brenda L. Mulac at fax 202–358– 
3602. U.S. citizens and Permanent 
Residents (green card holders) are 
requested to submit their name and 
affiliation 3 working days prior to the 
meeting to Ms. Brenda L. Mulac at fax 
202–358–3602 or email at 
brenda.l.mulac@nasa.gov. For 
questions, please call Ms. Brenda L. 
Mulac at 202–358–1578. 

Patricia D. Rausch, 
Advisory Committee Management Officer, 
National Aeronautics and Space 
Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2013–15037 Filed 6–24–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7510–13–P 

NATIONAL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS 
ADMINISTRATION 

Information Security Oversight Office 

[NARA–13–0030] 

National Industrial Security Program 
Policy Advisory Committee (NISPPAC) 

AGENCY: National Archives and Records 
Administration. 
ACTION: Notice of Meeting. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (5 
U.S.C. app 2) and implementing 
regulation 41 CFR 101–6, 
announcement is made for the following 

committee meeting to discuss National 
Industrial Security Program policy 
matters. 

DATES: The meeting will be held on July 
17, 2013 from 10:00 a.m. to 12:00 p.m. 
ADDRESSES: National Archives and 
Records Administration, 700 
Pennsylvania Avenue NW., Archivist’s 
Reception Room, Room 105, 
Washington, DC 20408. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
meeting will be open to the public. 
However, due to space limitations and 
access procedures, the name and 
telephone number of individuals 
planning to attend must be submitted to 
the Information Security Oversight 
Office (ISOO) no later than Friday, July 
12, 2013. ISOO will provide additional 
instructions for gaining access to the 
location of the meeting. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
David O. Best, Senior Program Analyst, 
ISOO, National Archives Building, 700 
Pennsylvania Avenue NW., Washington, 
DC 20408, telephone number (202) 357– 
5123, or at david.best@nara.gov. Contact 
ISOO at ISOO@nara.gov and the 
NISPPAC at NISPPAC@nara.gov. 

Dated: June 19, 2013. 
Patrice Little Murray, 
Acting Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2013–15157 Filed 6–24–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7515–01–P 

NATIONAL SCIENCE FOUNDATION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request 

AGENCY: National Science Foundation. 
ACTION: Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request. 

The National Science Foundation 
(NSF) has submitted the following 
information collection requirement to 
OMB for review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
Public Law 104–13. This is the second 
notice for public comment; the first was 
published in the Federal Register at 78 
FR 1266 and two comments were 
received. NSF is forwarding the 
proposed renewal submission to the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for clearance simultaneously 
with the publication of this second 
notice. The full submission may be 
found at: http://www.reginfo.gov/public/ 
do/PRAMain. 

Comments: Comments regarding (a) 
whether the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the agency, including 

whether the information will have 
practical utility; (b) the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of burden including 
the validity of the methodology and 
assumptions used; (c) ways to enhance 
the quality, utility and clarity of the 
information to be collected; or (d) ways 
to minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology should be 
addressed to: Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs of OMB, Attention: 
Desk Officer for National Science 
Foundation, 725—17th Street NW., 
Room 10235, Washington, DC 20503, 
and to Suzanne H. Plimpton, Reports 
Clearance Officer, National Science 
Foundation, 4201 Wilson Boulevard, 
Suite 295, Arlington, Virginia 22230 or 
send email to splimpto@nsf.gov. 
Comments regarding these information 
collections are best assured of having 
their full effect if received within 30 
days of this notification. Copies of the 
submission(s) may be obtained by 
calling 703–292–7556. Individuals who 
use a telecommunications device for the 
deaf (TDD) may call the Federal 
Information Relay Service (FIRS) at 1– 
800–877–8339, which is accessible 24 
hours a day, 7 days a week, 365 days a 
year (including federal holidays). 

NSF may not conduct or sponsor a 
collection of information unless the 
collection of information displays a 
currently valid OMB control number 
and the agency informs potential 
persons who are to respond to the 
collection of information that such 
persons are not required to respond to 
the collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Comments: As required by 5 CFR 
1320.8(d), comments on the information 
collection activities as part of this study 
were solicited through publication of a 
60-Day Notice in the Federal Register 
on January 8, 2013, at 78 FR 1266. We 
received two comments, to which we 
here respond. 

The first comment came from the 
Bureau of Economic Analysis (BEA). 
They expressed general support for the 
survey and requested several additional 
data elements to be considered for 
future collection. NSF is in regular 
contact with BEA about their data needs 
and the feasibility of adding questions 
to the HERD or FFRDC Surveys to 
address these needs. As always, there is 
a need to balance the burden on the 
respondents with requesting new data 
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