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1 See 83 Federal Register 939 (January 08, 2018). 

would likely cause substantial harm to 
the competitive position of the 
respondent. (5 U.S.C. 552(b)(4)). 
Additionally, individual respondents 
may request that personally identifiable 
information be afforded confidential 
treatment pursuant to exemption 6 of 
FOIA if the release of the information 
would constitute a clearly unwarranted 
invasion of personal privacy. (5 U.S.C. 
552(b)(6)). The applicability of FOIA 
exemptions 4 and 6 would be 
determined on a case-by-case basis. 

3. Report title: The Financial 
Statements of U.S. Nonbank 
Subsidiaries Held by Foreign Banking 
Organizations, Abbreviated Financial 
Statements of U.S. Nonbank 
Subsidiaries Held by Foreign Banking 
Organizations, and the Capital and 
Asset Report of Foreign Banking 
Organizations. 

Agency form number: FR Y–7N, FR 
Y–7NS, and FR Y–7Q. 

OMB control number: 7100–0125. 
Frequency: Quarterly and annually. 
Reporters: Foreign bank organizations 

(FBOs). 
Estimated annual reporting hours: FR 

Y–7N (quarterly): 1,224; FR Y–7N 
(annual): 156; FR Y–7NS: 31; FR Y–7Q 
(quarterly): 1,632; FR Y–7Q (annual): 48. 

Estimated average hours per response: 
FR Y–7N (quarterly): 6.8; FR Y–7N 
(annual): 6.8; FR Y–7NS: 1; FR Y–7Q 
(quarterly): 3; FR Y–7Q (annual): 1.5. 

Number of respondents: FR Y–7N 
(quarterly): 45; FR Y–7N (annual): 23 FR 
Y–7NS: 31; FR Y–7Q (quarterly): 136; 
FR Y–7Q (annual): 32. 

General Description of Report: The FR 
Y–7N and the FR Y–7NS are used to 
assess an FBO’s ability to be a 
continuing source of strength to its U.S. 
operations and to determine compliance 
with U.S. laws and regulations. FBOs 
file the FR Y– 7N quarterly or annually 
or the FR Y– 7NS annually 
predominantly based on asset size 
thresholds. The FR Y–7Q is used to 
assess consolidated regulatory capital 
and asset information from all FBOs. 
The FR Y–7Q is filed quarterly by FBOs 
that have effectively elected to become 
or be treated as a U.S. financial holding 
company (FHC) and by FBOs that have 
total consolidated assets of $50 billion 
or more, regardless of FHC status. All 
other FBOs file the FR Y–7Q annually. 

Legal authorization and 
confidentiality: With respect to FBOs 
and their subsidiary IHCs, section 5(c) 
of the BHC Act, in conjunction with 
section 8 of the International Banking 
Act (12 U.S.C. 3106), authorizes the 
board to require FBOs and any 
subsidiary thereof to file the FR Y–7N 
reports, and the FR Y–7Q. 

Information collected in these reports 
generally is not considered confidential. 
However, because the information is 
collected as part of the Board’s 
supervisory process, certain information 
may be afforded confidential treatment 
pursuant to exemption 8 of FOIA. (5 
U.S.C. 552(b)(8)). Individual 
respondents may request that certain 
data be afforded confidential treatment 
pursuant to exemption 4 of FOIA if the 
data has not previously been publically 
disclosed and the release of the data 
would likely cause substantial harm to 
the competitive position of the 
respondent. (5 U.S.C. 552(b)(4)). 
Additionally, individual respondents 
may request that personally identifiable 
information be afforded confidential 
treatment pursuant to exemption 6 of 
FOIA if the release of the information 
would constitute a clearly unwarranted 
invasion of personal privacy. (5 U.S.C. 
552(b)(6)). The applicability of FOIA 
exemptions 4 and 6 would be 
determined on a case-by-case basis. 

Proposed revisions: Under the 
proposal, revisions would be made to 
the FR Y–11, FR 2314, and FR Y–7N 
report forms and instructions that are 
consistent with certain changes to the 
FR Y–9 family of reports (OMB No. 
7100–0128) and the Federal Financial 
Institutions Examination Council 
(FFIEC) Consolidated Reports of 
Condition and Income (Call Reports) 
(FFIEC 031, 041, and 051; OMB No. 
7100–0036).1 Specifically, the proposed 
changes would (1) add a new data item 
to the balance sheet to separate and 
reclassify equity securities with readily 
determinable fair values from the 
‘‘available for sale’’ category in 
accordance with Accounting Standards 
update (ASU) No. 2016–01, 
‘‘Recognition and Measurement of 
Financial Assets and Financial 
Liabilities,’’ and (2) add new data items 
to the income statement to reflect the 
proper reporting of income associated 
with these securities. These revisions 
would be effective for reports reflecting 
the June 30, 2018, report date. The 
Board is not proposing any revisions to 
the Abbreviated Financial Statements of 
U.S. Nonbank Subsidiaries of U.S. Bank 
Holding Companies (FR Y–11S), the 
Abbreviated Financial Statements of 
Foreign Subsidiaries of U.S. Banking 
Organizations (FR 2314S), the 
Abbreviated Financial Statements of 
U.S. Nonbank Subsidiaries Held by 
Foreign Banking Organizations (FR Y– 
7NS), and the Capital and Asset Report 
for Foreign Banking Organizations (FR 
Y–7Q). 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, April 25, 2018. 
Ann Misback, 
Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2018–09083 Filed 4–30–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The applications will also be 
available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 
writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors not later than May 25, 2018. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Atlanta 
(Kathryn Haney, Director of 
Applications) 1000 Peachtree Street NE, 
Atlanta, Georgia 30309. Comments can 
also be sent electronically to 
Applications.Comments@atl.frb.org: 

1. PBD Holdings, LLC, Chattanooga, 
Tennessee; to become a bank holding 
company by acquiring outstanding 
shares of Millennium Bancshares, Inc., 
Ooltewah, Tennessee, and thereby 
acquire shares of Millennium Bank, 
Ooltewah, Tennessee and AB&T 
Financial Corporation, and thereby 
acquire shares of Alliance Bank and 
Trust Company, both of Gastonia, North 
Carolina. 
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Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, April 25, 2018. 
Ann Misback, 
Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2018–09082 Filed 4–30–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention 

Advisory Committee on Immunization 
Practices (ACIP) 

AGENCY: Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention (CDC), Department of Health 
and Human Services (HHS). 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, the 
Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention (CDC), announces the 
following meeting of the Advisory 
Committee on Immunization Practices 
(ACIP). This meeting is open to the 
public, limited only by room seating. 
The meeting room accommodates 
approximately 400 people. Time will be 
available for public comment. The 
public is welcome to submit written 
comments in advance of the meeting. 
Comments should be submitted in 
writing by email to the contact person 
listed below. The deadline for receipt is 
June 11, 2018. Written comments must 
include full name, address, 
organizational affiliation, email address 
of the speaker, topic being addressed 
and specific comments. Written 
comments must not exceed one single- 
spaced typed page with 1-inch margins 
containing all items above. Only those 
written comments received 10 business 
days in advance of the meeting will be 
included in the official record of the 
meeting. Public comments made in 
attendance must be no longer than 3 
minutes and the person giving 
comments must attend the public 
comment session at the start time listed 
on the agenda. Time for public 
comments may start before the time 
indicated on the agenda. The meeting 
will be webcast live via the World Wide 
Web; for instructions and more 
information on ACIP please visit the 
ACIP website: http://www.cdc.gov/ 
vaccines/acip/index.html. 
DATES: The meeting will be held on June 
20, 2018, 8:00 a.m. to 5:30 p.m., EDT, 
and June 21, 2018, 8:30 a.m. to 12:30 
p.m. EDT. 
ADDRESSES: CDC, 1600 Clifton Road NE, 
Tom Harkin Global Communications 

Center, Kent ‘Oz’ Nelson Auditorium, 
Atlanta, GA 30329–4027. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Stephanie Thomas, ACIP Committee 
Management Specialist, CDC, NCIRD, 
telephone 404–639–8836, email ACIP@
cdc.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Purpose: 
The committee is charged with advising 
the Director, CDC, on the use of 
immunizing agents. In addition, under 
42 U.S.C. 1396s, the committee is 
mandated to establish and periodically 
review and, as appropriate, revise the 
list of vaccines for administration to 
vaccine-eligible children through the 
Vaccines for Children (VFC) program, 
along with schedules regarding dosing 
interval, dosage, and contraindications 
to administration of vaccines. Further, 
under provisions of the Affordable Care 
Act, section 2713 of the Public Health 
Service Act, immunization 
recommendations of the ACIP that have 
been approved by the Director of the 
Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention and appear on CDC 
immunization schedules must be 
covered by applicable health plans. 

Matters to be Considered: The agenda 
will include discussions on Influenza 
vaccines, anthrax vaccine, Japanese 
encephalitis vaccines, human 
papillomavirus vaccines, pneumococcal 
vaccines, zoster vaccines, pertussis 
vaccines, and mumps. A 
recommendation vote is scheduled for 
Influenza vaccines, anthrax vaccine. A 
tentative vote is scheduled human 
papillomavirus vaccines. Agenda items 
are subject to change as priorities 
dictate. For updated information on the 
meeting agenda visit https://
www.cdc.gov/vaccines/acip/meetings/ 
meetings-info.html. 

The Director, Management Analysis 
and Services Office, has been delegated 
the authority to sign Federal Register 
notices pertaining to announcements of 
meetings and other committee 
management activities, for both the 
Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention and the Agency for Toxic 
Substances and Disease Registry. 

Elizabeth Millington, 
Acting Director, Management Analysis and 
Services Office, Centers for Disease Control 
and Prevention. 
[FR Doc. 2018–09097 Filed 4–30–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4163–18–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention 

Advisory Committee on Immunization 
Practices: Notice of Charter Renewal 

AGENCY: Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention (CDC), Department of Health 
and Human Services (HHS). 
ACTION: Notice of charter renewal. 

SUMMARY: This gives notice under the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act of 
October 6, 1972, that the Advisory 
Committee on Immunization Practices, 
Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention, Department of Health and 
Human Services, has been renewed for 
a 2-year period through April 1, 2020. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Amanda Cohn, M.D., Designated 
Federal Officer, Advisory Committee on 
Immunization Practices, Centers for 
Disease Control and Prevention, 
Department of Health and Human 
Services, 1600 Clifton Road NE, 
Mailstop A27, Atlanta, Georgia 30329– 
4027, telephone (404) 639–6039, or fax 
(404) 315–4679. 

The Director, Management Analysis 
and Services Office, has been delegated 
the authority to sign Federal Register 
notices pertaining to announcements of 
meetings and other committee 
management activities, for both the 
Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention and the Agency for Toxic 
Substances and Disease Registry. 

Elizabeth Millington, 
Acting Director, Management Analysis and 
Services Office, Centers for Disease Control 
and Prevention. 
[FR Doc. 2018–09096 Filed 4–30–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4163–18–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Administration for Children and 
Families 

Proposed Information Collection 
Activity; Comment Request 

Proposed Projects 

Title: State Self-Assessment Review 
and Report. 

OMB No.: 0970–0223. 
Description: Section 454(15)(A) of the 

Social Security Act, as amended by the 
Personal Responsibility and Work 
Opportunity Act of 1996, requires each 
State to annually assess the performance 
of its child support enforcement 
program in accordance with standards 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 18:12 Apr 30, 2018 Jkt 244001 PO 00000 Frm 00027 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\01MYN1.SGM 01MYN1am
oz

ie
 o

n 
D

S
K

30
R

V
08

2P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 N
O

T
IC

E
S

https://www.cdc.gov/vaccines/acip/meetings/meetings-info.html
https://www.cdc.gov/vaccines/acip/meetings/meetings-info.html
https://www.cdc.gov/vaccines/acip/meetings/meetings-info.html
http://www.cdc.gov/vaccines/acip/index.html
http://www.cdc.gov/vaccines/acip/index.html
mailto:ACIP@cdc.gov
mailto:ACIP@cdc.gov

		Superintendent of Documents
	2018-05-01T00:24:40-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




