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n. Comments, Motions to Intervene, or 
Protests: Anyone may submit 
comments, a motion to intervene, or a 
protest in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214. 
In determining the appropriate action to 
take, the Commission will consider all 
protests or other comments filed, but 
only those who file a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
Commission’s Rules may become a 
party to the proceeding. Any comments, 
motions to intervene, or protests must 
be received on or before the specified 
comment date for the particular 
application. 

o. Filing and Service of Responsive 
Documents: Any filing must (1) bear in 
all capital letters the title COMMENTS, 
MOTION TO INTERVENE, or PROTEST 
as applicable; (2) set forth in the 
heading the name of the applicant and 
the project number(s) of the application 
to which the filing responds; (3) furnish 
the name, address, and telephone 
number of the person intervening or 
protesting; and (4) otherwise comply 
with the requirements of 18 CFR 
385.2001 through 385.2005. All 
comments, motions to intervene, or 
protests must set forth their evidentiary 
basis. A copy of all other filings in 
reference to this application must be 
accompanied by proof of service on all 
persons listed in the service list 
prepared by the Commission in this 
proceeding, in accordance with 
385.2010. 

Dated: April 6, 2020. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–07577 Filed 4–9–20; 8:45 am] 
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ConocoPhillips Company, Shell 
Energy North America (US), L.P., XTO 
Energy Inc. v. Northern Border Pipeline 
Company; Notice of Complaint 

Take notice that on April 2, 2020, 
pursuant to Rule 206 of the Rules of 
Practice and Procedures of the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission 
(Commission), 18 CFR 385.206 (2019), 
ConocoPhillips Company, Shell Energy 
North America (US), L.P., and XTO 
Energy Inc. (jointly Indicated Shippers 
or Complainants) filed a formal 
complaint against Northern Border 
Pipeline Company, (Northern Border or 

Respondent) alleging that Northern 
Border has entered into a prearranged 
transaction without complying with the 
no undue discrimination requirements 
of the Natural Gas Act and the 
Commission’s regulations. In addition, 
the Indicated Shippers allege that 
Northern Border’s pre-arranged 
transaction violated the Commission’s 
policy on reserving unsubscribed 
capacity for a future expansion project. 
The Indicated Shippers respectfully 
request the Commission to: (1) Rescind 
the pre-arranged transaction; (2) require 
Northern Border to hold an open season 
where all interested parties will be on 
equal footing with respect to the 
potential transactions; and (3) direct 
Northern Border to cease from engaging 
in pre-arranged transactions where the 
unsubscribed capacity has not been 
publicly posted as generally available, 
all as more fully explained in the 
complaint. 

The Complainants certifies that copies 
of the complaint were served on the 
contacts listed for Respondent in the 
Commission’s list of Corporate Officials. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. The Respondent’s answer 
and all interventions, or protests must 
be filed on or before the comment date. 
The Respondent’s answer, motions to 
intervene, and protests must be served 
on the Complainants. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings of comments, protests 
and interventions in lieu of paper using 
the eFiling link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically may 
mail similar pleadings to the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426. 
Hand delivered submissions in 
docketed proceedings should be 
delivered to Health and Human 
Services, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
ferc.gov) using the eLibrary link. Enter 
the docket number excluding the last 
three digits in the docket number field 

to access the document. At this time, the 
Commission has suspended access to 
the Commission’s Public Reference 
Room, due to the proclamation 
declaring a National Emergency 
concerning the Novel Coronavirus 
Disease (COVID–19), issued by the 
President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact FERC at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on April 22, 2020. 

Dated: April 6, 2020. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–07576 Filed 4–9–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[10007–33–Region 5] 

Proposed Prospective Purchaser 
Agreement for the Danville Central 
Foundry Landfill Site in Danville, 
Illinois 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice; request for public 
comment. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Prospective Purchaser Agreement, 
notice is hereby given of a proposed 
administrative settlement concerning 
the Danville Central Foundry Landfill 
Site in Danville, Illinois with the 
following Settling Parties: Danville 
Foundry Holding, LLC and Ameresco 
Danville Foundry Solar LLC. The 
settlement requires the Settling Parties 
to, if necessary, execute and record a 
Declaration of Restrictive Covenant; 
provide access to the Site and exercise 
due care with respect to existing 
contamination. The settlement includes 
a covenant not to sue the Settling Parties 
pursuant to the Comprehensive 
Environmental Response, 
Compensation, and Liability Act or the 
Resource Conservation and Recovery 
Act with respect to the Existing 
Contamination. Existing Contamination 
is defined as any hazardous substances, 
pollutants, or contaminants or Waste 
Material present or existing on or under 
the Property as of the Effective Date of 
the Settlement Agreement; any 
hazardous substances, pollutants, or 
contaminants or Waste Material that 
migrated from the Property prior to the 
Effective Date; and any hazardous 
substances, pollutants, or contaminants 
or Waste Material presently at the Site 
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that migrates onto, on, under, or from 
the Property after the Effective Date. 

For thirty (30) days following the date 
of publication of this notice, the Agency 
will receive written comments relating 
to the settlement. The Agency will 
consider all comments received and 
may modify or withdraw its consent to 
the settlement if comments received 
disclose facts or considerations which 
indicate that the settlement is 
inappropriate, improper, or inadequate. 
The Agency’s response to any comments 
received will be available for public 
inspection at the EPA, Region 5, 
Records Center, 77 W Jackson Blvd., 7th 
Fl., Chicago, Illinois 60604. Commenters 
may request an opportunity for a public 
hearing in the affected area, in 
accordance with Section 7003(d) of 
RCRA. 

DATES: Comments must be submitted on 
or before May 11, 2020. 

ADDRESSES: The proposed settlement is 
available for public inspection at the 
EPA, Region 5, Records Center, 77 W 
Jackson Blvd., 7th Fl., Chicago, Illinois 
60604. A copy of the proposed 
settlement may be obtained from Peter 
Felitti, Assoc. Regional Counsel, EPA, 
Office of Regional Counsel, Region 5, 77 
W. Jackson Blvd., mail code: C–14J, 
Chicago, Illinois 60604. Comments 
should reference the Danville Central 
Foundry Landfill Site, Danville, Illinois 
and should be addressed to Peter Felitti, 
Assoc. Regional Counsel, EPA, Office of 
Regional Counsel, Region 5, 77 W. 
Jackson Blvd., mail code: C–14J, 
Chicago, Illinois 60604. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Peter Felitti, Assoc. Regional Counsel, 
EPA, Office of Regional Counsel, Region 
5, 77 W. Jackson Blvd., C–14J, Chicago, 
Illinois 60604. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Settling Parties propose to acquire 
ownership of the former General Motors 
Corporation North American operation, 
at Interstate 74 at North G Street I 
Danville, Illinois. The Site is one of the 
89 sites that were placed into an 
Environmental Response Trust (the 
‘‘Trust’’) as a result of the resolution of 
the 2009 GM bankruptcy. The Trust is 
administrated by Revitalizing Auto 
Communities Environmental Response. 

Dated: April 6, 2020. 

Douglas Ballotti, 
Director, Superfund & Emergency 
Management Division. 
[FR Doc. 2020–07532 Filed 4–9–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[FRL–10007–71–OMS] 

Request for Nominations to the 
National and Governmental Advisory 
Committees to the U.S. Representative 
to the Commission for Environmental 
Cooperation 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice of Request for 
Nominations. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency (EPA) is inviting 
nominations from a diverse range of 
qualified candidates to be considered 
for appointment to fill vacancies on the 
National Advisory Committee (NAC) 
and the Governmental Advisory 
Committee (GAC) to the U.S. 
Representative to the Commission for 
Environmental Cooperation (CEC). 
Vacancies on these two committees are 
expected to be selected by the spring of 
2020. Please submit nominations by 
May 8, 2020. Additional sources may be 
utilized in the solicitation of nominees. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
National Advisory Committee and the 
Governmental Advisory Committee 
advise the EPA Administrator in his 
capacity as the U.S. Representative to 
the CEC Council. The Committees are 
authorized under Articles 17 and 18 of 
the North American Agreement on 
Environmental Cooperation (NAAEC). 
Implementation Act, Public Law 103– 
182, and as directed by Executive Order 
12915, entitled ‘‘Federal 
Implementation of the North American 
Agreement on Environmental 
Cooperation.’’ The NAC and GAC are 
continued under the authority of 
Executive Order 13889, dated 
September 27, 2019, and operates under 
the provisions of the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act (FACA), 5 U.S.C. App. 2. 
The Committees are responsible for 
providing advice to the United States 
Representative on a wide range of 
strategic, scientific, technological, 
regulatory and economic issues related 
to implementation and further 
elaboration of the NAAEC. The National 
Advisory Committee consists of 15 
representatives from environmental 
non-profit groups, business and 
industry, and educational institutions. 
The Governmental Advisory Committee 
consists of 14 representatives from state, 
local, and tribal governments. Members 
are appointed by the EPA Administrator 
for a two-year term. The committees 
usually meet 3 times per year and the 
average workload for committee 

members is approximately 10 to 15 
hours per month. Members serve on the 
committees in a voluntary capacity. 

Although we are unable to provide 
compensation or an honorarium for 
your services, you may receive travel 
and per diem allowances, according to 
applicable federal travel regulations. 
EPA is seeking nominations from 
various sectors, i.e., for the NAC we are 
seeking nominees from academia, 
business and industry, and non- 
governmental organizations; for the 
GAC we are seeking nominees from 
state, local and tribal government 
sectors. Nominees will be considered 
according to the mandates of FACA, 
which requires committees to maintain 
diversity across a broad range of 
constituencies, sectors, and groups. EPA 
values and welcomes diversity. In an 
effort obtain nominations of diverse 
candidates, EPA encourages 
nominations of women and men of all 
racial and ethnic groups. The following 
criteria will be used to evaluate 
nominees: 

• Professional knowledge of the 
subjects examined by the committees, 
including trade & environment issues, 
the USMCA and ECA, the NAFTA and 
NAAEC, and the CEC. 

• Represent a sector or group 
involved in trilateral environmental 
policy issues. 

• Senior-level experience in the 
sectors represented on both committees. 

• A demonstrated ability to work in a 
consensus building process with a wide 
range of representatives from diverse 
constituencies. 

Nominations must include a resume 
and a short biography describing the 
professional and educational 
qualifications of the nominee, as well as 
the nominee’s current business address, 
email address, and daytime telephone 
number. Interested candidates may self- 
nominate. Anyone interested in being 
considered for nomination is 
encouraged to submit their application 
materials by May 8, 2020. To help the 
Agency in evaluating the effectiveness 
of its outreach efforts, please tell us how 
you learned of this opportunity. Please 
be aware that EPA’s policy is that, 
unless otherwise prescribed by statute, 
members generally are appointed for 
two-year terms. 
ADDRESSES: Submit nominations to: 
Oscar Carrillo, Designated Federal 
Officer, Office of Diversity, Advisory 
Committee Management and Outreach, 
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency 
(1601–M), 1200 Pennsylvania Avenue 
NW, Washington, DC 20460. You may 
also email nominations with subject line 
COMMITTEE RESUME 2020 to 
carrillo.oscar@epa.gov. 
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