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sales of any industry members’ 
products. 

For more information concerning the 
International Seafood Sustainability 
Foundation and Association, please 
contact Michael Cohen; Paul, Hastings, 
Janofsky & Walker LLP; 875 15th Street, 
NW., Washington, DC 20005. 

Patricia A. Brink, 
Deputy Director of Operations, Antitrust 
Division. 
[FR Doc. E9–9396 Filed 4–23–09; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–11–M 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993—Advanced Media 
Workflow Association, Inc. 

Notice is hereby given that, on March 
24, 2009, pursuant to Section 6(a) of the 
National Cooperative Research and 
Production Act of 1993, 15 U.S.C. 4301 
et seq. (‘‘the Act’’), Advanced Media 
Workflow Association, Inc. has filed 
written notifications simultaneously 
with the Attorney General and the 
Federal Trade Commission disclosing 
changes in its membership. The 
notifications were filed for the purpose 
of extending the Act’s provisions 
limiting the recovery of antitrust 
plaintiffs to actual damages under 
specified circumstances. Specifically, 
BroadView Software, Toronto, Ontario, 
CANADA; Chris Lacinak (individual 
member), Brooklyn, NY; and Tobias 
Soppa (individual member), Leipzig, 
GERMANY have been added as parties 
to this venture. Also, Arbitron, Inc., 
Columbia, MD; AutoDesk, Montreal, 
Quebec, CANADA; and Jeff Romine, 
Sandy, UT have withdrawn as parties to 
this venture. 

No other changes have been made in 
either the membership or planned 
activity of the group research project. 
Membership in this group research 
project remains open, and Advanced 
Media Workflow Association, Inc. 
intends to file additional written 
notifications disclosing all changes in 
membership. 

On March 28, 2000, Advanced Media 
Workflow Association, Inc. filed its 
original notification pursuant to Section 
6(a) of the Act. The Department of 
Justice published a notice in the Federal 
Register pursuant to Section 6(b) of the 
Act on June 29, 2000 (65 FR 40127). 

The last notification was filed with 
the Department on December 18, 2008. 
A notice was published in the Federal 

Register pursuant to Section 6(b) of the 
Act on February 3, 2009 (74 FR 5948). 

Patricia A. Brink, 
Deputy Director of Operations, Antitrust 
Division. 
[FR Doc. E9–9394 Filed 4–23–09; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–11–M 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993—Petroleum Environmental 
Research Forum Project No. 2007–05, 
Membrane Bioreactor Demonstration 

Notice is hereby given that, on March 
9, 2009, pursuant to Section 6(a) of the 
National Cooperative Research and 
Production Act of 1993, 15 U.S.C. 4301 
et seq. (‘‘the Act’’), Petroleum 
Environmental Research Forum Project 
No. 2007–05, Membrane Bioreactor 
Demonstration (‘‘PERF Project No. 
2007–05’’) has filed written notifications 
simultaneously with the Attorney 
General and the Federal Trade 
Commission disclosing changes in its 
membership. The notifications were 
filed for the purpose of extending the 
Act’s provisions limiting the recovery of 
antitrust plaintiffs to actual damages 
under specified circumstances. 
Specifically, Aramco Services Company, 
Houston, TX has been added as a party 
to this venture. 

No other changes have been made in 
either the membership or planned 
activity of the group research project. 
Membership in this group research 
project remains open, and PERF Project 
No. 2007–05 intends to file additional 
written notifications disclosing all 
changes in membership. 

On February 26, 2009, PERF Project 
No. 2007–05 filed its original 
notification pursuant to Section 6(a) of 
the Act. The Department of Justice 
published a notice in the Federal 
Register pursuant to Section 6(b) of the 
Act on April 3, 2009 (74 FR 15303). 

Patricia A. Brink, 
Deputy Director of Operations, Antitrust 
Division. 
[FR Doc. E9–9397 Filed 4–23–09; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–11–M 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

[NRC–2009–0178] 

Draft Regulatory Guide: Issuance, 
Availability 

AGENCY: Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice of Issuance and 
Availability of Draft Regulatory Guide 
(DG)–1220. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Bruce Lin, U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission, Washington, DC 20555– 
0001, telephone: (301) 251–7653 or 
e-mail to Bruce.Lin@nrc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Introduction 

The U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission (NRC) is issuing for public 
comment a draft regulatory guide in the 
agency’s ‘‘Regulatory Guide’’ series. 
This series was developed to describe 
and make available to the public such 
information as methods that are 
acceptable to the NRC staff for 
implementing specific parts of the 
NRC’s regulations, techniques that the 
staff uses in evaluating specific 
problems or postulated accidents, and 
data that the staff needs in its review of 
applications for permits and licenses. 

The draft regulatory guide (DG), 
entitled, ‘‘Performance-Based 
Containment Leak-Test Program,’’ is 
temporarily identified by its task 
number, DG–1220, which should be 
mentioned in all related 
correspondence. DG–1220 is proposed 
Revision 1 of Regulatory Guide 1.163. 

DG–1220 provides guidance on a 
performance-based leak-test program, 
leakage-rate test methods, procedures, 
and analyses that the NRC considers 
acceptable for use in complying with 
the Option B, performance-based 
requirements, in Appendix J, ‘‘Primary 
Reactor Containment Leakage Testing 
for Water-Cooled Power Reactors,’’ to 
Title 10, Part 50, ‘‘Domestic Licensing of 
Production and Utilization Facilities,’’ 
of the Code of Federal Regulations (10 
CFR Part 50). Licensees may voluntarily 
choose either Option A, ‘‘Prescriptive 
Requirements,’’ or Option B to meet the 
requirements of Appendix J to 10 CFR 
Part 50. 

II. Further Information 

The NRC staff is soliciting comments 
on DG–1220. Comments may be 
accompanied by relevant information or 
supporting data and should mention 
DG–1220 in the subject line. Comments 
submitted in writing or in electronic 
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