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displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 

Farm Service Agency 

Title: Representations for CCC and 
FSA Loans and Authorization to File a 
Financing Statement and Related 
Documents Under the Revised Article 9 
of the Uniform Commercial Code. 

OMB Control Number: 0560–0215. 
Summary of Collection: Commodity 

Credit Corporation and the Farm Service 
Agency (FSA) programs require loans be 
secured with collateral. The security 
interest is created and attaches to the 
collateral when: (1) Value has been 
given, (2) the debtor has rights in the 
collateral or the power to transfer rights 
in the collateral, and (3) the debtor has 
authenticated a security agreement that 
provides a description of the collateral. 
In order to perfect the security interest 
in collateral, a financing statement must 
be filed according to a State’s Uniform 
Commercial Code. The revised Article 9 
of the Uniform Commercial Code deals 
with secured transaction for personal 
property. The revised Article 9 affects 
the way the CCC and FSA, as well as 
any other creditor, perfect and liquidate 
security interests in collateral. 

Need and Use of the Information: FSA 
will collect information using form 
CCC–10, Representations for 
Commodity Credit Corporation or Farm 
Service Agency Loans and 
Authorization to File a Financing 
Statement and Related Documents. The 
information obtained on CCC–10 is 
needed to not only obtain authorization 
from loan applicants to file a financing 
statement without their signature, but 
also to verify the exact legal name and 
location of the debtor. If this 
information is not collected, CCC and 
FSA will not be able to disburse loans 
because a security interest would not be 
perfected. 

Description of Respondents: Farms; 
Individuals or households; Business or 
other for-profit. 

Number of Respondents: 4,634. 
Frequency of Responses: Reporting; 

On occasion. 
Total Burden Hours: 385. 

Ruth Brown, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2021–14962 Filed 7–13–21; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Office of the Under Secretary for 
Economic Affairs 

Advisory Committee on Data for 
Evidence Building 

AGENCY: Office of the Under Secretary 
for Economic Affairs, U.S. Department 
of Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice of public meetings. 

SUMMARY: The Office of the Under 
Secretary for Economic Affairs is 
providing notice of three upcoming 
meetings of the Advisory Committee on 
Data for Evidence Building (ACDEB or 
Committee). These will constitute the 
eleventh, twelfth, and thirteenth 
meetings of the Committee in support of 
its charge to review, analyze, and make 
recommendations on how to promote 
the use of Federal data for evidence 
building purposes. At the conclusion of 
the Committee’s first and second year, it 
will submit to the Director of the Office 
of Management and Budget, Executive 
Office of the President, an annual report 
on the activities and findings of the 
Committee. This report will also be 
made available to the public. 
DATES: August 20, 2021; September 17, 
2021; October 22, 2021. The meetings 
will begin at approximately 9:00 a.m. 
and adjourn at approximately 12:00 
p.m. (ET). Each meeting will be held 
virtually. 

ADDRESSES: Those interested in 
attending the Committee’s public 
meetings are requested to RSVP to 
Evidence@bea.gov one week prior to 
each meeting. Agendas, background 
material, and meeting links will be 
accessible 24 hours prior to each 
meeting at www.bea.gov/evidence. 

Members of the public who wish to 
submit written input for the 
Committee’s consideration are 
welcomed to do so via email to 
Evidence@bea.gov. Additional 
opportunities for public input will be 
forthcoming. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Gianna Marrone, Program Analyst, U.S. 
Department of Commerce, 4600 Silver 
Hill Road (BE–64), Suitland, MD 20746; 
phone (301) 278–9282; email Evidence@
bea.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Foundations for Evidence-Based 
Policymaking Act (Pub. L. 115–435, 
Evidence Act 101(a)(2) (5 U.S.C. 315 
(a)), establishes the Committee and its 
charge. It specifies that the Chief 
Statistician of the United States shall 
serve as the Chair and other members 
shall be appointed by the Director of the 

Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB). The Act prescribes a 
membership balance plan that includes: 
One agency Chief Information Officer; 
one agency Chief Privacy Officer; one 
agency Chief Performance Officer; three 
members who are agency Chief Data 
Officers; three members who are agency 
Evaluation Officers; and three members 
who are agency Statistical Officials who 
are members of the Interagency Council 
for Statistical Policy established under 
section 3504(e)(8) of title 44. 
Additionally, at least 10 members are to 
be representative of state and local 
governments and nongovernmental 
stakeholders with expertise in 
government data policy, privacy, 
technology, transparency policy, 
evaluation and research methodologies, 
and other relevant subjects. Committee 
members serve for a term of two years. 
Following a public solicitation and 
review of nominations, the Director of 
OMB appointed members per this 
balance plan and information on the 
membership can be found at 
www.bea.gov/evidence. Any member 
appointed to fill a vacancy occurring 
before the expiration of the term for 
which the member’s predecessor was 
appointed shall be appointed only for 
the remainder of that term. 

The ACDEB is interested in the 
public’s input on the issues it will 
consider, and requests that interested 
parties submit statements to the ACDEB 
via email to Evidence@bea.gov. Please 
use the subject line ‘‘ACDEB Meeting 
Public Comment.’’ All statements will 
be provided to the members for their 
consideration and will become part of 
the Committee’s records. Additional 
opportunities for public input will be 
forthcoming as the Committee’s work 
progresses. 

ACDEB Committee meetings are open, 
and the public is invited to attend and 
observe. Those planning to attend are 
asked to RSVP to Evidence@bea.gov. 
The call-in number, access code, and 
meeting link will be posted 24 hours 
prior to each meeting on www.bea.gov/ 
evidence. The meetings are accessible to 
people with disabilities. Requests for 
foreign language interpretation or other 
auxiliary aids should be directed to 
Gianna Marrone at Evidence@bea.gov 
two weeks prior to each meeting. 

Dated: July 7, 2021. 

Alyssa Holdren, 
Designated Federal Official, U.S. Department 
of Commerce. 
[FR Doc. 2021–14897 Filed 7–13–21; 8:45 am] 
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