
43355 Federal Register / Vol. 76, No. 139 / Wednesday, July 20, 2011 / Notices 

6. Department of the Army, Agency- 
wide (N1–AU–10–15, 1 item, 1 
temporary item). Master files of an 
electronic information system 
containing network security information 
such as lists of common vulnerabilities, 
exploitation and threats, intrusion 
events, and remediation methods. 

7. Department of Defense, Office of 
the Secretary of Defense (N1–330–11–2, 
1 item, 1 temporary item). Master files 
of an electronic information system 
containing medical inventories, quality 
assurance records, and medical 
technology and readiness information 
used for managing logistics of treatment 
facilities. 

8. Department of Defense, Office of 
the Secretary of Defense (N1–330–11–3, 
4 items, 4 temporary items). Master files 
of electronic information systems 
containing physician credentialing and 
qualifications records, and adverse 
actions and malpractice data; medical 
and dental expense, personnel, and 
workload data; patient movement 
management records; and Individuals 
with Disabilities Education Act 
implementation records. 

9. Department of Defense, Office of 
the Secretary of Defense (N1–330–11–4, 
1 item, 1 temporary item). Master files 
of an electronic information system 
containing voter registration 
information for U.S. citizens overseas, 
including personal identifiers, contact 
information, and party affiliation data. 

10. Department of Defense, Office of 
the Secretary of Defense (N1–330–11–5, 
1 item, 1 temporary item). Master file of 
an electronic information system 
containing testing data on individuals 
seeking entrance into the Military 
Services, including personal identifiers, 
educational experience, and test scores. 

11. Department of Homeland Security, 
U.S. Immigration and Customs 
Enforcement (N1–567–11–5, 2 items, 2 
temporary items). Master files of an 
electronic information system 
containing status information on 
agreements with state and local law 
enforcement agencies and vetting of 
state and local law enforcement officers 
to receive agency credentials. 

12. Department of Homeland Security, 
U.S. Immigration and Customs 
Enforcement (N1–567–11–13, 4 items, 4 
temporary items). Master files of an 
electronic information system 
containing approved and denied 
requests for court orders for recordings 
of oral, wire, and electronic 
communications, and queries on 
previous court order requests. 

13. Department of Justice, Federal 
Bureau of Investigation (N1–65–11–2, 2 
items, 2 temporary items). Master files 
and audit report logs of an electronic 

information system used to share law 
enforcement data in the law 
enforcement community. 

14. Department of Justice, Federal 
Bureau of Investigation (N1–65–11–4, 2 
items, 2 temporary items). Records 
maintained as part of an electronic 
information system that records activity 
associated with subjects of interest 
within a separate and broader electronic 
law enforcement activity tracking 
system. 

15. Department of Justice, Federal 
Bureau of Investigation (N1–65–11–28, 
175 items, 151 temporary items). 
Administrative files for selected 
classifications through October 15, 
1995, consisting of administrative and 
logistical records, citizen 
correspondence, and routine requests 
for information. 

16. Department of Justice, Tax 
Division (N1–60–09–46, 3 items, 3 
temporary items). Internal Web site 
records including Web content, 
management, and operations records. 

17. Department of Labor, Women’s 
Bureau (N1–86–10–1, 1 item, 1 
temporary item). Master files of an 
electronic information system used to 
track contact information, publications, 
events, meetings, and exhibits related to 
current Bureau initiatives. 

18. Department of State, Bureau of 
Diplomatic Security (N1–59–11–14, 5 
items, 5 temporary items). Records of 
the Office of the Chief Financial Officer, 
including routine budget 
correspondence, apportionments, 
allotments, reimbursements, and 
miscellaneous obligations files. 

19. Department of State, Bureau of 
Diplomatic Security (DAA–0059–2011– 
0002, 4 items, 4 temporary items). 
Records of the Office of the Chief 
Technology Officer, including program 
management records, correspondence, 
and copies of intra-agency agreements. 

20. Department of Transportation, 
Federal Transit Administration (N1– 
408–11–1, 1 item, 1 temporary item). 
Law and legal records, including 
correspondence and reports relating to 
the development and accomplishment 
of policies and programs. 

21. Department of Transportation, 
Federal Transit Administration (N1– 
408–11–2, 2 items, 2 temporary items). 
Records relating to legal procurement 
and contract appeals. 

22. Department of Transportation, 
Federal Transit Administration (N1– 
408–11–3, 2 items, 2 temporary items). 
Case and reference files relating to 
legislation involving the agency and its 
grantees. 

23. Department of Transportation, 
Federal Transit Administration (N1– 
408–11–4, 2 items, 1 temporary item). 

Litigation records consisting of 
correspondence, pleadings, 
dispositions, transcripts pertaining to 
court actions, and non-significant case 
files. Proposed for permanent retention 
are case files of historical or legal 
significance. 

24. Department of the Treasury, 
Alcohol and Tobacco Tax and Trade 
Bureau (N1–564–09–3, 1 item, 1 
temporary item). External Web site 
content records consisting of general 
information about the Bureau. 

25. Department of the Treasury, 
Alcohol and Tobacco Tax and Trade 
Bureau (N1–564–09–6, 1 item, 1 
temporary item). Master files of an 
electronic information system used to 
track processing and results for alcohol 
sample formulation and ingredients. 

26. Federal Deposit Insurance 
Corporation, Agency-wide (N1–34–11– 
1, 4 items, 4 temporary item). Reduction 
of retention period for records 
previously approved as temporary, 
including records relating to bank 
transaction authorizations and 
insurance assessment and appeal files. 

27. Office of the Director of National 
Intelligence, Office of Legislative Affairs 
(N1–576–11–5, 8 items, 4 temporary 
items). Includes copies of Congressional 
materials received from other agencies, 
non-substantive drafts and working 
papers, and reference files. Proposed for 
permanent retention are program 
records, Congressional materials and 
communications, and substantive 
working papers. 

Dated: July 12, 2011. 
Paul M. Wester, Jr., 
Chief Records Officer for the U.S. 
Government. 
[FR Doc. 2011–18411 Filed 7–19–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7515–01–P 

NATIONAL CAPITAL PLANNING 
COMMISSION 

Public Comment and Public Meeting 
on Draft Revisions to the 
Transportation Element and Federal 
Workplace Element of the 
Comprehensive Plan for the National 
Capital: Federal Elements 

AGENCY: National Capital Planning 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice of public comment 
period and public meeting. 

SUMMARY: The National Capital Planning 
Commission (NCPC), the Planning 
Commission for the Federal Government 
within the National Capital Region, has 
released for public comment draft 
revisions to the Transportation and 
Federal Workplace Elements of the 
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Comprehensive Plan for the National 
Capital: Federal Elements. The 
Comprehensive Plan for the National 
Capital: Federal Elements addresses 
matters relating to Federal Properties 
and Federal Interests in the National 
Capital Region, and provides a decision- 
making framework for actions the NCPC 
takes on specific plans and proposals 
submitted by Federal government 
agencies for the NCPC review as 
required by law. The Transportation 
Element articulates policies that guide 
actions on federal employee commuting, 
transportation investment, and 
integrating federal facilities into the 
regional transportation network. The 
Federal Workplace Element provides 
policies for the location, development 
and management of federal workplaces 
throughout the region. All interested 
parties are invited to submit written 
comments and/or attend the public 
meeting. The draft revised 
Transportation and Federal Workplace 
Elements are available online at http:// 
www.ncpc.gov/compplan. Printed 
copies are available upon request from 
the contact person noted below. 
DATE AND TIME: The public comment 
period closes on September 12, 2011. A 
public meeting to discuss the draft 
revisions to the Transportation Element 
and the Federal Workplace Element will 
be held on August 10, 2011 from 6:30 
p.m. to 8:30 p.m. 
ADDRESSES: Mail written or hand deliver 
comments on the draft revisions to 
Comprehensive Plan Public Comment, 
National Capital Planning Commission, 
401 9th Street, NW., Suite 500, 
Washington, DC 20004. The public 
meeting will be held at 401 9th Street, 
NW., North Lobby, Suite 500, 
Washington, DC 20004. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
David Zaidain at (202) 482–7230 or 
david.zaidain@ncpc.gov. Please confirm 
meeting attendance with Mr. Zaidain or 
as noted below. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Electronic Access and Filing Addresses 

You may submit comments 
electronically at the public comment 
portal at http://www.ncpc.gov/ 
compplan. Confirm meeting attendance 
at http://www.ncpc.gov.rsvp. 

Speaker Sign-Up and Speaking Time 
Limits 

Individuals interested in speaking at 
the meeting should indicate their intent 
on the speaker sign-up sheet available at 
the meeting. Speakers are asked to limit 
their remarks to five minutes. applies. 

Authority: (40 U.S.C. 8721(e)(2)). 

July 13, 2011. 
Anne R. Schuyler, 
General Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2011–18032 Filed 7–19–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE M 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

[NRC–2011–0152] 

Evaluations of Explosions Postulated 
To Occur at Nearby Facilities and on 
Transportation Routes Near Nuclear 
Power Plants 

AGENCY: Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission. 
ACTION: Draft regulatory guide; request 
for comment. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission (NRC or the Commission) 
is issuing for public comment draft 
regulatory guide (DG), DG–1270, 
‘‘Evaluations of Explosions Postulated 
to Occur at Nearby Facilities and on 
Transportation Routes Near Nuclear 
Power Plants’’. This draft regulatory 
guide describes for applicants and 
licensees of nuclear power reactors 
some methods and assumptions the 
NRC’s staff finds acceptable for 
evaluating postulated explosions at 
nearby facilities and transportation 
routes. 
DATES: Submit comments by September 
19, 2011. Comments received after this 
date will be considered if it is practical 
to do so, but the NRC is able to ensure 
consideration only for comments 
received on or before this date. 
Although a time limit is given, 
comments and suggestions in 
connection with items for inclusion in 
guides currently being developed or 
improvements in all published guides 
are encouraged at any time. 
ADDRESSES: Please include Docket ID 
NRC–2011–0152 in the subject line of 
your comments. Comments submitted in 
writing or in electronic form will be 
posted on the NRC Web site and on the 
Federal rulemaking Web site, http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Because your 
comments will not be edited to remove 
any identifying or contact information, 
the NRC cautions you against including 
any information in your submission that 
you do not want to be publicly 
disclosed. 

The NRC requests that any party 
soliciting or aggregating comments 
received from other persons for 
submission to the NRC inform those 
persons that the NRC will not edit their 
comments to remove any identifying or 
contact information, and therefore, they 

should not include any information in 
their comments that they do not want 
publicly disclosed. You may submit 
comments by any one of the following 
methods: 

• Federal Rulemaking Web Site: Go to 
http://www.regulations.gov and search 
for documents filed under Docket ID 
NRC–2011–0152. Address questions 
about NRC dockets to Carol Gallagher, 
telephone: 301–492–3668; e-mail: 
Carol.Gallagher@nrc.gov. 

• Mail comments to: Cindy Bladey, 
Chief, Rules, Announcements, and 
Directives Branch (RADB), Office of 
Administration, Mail Stop: TWB–05– 
B01M, U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission, Washington, DC 20555– 
0001. 

• Fax comments to: RADB at 301– 
492–3446. 

You can access publicly available 
documents related to this draft 
regulatory guide using the following 
methods: 

• NRC’s Public Document Room 
(PDR): The public may examine and 
have copied, for a fee, publicly available 
documents at the NRC’s PDR, O1–F21, 
One White Flint North, 11555 Rockville 
Pike, Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

• NRC’s Agencywide Documents 
Access and Management System 
(ADAMS): Publicly available documents 
created or received at the NRC are 
available online in the NRC Library at 
http://www.nrc.gov/reading-rm/ 
adams.html. From this page, the public 
can gain entry into ADAMS, which 
provides text and image files of the 
NRC’s public documents. If you do not 
have access to ADAMS or if there are 
problems in accessing the documents 
located in ADAMS, contact the NRC’s 
PDR reference staff at 1–800–397–4209, 
301–415–4737, or by e-mail to 
pdr.resource@nrc.gov. The draft 
regulatory guide is available 
electronically under ADAMS Accession 
Number ML110390554. The regulatory 
analysis is available electronically 
under ADAMS Accession Number 
ML110400261. 

• Federal Rulemaking Web Site: 
Public comments and supporting 
materials related to this draft regulatory 
guide can be found at http:// 
www.regulations.gov by searching on 
Docket ID NRC–2011–0152. 

Electronic copies of DG–1270 are 
available through the NRC’s public Web 
site under Draft Regulatory Guides in 
the ‘‘Regulatory Guides’’ collection of 
the NRC’s Library at http:// 
www.nrc.gov/reading-rm/doc- 
collections/. 

Regulatory guides are not 
copyrighted, and Commission approval 
is not required to reproduce them. 

VerDate Mar<15>2010 18:29 Jul 19, 2011 Jkt 223001 PO 00000 Frm 00104 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\20JYN1.SGM 20JYN1sr
ob

er
ts

 o
n 

D
S

K
5S

P
T

V
N

1P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 N
O

T
IC

E
S

http://www.nrc.gov/reading-rm/adams.html
http://www.nrc.gov/reading-rm/adams.html
http://www.ncpc.gov/compplan
http://www.ncpc.gov/compplan
http://www.ncpc.gov/compplan
http://www.ncpc.gov/compplan
http://www.regulations.gov
http://www.regulations.gov
http://www.regulations.gov
http://www.regulations.gov
http://www.regulations.gov
http://www.ncpc.gov.rsvp
mailto:Carol.Gallagher@nrc.gov
mailto:david.zaidain@ncpc.gov
mailto:pdr.resource@nrc.gov

		Superintendent of Documents
	2012-06-27T11:08:29-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




