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Shenzhen Dingjiang Technology Co., 
Ltd. LLLC, R701G, 
HuafengBao’anZhigu Innovation Park, 
Yintian 4th Road, Xixiang Street, 
Bao’an District, Shenzhen, China 
518000 

Shenzhen Jieruijia Technology Co. Ltd., 
No. 8 Mu Dun Road, No. 1 Industrial, 
Zone, Lou Cun Community, Gong 
Ming, Guang Ming District, China 

Shenzhen Mediatek Tong Technology 
Co., Ltd., Room 3A–E, Qianyu Tong 
Bldg., Qingji Rd., Longhua St., 
Longhua New Distrtict, Shenzhen, 
China 518000 

Shenzhen Take Tools Co., Ltd., No. 
B714, Niulanqian Building, Minzhi 
Road, Longhua District, 
ShenzhenGuangdong, China 518000, 

Shenzhen Topdon Technology Co., Ltd., 
5th Floor, Building 12, Taihua 
Wutong Island, Intersection of 
Shunchang Road and Hangkong Road, 
Xixiang Subdistrict, Baoan District, 
Guangdong, Shenzhen, China 518112 

Shenzhen Valuelink E-Commerce Co., 
Ltd., 2nd Two-way ChangJiangPu, 
Heao Community, HengGang Street 
Office, Longgang District, Shenzhen 
China 518000 

Smartech Products, Inc., 8700 Larkin 
Road, Suite B, Savage, MD 20763 

ThiEYE Technologies Co., Ltd., Room 
405, 4th Floor, Building B, Bantian 
International Center, Longgang 
District, China 518000 

Tii Trading Inc., 13200 Brooks Drive 
Suite F, Baldwin Park, CA 91707, 
Walmart Inc., 702 SW 8th Street, 
Bentonville, AR 72716 

Winplus North America, Inc., 2975 Red 
Hill Ave, Suite 100, Costa Mesa, CA 
92626 

Zagg Co. Rrd Gst, 381 Airtech Parkway, 
Plainfield, IN 46168 

Zhejiang Quingyou Electronic 
Commerce Co., Ltd., Room 266–270, 
Building 7, No. 253, Tinglan Street, 
Qiaosi Street, Yuhang District, 
Hangzhou, Zhejiang, China 311100 

70mai Co., Ltd., Room 2220, Building 2, 
No. 588, Zixing Road, Minhang 
District, Shanghai, China 201100 
(c) The Office of Unfair Import 

Investigations, U.S. International Trade 
Commission, 500 E Street SW, Suite 
401, Washington, DC 20436; and 

(4) For the investigation so instituted, 
the Chief Administrative Law Judge, 
U.S. International Trade Commission, 
shall designate the presiding 
Administrative Law Judge. 

Responses to the complaint and the 
notice of investigation must be 
submitted by the named respondents in 
accordance with section 210.13 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 19 CFR 210.13. Pursuant to 

19 CFR 201.16(e) and 210.13(a), as 
amended in 85 FR 15798 (March 19, 
2020), such responses will be 
considered by the Commission if 
received not later than 20 days after the 
date of service by the complainant of the 
complaint and the notice of 
investigation. Extensions of time for 
submitting responses to the complaint 
and the notice of investigation will not 
be granted unless good cause therefor is 
shown. 

Failure of a respondent to file a timely 
response to each allegation in the 
complaint and in this notice may be 
deemed to constitute a waiver of the 
right to appear and contest the 
allegations of the complaint and this 
notice, and to authorize the 
administrative law judge and the 
Commission, without further notice to 
the respondent, to find the facts to be as 
alleged in the complaint and this notice 
and to enter an initial determination 
and a final determination containing 
such findings, and may result in the 
issuance of an exclusion order or a cease 
and desist order or both directed against 
the respondent. 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: March 17, 2021. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2021–05905 Filed 3–22–21; 8:45 am] 
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SUMMARY: The Criminal Justice 
Information Services (CJIS) Division, 
Federal Bureau of Investigation (FBI), 
Department of Justice (DOJ), will be 
submitting the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for an additional 30 
days until April 22, 2021. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 

within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agencies 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
Revision of a currently approved 
collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: 
Biographic Verification Form. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
Agency form number 1–791. Sponsoring 
component: Criminal Justice 
Information Services Division, Federal 
Bureau of Investigation, Department of 
Justice. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: Agencies authorized 
to submit applicant fingerprints into the 
Next Generation Identification (NGI) 
system for noncriminal justice purposes 
such as employment, benefits, and 
licensing. This form is completed to 
obtain a biographic verification (name 
check) for an applicant when the 
fingerprints have been rejected twice for 
quality to ensure eligible individuals are 
not denied employment, benefits, or 
licensing. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
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estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: It is estimated that 50,000 
respondents will complete each form 
within approximately 8 minutes. 

(6) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: There are an estimated 6,700 
total annual burden hours associated 
with this collection. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Melody Braswell, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE, Suite 3E.405B, 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: March 18, 2021. 
Melody Braswell, 
Department Clearance Officer, PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2021–05950 Filed 3–22–21; 8:45 am] 
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SUMMARY: The Federal Bureau of 
Investigation, Department of Justice 
(DOJ), will be submitting the following 
information collection request to the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: The Department of Justice 
encourages public comment and will 
accept input until April 22, 2021. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 

—Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the FBI, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Evaluate whether and if so how the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected can be 
enhanced; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

1. Type of Information Collection: 
Extension, without change, of a 
currently approved collection. 

2. The Title of the Form/Collection: 
FBI eFOIA form. 

3. The agency form number, if any, 
and the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
The applicable component within the 
Department of Justice is the Federal 
Bureau of Investigation. 

4. Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: The general public who wish 
to make online FOIA request will be the 
most affected group. This information 
collection is to allow the Federal Bureau 
of Investigation to accept and responded 
to FOIA requester as defined in 28 CFR 
part 16.3 (a) How made and addressed. 
You may make a request for records of 
the Department of Justice by writing 
directly to the Department component 
that maintains those records. You may 
find the Department’s ‘‘Freedom of 
Information Act Reference Guide’’- 
which is available electronically at the 
Department’s World Wide website, and 
is available in paper form as well- 
helpful in making your request. For 
additional information about the FOIA, 
you may refer directly to the statute. If 
you are making a request for records 
about yourself, see § 16.41(d) for 
additional requirements. If you are 
making a request for records about 
another individual, either a written 
authorization signed by that individual 
permitting disclosure of those records to 
you or proof that that individual is 
deceased (for example, a copy of a death 
certificate or an obituary) will help the 

processing of your request. Your request 
should be sent to the component’s FOIA 
office at the address listed in appendix 
I to part 16. In most cases, your FOIA 
request should be sent to a component’s 
central FOIA office. For records held by 
a field office of the Federal Bureau of 
Investigation (FBI) or the Immigration 
and Naturalization Service (INS), 
however, you must write directly to that 
FBI or INS field office address, which 
can be found in most telephone books 
or by calling the component’s central 
FOIA office. (The functions of each 
component are summarized in part 0 of 
this title and in the description of the 
Department and its components in the 
‘‘United States Government Manual,’’ 
which is issued annually and is 
available in most libraries, as well as for 
sale from the Government Printing 
Office’s Superintendent of Documents. 
This manual also can be accessed 
electronically at the Government 
Printing Office’s World Wide website 
(which can be found at http://
www.access.gpo.gov/su_docs).) If you 
cannot determine where within the 
Department to send your request, you 
may send it to the FOIA/PA Mail 
Referral Unit, Justice Management 
Division, U.S. Department of Justice, 
950 Pennsylvania Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20530–0001. That 
office will forward your request to the 
component(s) it believes most likely to 
have the records that you want. Your 
request will be considered received as of 
the date it is received by the proper 
component’s FOIA office. For the 
quickest possible handling, you should 
mark both your request letter and the 
envelope ‘‘Freedom of Information Act 
Request.’’ (b) Description of records 
sought. You must describe the records 
that you seek in enough detail to enable 
Department personnel to locate them 
with a reasonable amount of effort. 
Whenever possible, your request should 
include specific information about each 
record sought, such as the date, title or 
name, author, recipient, and subject 
matter of the record. In addition, if you 
want records about a court case, you 
should provide the title of the case, the 
court in which the case was filed, and 
the nature of the case. If known, you 
should include any file designations or 
descriptions for the records that you 
want. As a general rule, the more 
specific you are about the records or 
type of records that you want, the more 
likely the Department will be able to 
locate those records in response to your 
request. If a component determines that 
your request does not reasonably 
describe records, it shall tell you either 
what additional information is needed 
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