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document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on October 17, 2011. 

Dated: September 28, 2011. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2011–25628 Filed 10–4–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 2479–011–CA] 

Pacific Gas and Electric Company 

Notice of Availability of Environmental 
Assessment 

In accordance with the National 
Environmental Policy Act of 1969 and 
the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission’s (Commission) 
regulations, 18 CFR part 380 (Order No. 
486, 52 FR 47897), the Office of Energy 
Projects has reviewed the application 
for a new license for the French 
Meadows transmission line project and 
has prepared an Environmental 
Assessment (EA). The project is located 
within the Middle Fork American River 
Drainage in Placer County, California, 
and occupies 32.78 acres of U.S. Forest 
Service land managed by the Eldorado 
and Tahoe National Forests. The 
combined length of the transmission 
lines on National Forest land is 6.58 
miles, 6.42 miles on the Eldorado 
National Forest and 0.16 mile on the 
Tahoe National Forest. Approximately 
6.69 miles on the French Meadows 
transmission line section of the project 
are located on private land. 

The EA contains staff’s analysis of the 
potential environmental effects of the 
project and alternatives and concludes 
that licensing the project, with 
appropriate environmental protective 
measures, would not constitute a major 
federal action that would significantly 
affect the quality of the human 
environment. 

A copy of the EA is available for 
review at the Commission in the Public 
Reference Room or may be viewed on 
the Commission’s Web site at http:// 
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. For 
assistance, contact FERC Online 
Support at 

FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or toll- 
free at 1–866–208–3676, or for TTY, 
(202) 502–8659. 

You may also register online at 
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
esubscription.asp to be notified via 
email of new filings and issuances 
related to this or other pending project. 
For assistance, contact FERC Online 
Support. 

For further information, contact Mary 
Greene at (202) 502–8865. 

Dated: September 28, 2011. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2011–25631 Filed 10–4–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. TX11–2–000] 

City of College Station, TX; Notice of 
Filing 

Take notice that on September 27, 
2011, pursuant to sections 210, 211, and 
212 of the Federal Power Act, 16 USC 
824i, 824j, and 824k, Part 36 of the 
Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission’s (Commission) 
Regulations, 18CFR 36.1, the City of 
College Station, TX filed an application 
requesting that the Commission direct 
(1) Entergy Texas, Inc. (ETI) to provide 
an interconnection located between 
ETI’s College Station Junction and 
College Station’s Switch Station to be 
used only during declared emergencies; 
and (2) direct ETI, in event of such 
declared emergencies, to provide 
transmission service for power flows 
within the transmission grid 
administered by the independent 
service operator, the Electric Reliability 
Council of Texas, Inc., certified by the 
Public Utility Commission of Texas to 
perform the functions set forth in 
Section 39.151(a) of the Texas Public 
Utility Regulatory Act. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. On or before the 

comment date, it is not necessary to 
serve motions to intervene or protests 
on persons other than the Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 pm Eastern Time on 
October 27, 2011. 

Dated: September 28, 2011 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2011–25624 Filed 10–4–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. ER11–4677–000] 

NextEra Energy Montezuma II Wind, 
LLC; Supplemental Notice That Initial 
Market-Based Rate Filing Includes 
Request for Blanket Section 204 
Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced proceeding of NextEra 
Energy Montezuma II Wind, LLC’s 
application for market-based rate 
authority, with an accompanying rate 
tariff, noting that such application 
includes a request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street, NE., Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 
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