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4. Who should we contact for further 
information regarding redesignation of 
this Federal Building? U.S. General 
Services Administration, Public 
Buildings Service (P),Attn: Anthony E. 
Costa, 1800 F Street, NW, Washington, 
DC 20405, telephone number: (202) 
501–1100, e-mail at 
anthony.costa@gsa.gov. 

Dated: April 5, 2007. 

Lurita Doan, 
Administrator of General Services. 
[FR Doc. E7–7827 Filed 4–24–07; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6820–23–S 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Office of the Secretary 

Notice of Interest Rate on Overdue 
Debts 

Section 30.13 of the Department of 
Health and Human Services’ claims 
collection regulations (45 CFR part 30) 
provides that the Secretary shall charge 
an annual rate of interest as fixed by the 
Secretary of the Treasury after taking 
into consideration private consumer 
rates of interest prevailing on the date 
that HHS becomes entitled to recovery. 
The rate generally cannot be lower than 
the Department of Treasury’s current 
value of funds rate or the applicable rate 
determined from the ‘‘Schedule of 
Certified Interest Rates with Range of 
Maturities.’’ This rate may be revised 
quarterly by the Secretary of the 
Treasury and shall be published 
quarterly by the Department of Health 
and Human Services in the Federal 
Register. 

The Secretary of the Treasury has 
certified a rate of 123⁄8% for the quarter 
ended March 31, 2007. This interest rate 
will remain in effect until such time as 
the Secretary of the Treasury notifies 
HHS of any change. 

Dated: April 18, 2007. 

Jean Augustine, 
Director, Office of Financial Policy and 
Reporting. 
[FR Doc. 07–2048 Filed 4–24–07; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4150–04–M 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention 

[Docket Number NIOSH–104] 

Notice of Public Meeting; ‘‘Safety and 
Health in the Horse Racing Industry 
and Best Practices’’ 

AGENCY: National Institute for 
Occupational Safety and Health 
(NIOSH) of the Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention (CDC), 
Department of Health and Human 
Services (HHS). 

Meeting Date and Time: May 22, 
2007, 9 a.m.–5 p.m. EDT. 

Place: Hyatt Regency Crystal City at 
Reagan National Airport, 2799 Jefferson 
Davis Highway, Arlington, VA 22202, 
telephone (703) 418–1234. 
SUMMARY: The National Institute for 
Occupational Safety and Health 
(NIOSH) announces the opportunity for 
the public to provide input regarding 
issues related to safety and health in the 
horse racing industry and best practices. 
These comments may help to shape 
proposed future activities by NIOSH. 
The public meeting will be held on May 
22, 2007 at the Hyatt Regency Crystal 
City at Reagan National Airport, 2799 
Jefferson Davis Highway, Arlington, VA 
22202. 

An opportunity to make oral 
presentations will be provided to 
interested parties given available time 
on the agenda. Requests to make such 
presentations at the meeting should be 
made by e-mail to khendricks@cdc.gov. 
All requests to present should include 
the name, address, telephone number, 
relevant business affiliations of the 
presenter, and a brief summary of the 
presentation. All requests for oral 
presentation must be received by May 7, 
2007. All comments should be 
submitted to the NIOSH Docket Office. 

Status: Open to the public, limited by 
space available. The meeting room 
accommodates approximately 40 
people. 

Address: Written comments on issues 
related to safety and health in the horse 
racing industry should be mailed to: 
NIOSH Docket Office, Robert A. Taft 
Laboratories, M/S C34, 4676 Columbia 
Parkway, Cincinnati, Ohio 45226, 
Telephone 513–533–8303, Fax 513– 
533–8285. Comments may also be 
submitted by e-mail to 
niocindocket@cdc.gov. E-mail 
attachments should be formatted in 
Microsoft Word. All comments should 
be submitted to NIOSH no later than 
June 22, 2007 and must reference the 

Docket Number (NIOSH 104) in the 
subject heading. 

Contact Person for Additional 
Information: Kitty Hendricks, Research 
Epidemiologist, Surveillance and Field 
Investigations Branch, Division of Safety 
Research, Telephone 304–285–6252. 

Dated: April 18, 2007. 
James D. Seligman, 
Chief Information Officer, Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention. 
[FR Doc. E7–7855 Filed 4–24–07; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4163–19–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention 

Notice of Public Meeting 

AGENCY: The National Institute for 
Occupational Safety and Health 
(NIOSH) of the Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention (CDC), 
Department of Health and Human 
Services. 

Meeting Date and Time: May 3, 2007, 
1:30 p.m.–5 p.m. EDT. 

Place: Pittsburgh Airport Marriott, 
777 Aten Road, Coraopolis, PA 15108, 
telephone (412) 788–8800, fax (412) 
788–6299. 
SUMMARY: The National Institute for 
Occupational Safety and Health 
(NIOSH) of the Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention (CDC) 
announces the following public meeting 
and request for information: 

NIOSH Availability of Opportunity to 
Provide Input regarding the National 
Occupational Research Agenda (NORA) 
for the Mining Sector. 

Status: Meeting is open to the public, 
limited only by the space available. 
Participation is encouraged through the 
Web for those who cannot attend in 
person. 

Background: A large part of our lives 
is shaped by the work we do. NORA is 
a framework to guide occupational 
safety and health research for the 
nation. It is an ongoing endeavor to 
focus research to reduce work-related 
injury and illness. As the program 
entered its second decade, it was 
structured according to eight industry 
sector groups in order to encourage 
widespread adoption of effective 
practices developed through research. 
Each sector will have a NORA Sector 
Council consisting of NIOSH and 
stakeholder representatives. The initial 
task of the NORA Mining Council will 
be to draft a strategic plan for the nation 
addressing high priority needs in the 
sector. Following revisions based on 
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