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questionnaires; and (3) for a few 
questionnaires, accessing notes or other 
information to answer questions. 
Burden estimates are presented in terms 
of hours and imputed costs based on the 
estimated value of respondents’ time. 
No start-up or capital costs for 
respondents are anticipated, even for 
questionnaires available electronically 
(these respondents will be members of 
the Institute’s National Roster of 
Environmental Dispute Resolution and 
Consensus Building Professionals and 
will use the same computer equipment 
to access the questionnaires as was used 
to apply for Roster membership, or can 
request hard copies of the 
questionnaires and submit them via the 
US Postal Service). 

Following is a summary of the burden 
estimates: 

ECR Services Program Area 

Type of Respondents: facilitators/
mediators and participants in the 
Institute’s ECR cases. 

Estimated Number of Potential 
Respondents (annual average for three 
years): 1,170. 

Proposed Frequency of Response: 
once per case for facilitators/mediators, 
once per case for attorneys, twice per 
case for parties. 

Estimated Average Time per 
Respondent: 21 minutes. 

Estimated Total Cost per Respondent: 
$10.39. 

Conflict Assessment Services 

Type of Respondents: facilitators/
mediators and members of initiating 
organizations in the Institute’s conflict 
assessments. 

Estimated Number of Potential 
Respondents (annual average for three 
years): 220. 

Proposed Frequency of Response: 
once per assessment. 

Estimated Average Time per 
Respondent: 11 minutes. 

Estimated Total Cost per Respondent: 
$7.36. 

National Roster of Dispute Resolution 
and Consensus Building Professionals 

Type of Respondents: members and 
users of the National Roster. 

Estimated Number of Potential 
Respondents (annual average for three 
years): 385. 

Proposed Frequency of Response: 
once per year for members, once per use 
event for users. 

Estimated Average Time per 
Respondent: 18 minutes. 

Estimated Total Cost per Respondent: 
$10.09. 

ECR Training 

Type of Respondents: instructors and 
participants in the Institute’s training 
courses. 

Estimated Number of Potential 
Respondents (annual average for three 
years): 415. 

Proposed Frequency of Response: 
twice per course for instructors, three 
times per course for participants. 

Estimated Average Time per 
Respondent: 39 minutes. 

Estimated Total Cost per Respondent: 
$17.79. 

Meeting Facilitation 

Type of Respondents: attendees at the 
Institute’s facilitated meetings. 

Estimated Number of Potential 
Respondents (annual average for three 
years): 500. 

Proposed Frequency of Response: 
once per meeting. 

Estimated Average Time per 
Respondent: 5 minutes. 

Estimated Total Cost per Respondent: 
$2.25. 

F. Other Information 

Each ICR also contains information on 
the following topics: development of the 
Institute’s program evaluation system, 
confidentiality of information, estimates 
of costs to the Federal Government for 
collecting, processing, storing and using 
the requested information, and issues 
related to analysis of the information.
(Authority: 20 U.S.C. Sec. 5601–5609)

Dated: March 25, 2002. 
Christopher L. Helms, 
Executive Director, Morris K. Udall 
Foundation.
[FR Doc. 02–7577 Filed 3–28–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6820–FN–P

NATIONAL FOUNDATION ON THE 
ARTS AND THE HUMANITIES 

National Endowment for the Arts; 
Fellowships Advisory Panel 

Pursuant to Section 10(a)(2) of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (Public 
Law 92–463), as amended, notice is 
hereby given that a meeting of the 
Fellowships Advisory Panel, Music 
Section (American Jazz Masters 
Fellowships category) to the National 
Council on the Arts will be held on 
April 18, 2002 at the Nancy Hanks 
Center, 1100 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW, 
(Room 527) Washington, DC, 20506. A 
portion of this meeting, from 11:15 a.m. 
to 12:00 p.m., will be open to the public 
for policy discussion. The remaining 
portion of this meeting, from 10:00 a.m. 
to 11:15 a.m., will be closed. 

The closed portion of these meetings 
are for the purpose of Panel review, 
discussion, evaluation, and 
recommendation on applications for 
financial assistance under the National 
Foundation on the Arts and the 
Humanities Act of 1965, as amended, 
including information given in 
confidence to the agency by grant 
applicants. In accordance with the 
determination of the Chairman of May 
22, 2001, these sessions will be closed 
to the public pursuant to (c)(4)(6) and 
(9)(B) of section 552b of Title 5, United 
States Code. 

Any person may observe meetings, or 
portions thereof, of advisory panels that 
are open to the public, and, if time 
allows, may be permitted to participate 
in the panel’s discussions at the 
discretion of the panel chairman and 
with the approval of the full-time 
Federal employee in attendance. If you 
need special accommodations due to a 
disability, please contact the Office of 
AccessAbility, National Endowment for 
the Arts, 1100 Pennsylvania Avenue, 
NW., Washington, DC 20506, 202/682–
5532, TDY–TDD 202/682–5496, at least 
seven (7) days prior to the meeting. 

Further information with reference to 
this meeting can be obtained from Ms. 
Kathy Plowitz-Worden, Office of 
Guidelines & Panel Operations, National 
Endowment for the Arts, Washington, 
DC, 20506, or call 202/682–5691.

Dated: March 25, 2002. 
Kathy Plowitz-Worden, 
Panel Coordinator, Panel Operations, 
National Endowment for the Arts.
[FR Doc. 02–7586 Filed 3–28–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 7537–01–P

NATIONAL FOUNDATION FOR THE 
ARTS AND THE HUMANITIES 

National Endowment for the Arts; 
President’s Committee on the Arts and 
the Humanities: Meeting #52 

Pursuant to Section 10 (a)(2) of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (Pub. 
L. 92–463), as amended, notice is hereby 
given that a meeting of the President’s 
Committee on the Arts and the 
Humanities will be held on April 23, 
2002 from 10:45 a.m. to approximately 
1:00 p.m. The meeting will be held in 
the Hubbard Hall Board Room of the 
National Geographic Society, 16th and 
M Streets, NW., Washington, DC 20036–
4688. 

The Committee meeting will begin at 
10:45 a.m. with a welcome and 
introductions by Adair Margo, 
Committee Chairman. Agency heads 
Robert Martin (Director, Institute of 
Museum and Library Services), Bruce 
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