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requested that the withdrawals be 
partially revoked. This Order opens the 
lands to appropriation under the public 
land laws, subject to valid existing 
rights. 

DATES: This Order takes effect on 
January 7, 2025. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Tessa Telles, BLM, Carlsbad Field 
Office, at (575) 234–5980 or by email 
ttelles@blm.gov. Individuals in the 
United States who are deaf, deafblind, 
hard of hearing, or have a speech 
disability may dial 711 (TTY, TDD, or 
Tele Braille) to access 
telecommunications relay services. 
Individuals outside the United States 
should use the relay services offered 
within their country to make 
international calls to the point-of- 
contact in the United States. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The BOR 
has requested a partial withdrawal 
revocation of 335.25 acres of land 
originally withdrawn in support of the 
Avalon Reservoir Carlsbad Project 
created by two Secretary’s orders dated 
December 10 and 22, 1928, issued 
pursuant to the Reclamation Act of June 
17, 1902, section 3. The BOR has 
determined that the lands are no longer 
needed for reclamation purposes. The 
revocation of the withdrawal will open 
the lands to appropriation and allow the 
lands to be conveyed out of Federal 
ownership in a proposed land sale. Any 
lands not conveyed will be restored to 
the administration of the Bureau of 
Land Management. 

Order 

By virtue of the authority vested in 
the Secretary of the Interior by section 
204 of the Federal Land Policy and 
Management Act of 1976, 43 U.S.C. 
1714, it is ordered as follows: 

1. The withdrawals created by 
Secretary Orders dated December 10 
and 22, 1928, which withdrew public 
lands for use by the Bureau of 
Reclamation for the Avalon Reservoir 
Carlsbad Project, are hereby partially 
revoked as to the following described 
lands: 

New Mexico Principal Meridian 

T. 21 S., R. 26 E., 
Sec. 14, lot 4; 
Sec. 23, lots 1, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9, 12, and 13. 

The area described contains 335.25 
acres. 

2. At 8 a.m. Mountain Time (MT) on 
January 7, 2025, the lands described 
above will open to the operation of the 
public land laws, subject to valid 
existing rights, the provisions of existing 
withdrawals, other segregations of 
record, and the requirements of 

applicable law. All valid applications 
received at or prior to 8 a.m. MT on 
January 7, 2025, shall be considered as 
simultaneously filed at that time. Those 
received thereafter shall be considered 
in the order of filing. Applications to 
appropriate any of the lands referenced 
in this Order received prior to the date 
and time stated above shall be rejected. 
The lands will remain closed to location 
and entry under the United States 
mining laws until such time as the lands 
are conveyed out of Federal ownership 
or an opening order is issued pursuant 
to 43 CFR 2091.6. 
(Authority: 43 U.S.C. 1714) 

Robert T. Anderson, 
Solicitor. 
[FR Doc. 2025–00003 Filed 1–6–25; 8:45 am] 
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Areas, Chattahoochee River National 
Recreation Area, Everglades National 
Park, Gulf Islands National Seashore, 
Jean Lafitte National Historical Park 
and Preserve, Little River Canyon 
National Preserve, Virgin Islands 
National Park 

AGENCY: National Park Service, Interior. 
ACTION: Notice of intent. 

SUMMARY: Pursuant to the Wilderness 
Act of 1964, and in accordance with 
National Park Service (NPS) 
Management Policies 2006, the NPS 
intends to evaluate all previously 
unassessed lands within the following 
parks for their eligibility for inclusion in 
the national wilderness preservation 
system: Chattahoochee River National 
Recreation Area, Everglades National 
Park, Gulf Islands National Seashore, 
Jean Lafitte National Historical Park and 
Preserve, Little River Canyon National 
Preserve, and Virgin Islands National 
Park. 
DATES: Each of the listed parks will 
begin its wilderness eligibility 
assessment on January 7, 2025. All 
assessments are expected to be 
completed by January 7, 2026. 
ADDRESSES: Interested individuals, 
organizations, and agencies are 
encouraged to provide written 
information that may assist the NPS in 
identifying lands eligible or ineligible 
for designation as wilderness. 

Suggestions and requests for further 
information should be directed to: 
National Park Service, Department of 
the Interior Region 2—South Atlantic 
Gulf, 100 Alabama St. SW, Atlanta, GA 
30303. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: PJ 
Walker, Regional Wilderness 
Coordinator, by phone at 404–507–5709, 
via email at PJ_Walker@nps.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
furtherance of the Wilderness Act of 
1964 (16 U.S.C. 1131 et seq.), NPS 
Management Policies 2006 section 6.2.1 
provides that all lands administered by 
the NPS, including new units and 
additions to existing units since 1964, 
will be evaluated for their eligibility for 
inclusion in the national wilderness 
preservation system. Accordingly, the 
NPS intends to evaluate all previously 
unassessed lands within the following 
parks for wilderness eligibility: 
Chattahoochee River National 
Recreation Area (all lands), Everglades 
National Park (three small, 
noncontiguous areas not previously 
assessed), Gulf Islands National 
Seashore (Cat Island Unit), Jean Lafitte 
National Historical Park and Preserve 
(Barataria Preserve Unit), Little River 
Canyon National Preserve (all lands), 
and Virgin Islands National Park. 

For areas determined to be ineligible 
for wilderness designation, the 
wilderness preservation provisions in 
the NPS Management Policies 2006 
would not apply (NPS Management 
Policies 2006 section 6.2.1.3). However, 
ineligible lands will continue to be 
managed in accordance with the NPS 
Organic Act and all other laws, 
Executive orders, regulations, and 
policies applicable to units of the 
national park system. 

Lands and waters found to possess the 
characteristics and values of wilderness, 
as defined in the Wilderness Act and 
determined eligible pursuant to the 
wilderness eligibility assessment, will 
be formally studied to develop the 
recommendation to Congress for 
wilderness designation (NPS 
Management Policies 2006 section 
6.2.2). The wilderness study will 
include the appropriate level of analyses 
under the National Environmental 
Policy Act and the National Historic 
Preservation Act. Congress alone can 
designate wilderness areas. 

Determinations of eligibility and 
subsequent future actions will be 
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announced in the Federal Register upon 
completion of these assessments. 

Mark A. Foust, 
Regional Director, Interior Region 2—South 
Atlantic-Gulf. 
[FR Doc. 2025–00114 Filed 1–6–25; 8:45 am] 
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COMMISSION 
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Products (Solar Panels) From 
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Phase of Countervailing Duty and 
Antidumping Duty Investigations 

AGENCY: United States International 
Trade Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Commission hereby gives 
notice of the scheduling of the final 
phase of antidumping and 
countervailing duty investigation Nos. 
701–TA–722–725 and 731–TA–1690– 
1693 (Final) pursuant to the Tariff Act 
of 1930 (‘‘the Act’’) to determine 
whether an industry in the United 
States is materially injured or 
threatened with material injury, or the 
establishment of an industry in the 
United States is materially retarded, by 
reason of imports of crystalline silicon 
photovoltaic products (solar panels) 
from Cambodia, Malaysia, Thailand, 
and Vietnam, provided for in statistical 
reporting numbers 8541.42.0010 and 
8541.43.0010 of the Harmonized Tariff 
Schedule of the United States. 
Crystalline silicon photovoltaic cells, 
whether or not assemabled into 
modules, may also be imported under 
subheadings 8501.71, 8501.72, and 
8501.80 and statistical reporting number 
8507.20.8010, preliminarily determined 
by the Department of Commerce 
(‘‘Commerce’’) to be subsidized and sold 
at less-than-fair-value. 
DATES: December 4, 2024. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Julie 
Duffy ((202) 708–2579), Office of 
Investigations, U.S. International Trade 
Commission, 500 E Street SW, 
Washington, DC 20436. Hearing- 
impaired persons can obtain 
information on this matter by contacting 
the Commission’s TDD terminal on 202– 
205–1810. Persons with mobility 
impairments who will need special 
assistance in gaining access to the 
Commission should contact the Office 
of the Secretary at 202–205–2000. 
General information concerning the 

Commission may also be obtained by 
accessing its internet server (https://
www.usitc.gov). The public record for 
these investigations may be viewed on 
the Commission’s electronic docket 
(EDIS) at https://edis.usitc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Scope.—For purposes of these 
investigations, Commerce has defined 
the subject merchandise as ‘‘The 
merchandise covered by these 
investigations is crystalline silicon 
photovoltaic cells, and modules, 
laminates, and panels, consisting of 
crystalline silicon photovoltaic cells, 
whether or not partially or fully 
assembled into other products, 
including, but not limited to, modules, 
laminates, panels and building 
integrated materials. 

These investigations cover crystalline 
silicon photovoltaic cells of thickness 
equal to or greater than 20 micrometers, 
having a p/n junction formed by any 
means, whether or not the cell has 
undergone other processing, including, 
but not limited to, cleaning, etching, 
coating, and/or addition of materials 
(including, but not limited to, 
metallization and conductor patterns) to 
collect and forward the electricity that 
is generated by the cell. 

Merchandise under consideration 
may be described at the time of 
importation as parts for final finished 
products that are assembled after 
importation, including, but not limited 
to, modules, laminates, panels, 
buildingintegrated modules, building- 
integrated panels, or other finished 
goods kits. Such parts that otherwise 
meet the definition of merchandise 
under consideration are included in the 
scope of the investigations. 

Excluded from the scope of the 
investigations are thin film photovoltaic 
products produced from amorphous 
silicon (a-Si), cadmium telluride (CdTe), 
or copper indium gallium selenide 
(CIGS). Also excluded from the scope of 
the investigations are crystalline silicon 
photovoltaic cells, not exceeding 10,000 
mm2 in surface area, that are 
permanently integrated into a consumer 
good whose function is other than 
power generation and that consumes the 
electricity generated by the integrated 
crystalline silicon photovoltaic cell. 
Where more than one cell is 
permanently integrated into a consumer 
good, the surface area for purposes of 
this exclusion shall be the total 
combined surface area of all cells that 
are integrated into the consumer good. 

Additionally, excluded from the 
scope of the investigations are panels 
with surface area from 3,450 mm2 to 
33,782 mm2 with one black wire and 

one red wire (each of type 22 AWG or 
24 AWG not more than 206 mm in 
length when measured from panel 
extrusion), and not exceeding 2.9 volts, 
1.1 amps, and 3.19 watts. For the 
purposes of this exclusion, no panel 
shall contain an internal battery or 
external computer peripheral ports. 

Also excluded from the scope of the 
investigations are: 

1. Off grid CSPV panels in rigid form 
with a glass cover, with the following 
characteristics: (A) a total power output 
of 100 watts or less per panel; (B) a 
maximum surface area of 8,000 cm2 per 
panel; (C) do not include a built-in 
inverter; (D) must include a 
permanently connected wire that 
terminates in either an 8 mm male 
barrel connector, or a two-port 
rectangular connector with two pins in 
square housings of different colors; (E) 
must include visible parallel grid 
collector metallic wire lines every 1–4 
millimeters across each solar cell; and 
(F) must be in individual retail 
packaging (for purposes of this 
provision, retail packaging typically 
includes graphics, the product name, its 
description and/or features, and foam 
for transport); and 

2. Off grid CSPV panels without a 
glass cover, with the following 
characteristics: (A) a total power output 
of 100 watts or less per panel; (B) a 
maximum surface area of 8,000 cm2 per 
panel; (C) do not include a built-in 
inverter; (D) must include visible 
parallel grid collector metallic wire 
lines every 1–4 millimeters across each 
solar cell; and (E) each panel is (1) 
permanently integrated into a consumer 
good; (2) encased in a laminated 
material without stitching, or (3) has all 
of the following characteristics: (i) the 
panel is encased in sewn fabric with 
visible stitching, (ii) includes a mesh 
zippered storage pocket, and (iii) 
includes a permanently attached wire 
that terminates in a female USB–A 
connector. 

In addition, the following CSPV 
panels are excluded from the scope of 
the investigations: off-grid CSPV panels 
in rigid form with a glass cover, with 
each of the following physical 
characteristics, whether or not 
assembled into a fully completed off- 
grid hydropanel whose function is 
conversion of water vapor into liquid 
water: (A) a total power output of no 
more than 80 watts per panel; (B) a 
surface area of less than 5,000 square 
centimeters (cm2) per panel; (C) do not 
include a built-in inverter; (D) do not 
have a frame around the edges of the 
panel; (E) include a clear glass back 
panel; and (F) must include a 
permanently connected wire that 
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