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PSEG Nuclear LLC, Docket No. 50–354, 
Hope Creek Generating Station, Salem 
County, New Jersey 

Date of application for amendment: 
February 28, 2011, as supplemented by 
letters dated August 29, and December 
16, 2011, and January 26, 2012. 

Brief description of amendments: The 
amendment modifies the Hope Creek 
Generating Station Technical 
Specifications (TSs) to revise the 
existing TS for the control room 
emergency filtration system and to add 
a new TS for the control room air 
conditioning system. The amendment is 
based, in part, on Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission-approved Technical 
Specification Task Force (TSTF) 
Standard TS Change Traveler TSTF– 
477, Revision 3, ‘‘Adding an Action 
Statement for Two Inoperable Control 
Room Air Conditioning Subsystems.’’ 

Date of issuance: February 8, 2012. 
Effective date: As of the date of 

issuance, to be implemented within 60 
days. 

Amendment No.: 191. 
Facility Operating License No. NPF– 

57: The amendment revised the TSs and 
the Facility Operating License. 

Date of initial notice in Federal 
Register: May 3, 2011 (76 FR 24929). 

The letters dated August 29, and 
December 16, 2011, and January 26, 
2012, provided clarifying information 
that did not change the initial proposed 
no significant hazards consideration 
determination or expand the 
application. 

The Commission’s related evaluation 
of the amendments is contained in a 
Safety Evaluation dated February 8, 
2012. 

No significant hazards consideration 
comments received: No. 

Yankee Atomic Electric Company, 
Docket No. 50–29, Yankee Nuclear 
Power Station, Franklin County, 
Massachusetts. 

Date of application for amendment: 
August 10, 2011. 

Brief Description of Amendment: The 
amendment revises License Condition 
C(3) ‘‘Physical Protection’’. It updates 
the title of the Physical Security Plan, 
from the ‘‘Yankee Nuclear Power 
Station Defueled Security Plan’’ 
Revision 0, dated October 13, 1992, and 
‘‘Yankee Defueled Security Training and 
Qualification Plan’’ Revision 0, dated 
October 13, 1992, to the ‘‘Physical 
Security Plan for Yankee Rowe 
Independent Spent Fuel Storage 
Installation.’’ 

Amendment No.: 159. 
Facility Operating License No. DPR–3. 

The amendment revised the Facility 
Operating License. 

Date of Initial Notice in Federal 
Register. October 4, 2011 (76 FR 
61398). 

The Commission’s related evaluation 
of the amendment is contained in a 
Safety Evaluation dated January 24, 
2012. 

No Significant Hazards Consideration 
Comments Received: No. 

Dated at Rockville, Maryland, this 10th day 
of February 2012. 

For the Nuclear Regulatory Commission. 
Michele G. Evans, 
Director, Division of Operating Reactor 
Licensing, Office of Nuclear Reactor 
Regulation. 
[FR Doc. 2012–3822 Filed 2–17–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7590–01–P 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

Advisory Committee on Reactor 
Safeguards (ACRS); Meeting of the 
ACRS Subcommittee on Reliability and 
PRA; Notice of Meeting 

The ACRS Subcommittee on 
Reliability and PRA will hold a meeting 
on March 7, 2012, Room T–2B1, 11545 
Rockville Pike, Rockville, Maryland. 

The entire meeting will be open to 
public attendance. 

The agenda for the subject meeting 
shall be as follows: 

Wednesday, March 7, 2012—8:30 a.m. 
Until 5 p.m. 

The Subcommittee will be briefed on 
the progress made for the tabletop 
exercises as part of the response to the 
SRM on SECY 10–0121, Modifying the 
Risk-Informed Regulatory Guidance For 
New Reactors. The Subcommittee will 
hear presentations by and hold 
discussions with the NRC staff and 
other interested persons regarding this 
matter. The Subcommittee will gather 
information, analyze relevant issues and 
facts, and formulate proposed positions 
and actions, as appropriate, for 
deliberation by the Full Committee. 

Members of the public desiring to 
provide oral statements and/or written 
comments should notify the Designated 
Federal Official (DFO), John Lai 
(Telephone 301–415–5107 or Email: 
John.Lai@nrc.gov) five days prior to the 
meeting, if possible, so that appropriate 
arrangements can be made. Thirty-five 
hard copies of each presentation or 
handout should be provided to the DFO 
thirty minutes before the meeting. In 
addition, one electronic copy of each 
presentation should be emailed to the 
DFO one day before the meeting. If an 
electronic copy cannot be provided 
within this timeframe, presenters 

should provide the DFO with a CD 
containing each presentation at least 
thirty minutes before the meeting. 
Electronic recordings will be permitted 
only during those portions of the 
meeting that are open to the public. 
Detailed procedures for the conduct of 
and participation in ACRS meetings 
were published in the Federal Register 
on October 17, 2011, (76 FR 64126– 
64127). 

Detailed meeting agendas and meeting 
transcripts are available on the NRC 
Web site at http://www.nrc.gov/reading
-rm/doc-collections/acrs. Information 
regarding topics to be discussed, 
changes to the agenda, whether the 
meeting has been canceled or 
rescheduled, and the time allotted to 
present oral statements can be obtained 
from the Web site cited above or by 
contacting the identified DFO. 
Moreover, in view of the possibility that 
the schedule for ACRS meetings may be 
adjusted by the Chairman as necessary 
to facilitate the conduct of the meeting, 
persons planning to attend should check 
with these references if such 
rescheduling would result in a major 
inconvenience. 

If attending this meeting, please enter 
through the One White Flint North 
building, 11555 Rockville Pike, 
Rockville, MD. After registering with 
security, please contact Mr. Theron 
Brown (240–888–9835) to be escorted to 
the meeting room. 

Dated: February 14, 2012. 
Antonio Dias, 
Technical Advisor, Advisory Committee on 
Reactor Safeguards. 
[FR Doc. 2012–3953 Filed 2–17–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7590–01–P 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

Sunshine Act Meeting 

AGENCY HOLDING THE MEETINGS: Nuclear 
Regulatory Commission, [NRC–2012– 
0002]. 
DATE: Week of February 20, 2012. 
PLACE: Commissioners’ Conference 
Room, 11555 Rockville Pike, Rockville, 
Maryland. 
STATUS: Public and Closed. 

Additional Items To Be Considered 

Week of February 20, 2012 

Wednesday, February 22, 2012 

8:55 a.m. Affirmation Session (Public 
Meeting) (Tentative). 

a. Entergy Nuclear Generation Co. and 
Entergy Nuclear Operations, Inc. 
(Pilgrim Nuclear Power Station), 
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Pilgrim Watch’s Petition for Review 
of Memorandum and Order 
(Denying Pilgrim Watch’s Requests 
for Hearing on New Contentions 
Relating to Fukushima Accident) 
Sept. 8, 2011 (Sept. 23, 2011) 
(Tentative). 

b. Crow Butte Resources, Inc. (License 
Renewal for the In Situ Leach 
Facility, Crawford, Nebraska), 
Docket No. 40–8943, Memorandum 
(Bringing Matter of Concern to 
Commission’s Attention) (Tentative) 

This meeting will be webcast live at the 
Web address—www.nrc.gov. 

* * * * * 
*The schedule for Commission 

meetings is subject to change on short 
notice. To verify the status of meetings, 
call (recording)—(301) 415–1292. 
Contact person for more information: 
Rochelle Bavol, (301) 415–1651. 
* * * * * 

The NRC Commission Meeting 
Schedule can be found on the Internet 
at: www.nrc.gov/about-nrc/policy- 
making/schedule.html. 
* * * * * 

The NRC provides reasonable 
accommodation to individuals with 
disabilities where appropriate. If you 
need a reasonable accommodation to 
participate in these public meetings, or 
need this meeting notice or the 
transcript or other information from the 
public meetings in another format (e.g. 
braille, large print), please notify Bill 
Dosch, Chief, Work Life and Benefits 
Branch, at 301–415–6200, TDD: 301– 
415–2100, or by email at william.
dosch@nrc.gov. Determinations on 
requests for reasonable accommodation 
will be made on a case-by-case basis. 
* * * * * 

This notice is distributed 
electronically to subscribers. If you no 
longer wish to receive it, or would like 
to be added to the distribution, please 
contact the Office of the Secretary, 
Washington, DC 20555 (301–415–1969), 
or send an email to darlene.wright@nrc.
gov. 

Dated: February 15, 2012. 
Rochelle C. Bavol, 
Policy Coordinator, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2012–4047 Filed 2–16–12; 4:15 pm] 

BILLING CODE 7590–01–P 

OFFICE OF PERSONNEL 
MANAGEMENT 

CFC–50 Commission 

AGENCY: Office of Personnel 
Management. 

ACTION: Establishment of advisory 
committee. 

SUMMARY: The CFC–50 Advisory 
Commission will hold its third and final 
meeting on March 2, 2012, at the time 
and location shown below. The 
Commission shall advise the Director of 
the U.S. Office of Personnel 
Management (OPM) on strengthening 
the integrity, the operation and 
effectiveness of the Combined Federal 
Campaign (CFC) to ensure its continued 
growth and success. The Commission is 
an advisory committee composed of 
Federal employees, private campaign 
administrators, charitable organizations 
and ‘‘watchdog’’ groups. The 
Commission is co-chaired by Thomas 
Davis and Beverly Byron. 

The meeting is open to the public. 
Please contact the Office of Personnel 
Management at the address shown 
below if you wish to present material to 
the Commission at the meeting. The 
manner and time prescribed for 
presentations may be limited, 
depending upon the number of parties 
that express interest in presenting 
information. 

DATES: March 2, 2012 at 1:00 p.m. CST. 
Location: Crowne Plaza Riverwalk, 

111 E. Pecan Street, San Antonio, TX, 
78205. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Keith Willingham, Director, Combined 
Federal Campaign, U.S. Office of 
Personnel Management, 1900 E St. NW., 
Suite 6484, Washington, DC 20415. 
Phone (202) 606–2564 FAX (202) 606– 
5056 or email at cfc@opm.gov. 

U.S. Office of Personnel Management. 
John Berry, 
Director. 
[FR Doc. 2012–3896 Filed 2–17–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6325–46–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[File No. 500–1] 

C$ cMoney, Inc.; Order of Suspension 
of Trading 

February 16, 2012. 
It appears to the Securities and 

Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of C$ cMoney, 
Inc. (‘‘cMoney’’) because of questions 
regarding the accuracy of assertions by 
cMoney, and by others, in press releases 
to investors and other public statements 
concerning, among other things, the 
identity of persons controlling the 
operations, management and securities 

of the company, the purported 
engagement of an independent auditor 
and the status of the company’s audit. 

The Commission is of the opinion that 
the public interest and the protection of 
investors require a suspension of trading 
in the securities of the above-listed 
company. 

Therefore, it is ordered, pursuant to 
Section 12(k) of the Securities Exchange 
Act of 1934, that trading in the 
securities of the above-listed company is 
suspended for the period from 9:30 a.m. 
EST, on February 16, 2012 through 
11:59 p.m. EST, on March 1, 2012. 

By the Commission. 

Elizabeth M. Murphy, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2012–4043 Filed 2–16–12; 4:15 pm] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[File No. 500–1] 

Nikron Technologies, Inc.; Order of 
Suspension of Trading 

February 16, 2012. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Nikron 
Technologies, Inc. (‘‘Nikron’’) because 
of possible manipulative conduct 
occurring in the market for the 
company’s stock. Nikron is quoted on 
OTC Link operated by OTC Markets 
Group, Inc. under the ticker symbol 
‘‘NKRN.’’ 

The Commission is of the opinion that 
the public interest and the protection of 
investors require a suspension of trading 
in the securities of the above-listed 
company. 

Therefore, it is ordered, pursuant to 
Section 12(k) of the Securities Exchange 
Act of 1934, that trading in the 
securities of the above-listed company is 
suspended for the period from 9:30 a.m. 
EST, on February 16, 2012 through 
11:59 p.m. EST, on March 1, 2012. 

By the Commission. 

Elizabeth M. Murphy, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2012–4044 Filed 2–16–12; 4:15 pm] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 
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