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other pertinent documents (including 
exhibits), as well as all submitted 
comments, contact the Docket Office, at 
the above address; these materials also 
are available online at https://
www.regulations.gov under Docket No. 
OSHA–2010–0013. 

The NRTL Program staff will review 
all comments to the docket submitted in 
a timely manner and, after addressing 
the issues raised by these comments, 
will make a recommendation to the 
Assistant Secretary on whether to grant 
PTL’s application for renewal. The 
Assistant Secretary will make the final 
decision on granting the application 
and, in making this decision, may 
undertake other proceedings prescribed 
in Appendix A to 29 CFR 1910.7. 

OSHA will publish a public notice of 
this final decision in the Federal 
Register. 

III. Authority and Signature 

Amanda L. Edens, Deputy Assistant 
Secretary of Labor for Occupational 
Safety and Health, 200 Constitution 
Avenue NW, Washington, DC 20210, 
authorized the preparation of this 
notice. Accordingly, the agency is 
issuing this notice pursuant to 29 U.S.C. 
657(g)(2)), Secretary of Labor’s Order 
No. 8–2020 (85 FR 58393, Sept. 18, 
2020), and 29 CFR 1910.7. 

Signed at Washington, DC, on January 28, 
2021. 
Amanda L. Edens, 
Deputy Assistant Secretary of Labor for 
Occupational Safety and Health. 
[FR Doc. 2021–02209 Filed 2–2–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–26–P 

LIBRARY OF CONGRESS 

[Docket No. 2021–1] 

Announcement of Copyright Public 
Modernization Committee 

AGENCY: Library of Congress. 
ACTION: Notice of convening of IT 
modernization public stakeholder 
committee. 

SUMMARY: The Library of Congress is 
convening a public committee to 
enhance communication and provide a 
public forum for the technology-related 
aspects of the U.S. Copyright Office’s 
modernization initiative. At this time, 
the Library is announcing that it will 
accept applications from qualified 
members of the public to serve on this 
committee. The scope of contributions 
made by the committee are limited to 
the specific topics set forth in this 
notice. Membership will be on a 
volunteer basis, with the expectation of 

in-person or virtual participation at two 
open forums a year at the member’s own 
expense. 
DATES: The application period will be 
until March 15, 2021. The first meeting 
of the committee will be in early 
summer 2021, and meetings will 
continue twice a year for the duration of 
the Copyright Office IT modernization 
efforts, currently estimated to conclude 
at the end of fiscal year 2023. Meetings 
may be held by web conference as 
appropriate, and schedules are subject 
to change due to the evolving 
coronavirus pandemic. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: The 
Library of Congress at cpmc@loc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Background 

The Library of Congress will form a 
public committee on Copyright Office 
information technology (IT) 
modernization. The committee will be 
managed by the Office of the Chief 
Information Officer (OCIO), with 
support from the U.S. Copyright Office 
and from other Library offices as 
necessary. The goal of the committee 
will be to expand and enhance 
communication with external 
stakeholders on IT modernization of 
Copyright Office systems and to provide 
an ongoing public forum for sharing 
information and answering questions 
related to this initiative. 

II. Public Stakeholder Committee 
Subjects of Discussion 

Members of the Copyright Public 
Modernization Committee will provide 
feedback to the Library on the 
technology-related aspects of the 
Copyright Office’s modernization 
initiative, including both Copyright 
Office IT systems and broader Library IT 
systems that interface with and/or 
support Copyright Office operations. 

III. Public Stakeholder Committee 
Application Process 

Members of the public who seek to 
participate in the Copyright Public 
Modernization Committee should 
submit a current curriculum vitae and a 
statement of interest of no more than 
1000 words addressing the questions 
identified below no later than March 15, 
2021. Answers can be submitted via 
email at cpmc@loc.gov. If you are unable 
to access a computer or the internet, 
please contact the Library using the 
contact information above for special 
instructions. Individuals selected for 
participation will be notified directly by 
the Library not later than May 15, 2021. 
In order to accommodate the expected 
level of interest, the Library expects to 

assign no more than one representative 
per organization to the committee. 

The public stakeholder committee 
will have a limited number of seats. 
Thus, the application and selection 
process is expected to be competitive. 
The Library will seek to select a 
membership that is representative of the 
broad and diverse Copyright Office 
stakeholder community. The areas of 
relevant expertise for membership 
include skill in communicating on 
complex technical issues; the ability to 
work collaboratively; and knowledge of 
technology relevant to Copyright Office 
services. 

IV. Questions for Statement of Interest 
For the Statement of Interest, the 

applicant need not address every subject 
identified below, but the Library 
requests that applicants clearly identify 
and separately address each numbered 
subject for which a response is 
submitted. Answers will be evaluated 
by the Library to select a committee 
with members that represent the 
broadest possible cross-section of 
Copyright Office stakeholders. 

1. An important skill for members of 
the CPMC is the ability to communicate, 
whether orally or in writing, on 
complex technological issues, including 
describing their impact on the needs or 
interests of Copyright Office 
stakeholders. Please identify any 
relevant experience you have working 
and communicating on technological 
issues with these or any other relevant 
parties: 

(a) Individual creators and copyright 
owners; 

(b) Large corporate creators and 
companies that own or manage 
copyrights; 

(c) Small-to-medium size enterprises 
that own or manage copyrights; 

(d) Creators, copyright owners, or 
copyright users from the following 
sectors: photography, motion picture, 
musical works, sound recordings, 
graphic arts, publishing, software, and 
information technology; 

(e) users of Copyright Office services, 
including but not limited to individuals 
or entities that register their works with 
the Office, record copyright-related 
documents with the Office, or benefit 
from or pay into the licensing systems 
administered by the Copyright Office; 

(f) user interest groups, including 
researchers, universities, archives, and 
libraries; and 

(g) representatives of the public and 
public interest groups (including 
organizations involved in issues related 
to open government, public government 
data and APIs, and government use of 
technology). 
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2. Another important skill for 
members of the CPMC is the ability to 
work collaboratively with others, 
including diverse stakeholders. Please 
describe any relevant past experience 
developing and maintaining 
relationships with a variety of 
individuals; communicating effectively 
about topics involving inter- 
dependencies, competing priorities, and 
diverse audiences/user groups; or 
reaching a consensus among diverse 
stakeholders with conflicting interests. 

3. A key skill that the Library is 
seeking in members of the CPMC is 
knowledge of the technology relevant to 
Copyright Office IT modernization and 
the Office’s recent initiatives. Please 
describe any relevant experience in the 
following sectors: government 
innovation and/or technology, copyright 
law and Copyright Office services, rights 
management, and the development and 
use of IT systems in library, cultural 
heritage, museum, creative industry or 
other settings. 

4. Please describe your knowledge of 
user-centered strategies and design 
methods, including any experience 
applying iterative design principles to 
solving complex problems. 

5. If your application is endorsed by 
other stakeholders or associations, 
please identify them. 

Dated: January 28, 2021. 
Carla D. Hayden, 
Librarian of Congress. 
[FR Doc. 2021–02194 Filed 2–2–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 1410–30–P 

NATIONAL SECURITY COMMISSION 
ON ARTIFICIAL INTELLIGENCE 

[Docket No. 1–2021–02] 

National Security Commission on 
Artificial Intelligence; Notice of Federal 
Advisory Committee Meeting 

AGENCY: National Security Commission 
on Artificial Intelligence. 
ACTION: Notice of Federal Advisory 
Committee virtual public meeting. 

SUMMARY: The National Security 
Commission on Artificial Intelligence 
(the ‘‘Commission’’) is publishing this 
notice to announce that the following 
Federal Advisory Committee virtual 
public meeting will take place. 
DATES: Wednesday, February 17, 2021, 
1:00 p.m. to 4:00 p.m. Eastern Standard 
Time (EST). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ms. 
Angela Ponmakha, 703–614–6379 
(Voice), nscai-dfo@nscai.gov. Mailing 
address: Designated Federal Officer, 

National Security Commission on 
Artificial Intelligence, 2530 Crystal 
Drive, Box 45, Arlington, VA 22202. 
website: https://www.nscai.gov. The 
most up-to-date information about the 
meeting and the Commission can be 
found on the website. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
meeting is being held under the 
provisions of the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act (FACA) (5 U.S.C., 
Appendix), the Government in the 
Sunshine Act (5 U.S.C. 552b), and 41 
CFR 102–3.140 and 102–3.150. 

Purpose of the Meeting: The John S. 
McCain National Defense Authorization 
Act for Fiscal Year 2019 (FY19 NDAA), 
Sec. 1051, Public Law 115–232, 132 
Stat. 1636, 1962–65 (2018), created the 
Commission to ‘‘consider the methods 
and means necessary to advance the 
development of artificial intelligence, 
machine learning, and associated 
technologies by the United States to 
comprehensively address the national 
security and defense needs of the 
United States.’’ In a two-day meeting on 
January 25–26, 2021, the Commission 
deliberated on the draft Final Report 
and associated recommendations for 
Congress and the Executive Branch. The 
Commissioners then tasked the 
Commission staff with drafting specific 
implementation plans to accompany the 
Commission’s Final Report. On 
February 17, 2021, Commissioners will 
meet and deliberate on these draft 
implementation plans. 

Agenda: The meeting will begin on 
February 17, 2021 at 1:00 p.m. EST with 
opening remarks by the Designated 
Federal Officer, Ms. Angela Ponmakha; 
the Executive Director, Mr. Yll 
Bajraktari; the Commission Chair, Dr. 
Eric Schmidt; and the Commission Vice 
Chair, Mr. Robert Work. Commissioners 
from each of the Commission’s lines of 
effort (LOEs) will present specific 
implementation plans associated with 
chapters of the Final Report for 
consideration by the entire Commission. 
The Commission’s LOEs are: LOE 1— 
Invest in AI Research & Development 
and Software; LOE 2—Apply AI to 
National Security Missions; LOE 3— 
Train and Recruit AI Talent; LOE 4— 
Protect and Build Upon U.S. 
Technological Advantages & Hardware; 
LOE 5—Marshal Global AI Cooperation; 
and LOE 6—Ethics and Responsible AI. 

The Commission will deliberate on 
the draft implementation plans and 
consider them for inclusion in the 
Commission’s final report to Congress 
and the Administration. The meeting 
will adjourn at 4:00 p.m. EST. 

Meeting Accessibility: Pursuant to 
Federal statutes and regulations (the 

FACA, the Sunshine Act, and 41 CFR 
102–3.140 through 102–3.165) and the 
availability of space, the virtual meeting 
is open to the public February 17, 2021 
from 1:00 p.m. to 4:00 p.m. EST. 
Members of the public wishing to 
receive a link to the live stream webcast 
for viewing and audio access to the 
virtual meeting should register on the 
Commission’s website, https://
www.nscai.gov. Registration will be 
available from February 8, 2021 through 
February 16, 2021. Members of the 
media should RSVP to the 
Commission’s press office at press@
nscai.gov. 

Special Accommodations: Individuals 
requiring special accommodations to 
access the public meeting should 
contact the DFO, see the FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT section for contact 
information, no later than February 12, 
2021, so that appropriate arrangements 
can be made. 

Access to Records of the Meeting: 
Pursuant to FACA requirements, the 
meeting materials for the virtual 
meetings will be available for public 
inspection on the Commission’s website 
at https://www.nscai.gov on February 
12, 2021. 

Written Statements: Written 
comments may be submitted to the DFO 
via email to: nscai-dfo@nscai.gov in 
either Adobe Acrobat or Microsoft Word 
format. The DFO will compile all 
written submissions and provide them 
to the Commissioners for consideration. 
Comments must be received by 
February 15 to be reviewed by 
Commissioners in advance of the 
meeting. Please note that all submitted 
comments will be treated as public 
documents and will be made available 
for public inspection, including, but not 
limited to, being posted on the 
Commission’s website. 

Dated: January 28, 2021. 
Michael Gable, 
Chief of Staff. 
[FR Doc. 2021–02196 Filed 2–2–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3610–Y8–P 

NATIONAL SCIENCE FOUNDATION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Comment Request; Merit 
Review Survey—2021 and 2023 
Assessment of Applicant and Reviewer 
Experiences 

AGENCY: National Science Foundation. 
ACTION: Submission for OMB review; 
comment request. 

SUMMARY: The National Science 
Foundation (NSF) has submitted the 
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