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DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Bonneville Power Administration 

Goodnoe Hills and White Creek Wind 
Energy Projects, October 2005 

AGENCY: Bonneville Power 
Administration (BPA), Department of 
Energy (DOE). 

ACTION: Notice of availability of Record 
of Decision (ROD). 

SUMMARY: BPA has decided to offer 
contract terms for interconnection of the 
Goodnoe Hills and White Creek Wind 
Energy Projects into the Federal 
Columbia River Transmission System 
(FCRTS) at the Rock Creek substation in 
Klickitat County, Washington. The 
Large Generation Interconnection 
Agreement (LGIA) provides for 
interconnection of the Wind Projects 
with the FCRTS, the operation of 
Goodnoe Hills and White Creek Wind 
Energy Projects in the BPA Control Area 
(including control area services such as 
generation imbalance service), and the 
maintenance of reliability of the FCRTS 
and interconnected systems. It also 
provides for the construction, operation 
and maintenance of the interconnection 
facilities (i.e., the Rock Creek 
substation). As described above, BPA 
has considered both the economic and 
environmental consequences of taking 
action to integrate power from the Wind 
Projects into the FCRTS. This notice 
announces the availability of the ROD to 
offer terms to interconnect the Wind 
Projects based on the Business Plan 
Final Environment Impact Statement 
(BP EIS) (DOE/EIS–0183, June 1995), 
and the Business Plan Record of 
Decision (BP ROD, August 15, 1995). 
BPA has decided to offer terms to 
interconnect the Wind Projects in 
Klickitat County, Washington. 

ADDRESSES: Copies of the ROD and EIS 
may be obtained by calling BPA’s toll- 
free document request line, 1–800–622– 
4520. The ROD and EIS Summary are 
also available on our Web site, http:// 
www.efw.bpa.gov. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION, CONTACT: 
Nancy Wittpenn, Bonneville Power 
Administration—KEC–4, P.O. Box 3621, 
Portland, Oregon, 97208–3621; toll-free 
telephone number 1–800–282–3713; fax 
number 503–230–5699; or e-mail 
nawittpen@bpa.gov. 

Issued in Portland, Oregon, on November 
16, 2005. 
Stephen J. Wright, 
Administrator and Chief Executive Officer. 
[FR Doc. E5–6522 Filed 11–23–05; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6450–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RP06–92–000] 

ANR Pipeline Company; Notice of 
Tariff Filing 

November 17, 2005. 

Take notice that on November 15, 
2005, ANR Pipeline Company (ANR) 
tendered for filing as part of its FERC 
Gas Tariff, Second Revised Volume No. 
1, the tariff sheets attached to the filing, 
to become effective on December 16, 
2005. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed in accordance 
with the provisions of section 154.210 
of the Commission’s regulations (18 CFR 
154.210). Anyone filing an intervention 
or protest must serve a copy of that 
document on the Applicant. Anyone 
filing an intervention or protest on or 
before the intervention or protest date 
need not serve motions to intervene or 
protests on persons other than the 
Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 

(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E5–6483 Filed 11–23–05; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RP96–190–027] 

Colorado Interstate Gas Company; 
Notice Negotiated Rate 

November 18, 2005. 
Take notice that on November 16, 

2005, Colorado Interstate Gas Company 
(CIG) tendered for filing as part of its 
FERC Gas Tariff, First Revised Volume 
No. 1, First Revised Sheet No. 11D to be 
effective December 1, 2005. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed in accordance 
with the provisions of section 154.210 
of the Commission’s regulations (18 CFR 
154.210). Anyone filing an intervention 
or protest must serve a copy of that 
document on the Applicant. Anyone 
filing an intervention or protest on or 
before the intervention or protest date 
need not serve motions to intervene or 
protests on persons other than the 
Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
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Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208-3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502-8659. 

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E5–6489 Filed 11–23–05; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP06–17–000] 

Colorado Interstate Gas Company; 
Notice of Application 

November 18, 2005. 
Take notice that Colorado Interstate 

Gas Company (CIG), P.O. Box 1087, 
Colorado Springs, Colorado 80944, filed 
in Docket No. CP06–17–000 on October 
31, 2005, an application pursuant to 
section 7(b) of the Natural Gas Act 
(NGA), for authorization for CIG to 
abandon, by removal, its Sanford 
Compressor Station and Gas Sweetening 
Plant, comprised of three 880 
horsepower (ISO) reciprocal compressor 
units and miscellaneous gas processing 
and sweetening facilities, located in 
Hutchinson County, Texas, all as more 
fully set forth in the application which 
is on file with the Commission and open 
to public inspection. This filing may be 
also viewed on the Web at http:// 
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. For 
assistance, call (202) 502–8659 or TTY, 
(202) 208–3676. 

Any questions regarding this 
application should be directed to 
Richard Derryberry, Director, Regulatory 
Affairs, Colorado Interstate Gas 
Company, P.O. Box 1087, Colorado 
Springs, Colorado 80944 at (719) 520– 
3788 or by fax at (719) 667–7534. 

There are two ways to become 
involved in the Commission’s review of 
this project. First, any person wishing to 
obtain legal status by becoming a party 
to the proceedings for this project 
should, on or before the comment date 
stated below, file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street, NE., Washington, DC 20426, 
a motion to intervene in accordance 
with the requirements of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.214 or 385.211) 
and the Regulations under the NGA (18 
CFR 157.10). A person obtaining party 
status will be placed on the service list 
maintained by the Secretary of the 

Commission and will receive copies of 
all documents filed by the applicant and 
by all other parties. A party must submit 
14 copies of filings made with the 
Commission and must mail a copy to 
the applicant and to every other party in 
the proceeding. Only parties to the 
proceeding can ask for court review of 
Commission orders in the proceeding. 

However, a person does not have to 
intervene in order to have comments 
considered. The second way to 
participate is by filing with the 
Secretary of the Commission, as soon as 
possible, an original and two copies of 
comments in support of or in opposition 
to this project. The Commission will 
consider these comments in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but the filing of a comment alone 
will not serve to make the filer a party 
to the proceeding. The Commission’s 
rules require that persons filing 
comments in opposition to the project 
provide copies of their protests only to 
the party or parties directly involved in 
the protest. 

Persons who wish to comment only 
on the environmental review of this 
project should submit an original and 
two copies of their comments to the 
Secretary of the Commission. 
Environmental commenters will be 
placed on the Commission’s 
environmental mailing list, will receive 
copies of the environmental documents, 
and will be notified of meetings 
associated with the Commission’s 
environmental review process. 
Environmental commenters will not be 
required to serve copies of filed 
documents on all other parties. 
However, the non-party commenters 
will not receive copies of all documents 
filed by other parties or issued by the 
Commission (except for the mailing of 
environmental documents issued by the 
Commission) and will not have the right 
to seek court review of the 
Commission’s final order. 

Comments, protests and interventions 
may be filed electronically via the 
Internet in lieu of paper. See, 18 CFR 
385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the instructions 
on the Commission’s Web site under the 
‘‘e-Filing’’ link. 

Comment Date: December 9, 2005. 

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E5–6490 Filed 11–23–05; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. PR04–6–003] 

Cranberry Pipeline Corporation; Notice 
of Compliance Filing 

November 17, 2005. 

Take notice that on November 14, 
2005, Cranberry Pipeline Corporation 
(Cranberry) tendered for filing a revised 
statement of operating conditions in 
compliance with the Commission’s 
‘‘Order Rejecting Partial Settlement, 
Establishing Transportation and Storage 
Rates, and Directing Filings,’’ issued on 
September 13, 2005 in Docket Nos. 
PR04–6–000 and PR04–6–001. 

Cranberry states that copies of this 
filing were served upon its customers 
and interested state commissions. 

Any person desiring to protest this 
filing must file in accordance with Rule 
211 of the Commission’s Rules of 
Practice and Procedure (18 CFR 
385.211). Protests to this filing will be 
considered by the Commission in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but will not serve to make 
protestants parties to the proceeding. 
Such protests must be filed on or before 
the date as indicated below. Anyone 
filing a protest must serve a copy of that 
document on all the parties to the 
proceeding. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests in lieu 
of paper using the ‘‘eFiling’’ link at 
http://www.ferc.gov. Persons unable to 
file electronically should submit an 
original and 14 copies of the protest to 
the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 888 First Street, NE., 
Washington, DC 20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on November 25, 2005. 

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E5–6480 Filed 11–23–05; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 
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