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additional voting shares of Union State 
Holding Company, Wilmington, 
Delaware, and Union State Bank, 
Florence, Texas.

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, August 2, 2005.
Robert deV. Frierson,
Deputy Secretary of the Board.
[FR Doc. 05–15704 Filed 8–8–05; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 6210–01–S

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR Part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below.

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The application also will be 
available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 
writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 
Additional information on all bank 
holding companies may be obtained 
from the National Information Center 
website at www.ffiec.gov/nic/.

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors not later than September 2, 
2005.

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Atlanta 
(Andre Anderson, Vice President) 1000 
Peachtree Street, N.E., Atlanta, Georgia 
30303:

1. Northside Bancshares, Inc., 
Adairsville, Georgia; to become a bank 
holding company by acquiring 100 
percent of the voting shares of Northside 
Bank, Adairsville, Georgia.

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, August 3, 2005.
Robert deV. Frierson,
Deputy Secretary of the Board.
[FR Doc. 05–15677 Filed 8–8–05; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 6210–01–S

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR Part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below.

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The application also will be 
available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 
writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 
Additional information on all bank 
holding companies may be obtained 
from the National Information Center 
website at www.ffiec.gov/nic/.

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors not later than September 1, 
2005.

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Boston 
(Richard Walker, Community Affairs 
Officer) P.O. Box 55882, Boston, 
Massachusetts 02106-2204:

1. Monson Financial Services Corp., 
and Monson Financial Services MHC, 
both of Monson, Massachusetts; to 
become bank holding companies by 
acquiring Monson Savings Bank, 
Monson, Massachusetts.

B. Federal Reserve Bank of New York 
(Jay Bernstein, Bank Supervision 
Officer) 33 Liberty Street, New York, 
New York 10045-0001:

1. IA Bancorp, Inc., Iselin, New Jersey; 
to become a bank holding company by 
acquiring 100 percent of the voting 
shares of Indus American Bank, Iselin, 
New Jersey.

C. Federal Reserve Bank of Atlanta 
(Andre Anderson, Vice President) 1000 
Peachtree Street, N.E., Atlanta, Georgia 
30303:

1. CCB Financial Corporation, 
Jonesboro, Georgia; to become a bank 
holding company by acquiring 100 
percent of the voting shares of 
Community Capital Bank, Jonesboro, 
Georgia.

2. Northside Bancshares, Inc., 
Adairsville, Georgia; to become a bank 
holding company by acquiring 100 
percent of the voting shares of Northside 
Bank, Adairsville, Georgia (in 
organization).

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, August 2, 2005.
Robert deV. Frierson,
Deputy Secretary of the Board.
[FR Doc. 05–15705 Filed 8–8–05; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 6210–01–S

FEDERAL TRADE COMMISSION

[File No. 042–3196] 

Advertising.com, Inc., and John 
Ferber; Analysis of Proposed Consent 
Order To Aid Public Comment

AGENCY: Federal Trade Commission.
ACTION: Proposed consent agreement.

SUMMARY: The consent agreement in this 
matter settles alleged violations of 
Federal law prohibiting unfair or 
deceptive acts or practices or unfair 
methods of competition. The attached 
Analysis to Aid Public Comment 
describes both the allegations in the 
draft complaint and the terms of the 
consent order—embodied in the consent 
agreement—that would settle these 
allegations.

DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before August 31, 2005.
ADDRESSES: Interested parties are 
invited to submit written comments. 
Comments should refer to 
‘‘Advertising.com, Inc., et al., File No. 
042 3196,’’ to facilitate the organization 
of comments. A comment filed in paper 
form should include this reference both 
in the text and on the envelope, and 
should be mailed or delivered to the 
following address: Federal Trade 
Commission/Office of the Secretary, 
Room 135–H, 600 Pennsylvania 
Avenue, NW., Washington, DC 20580. 
Comments containing confidential 
material must be filed in paper form, 
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