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DC 20230 or via the Internet at 
MClayton@doc.gov. 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent to 
David Rostker, OMB Desk Officer, Room 
10202, New Executive Office Building, 
Washington, DC 20503 within 30 days 
of the publication of this notice in the 
Federal Register.

Dated: May 30, 2002. 
Madeleine Clayton, 
Departmental Paperwork Clearance Officer, 
Office of the Chief Information Officer.
[FR Doc. 02–13998 Filed 6–4–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3510–FP–P

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE

Submission for OMB Review: 
Comment Request 

DOC has submitted to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
clearance of the following proposal for 
collection of information under the 
provisions of the Paperwork Reduction 
Act of 1995, Public Law 104–13. 

Bureau: International Trade 
Administration. 

Title: U.S.-Japan Semiconductor 
Agreement Data Collection Program. 

Agency Form Number: ITA–4115P. 
OMB Number: 0625–0211. 
Type of Request: Regular Submission. 
Burden: 456 hours. 
Number of Respondents: 38. 
Avg. Hours Per Response: 1 hour. 
Needs and Uses: The Data Collection 

Form is the vehicle by which individual 
‘‘Foreign’’ (non-Japanese) 
semiconductor companies voluntarily 
report their sales to Japan. The 
information provided by the Data 
Collection Program (DCP) is used by the 
U.S. Government to calculate foreign 
market share in the Japanese 
semiconductor market to ensure access 
to the Japanese market gained under the 
1986 and 1991 U.S.-Japan 
Semiconductor Arrangement continues 
under the 1996 Semiconductor 
Agreement. 

Affected Public: Business or other for 
profit, not-for-profit institutions. 

Frequency: Monthly. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Required to 

obtain or retain a benefit, voluntary. 
OMB Desk Officer: David Rostker, 

(202) 395–3897. 
Copies of the above information 

collection can be obtained by calling or 
writing Madeleine Clayton, 
Departmental Paperwork Clearance 
Officer, (202) 482–3129, Department of 
Commerce, Room 6608, 14th & 
Constitution Avenue, NW., Washington, 
DC 20230 or via the Internet at 
MClayton@doc.gov. 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent to 
David Rostker, OMB Desk Officer, Room 
10202, New Executive Office Building, 
Washington, DC 20503 within 30 days 
of the publication of this notice in the 
Federal Register.

Dated: May 30, 2002. 
Madeleine Clayton, 
Departmental Paperwork Clearance Officer, 
Office of the Chief Information Officer.
[FR Doc. 02–14000 Filed 6–4–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3510–DR–P

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

DOC has submitted to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
clearance the following proposal for 
collection of information under the 
provisions of the Paperwork Reduction 
Act of 1995, Public Law 104–13. 

Bureau: International Trade 
Administration. 

Title: Export Trading Companies 
Contact Facilitation Service. 

Agency Form Number: ITA 4094P. 
OMB Number: 0625–0120. 
Type of Request: Regular Submission. 
Burden: 3,000 hours. 
Number of Respondents: 12,000. 
Avg. Hours Per Response: 15 minutes. 
Needs and Uses: Title III of the Export 

Trading Company Act of 1982 (Pub. L. 
No. 97–290, 96 Stat. 1233–1247), 
requires the Department of Commerce to 
establish a program to evaluate 
applications for Export Trade 
Certificates of Review and, with the 
concurrence of the Department of 
Justice, issue such certificates where the 
requirements of the Act are satisfied. 
The Act requires that Commerce, with 
Justice concurrence, issue regulations 
governing the evaluation and issuance 
of certificates before Commerce can 
accept applications for certification. The 
collection of information is necessary 
for the antitrust analysis which is a 
prerequisite to issuance of a certificate. 
Without the information, there would be 
no basis upon which a certificate could 
be issued. 

In the Department of Commerce, this 
economic and legal analysis will be 
performed by the Office of Export 
Trading Company Affairs and the Office 
of the General Counsel. The Department 
of Justice analysis will be conducted by 
the Antitrust Division. The purpose of 
such analysis is to make a determination 
as to whether or not to approve an 
application and issue an Export Trade 
Certificate of Review. If this information 

is not collected, the antitrust analysis 
cannot be performed and without that 
analysis no certificate can be issued. A 
certificate provides its holder and 
members named in the certificate (a) 
immunity from government actions 
under state and Federal antitrust laws 
for the export conduct specified in the 
certificate; (b) some protection from 
frivolous private suits by limiting their 
liability in private actions to actual 
damages when the challenged activities 
are covered by an Export Certificate of 
Review. Title III was enacted to reduce 
uncertainty regarding application of 
U.S. antitrust laws to export activities—
especially those involving actions by 
domestic competitors. 

Affected Public: Businesses or other 
for-profit, not-for-profit institutions, 
state, local or tribal Government. 

Frequency: On Occasion. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Required to 

obtain or retain a benefit, voluntary. 
OMB Desk Officer: David Rostker, 

(202) 395–3897. 
Copies of the above information 

collection can be obtained by calling or 
writing Madeleine Clayton, 
Departmental Paperwork Clearance 
Officer, (202) 482–3129, Department of 
Commerce, Room 5033, 14th & 
Constitution Avenue, NW., Washington, 
DC 20230 or via the Internet at 
MClayton@doc.gov.

Copies of the above information 
collection can be obtained by calling or 
writing Madeleine Clayton, 
Departmental Paperwork Clearance 
Officer, (202) 482–3129, Department of 
Commerce, Room 6608, 14th & 
Constitution Avenue, NW., Washington, 
DC 20230 or via the Internet at 
MClayton@doc.gov.

Dated: May 30, 2002. 
Madeleine Clayton, 
Departmental Paperwork Clearance Officer, 
Office of the Chief Information Officer.
[FR Doc. 02–14001 Filed 6–4–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3510–DR–P

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE

Foreign Trade Zones Board 

[Docket 25–2002] 

Foreign-Trade Zone 47—Boone 
County, Kentucky; Application for 
Foreign-Trade Subzone Status, GE 
Engine Services Distribution LLC (Gas 
Turbine Engines), Erlanger, KY 

An application has been submitted to 
the Foreign-Trade Zones Board (the 
Board) by the Northern Kentucky 
Foreign Trade Zone, Inc., grantee of FTZ 
47, requesting special-purpose subzone 
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status for the manufacturing and 
distribution facilities (gas turbine 
engines) of GE Engine Services 
Distribution (GEESD) in Erlanger, 
Kentucky. The application was 
submitted pursuant to the Foreign-Trade 
Zones Act, as amended (19 U.S.C. 81a–
81u), and the regulations of the Board 
(15 CFR part 400). It was formally filed 
on May 28, 2002. 

The GEESD facilities are located at 
1800 Donaldson Highway, Erlanger, 
Kentucky (395,500 square feet of 
enclosed space on 24 acres). The 
facilities (75 employees) are used for the 
warehousing, distribution, and ‘‘kitting’’ 
of gas turbine engines and engine parts 
for aerospace, marine, and industrial 
applications. The facilities also may be 
used in future for the manufacture of 
such products. Foreign-sourced 
materials account for approximately 10 
to 20 percent of the finished-product 
value of GE’s current gas turbine 
engines, and may include items from 
the following categories: Plastic or 
rubber tubes, plates, and other articles; 
fiberglass sheets; stainless steel wire; 
iron or steel tubes or fittings; stranded 
wire products; iron or steel fasteners; 
nickel or nickel-alloy products; 
aluminum wire and fittings; cobalt 
mattes; titanium nuts, bolts, screws, 
tubes, sleeves, and bars; articles of 
chromium and rhenium; base metal 
fittings, tubing, and stoppers; pumps for 
liquids and parts thereof; heat exchange 
units; centrifuges; valves and parts 
thereof; bearings and parts thereof; 
transmission shafts and parts thereof; 
gaskets; electric motors; electrical 
inductors and ignition equipment; 
signaling equipment; electrical switches 
and relays; insulated wire and cable; 
ceramic insulators; counters and other 
instruments; measuring or checking 
instruments; and lamps and lighting 
fittings. 

Zone procedures would exempt 
GEESD from Customs duty payments on 
foreign materials used in production for 
export. On domestic sales, the company 
would be able to choose the duty rates 
that apply to the finished products 
(duty-free to 2.5%) rather than the duty 
rates that would otherwise apply to the 
foreign-sourced materials noted above 
(duty-free to 15%). In addition, GEESD 
states that it would realize logistical/
procedural and other benefits. FTZ 
status may also make a site eligible for 
benefits provided under state/local 
programs. The application indicates that 
the savings from zone procedures will 
help improve the plant’s international 
competitiveness. 

In accordance with the Board’s 
regulations, a member of the FTZ Staff 
has been designated examiner to 

investigate the application and report to 
the Board. Public comment is invited 
from interested parties. Submissions 
(original and 3 copies) shall be 
addressed to the Board’s Executive 
Secretary at one of the following 
addresses: 

1. Submissions Via Express/Package 
Delivery Services: Foreign-Trade-Zones 
Board, U.S. Department of Commerce, 
Franklin Court Building—Suite 4100W, 
1099 14th St. NW., Washington, DC 
20005; or 2. Submissions Via the U.S. 
Postal Service: Foreign-Trade-Zones 
Board, U.S. Department of Commerce, 
FCB—Suite 4100W, 1401 Constitution 
Ave. NW., Washington, DC 20230. 

The closing period for their receipt is 
August 5, 2002. Rebuttal comments in 
response to material submitted during 
the foregoing period may be submitted 
during the subsequent 15-day period to 
August 19, 2002. A copy of the 
application and accompanying exhibits 
will be available for public inspection at 
the Office of the Foreign-Trade Zones 
Board’s Executive Secretary at address 
Number 1 listed above, and at the U.S. 
Department of Commerce Export 
Assistance Center, 36 East 7th Street, 
Suite 2650, Cincinnati, OH 45202.

Dated: May 29, 2002. 
Dennis Puccinelli, 
Executive Secretary.
[FR Doc. 02–14075 Filed 6–4–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[Docket 23–2002] 

Foreign-Trade Zone 46—Cincinnati, 
Ohio; Application For Foreign-Trade 
Subzone Status, General Electric 
Aircraft Engines, (Gas Turbine 
Engines), Cincinnati, OH 

An application has been submitted to 
the Foreign-Trade Zones Board (the 
Board) by the Greater Cincinnati Foreign 
Trade Zone, Inc., grantee of FTZ 46, 
requesting special-purpose subzone 
status for the manufacturing and 
distribution facilities (gas turbine 
engines) of General Electric Aircraft 
Engines (GEAE) in Cincinnati, Ohio. 
The application was submitted pursuant 
to the Foreign-Trade Zones Act, as 
amended (19 U.S.C. 81a-81u), and the 
regulations of the Board (15 CFR part 
400). It was formally filed on May 28, 
2002. 

The GEAE facilities are located at One 
Neumann Way in Cincinnati, Ohio (6.5 
million square feet of enclosed space on 
413 acres). The facilities (6,000 

employees) are used for the 
development, manufacture, and 
distribution of gas turbine engines and 
engine parts for aerospace, marine, and 
industrial applications. Foreign-sourced 
materials account for approximately 10 
to 20 percent of finished-product value, 
and may include items from the 
following categories: Plastic or rubber 
tubes, plates, and other articles; 
fiberglass sheets; stainless steel wire; 
iron or steel tubes or fittings; stranded 
wire products; iron or steel fasteners; 
nickel or nickel-alloy products; 
aluminum wire and fittings; cobalt 
mattes; titanium nuts, bolts, screws, 
tubes, sleeves, and bars; articles of 
chromium and rhenium; base metal 
fittings, tubing, and stoppers; pumps for 
liquids and parts thereof; heat exchange 
units; centrifuges; valves and parts 
thereof; bearings and parts thereof; 
transmission shafts and parts thereof; 
gaskets; electric motors; electrical 
inductors and ignition equipment; 
signaling equipment; electrical switches 
and relays; insulated wire and cable; 
ceramic insulators; counters and other 
instruments; measuring or checking 
instruments; and lamps and lighting 
fittings. 

Zone procedures would exempt GEAE 
from Customs duty payments on foreign 
materials used in production for export. 
On domestic sales, the company would 
be able to choose the duty rates that 
apply to the finished products (duty-free 
to 2.5 %) rather than the duty rates that 
would otherwise apply to the foreign-
sourced materials noted above (duty-
free to 15 %). In addition, GEAE states 
that it would realize logistical/
procedural and other benefits. FTZ 
status may also make a site eligible for 
benefits provided under state/local 
programs. The application indicates that 
the savings from zone procedures will 
help improve the plant’s international 
competitiveness. 

In accordance with the Board’s 
regulations, a member of the FTZ Staff 
has been designated examiner to 
investigate the application and report to 
the Board. Public comment is invited 
from interested parties. Submissions 
(original and 3 copies) shall be 
addressed to the Board’s Executive 
Secretary at one of the following 
addresses: 

1. Submissions Via Express/Package 
Delivery Services: Foreign-Trade-Zones 
Board, U.S. Department of Commerce, 
Franklin Court Building—Suite 4100W, 
1099 14th St. NW., Washington, DC 
20005; or 

2. Submissions Via the U.S. Postal 
Service: Foreign-Trade-Zones Board, 
U.S. Department of Commerce, FCB—
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