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Written inquiries should contain the 
requester’s full name, mailing address, 
telephone number and signature.’’ 

RECORD ACCESS PROCEDURES: 

Delete entry and replace with 
‘‘Individuals seeking access to 
information about themselves contained 
in this system should address written 
inquiries to the National Security 
Agency/Central Security Service, 
Freedom of Information Act/Privacy Act 
Office, 9800 Savage Road, Suite 6248, 
Ft. George G. Meade, MD 20755–6248. 

Written inquiries should contain the 
requester’s full name, mailing address, 
telephone number and signature.’’ 

CONTESTING RECORD PROCEDURES: 

Delete entry and replace with ‘‘The 
NSA/CSS rules for contesting contents 
and appealing initial Agency 
determinations are published at 32 CFR 
Part 322 or may be obtained by written 
request addressed to the National 
Security Agency/Central Security 
Service, Freedom of Information Act/
Privacy Act Office, 9800 Savage Road, 
Suite 6248, Ft. George G. Meade, MD 
20755–6248.’’ 

RECORD SOURCE CATEGORIES: 

Delete entry and replace with 
‘‘Correspondence to and from 
individuals and government 
departments and agencies. Written 
materials developed in response to 
requests and queries from individuals 
and government departments and 
agencies, claims, complaints, 
investigations and litigation.’’ 

EXEMPTIONS CLAIMED FOR THE SYSTEM: 

Delete entry and replace with 
‘‘Information specifically authorized to 
be classified under E.O. 13526, as 
implemented by DoD 5200.1–R, maybe 
exempt pursuant to 5 U.S.C. 552a(k)(1). 

Investigatory material compiled for 
law enforcement purposes, other than 
material within the scope of subsection 
5 U.S.C. 552a(k)(2). However, if an 
individual is denied any right, privilege, 
or benefit for which he would otherwise 
be entitled by Federal law or for which 
he would otherwise be eligible, as a 
result of the maintenance of the 
information, the individual will be 
provided access to the information 
exempt to the extent that disclosure 
would reveal the identity of a 
confidential source. Note: When 
claimed, this exemption allows limited 
protection of investigative reports 
maintained in a system of records used 
in personnel or administrative actions. 

Records maintained solely for 
statistical research or program 
evaluation maintained solely for 

statistical research or program 
evaluation purposes and which are not 
used to make decisions on the rights, 
benefits, or entitlement of an individual 
except for census records which may be 
disclosed under 13 U.S.C. 8, may be 
exempt pursuant to 5 U.S.C. 552a(k)(4). 

Investigatory material compiled solely 
for the purpose of determining 
suitability, eligibility or qualifications 
for federal civilian employment, 
military service, federal contracts, or 
access to classified information may be 
exempt pursuant to 5 U.S.C. 552a(k)(5), 
but only to the extent that such material 
would reveal the identity of a 
confidential source. 

An exemption rule for this system has 
been promulgated according to the 
requirements of 5 U.S.C. 553(b)(1), (2) 
and (3), 553(c) and 553(3) and published 
in 32 CFR Part 322. For additional 
information contact the system 
manager.’’ 
[FR Doc. 2014–00216 Filed 1–9–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–06–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Department of the Army; Corps of 
Engineers 

Notice of Availability of the Draft 
Environmental Impact Statement 
(DEIS) for the Installation of a Terminal 
Groin Structure at the Western End of 
South Beach, Bald Head Island, 
Adjacent to the Federal Wilmington 
Harbor Channel of the Cape Fear River 
(Brunswick County, North Carolina) 

AGENCY: Department of the Army, U.S. 
Army Corps of Engineers, DOD. 
ACTION: Notice of availability. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Army Corps of 
Engineers (USACE), Wilmington 
District, Wilmington Regulatory Field 
Office, has received a request for 
Department of the Army authorization, 
pursuant to Section 404 of the Clean 
Water Act and Section 10 of the Rivers 
and Harbor Act, from the Village of Bald 
Head Island (VBHI) to develop and 
implement a shoreline protection plan 
that includes the installation of a 
terminal groin structure on the east side 
of the Wilmington Harbor Bald Head 
Shoal Entrance Channel (a federally- 
maintained navigation channel of the 
Cape Fear River) at the ‘‘Point’’ of Bald 
Head Island. 
DATES: A public hearing for the Draft 
Environmental Impact Statement (DEIS) 
will be held at the International 
Longshoreman’s Association Hall, 
located at 211 West 10th Street in 
Southport, Brunswick County, North 

Carolina, on February 12, 2014, at 6:00 
p.m. Written comments on the DEIS will 
be received until February 24, 2014. 
ADDRESSES: Copies of comments and 
questions regarding scoping of the DEIS 
may be submitted to: U.S. Army Corps 
of Engineers (Corps), Wilmington 
District, Regulatory Division. Attn: File 
Number SAW–2012–00040, 69 
Darlington Avenue, Wilmington, North 
Carolina 28403. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Questions about the proposed action 
and DEIS can be directed to Mr. Ronnie 
Smith, Wilmington Regulatory Field 
Office, telephone number: (910) 251– 
4829. A copy of the DEIS can be found 
at the following link: http://
www.saw.usace.army.mil/Missions/
RegulatoryPermitProgram/
PublicNotices.aspx under the VBHI 
Terminal Groin Project. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

1. Project Description. The west end 
of South Beach, Bald Head Island, 
Brunswick County, North Carolina, has 
experienced both chronic and short- 
term shoreline erosion. This erosion has 
resulted in direct impacts to nearby 
beaches and dunes and could 
potentially impact public infrastructure 
and homes. This area has been subject 
to past sand placement activities 
sponsored by both the VBHI and the 
Corps. The Corps has placed several 
million cubic yards of suitable material 
on this shoreline since 1991 as part of 
a Federal navigation project. To address 
its erosion issue, the VBHI desires to 
implement a long-term beach and dune 
stabilization strategy to include 
installation of a single terminal groin at 
the western end of South Beach. The 
proposed terminal groin would be 
expected to perform the following 
functions: (1) Reduce inlet-directed 
sand losses from beach fill projects; and 
(2) stabilize shoreline alignment along 
the westernmost segment of South 
Beach in such a manner that alongshore 
transport rates are reduced. The 
terminal groin would serve as a 
‘‘template’’ for fill material placed 
eastward (of the proposed terminal 
groin). The proposed groin has been 
designed as a ‘‘leaky’’ structure (i.e. 
semi-permeable) so as to provide for 
some level of sand transport to West 
Beach (located northward and 
downdrift of the proposed groin). 

2. Issues. There are several potential 
environmental and public interest 
issues that are addressed in the DEIS. 
Additional issues may be identified 
during the public review process. Issues 
initially identified as potentially 
significant include: 
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a. Potential impacts to marine 
biological resources (benthic organisms, 
passageway for fish and other marine 
life) and Essential Fish Habitat. 

b. Potential impacts to threatened and 
endangered marine mammals, reptiles, 
birds, fish, and plants. 

c. Potential for shoreline changes on 
West Beach of Bald Head Island and 
adjacent areas. 

d. Potential impacts to navigation, 
commercial and recreational. 

e. Potential impacts to the long-term 
management of the oceanfront 
shorelines. 

f. Potential effects on regional sand 
sources and sand management practices. 

g. Potential effects of shoreline 
protection. 

h. Potential impacts on public health 
and safety. 

i. Potential impacts to recreational 
and commercial fishing. 

j. Potential impacts to cultural 
resources. 

k. Cumulative impacts of future 
dredging and nourishment activities. 

3. Alternatives. Several alternatives 
are being considered for the proposed 
project. These alternatives, including 
the No Action alternative, were further 
formulated and developed during the 
scoping process and are considered in 
the DEIS. A summary of alternatives 
under consideration are provided 
below: 
• Alternative #1: No-Action (includes 

component of Status-Quo) 
• Alternative #2: Retreat 
• Alternative #3: Beach Nourishment/

Disposal With Existing Sand Tube 
Groinfield To Remain in Place 

• Alternative #4: Beach Nourishment/
Beach Disposal and Sand Tube 
Groinfield Removal 

• Alternative #5: Terminal Groin With 
Beach Nourishment/Beach Disposal 
(Sand Tube Groinfield Remaining) 

• Alternative #6: Terminal Groin With 
Beach Nourishment/Disposal 
(Removal of Sand Tube Groinfield) 
4. Scoping Process. Project Review 

Team meetings were held to receive 
comments and assess concerns 
regarding the appropriate scope and 
preparation of the DEIS. Federal, state, 
and local agencies and other interested 
organizations and persons participated 
in these Project Review Team meetings. 

The Corps is also consulting with the 
U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service under the 
Endangered Species Act and the Fish 
and Wildlife Coordination Act, and with 
the National Marine Fisheries Service 
under the Magnuson-Stevens Act and 
Endangered Species Act. Additionally, 
the DEIS has assessed potential water 
quality impacts pursuant to Section 401 

of the Clean Water Act, and is being 
coordinated with North Carolina 
Division of Coastal Management 
(NCDCM) to determine the project’s 
consistency with the Coastal Zone 
Management Act and permittability 
under State Coastal Management rules. 
The USACE has worked with the 
NCDCM through the DEIS process to 
ensure the process complies with all 
State Environmental Policy Act (SEPA) 
requirements. It is the Corps’ and 
NCDCM’s intentions to consolidate both 
National Environmental Policy Act 
(NEPA) and SEPA processes to 
eliminate duplications. 

5. Availability of the DEIS. The DEIS 
has been published and circulated, and 
a public hearing will be held February 
12, 2014 at the International 
Longshoreman’s Association Center, 
located at 211 West 10th Street in 
Southport, Brunswick County, North 
Carolina at 6 p.m. 

Dated: December 30, 2013 . 
Scott McLendon, 
Chief, Regulatory Division. 
[FR Doc. 2014–00262 Filed 1–9–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3720–58–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Department of the Navy 

[Docket ID USN–2014–0002] 

Privacy Act of 1974; System of 
Records 

AGENCY: Department of the Navy, DoD. 
ACTION: Notice to alter a System of 
Records. 

SUMMARY: The Department of the Navy 
proposes to alter the system of records, 
N01070–13, entitled ‘‘Navy 
Mobilization Processing System’’, in its 
inventory of record systems subject to 
the Privacy Act of 1974, as amended. 
This system will be used to provide 
end-to-end command visibility and 
control of integrated augmentation 
processes and automated work-flow; for 
requesting manpower requirements, 
approving requirements, sourcing 
requirements, and writing orders for 
requirements; tracking, accounting, data 
collection, and coordination during 
activation/deactivation. 
DATES: This proposed action will be 
effective on February 10, 2014 unless 
comments are received which result in 
a contrary determination. Comments 
will be accepted on or before February 
10, 2014. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by docket number and title, 
by any of the following methods: 

• Federal Rulemaking Portal: http://
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Mail: Federal Docket Management 
System Office, 4800 Mark Center Drive, 
East Tower, 2nd Floor, Suite 02G09, 
Alexandria, VA 22350–3100. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name and 
docket number for this Federal Register 
document. The general policy for 
comments and other submissions from 
members of the public is to make these 
submissions available for public 
viewing on the Internet at http://
www.regulations.gov as they are 
received without change, including any 
personal identifiers or contact 
information. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ms. 
Robin Patterson, Head, PA/FOIA Office 
(DNS–36), Department of the Navy, 
2000 Navy Pentagon, Washington, DC 
20350–2000, or by phone at (202) 685– 
6545. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Department of the Navy’s notices for 
systems of records subject to the Privacy 
Act of 1974 (5 U.S.C. 552a), as amended, 
have been published in the Federal 
Register and are available from the 
address in FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT or from the Defense Privacy 
and Civil Liberties Office Web site at 
http://dpclo.defense.gov/privacy/
SORNs/component/navy/index.html. 

The proposed system report, as 
required by 5 U.S.C. 552a(r) of the 
Privacy Act of 1974, as amended, was 
submitted on December 11, 2013, to the 
House Committee on Oversight and 
Government Reform, the Senate 
Committee on Governmental Affairs, 
and the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) pursuant to paragraph 4c 
of Appendix I to OMB Circular No. A– 
130, ‘‘Federal Agency Responsibilities 
for Maintaining Records About 
Individuals,’’ dated February 8, 1996 
(February 20, 1996, 61 FR 6427). 

Dated: January 6, 2014. 
Aaron Siegel, 
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison 
Officer, Department of Defense. 

N01070–13 

SYSTEM NAME: 

Navy-Marine Corps Mobilization 
Processing System (NMCMPS) (April 
11, 2007, 72 FR 18215). 

CHANGES: 

* * * * * 

SYSTEM NAME: 

Delete entry and replace with ‘‘Navy 
Mobilization Processing System.’’ 
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