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also must submit a public version of 
their submissions. The file name of the 
public version should end with the 
character ‘‘P’’. The ‘‘BC’’ and ‘‘P’’ 
should follow the rest of the file name. 
If these procedures are not sufficient to 
protect BCI or otherwise protect 
business interests, please contact the 
USTR Section 301 line at (202) 395– 
5725 to discuss whether alternative 
arrangements are possible. 

USTR will post submissions in the 
docket for public inspection, except 
BCI. You can view submissions on the 
https://www.regulations.gov website by 
entering docket number USTR–2018– 
0025 in the search field on the home 
page. 

Robert E. Lighthizer, 
United States Trade Representative. 
[FR Doc. 2018–14820 Filed 7–10–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3290–F8–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Aviation Administration 

Notice of Request To Release Airport 
Property at Charleston International 
Airport, Charleston, South Carolina 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice and request for comment. 

SUMMARY: The Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA) is considering a 
request to release and authorize the sale 
of 19.098 acres of airport property 
located at the Charleston International 
Airport, Charleston, South Carolina, and 
invites public comment on this notice. 
The airport property is planned to be 
sold by the Charleston County Aviation 
Authority (CCAA) for the proposed use 
of aircraft manufacturing. Currently, 
ownership of the property provides for 
protection of FAR Part 77 surfaces and 
compatible land use which would 
continue to be protected with deed 
restrictions required in the transfer of 
land ownership. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before August 10, 2018. 
ADDRESSES: Comments on this 
application may be mailed or delivered 
to the FAA at the following address: 
Aimee McCormick, Federal Aviation 
Administration, Atlanta Airports 
District Office, 1701 Columbia Ave., Ste. 
220, College Park, GA 30337. 

In addition, one copy of any 
comments submitted to the FAA must 
be mailed or delivered to: Hernan Pena, 
Deputy Director, Charleston County 
Aviation Authority, 5500 International 

Blvd., #101, North Charleston, SC 
29418. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Aimee McCormick, Federal Aviation 
Administration, Atlanta Airports 
District Office, 1701 Columbia Ave., Ste. 
220, College Park, GA 30337, 
aimee.mccormick@faa.gov. The request 
to release property may be reviewed, by 
appointment, in person at this same 
location. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: On 
November 9, 2017, CCAA requested the 
FAA to release 19.089 acres of airport 
property. The request will allow CCAA 
to transfer ownership to the South 
Carolina Department of Commerce for 
the use of aircraft manufacturing. In 
return, the Department of Commerce 
will transfer 33.715 acres of property to 
CCAA. The fair market value of the two 
properties involved are of equal value. 
The use of the 33.715 acres will allow 
CCAA to construct a public parking 
facility. The FAA may approve the 
request, in whole or in part, no sooner 
than thirty days after the publication of 
this notice. 

Any person may inspect, by 
appointment, the request in person at 
the FAA office listed above under FOR 
FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT. In 
addition, any person may, upon 
appointment and request, inspect the 
application, notice and other documents 
determined by the FAA to be related to 
the application in person at the 
Charleston International Airport. 

Issued in Atlanta, GA, on July 3, 2018, 
Larry F. Clark, 
Manager, Atlanta Airports District Office. 
[FR Doc. 2018–14785 Filed 7–10–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–13–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Aviation Administration 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Requests for Comments; 
Clearance of New Approval of 
Information Collection: Safety 
Assurance System (SAS) External 
Portal 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, FAA 
invites public comments about our 
intention to request the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) 
approval for a new information 
collection. The Federal Register Notice 

with a 60-day comment period soliciting 
comments on the following collection of 
information was published on February 
23, 2018. The collection involves an 
internet-based tool, Safety Assurance 
System (SAS) External Portal. SAS 
External Portal is used by the FAA’s 
Office of Flight Standards to conduct 
initial certification, routine surveillance, 
and certificate management for 
applicants and certificate holders. The 
information to be collected will be used 
to better facilitate efficient certification, 
surveillance and certificate management 
activities. 
DATES: Written comments should be 
submitted by August 10, 2018. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit written comments on 
the proposed information collection to 
the Office of Information and Regulatory 
Affairs, Office of Management and 
Budget. Comments should be addressed 
to the attention of the Desk Officer, 
Department of Transportation/FAA, and 
sent via electronic mail to oira_
submission@omb.eop.gov, or faxed to 
(202) 395–6974, or mailed to the Office 
of Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget, 
Docket Library, Room 10102, 725 17th 
Street NW, Washington, DC 20503. 

Public Comments Invited: You are 
asked to comment on any aspect of this 
information collection, including (a) 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for FAA’s 
performance; (b) the accuracy of the 
estimated burden; (c) ways for FAA to 
enhance the quality, utility and clarity 
of the information collection; and (d) 
ways that the burden could be 
minimized without reducing the quality 
of the collected information. The agency 
will summarize and/or include your 
comments in the request for OMB’s 
clearance of this information collection. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Barbara Hall at (940) 594–5913, or by 
email at: Barbara.L.Hall@faa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

OMB Control Number: 2120–XXXX. 
Title: Safety Assurance System 

External Portal. 
Form Numbers: (Pending) Initial 

Certification Data Collection Tool (14 
CFR 121 and 135) and Initial 
Certification Data Collection Tool (14 
CFR 145). 

Type of Review: This is a new 
information collection. 

Background: Safety Assurance System 
(SAS) External Portal is a tool used by 
aviation industry applicants and 
certificate holders to provide 
information to the FAA, primarily with 
Principal Inspectors and Certification 
Project Managers. SAS External Portal 
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allows external users to register and 
gain secure access to SAS functions for 
initial certification, configuration, and 
to collaborate with their FAA 
counterparts in the execution of these 
functions. There will be extensive use of 
the External Portal for submittal of 
electronic documents from certificate 
holders and applicants. SAS External 
Portal is now accessible to all users via 
the internet, regardless of geographical 
location of the certificate holder or 
applicant, thus making it easier for 
applicants and certificate holders to 
collaborate with the FAA. 

Respondents: 300 respondents. 
Frequency: On occasion. 
Estimated Average Burden per 

Response: 146 hours. 
Estimated Total Annual Burden: 

43,800 hours. 
Issued in Washington, DC, on June 28, 

2018. 
Barbara Hall, 
FAA Information Collection Clearance 
Officer, IT Enterprises Business Services 
Division, ASP–110. 
[FR Doc. 2018–14784 Filed 7–10–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–13–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Transit Administration 

FY 2018 Competitive Funding 
Opportunity: Public Transportation on 
Indian Reservations Program; Tribal 
Transit Program 

AGENCY: Federal Transit Administration 
(FTA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice of funding opportunity 
(NOFO). 

SUMMARY: The Federal Transit 
Administration (FTA) announces the 
availability of approximately $5 million 
in funding provided by the Public 
Transportation on Indian Reservations 
Program (Tribal Transit Program). This 
notice is a national solicitation for 
project proposals and includes the 
selection criteria and program eligibility 
information for Fiscal Year (FY) 2018 
projects. FTA may fund the program for 
more or less than the full year 
appropriation when made available, and 
may include other funding if available 
from prior fiscal years toward project 
proposals received in response to this 
Notice of Funding Opportunity (NOFO). 

This announcement is available on 
the FTA website at: http://
www.transit.dot.gov. Additionally, a 
synopsis of the funding opportunity, 
FTA–2018–001–TPM–TR, will be 
posted in the FIND module of the 
government-wide electronic grants 

website at http://www.grants.gov. The 
program is located in the Catalog of 
Federal Domestic Assistance (CFDA) 
under 20.509. 
DATES: Complete proposals for the TTP 
announced in this Notice must be 
submitted by 11:59 p.m. EDT on 
September 10, 2018. All proposals must 
be submitted electronically through the 
GRANTS.GOV APPLY function. Any 
applicant intending to apply should 
initiate the process of registering on the 
GRANTS.GOV site immediately to 
ensure completion of registration before 
the submission deadline. Instructions 
for applying can be found on FTA’s 
website at http://www.transit.dot.gov 
and in the ‘‘FIND’’ module of 
GRANTS.GOV. Mail and fax 
submissions will not be accepted. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Contact the appropriate FTA Regional 
Office at http://www.transit.dot.gov for 
proposal-specific information and 
issues. For general program information, 
contact Douglas Moore, Office of 
Program Management, (202) 366–0876, 
email: douglas.moore@dot.gov. A TDD 
is available at 1–800–877–8339 (TDD/ 
FIRS). 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Table of Contents 

A. Program Description 
B. Federal Award Information 
C. Eligibility Information 
D. Application and Submission Information 
E. Application Review 
F. Federal Award Administration 
G. Federal Awarding Agency Contacts 
Appendix A: Registering in SAM and 

Grants.gov 

A. Program Description 
The Tribal Transit Program is 

authorized by Federal Transit law 49 
U.S.C. 5311(c)(1)(A), as amended by the 
Fixing America’s Surface Transportation 
(FAST) Act, Public Law 114–94 
(December 4, 2015), contingent on full 
appropriations. The FAST Act increased 
the Tribal Transit formula program from 
$25 million to $30 million and 
continued the $5 million competitive 
program authorized under 49 U.S.C. 
5311(c)(1). The program authorizes 
grants ‘‘under such terms and 
conditions as may be established by the 
Secretary’’ to Indian tribes for any 
purpose eligible under FTA’s Formula 
Grants for Rural Areas Program, 49 
U.S.C. 5311. Tribes may apply for this 
funding directly. 

The primary purpose of these 
competitively selected grants is to 
support planning, capital, and, in 
limited circumstances, operating 
assistance for tribal public transit 
services. Funds distributed to Indian 

tribes under the TTP should NOT 
replace or reduce funds that Indian 
tribes receive from States through FTA’s 
Formula Grants for Rural Areas 
Program. Specific project eligibility 
under this competitive allocation is 
described in Section C of this notice. 

B. Federal Award Information 

Five million dollars is authorized for 
the Tribal Transit competitive allocation 
in FY 2018 to projects selected pursuant 
to the process described in the following 
sections. Federal awards under this 
competitive program will be in the form 
of grants. Additionally, there is a 
$25,000 cap on planning grant awards, 
and FTA has the discretion to cap 
capital and operating awards. 

C. Eligibility Information 

1. Eligible Applicants 

Eligible applicants include federally 
recognized Indian tribes or Alaska 
Native villages, groups, or communities 
as identified by the U.S. Department of 
the Interior (DOI) Bureau of Indian 
Affairs (BIA). As evidence of Federal 
recognition, an Indian tribe may submit 
a copy of the most up-to-date Federal 
Register notice published by BIA: 
Entities Recognized and Eligible to 
Receive Service from the United States 
Bureau of Indian Affairs. To be an 
eligible recipient, an Indian tribe must 
have the requisite legal, financial and 
technical capabilities to receive and 
administer Federal funds under this 
program. Additionally, applicants must 
be located and provide service in a rural 
area with a population of 50,000 or less. 
A service area can include some 
portions of urban areas, as long as the 
tribal transit service begins in and 
serves rural areas. An applicant must be 
registered in the System for Award 
Management (SAM) database and 
maintain an active SAM registration 
with current information at all times 
during which it has an active Federal 
award or an application or plan under 
consideration by FTA. 

2. Cost Sharing or Matching 

There is a 90 percent Federal share for 
projects selected under the TTP 
competitive program, unless the Indian 
tribe can demonstrate a financial 
hardship in its application. FTA is 
interested in the Indian tribe’s financial 
commitment to the proposed project, 
thus the proposal should include a 
description of the Indian tribe’s 
financial commitment. Tribes may use 
any eligible local match under 
Chapter 53. 
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